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" Veron Chen SLI(]{Autu!

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 27 November 2018 3:45 PM

To: ‘wega claim’; SUR

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJZB668R & SIY7240C ON 18/11/2018
Dear Sir/Madam,

As instructed by our client , please proceed to repair the insured vehicle SJZ 8668R (Excess $400/-).

If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel:
6741 8434 to arrange our surveyor for inspection.

All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company
before completion of the repair.

*Our client reserve their right_not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 8256-3561 | emall :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: wega claim <wegaclaim@gmail.com=

Sent: Monday, 26 November 2018 5:54 PM

To: SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com=>

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJZ8668R & SJY7240C ON 18/11/2018

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Please kindly refer to attached and getting the authoriz approved

Thanks & Regards,

Claim Advisor

Wega Engineering Pte Ltd
Tel: 64521493



 ' Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veran Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 27 November 2018 3:33 PM

To: TEO Kitty'

Ce: SUR

Subject: RE: |A FOR SJZ B6GBR-{AXA REF: SBM013KZ)
Dear Kitty,

We have informed repairer authorise repair.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | emall :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S5{408933)

From: TEO Kitty <kitty.teo@axa.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 27 November 2018 3:17 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>
Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: IA FOR SJZ 8668R-(AXA REF: SBMO13KZ)

Hi Veron,

Please authorise

Best Regards

Kitty Teo
Specialist, Motor Claims Department
AXA Insurance Pte Ltd

B Shenton Way, #24-01 AXA Tower, Singapore 068811
Email: kitty teo@axa.com.sg

Customer Care No. 1800 8804741 Press 3
WWW.axXa.com.5g

GLOBAL INSURANCE

BRAND FOR 10
CONSECUTIVE YEARS

Please consider the environment before printing this message
This message is confidential. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either whole or partial, Is
prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender immediately



" From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) [mailto:veronchen@Ikkauto.com]
Sent: Tuesday, 27 November, 2018 11:39 AM
To: TEO Kitty <kitty.teo@axa.com.sg>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Subject: |1A FOR SJZ 8668R-(AXA REF: S58MO13KZ)

Dear Kitty,

Enclosed IA of vehicle SIZ 8668R
Date of survey: 23/11/2018
Number of days : 5 days

We have Not authorise repair.

Kindly let us have your approval please.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email ;sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

-—--Disclaimer-—

This message may contain confidential information Intended solely for the use of the named addressee. If you are
not the intended recipient, you should not read, use, disclose or reproduce the content of this message. If you have
received this message by mistake, please notify the sender immediately. Any views or opinions presented in this
message are solely those of the author and do not necessarily represent those of AXA Insurance Pte Ltd or any other
entity of the AXA Group, unless otherwise stated by the sender and duly authorized by the said companies.



" Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: TEO Kitty <kitty.teo@axa.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 27 November 2018 3:17 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Ce: SUR

Subject: RE: |A FOR SJZ 8668R-(AXA REF: SBM013KZ)
Attachments: IA (COST PRICE).pdt: MARK ESTIAMTE (COST PRICE) pdf
Hi Veron,

Please authorise.

Best Regards

Kitty Teo
Specialist, Motor Claims Department
AXA Insurance Pte Ltd

8 Shenton Way, #24-01 AXA Tower, Singapore 068811
Email: kitty.teo@axa.com.s5g

Customer Care No. 1800 8804741 Press 3
WWW,.3xa.COm.5g

GLOBAL INSURANCE

BRAND FOR 10
CONSECUTIVE YEARS

Please consider the environment before printing this message
This message is confidential. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either whale or partial, is
prohibited, If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender iImmediately

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) [mailto:veronchen@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Tuesday, 27 November, 2018 11:39 AM

To: TEOD Kitty <kitty.teo@axa.com.sg>

Cec: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: |A FOR SJZ 8668R-|AXA REF: SBMO13KZ)

Dear Kitty,

Enclosed IA of vehicle SJZ 8668R
Date of survey: 23/11/2018
Number of days : 5 days

We have Not authorise repair.

Kindly let us have your approval please.



Hleit—ﬂﬂgarﬂs.
. Veron Chen | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6256-3561 | email ;sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

-——Disclaimer—

This message may contain confidential information intended solely for the use of the named addressee. If you are
not the intended recipient, you should not read, use, disclose or reproduce the content of this message. If you have
received this message by mistake, please notify the sender immediately. Any views or opinions presented in this
message are solely those of the author and do not necessarily represent those of AXA Insurance Pte Ltd or any other
entity of the AXA Group, unless otherwise stated by the sender and duly authorized by the said companies.



~ Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LEKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 27 November 2018 11:39 AM

Te: Kitty Teo Poh Guek

Cc: SUR

Subject: & FOR SJZ B66BR-(AXA REF: SBMD13KZ)

Attachments: |A (COST PRICE).pdf; MARK ESTIAMTE (COST FRICE}.pdt
Dear Kitty,

Enclosed 1A of vehicle SJZ 8668R
Date of survey: 23/11/2018
Number of days : 5 days

We have Not authorise repair.

Kindly let us have your approval please.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone; 6256-3561 | email :sur@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)
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Immediate Advice
To: AXA Insurance Pte Ltd Date:27/11/2018
Survey details
Date of loss 18/11/2018
Date of appointment 22/11/2018
Date of survey 23/11/2018
Location of survey WEGA ENGINEERING PTE LTD
Vehicle Details:
Claim Type: Own Damage
Vehicle number 5JZ 8668R
Make and Model BMW 1351 (A)
Date of registration 20/7/2010
Excess 5400
Market Value 545,000.00
Parf Rebate §32,701.00
MNett Loss 512,299.00
Re i

[initial Estimate |s8,299.50
Proposed/Revised repair cost:
Parts 52,318.00
“Check items (Estimated)  |53,397.00
Labour 51,020.00
Total 56,735.00
Lump Sum (Estimated)
[Number of days of repair | 5 days (est) |
Remarks: The vehicle sustained damages at the n/s front portion

and undercarriage

Damages Consistent
Repair Cost Economical




M/26872018 Claim Poral

LKK AUTO COMNSULT

New Message
Type *

O Message

Subject *
|4 SUBMITTED FOR 5JZ B4SER

Message °
Dear Kitty,

Please be informed that 1A submitted. Repairer unable to provides cost price.we have Not Authorize repalr, Kindly
let us have your approval please.Thanks Veron Chen
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Immediate Advice
To : AXA Insurance Pte Ltd Date:26/11/2018
Survey details

Date of loss 18/11/2018

Date of appointment 22/11/2018

Date of survey 23/11/2018

Location of survey WEGA ENGINEERING PTE LTD

icle Deta

Claim Type: Own Damage

Vehicle number SIZ 8668R

Make and Model BMW 1351 (A)

Date of registration 20/7/2010

Excess 5400

Market Value 545,000.00

Parf Rebate $32,701.00

Nett Loss $12,299.00

ir detal

[initial Estimate |$11,107.00
Proposed/Revised repair cost:

Parts 53.641.00

"Check items [Estimated)  |55,746.00

Labour $1,020.00

Total 510,407.00

Lump Sum [Estimated)
[Number of days of repair | 5 days [est)

Remarks:

il A DAY

and undercarriage

Damages Consistent
Repair Cost Economical

Repairer unable to provides cost price.

The vehicle sustained damages at the n/s front partion




tauy LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD(ODI »  Menu

« Service Request Details

Claim
SEMO13KZ

Reference

None &

Loss Date
Movember 18, 2018

Reguest Date
Movember 22, 2018

Due Date
MNovember 29, 2018

Vendor Name
LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (OD)

Type of Loss
Own Damage

Services
Accelerated workshop survey

Actions

Mext Step
Agree to perform service

Vehicle Information

Incident Vehicle Registration #
SIZ8468R

Make
BMwW



s Model

1351

Service Address

176 Sin Ming Drive, , , 575721

Primary Contact/Insured

ARTHUR LO FOO MAN (ARTHUR LUO FUWEN)
5 THOMSON LANE. #33-01, 297724, Singapore

a2000lo@yahoo.com.sg

Claim Handler

TEO Kitty
4568804602
kitty.teo@axa.com.sg

Additional Instructions
EXCESS $400

Meszages Invaices

Histary Documents Assessment Metrics

Notes

TYPE

SENT

FROM

SUBJECT

BODY

11/22/18 4:06 PM

TEO Kitty

WP SURVEY

Hi Please offer cost + 10% mark up on parts.

-~



" RATAN BHOSALE Pragati _

From: weqga claim <wegaclaim@gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, November 21, 2018 1:21 PM

To: SG AXA Insurance SM AXA SGP - Motor Survey

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJZ8668R &L 5JY7240C ON 18/11/2018
Attachments: 5)Z8668R.PDF

Categories: Pragati

Diear Sir'Mdm,

Please kindly help to arrange surveyor , Kindly refer to the attachment.

Thanks & Regards,

Claim Advisor

Wega Engineering Pte Ltd
Tel: 64521493




11262018 PARFICOE Rebata Enguiry
. »Back to OneMotoring
“Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vrehicle Owner Particulars

DOwereer |0 Type: Singapare NRIC
Orwner 1D TI187C

WVehicle Details

Vebicle Mo SIZBLAER

Wehicle to be Exported: Ha

Interded Deregistration Date: 24 Nov 2018
Wehicle Make: BAW,

Vehicle Madel 1351M A

Primary Colour: White
Manufaciuring Year: 2010

Engine Mo 16237I9INSSBI0A
Chasslé Mo WHAUNTZOTOVMII419
Manirmumm Poweer Qutput: 2750 kW (301 bhpj
Open Market Value: $48,070.00

Original Registration Date: 20 Jul 2010

Firat Reglitration Date: 20 Jul 2010
Tranafer Count: o

Actual ARF Paid: $2B.090.00
Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility; Yo

PARF Elgitdlity Exgiry Dats 1% Jul 2020

PARF Rebate Amount: $24.847.00
Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Exgury Date: 1¥ Jul 2020

COE Category: B - Car (1600 cc & above)
COE Period(Years): 10

QP Pale $38,00000

COE Rebate Amouni: $6.25200

Total Rebate Amount: $32,701.00

The information contained herein ls correct an at 24 Now 2018

OK
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il bl i el 1
xa atlon U Accigant 108 JALAN BUKIT MERAK OPEN CARPARK
auntry’State of Loss SINGAPORE
Vehicle Registration Number SJ7BBRER
Insured/Policyholder
Mame Of Re IWnE ARTHUR LD FOO MAN
£3 [ JEYAHL =
Mobile Phane MNi DAL +65-96025198
Altarnative Phone Ne OFFICE-NOPHONE
Vehicle Particulars
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& Npoite Numbe 200072018 T a/07/2019
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H ' 6281648
il f Birtt TOT
oAt NDOOR
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Address 5 THOMSON LANE #33-01
Posteode 207724

vwas driver an employee of the Insured’s Company NO

If Mo, Relationship of the Drver with the Insured SPOUSE
vehcie Regisiration Numbar of Dnvars Own

YVEniche N
Insurance Company of Drivers Own Vehicle

Ganeral Information of the Accident

Type Of Accident COLLISION - MAJOR/MINOR RD
Véeathar Conditions CLEAR
Roag Surlace oRY
Other Information

Was any foreign veticle involved in this acoidem? NO
Rumbsar of vehicles invalved in the accidien

Was any oogy mjured in the Acoigent? MO

Was ﬁ.’"l"r ."_'l_u'l.i:" conveyead 10 hospital by NO
ambulance

¥Was any giher matenal or proparty dampged? YES

| have baen approached by unknown person(s) e
saliciting/offerng acclden! claims assistance

Mumber of Passengers (Including Driver

Detalls of Police Action

VWas the scoident reporiad 1o the police NO

I' Yag Plagss state which Palice Siation

WWas nobca of intentded Prosecution given? )

' Yes against whom™

Circumstances of Accident

REFER TO SKETCH PLAMN

Attachment(s)

Ara accident photos avallable for attachmant? YES

N as there any video captured by Car Camera? ND

Was thare any audic recorded? NO
Vehicle Registration Number SJYT240C
danicie MakaMooal'Colbu

Detalls Of Prapartias

Vahichke Category PRIVATE CAR

Name of Drivar
NRIC/Passpor Numbar
Contact Number

Addreas

Postooge

Insurance Company Name
Natura Of Damage

Mo Of Passanger (Including Drivar
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Sketch Plan Pg. 2

Dateof accident: /@ .~/ 3o0/fTime: /&30 Location _SM_@M

er’#'iddl.l. 3;]28553 Vehicle 8% 3240 Vehide C:

DESCAIBE CIRCUMSTANCES OF THE ACCIDENT
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Bk 176 Sin Ming Drive #04-16 Sin Ming Autocare Singapore 575721

Tel, 6452 1493 Fax: 6452 9153 GST Reg 19-9900741 /2
L L1
Claim Ret:
w117 G
AXA INSURANCE SINGAPORE PTE LTD ¢ Date 21/11/2018
8 SHENTON WAY #27-01/02
- 4 el
vehicle No SIZ8666R -a"'c-'r:«7 '
Chassis No WBAUNT2070VM22418 Vot 7
Make/Mode! BMW 1351MA 'f:f &ﬁ’
Year T Ceof
s 254 €375
IETET Description Unit Price Amount ||
1 1pc FRONT BUMPER § L6900 5§ 1,640.00
T oIpe FRONT HEADLAMP | H 5 290000 5 250000 7
3 1pe FRONT HEADLAMP BRACKET LH 5  TEO0 s 7800 7
4 1pc FRONT SENSOR REVERSE $ 28800 $ 28800 7
5 1pc FRONT FENDER LH ‘}" £ 7ELOO 5 TEAOD —
6 lpc FRONT FENDER INNER SHIELD ep} 5 22000 s g0l —m
T FRONT FENDER WHEEL HOUSE LH $ 16100 § 16200 7
B ipe FRONT BUMPER RENTANNER LH $ 5500 s¥7 s —
8 1pe FRONT RiM Lt K’ oo 5 ssoo
10 g FRONT Rt LOGO COVER LH B 5 5500 5 5500 a—""
11 lpe FRONT TYRE L § 23000 S$ 23000 7
12 1pe FRONT KNUCKER ARM (H § 2/600 S 276500 <
13 lpe FRONT WHEEL MUP LH $ 56400 5 S6400 7
14 1pe FRONT LOWER AM# LM s 27600 § 27600 7
15 1pe FHONT ABSORBER LH S 44200 $ 44200 7
16 1pe FRONT TIE ROD LH 5 33600 5 33600 7
17 1pe FRONT TORSION BAR LINK |H p [ ¢ 11400 § 11400 7
Labour Charges
1 Tocheck wiring and system function $ 12000 k{’
i Towhesl aligment 7 5 80.00 Jﬂf
1 Tocuting welding , knucking and remove and refis undercarmage $ BDDOD 5’;4
4 To respray accident partion $ B00DD 5‘,’(
Grand Total $ 11,107.00

|
Wegg En pect Pre Jitd et
LKK Auto Consultants hen Jg?‘_&ﬁ
ce noti

N the Repairer of the folowing:
Authiriset) Sig * To rasiurvey beforaiafie: spray paining
Leany Kwong * Ta disay domaged Dty Suring resurvey
Matile No- 84917768 * Parts prices e sutyect i contirmaien

* Thed marty Survey i o0 & "Withayt Prajudice” basiy
o Ny dre rrsification|v) s showed

"y b)) mugt be
0 final appeesl mun!rﬁ{u!
¢ From fssarance Company

=3 by Rapaire:

e m f‘ﬁﬂég faf
(4




Uik 178 Sin Ming Drive #04-16 Sin Ming Autocare Singapore 575721

. =

X

Wega Engineering Ple Lid

Tel: 6452 1491 Fax: 6452 9153 [GST Reg: 199900741 f 4
Claim Rel:
AXA INSURANCE SINGAPORE FTE LTD Date 21/11/2018
8 SHENTON WAY #27-01/02
At Y iz S
B¢ pon
Vehicle No SIZBEESA ﬂ”' G el
ChassisNo @ WBAUN72070VM22419
Make/Model = BMW 1351MA & {34‘?‘% J"--"'ci-l: eXcesy
Year H fii.' @ﬁ:?q‘- —
T Description = cout Price Ameunt |
1 1pe FRONT BUMPER Aot S 111600 S L1600 —
2 1pe FRONT HEADLAMP LH ? A= g 01300 0§ 101300
3 I FRONT HEADLAMP BRACKET (H T Cry 5 00§ £3.00
4 1pe FRONT SENSOR REVERSE ) s 16000 $ 16000 X
5 ip FRONTFENDERLH BT $ 52900 §  sH <
6 lpc FRONT FENDER INNER SHIELD €& § 15000 5 15000 —
7 lpe FRONT FENDER WHEEL HOUSELH 7 A 000 s oo X
8 1pe ERONT BUMPER RENTANNERLH DLS § mo0  § 28.00 :::
9 1pe ERONT RIM LH 2] ] § 4800 § 48000 T
1w 1pc FRONT RIM LOGD COVERLH B r $ 1500 5 1500
1 1pe FRONT TYRE LH s 13500 5 19500 %
n oI FRONT KNUCKER ARM LH A s o0 s 800X
B 1pc FRONT WHEEL HUP LH % ¢ w00 0§ 127.00
M 1pe FRONT LOWER AMP LH w.s ¢ ploo 5 8100
15 lpe FRONT ABSORBER LH Ao 5 29900 2§ 19900 k>
16 tpe FRONT TIE ROD LH & ¢ 15000 $ 15000
17 1ipc FRONT TORSION BAR LINK LH &y 5 3T -1 38.00
Pl 1of
i To check wiring ond system function % 11000 (
2 Ta wheel aligment ¢ soco 1 4’-{
1 To cuting weiding . knucking and remove and refu undercarriage 5 BOO0O 500
4 To respray accident portion 5 80000 s0p
Grand Totsl ORI

Apthorived Signature
Leang Ches Bweng
Mobile No: 84917268

LI Auto Consyltants hence notify
the Repalrer of hae lollowing:
» To resurvey belorelaller spray (ainting
o T displey damaged partis] during resurvey
« Pris prices Bre Subsec] o confirmnton
» Thwr piety Survey B on 8 Withou! Frepedios” bess
» o fiegal modfcadons| & alowed
& Suppemariacy BTyl it e reurvrysd B
8 putyeet 10 il aporowsl from imsarance Company

Ackncmdigas by Fapsmw

Sgrature:
[Ciale:




Blk 176 Sin Ming Drive #04-16 Sin Ming Autocare Singapore 575721

LK Aulo Congijltants hence notify

the Repairer of ihe followina:

o T0 resurvey betorp gt TEETy -i-ﬂ‘.lf‘lq
displsy darmaged @ a1 Banng resurvey Wlu

& Parts prices are sulyect b confirmation

* Thrd parly swrvey non g Withaut Prasedcs” o

* Mo iliagad modicationds ) is aomes

X Soppermwntary aemis) must be resurveyes
= subwct © fnnwwﬁmmumc;:m

Acnoweoged by Regainee
Sepraiure:
Doig:

Mobile Ne 5491776

Tel: 6452 1493 Fax: 64529153 GST Reg: 19-9900741 / 7
Clavm Rt
Sl
AXA INSURANCE SINGAPORE FTE LTO KWE Date 2112008
8 SHENTON WAY #27.01/02
/4
Yehagle No SIZB068R — 4 A ‘F /
Chasyis No WBAUNT2070VM22410 7 {fﬁ-.-.fg,?
Make/Mode! BMW 1351MA [ &fv
Year - x
i (254 ¢35 oo
[ /N Qiy Destription Unat Price Amgunt
T ipc ADNT BUMPER 5 L64900 5 LESGO
! e FRONT HEADLAMP Lui = § 290000 5 150300 "l----""""
1 lpe FRONT HEADLAMP BRACKET LH LT Y $ o0 B
4 tpc FHONT SENSOR REVERSE $ 28800 5 2300 %
5 lpe FHONT FENDER LI % s o 8 Mi00 —
Bolpe FRONT FENDER INNER SHIELD cp] 5 12000 5 12000 —
7 1pe FRONT FENDER WHEEL MOUSE Li s 18200 § 8200 F
Bl FRONT BUMPER RENTANNER LH 5 5400 s¥r sxpn —"
§ o oloe FRONT RIM LW %’ 5 ssnoo S BRO.DO &
W lec FRONT RIM LOGO COVER LH Ay § 5500 5 5500 —
ST T FRONT TYRE LH $ 23000 5 2000 X
17 imc FRONT KNUCKER AT LH § 276.00 $  llebd X
13 Ipc ERONT WHEEL HUP LK s 5 56400 5 554.00 r__’__,
" ipc FRONT LOWER AMIP LM « % 27600 § 17600 Y
15 Ipc FROMT ADSORBER LH S 44300 & a2 00 i
16 lpc FRONT TIL ROD LM a$ 13600 5 33500 e
17 1pe FRONT TORSION DAR LINK LH p, [ « % 11400 $ 11400
~= Labour Charges P
1 Ta cwech winng ang system funcion $ 12000 /
2 To wheet sligment 7 s 8000 der
1 Ta cuting welding , knucking and remove and refix underearria 5 ROD.OO .'.F'pgz‘
4 To respray accdent portion $ BOD.DO f# >
Grand Total i‘.‘h-lﬂﬂ

|1



'k Ordar: RO51811

. mso: SJZBG6ER
r 09
] 26.11.18 17:00
BMW 2007-13 ES2 18" | h\‘—\
Front : Left :
Actual  Before | Spocified Range " Actual |
-1°24’ -1°24'  -0%42' 0"18 Camber /=308’ |
§°48' | 6"ag' l_ ) - Caster L 706"
010" | 0m 0°02' 0"14° Toe T otor
L2k N . o & - BAl . tHas
12°49° 12°49° = Included Angl 1338 |
i | -2°08' -1*08’ Turning Anglo Diff. L
Front " ———
Actual | Boefore  Spocified Range
Cross Cambor 1742 172"  -0"30° 0°30'
Cross Castor . O 019 -0"30" 0°30'
Cross SAl 2529 | -a%2¢
Total Toe | 0%0¥ 0%04  0°04'0°28°
Croas Turn Dill. - =N N
Rear : Loft Roor : Right
Actual  Beforo | Specified Range " Actual = Bofore | Specified Rango |
127 1728' | -1°88' 1°08° | Cambeor . A727T | 1726 | -1°587-1°08°
%3 | .0t | 0°03° 018 Too 0°35°  0"38" 0703 071E°
Roar
| Actual _ Bofore | Spocified Rango |
Cross Camber Lot ety | -0°30°0°30°
Total Toe R E 0’22 | 0°08'0°30°
Thrust Angle 024’ -0°24'  -0°D4° 0°04'

Wlrkaige 10,9 E33 vt JOUF O 0 Filldad



k Order:  ROS1812
oo SJEUGOUR
o 08
* 28.11.18 12:08
Front : Left
Actual _ Boforo | Specified Range
47200 | 1"22° | -0°42' 018’
645 | g%E' | =
007 0*17° | 0°02' 0"14’
14°24° 14726 N
13"04° | 19°04" i
T avoeates |
..ﬂ.l:‘hlll
Cross Cambaor -L'I'd:l'
Crosa Castor i i 21‘
Cross SAI 0716
Total Too D=3
Crosas Turn Diff.
Rear : Loft
Actusl _ Boforo Specifiod Range |
"26" -172r -1*565' -1°05"
0" 10 it WS 0"15°
_Ar.:tunl
Cross Cambor 002
Tolal Too 02z
Thrust Angle 0 u-'l

BMW 2007-12 EB2 18"

Front: Rinhl
~ Actual _ Before Specified Range
Cambaor G 37 -0°38 -0*42' g*18'
Castor L 70T | 70T
Toe [ C08" | 008 | O0RO0e
sal 14%08° 14"06"
Included Angla e 13°31°
Turning Angle Diff. | ~2%08"' -1°08"
Front
Bofore | Spocified Rango
-0*a7 -0°30° 0°30°
N -0%30° 0*a0
w20, -
O 0*04' 0*28
Roar : Right
Actual | Beforo | B_E_::llﬁd Rango |
Cambor T oATam | 72T | -1°55'-1°06° |
Toe B RES 11 0*03° 0*15'
Roar
Bofore  Spocifiod Range
g0’ _-0°30" 0"30° |
v ~ 0"06" l,'l-":ll:l'
o 00" 0704’ 0°04°

Adadigges 10 1 DRIY imtseabonal JUTF D0 HBATE



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

#

From: wega claim <wegaclaim@gmail.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 20 February 2019 11:54 AM
To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Subject: 0D Claim for SIZ B66B R

Attachments: OD Claim 5)Z 8668 R.pdf

Dear Ms. Veron,

Enclosed are the document for your perusal and kindly reply us as soon as possible.

Thanks & Regards,

Claim Advisor

Wega Engineering Pte Ltd
Tel: 54521493



INTEGRATED GLOBAL NETWORK ENTERPRISE

1 Block 8 Kaki Bukil Road 1 201.07/0R EunnsTechnotink Singapore 415938 = mail Bign.cam.sg <) wwwgnoom o
T ES-6348 1051 B K5-B440 4375  Husiness Rey Noo 51045222wW + (ST Regiswatinn No.: M9-D010002.A

300-0182 TAX INVOICE Ne.: 1118-060849

Wega Engineenng Pte Ltd Your Ref. : S)ZB6BSR VM22419

176 Sin Ming Drive Model :

#04-13/16 Sin Ming Autocare Terms CASH

Singapora 575721 Date 28-11-2018

Salesman
Ah Chia B245 0276 Page 1of]
Tel ; 6452 1493 Fax : 6452 9153 Ship Via
i Price Disc Amount

item Part No, Description Gty u/ Aee .
1 31126770 B49P LOWER ARM ES0 LM [GER] 1 PC 81.00 81.00
2 32106 765 235BM TIE ROD ES0 LH 1 PC 150.00 150.00
3 313567659336 THRUST ROD ES0 LH [GER] 1 rC 38.00 18.00
4 11215785 157 WHL BRG FRT ES0 1 PC 122.00 127.00
5 5111804591 FENDER UNDER COVER EB2/B8 LH L 150.00 150.00
& 51 L18057 508 QUMPER FNT EB2/B8 M [HLC. NO PDC) 1 PC 1,116.00 1,116.00
7 51117148 761 HEADLAMP BKT LH 1 PC 63.00 631.00
B 4135713337 FENDER FRT EB1/82/B7/88 LH 1 PC 529.00 529.00
9 35116 768 854 RIM I PC 480.00 480,00
10 36131 1BD 419 Hug Cae 1 FC 15.00 15.00
11 S11i7134 087 BUMBER BKT FRT _H 1 PC 28.00; 18.00
Remarks:

SINGAPORE DOLLAR TWO THOUSAND NINE HUNDRED SEVENTY ONE AND CENTS

THIRTY NINE ONLY

Mies

1 Goods s2ia are not refurnable unlgss othenwss arrange

2 Al cheques should ba crossed and made payable 1o
INTEGRATED GLOBAL NETWORK ENTERPRISE

3 For TIT, pls remd 1o DBS Bank Lid - A/C No 027-902198-5 |SGD) or
WOB Bank Lig - ARG No 356-300-274-1 [SG0]

4 Gaads mmain gur prope My unless bl payment & recened

(AN

for Integrated Global Network Enterprise

HQ

Qur BMW and MIN] Parts - Drven by Quality & Value

Sub Total 2,777.00
GST 7.00 %: 194,39
Total SGD : 2,971.39

Received In good order and condition

Customer's Chaop & Signature

28-Now-18 2:29:52 P



Tr I 4 M
* INTEGRATED GLOBA[ NI:'TWORI( ENTERPRISE

Mo w9 s Pt} i) | vy 0" L [T— R T—— VO BE ) e e
Taelan ims R R Te— 1T 1" VLI TW 0 (Y] Begiattaie e e
3000182 TAX INVOICE No. : 1218-061343
Wega Enginessring Pte Litd Your Ref. SIZBGEER YM22419
176 Sin Ming Drive Mexchel EBB 1351 N55
#04-13/16 Sin Ming Autocane Terms CASH
Singapore 575721 Date : 24-12-2018
Salesman
\h Chia B245 0276 Page : 1001
e ;6452 1493 Fax : 6452 9153 Ship Via
tem  Part No. Description Qty L/ Price  Disc Amourt
56D _SGD
I 63117 161 255 AHL XENON H/ LAMP EB2/88 LH 1 PC  2,013.00 2,013.00
narks:
APORE DOLLAR TWO THOUSAND ONE HUNDRED FIFTY THREE AND CENTS Sub Total - 2 013.00
TY ONE ONLY N
GST 7.00 %: 140.91
18 50id arw not returnable uniess otherwise arrange Total SGD 2,153.91
wques shouid be crossed and made payable 1o
GHRATED GLOBAL NETWORK ENTERPRISE
/T, pis remit to DBS Bank Ltd - AC No 027-902198-5 [SGD] or
Bank Ltd - A/C No 358-300-274-1 .
§ reman cur property uniess full payment is received Received in good order and condtion
egrated Global Network Enterprise Customer's Chop & Signature
“m‘“'mmm.m H'DH:"IB LO:58'51 AM



Veud WEGA / ENGINEERING

ouismative warkihop and beyond

24lhrs Towing, Insurance Claims, Car Rapaind & Spray Painting

TEL - 65-6451 14¥) FAX : 65-6457 %153 GETREG NO - 1999 D0T41 Z

INVOICE
AXA INSURANCE SINGAPORE PTE LTD
B Shemon Way, #24-01

oD201901

ANA Tower Singapore 068811 WV DATE oTmRIe
VEMICLE MO 5.Z BEGaA R
MARE | MOOEL LEL
TERMS 2 WEEKS
Adtn: Claims Department YOUR HEF KO
A Particulae Cluantity Amount 5GO
Acciden! between SIF B8 R £ 5JY T240 C dated 181172018
' DO CLaM FOR 5JZ 8888 H Lurmp Sdm Repair Cos! § 6.349.00
Less Evceas 3 {400 o)
L3489 00
GST ™% [ 1By
£.368.42
COLLARS: SIX THOUSAND THREL HUNDRED SIXTY FIVE AND CENTE FORTY THREE DNLY.
GRAND TOTAL 5,365.43

Cheques should be mads payable o WEGA ENGINEERING PTELTD

TERMS : 10 DAYS



WEGA ' ENGINEERING

i trs Towsing, Inturanes Claims, Car Papain b Sorey Painting

Bk | 78 Sin Ming Drrve, 804-18, 13 5o Ming Auccare Singapors 575721

Tel: 6457 1495 Fao G457 91 53 Websine: hap? woww wogn com.sg E-mail wegaclam@igmail com
OST Reg Mo (9.00007412

ol ar €]
Date :
Our Ref - dhav a9 f'
Your Refl ! WITHOUT PREJUDICE
M5 Al Do -r!a'?(j {2r AL e 4y
G Shoniey Wiy |, Bdli-p] FXB Tewr dingipras  0bHfY
Dear Sir,

Accidentinvoiving ST L Pdif 22 ST Tow datep dfufrv 7€

We enclosed the following documents for your perusal:

* Original Survey report hill _f,_l_ original copies of photographs

* Original Tax |nvaice no, d * Dyipinal Rental Involen no.____—
* GlA report / police reportof _ — * Palice result /
* Certificate of insurance, ! * LTA search amd receiptof. :

* Driginal Medical BIll/ Receipt____~ * Driver's Letter of Authority____
* Satisfaction Cumn Discharge Yourcher__ = * Others =
* Survey under insurance instruction J independent Surveyor

Wea would ke to claim all the lollowing losses on bishalf of our cdlient-

1) Cost of Regair [Inclusive G5T) L_in_’}ﬁﬂﬁ
2) Surveyor fees (with/without GST) =
3) Rental Fees/fLoss of Use for _"doys et 3___ per day - _
4] LTA / UIA / Palice Fees L E—
5 Medical Fees =

Total Claim s L3sls3

If your agree to the above, please forward your full settement directly to WEGA ENGINEERING PTE LTD
Your prompt action 15 most appreciated.




TO:

venicieno: | SIZ KE68R

DATE OF ACCIDENT/REPAIR, l%lulzm& {

Accident Invalving gﬂz eﬁﬂg and 33‘}‘ AL 0C alang
508 Talan Aukit ngrals cpeo C_B-_S_&L

This is to confirm that my/ our vehicle S312 BLEE R is under repalr at

WEGA ENGINEERING PTE LTD.

Repairs had been carried out to my satisfaction.

pATED/TIMEIN: 'O - 11 2ol & !

DATED/MMEOUT: _ - 12 21

il

SIGNATURE

(OWNER/AUTHORISED PERSONNEL COLLECTING VEHICLE)

NAME:

I/C NO:



Date:

To: Wega Engineering Pte Ltd
Blk 176 5in Ming Drive
#04-16 Sin Ming Autocare
Singapore 575721,

LETTER OF AUTHORITY & INDENMITY

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLEND. __ SO SEERR

)/ We _PRTHUR LD f50 MBN UEN/NRICNo.  SFAIRRTL.

Owner of Vehicle No. 328868 R hereby authorise M/S WEGA ENGINEERING PTE LTD

To commence repairs to my vehicle and to forward the claim for damages systained in the above
Accident to the third party driver and / or his employer and / or the vehicle owner and / or the insurer
Concerned. |/ We agree that in consideration of your giving up your repairer's llen | / We agree to
Assign the whole proceeds of my / our third party claim to you and if applicable, our solicitors (to be
Appointed by you on my/ our behalf) shall accept this as my/ our irrevocable authority to pay the
Amount compensated direct to you after deduction of their costs on a solicitor & clients basis. I/We
Undertake to co-operation fully with you and our solicitors to see the claim to a successful conclusion,

If third party deiver and/ or his employer and / or the vehicle owner and /or the insurer reject liability,
| / We will fully be responsible for the repair costs and other incidentals.

| / We also authorize you to sign all discharge vouchers / Indemnity forms and all necessary paper in
Connection with the above claim in my/ our absence

|/ We authorise you to appoint such a firm of solicitors on my/ our behalf as you shall deem fit for the
Purpose of the third party/ own insurer’s claim

|/We undertake ta inform you and/or the solicitors appointed by you on my Jour behalf in the event
of the third party's insurance company communicate with me/ us directly by telephone or in writing
and I/We further undertake not to accept any monies of offer of settlement from the third party's
insurer without first communicating with you

My/our vehicle is repaired by the repairer on my/our own will without any inducament, threat
and for promise.

In the avent that the repairer is completed to enforce this undertaking, | /We agree that I/we shall
Pay for the legal costs incurred by repairer on a solicitor and client’s full indemnity basis.

Owner Sig re
[Company Ssamp if applicable]



Dear Sirs,

CLAIMANT :

ACCIDENT INVLOVING_ o2 268K AND SIFLOC

on_ 1&-1l - 2@ AT 506 Talan Bulkit meraly gpen Gcpack
ywe, BRTAUR \0 oo pAmed ,am [are the

registered owner of vehicle No. RIZ_XL6ER

Please note that | have assigned all compensation monies due to me/ us in the above said
Accident to WEGA ENGINEERING PTE LTD.

| /We, hereby authorize you to release all compensation monies pertaining to the above said
Accident to WEGA ENGINEERING PTE LTD and forward you settlement cheque

To WEGA ENGINEERING PTE LTD whom |/we had authorized to collect the sald
Compensation monies.

Thank you.

Signature of Claima ,JQJP
(Company Stamp, If applicable)
Name

NRICNo -

Date:



