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hitps:/ivp . smariclaims.axa.com.sg/claim-portalhtmliindex-vendor-service-requests himi#/ service-requestsiview-message/ 7serviceRequestNumbe. ..

Claim Portal

RE: <TP - Mandate |IA> - SSBM013TV £ACC DENT
INVOLVING ]SKD 3107E(Ol) & SLU 1207L(TP) ON
16/11/2018

Type
@ Question

Message

Hi, For LOR, we have offered up to 9days, however third party insisted for 10days(8 repair days + 15aturday
+ 1Sunday). The total amount counter proposed by third party is $12,037.79(all-in). Kindly advise if we may
proceed to settle at $12,037.7%(all-in) or elase advise further. Thank you. Hsiao Tong - 08 Oct 2019.
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1082019 Claim Portal

<TP - Mandate IA> - SBM013TV [ACCIDENT INVOLVING
SKD 3107E(Eb|) & SLU 1207L(TP) ON 16/11/2018]

Type
@ Question

Message
Hi Hsiao Tong, pls inform TR, offer maintain. Tks

hitps:/ivp.smarlclaims.axacom.sglclaim-porialhtmifindex-vendor-service-requests, htmi#service-requestsiview-message/?serviceReguesiMumbe... 11



_Hsian Tung (LKKAuto)

e e —F
From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto)
Sent: Wednesday, 9 October 2019 9:26 AM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: New message for service request 83483, vehicle number 5LU1207L
revised to 9 days max (full & final). Tks _

' 1219/2019

] \Revised offer at $11,930.79 CHT [10:31:01

Al
lessage XA Hi For LOR. we have offerad -u;: ta Sdays, however third party insisted for

7 10days(8 repair days + 15aturday + 1Sunday). The total amount counter proposed oy third CHT ?g?f?;g
party is $12,037.79(all-in}. Kindly advise it we may proceed to settle at $12.037.79(all-in} or #“' :
elase advise further. Thank you. Hsiao Tong - 08 Oct 2019 [

[8M0/2018
i WINMIE{AXA) CALLED IM. SHE SAID TELL TP WKSP (SUHAIMI) MAINTAIN OFFER AT CHT 10,25,0;
9DAYS ‘ i
| A
J h_ ot [ g/10/201
11100819 10:34 AM HO Winnie—-—Hi Hsiao Tong, pls inform TP, offer maintain. Tks |LEP :

8:12:10 AW

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D [LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com=

Sent: Tuesday, 8 October 2019 10:39 AM

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: New message for service request 83483, vehicle number 5LU1207L

Best Regards,

Summer Lee | Admin

LKk Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue
1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

--—-Original Message-----

From: winnie.ho@axa.com.sg swinnie.ho@axa.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 8 October, 2019 10:35 AM

To: admin-d@|kkauto.com

Subject: New message for service request 83483, vehicle number SLU1207L

AXA Insurance has sent you a message for claim number SBMO13TV.
Please click here https://vp.smartclaims.axa.com.sg/claim-portal/ to view the message in Vendor Portal.



Hsiao Tuna (LKKAuto)

From: Suhaimi Saidi <suhaimisaidiB069@gmail.com=>

Sent: Tuesday, 15 October 2019 10:05 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: SLU1207L / SKD3107E DOA LKK REF CC4/ASM18021148/R1pb3

Dear Hsiao Tong,

We refer to your email of 14.10.19.

We confirmed acceptance of your offer therein.
Please let us have the DV soonest.

Thanks,
Suhaimi

On Mon, 14 Oct 2019 at 08:16, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@|kkauto.com> wrote:

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to your below email

We have our principal instruction to maintain our offer as follows: -

1, Cost of Repair (w/G5T) 510,967.79
2. Loss of Rental [9days x 5100.00)(w/GST) 5 963.00
Total | $11,930.79

Please re-consider,

“Please note that our proposal and correspondence with you is strictly on a without prejudice basis and should not be construed as an
admission of liability on our part and/or that of our policyholder and/or the authorised driver. The terms of our without prejudice
engagement should not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of this accident nor should it be binding in any other related
claims.”



Best Regards,

[siao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-9197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Suhaimi Saidi <suhaimisaidi8069 @gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, 10 October 2019 12:53 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@|kkauto.com=>

Subject: Re: SLU1207L / SKD3107E DOA LKK REF CC4/ASM18021148/R1ph3

Dear Hsiao Tong,

We refer to our emails of 02.09.19, 14.09.19 and 27.09.19.

We have yet to hear from you.

As matter as been protracted, please revert within the next 7 days failing which we shall
proceed accordingly.

Regards,
Suhaimi
For Wearnes Automotive Pte Ltd

Hp: 93865752

On Fri, 27 Sep 2019 at 14:57, Suhaimi Saidi <suhaimisaidiB069@gmail.com> wrote:

Dear Hsiao Tong,



As spoken a moment ago, please revert soonest with your revised offer.

Regards,

Evelyn

On Sat, 14 Sep 2019 at 15:57, Suhaimi Saidi <suhaimisaidiB069 @gmail.com> wrote:

Dear Hsiao Tong,

We refer to our email of 02.09.19.

Please revert soonest.

Regards,

Suhaimi

On Mon, 2 5ep 2019 at 12:45, Suhaimi Saidi <suhaimisaidi8069@gmail.com> wrote:

Dear Hsiao Tong,

Refer to your offer dated 02.09.2019

We maintained our counter propose loss of rental in full as per our letter of demand dated
07.02.2019

LOR 10 days = $1070.00 and the rest remain same.

Please review and revert.

Regards



Suhaimi Saidi
Hp:93865752

For Wearnes Automotive Pte Ltd

On Mon, 2 Sep 2019 at 10:42, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto. com> wrote:

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter.

We have our principal instruction to revise our offer as follows: -

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) 510,967.79
2. Loss of Rental (9days x $100.00)(w/G5T) 5 963.00

Total | $11,930.79

Please confirm acceptance.

“Please note that our proposal and correspondence with you is strictly on a without prejudice basis and should not be construed as
an admission of liability on our part and/or that of our policyhelder and/or the authorised driver. The terms of our without prejudice

engagement should not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of this accident noer should it be binding in any other
related claims.”

Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler
LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108



Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: Suhaimi Saidi <suhaimisaidi8069@gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 27 August 2019 2:41 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@|kkauto.com=>

Subject: Re: 5LU1207L / SKD3107E DOA LKK REF CC4/A5M18021148/R1pb3

Hi Hsiao Tong,

We refer to our emails of 30.07.19 and 06.08.19.

Please revert soonest.

Regards,

Suhaimi

On Tue, 6 Aug 2019 at 13:12, Suhaimi Saidi <subaimisaidi8069@gmail.com> wrote:

Dear Hsiao Tong,

Any updates?

Regards

Suhaimi Saidi

Hp:93865752

For Wearnes Automotive Pte Ltd

On Tue, 30 Jul 2019 at 11:12, Suhaimi Saidi <suhaimisaidi8069@gmail.com> wrote:
5




Hi Hsiao Tong,

We refer to your email of 28.07.19.

We would like to counter propose in full for LOR, 8 days repair + weekend.

Please review and revert.

Regards,

Suhaimi

On Sun, 28 Jul 2019 at 10:15, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@|kkauto.com> wrote:

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter,

We have our principal instruction to offer as follows: -

1. Cost of Repair [w/G5T) 1096779
2. Loss of Rental [(8days x $100.00) {w/GST| $ 856.00
Total | 511 7

Please confirm acceptance.

“Please note that our proposal and correspondence with you is strictly on a without prejudice basis and should not be construed
as an admission of liability on our part and/or that of our policyholder and/or the authorised driver. The terms of our without
prejudice engagement should not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of this accident nor should it be binding
in any other related claims.”



Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewhti@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Saturday, 6 July 2015 11:18 AM

To: Suhaimi Saidi <suhaimisaidiB069@gmail.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: 5SLU1207L / SKD3107E DOA LKK REF CCA/ASM18021148/R1pb3

Without Prejudice

Hi Suhaimi,

We refer to the above mattfer,

As per our surveyor, kindly let us have the following damage photos for our necessary action: -

e Tyre Pressure Sensor
« Harness - Bumper Fri

Appreciate an early reply.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be
deemed [ inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.



In the event of new evidence being diseovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on
the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LEKK Auto Consultants Ple Lid

Phone: 6742-2197 | email: chewht@lidkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408033)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Saturday, 15 June 2019 11:00 AM

To: Suhaimi Saidi <suhaimisaidiB063@gmail.com:>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com:
Subject: RE: SLU1207L/ SKD3107E DOA LKK REF CC4/ASM 18021148/R1pb3

Without Prejudice

Hi Subhairmi,

We refer to the above matter,

As per our surveyor, kindly let us have the following damage photos for our necessary action: -

s Tyre Pressure Sensor
« Hamess — Bumper Frt

Appreciate an early reply.



“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be
deemed [ inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on
the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler
LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Payva Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 13 June 2015 4:38 PM

To: Suhaimi Saidi <suhaimisaidi8069@gmail.com=; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@|kkauto.com>
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com=

Subject: RE: SLU1207L / SKD3107E DOA LKK REF CC4/ASM18021148/R1phb3

Without Prejudice

Dear Suhaimi,

We refer to your below email and the contents were noted.

Please be informed that this matter is now handled by my colleague Ms Hsiao Tong and she will get back to
vou for an update/offer.

Thank you.



Hi Hsiao Tong,

Kindly do the necessary.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2006 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408033)

L

t'!

Save the Earth- Frint only when recessary

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or
distribution by an unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a viclation of law. If you believe that you received this e-
mail in error, please do not read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including
any copies thereof, and inform the sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachmenis and any copies thereof
Thank you

From: Suhaimi Saidi [mailto:suhaimisaidi8069
Sent: Wednesday, 12 June, 2019 10:07 AM
To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: 5LU1207L / SKD3107E DOA

Dear Vic,

Please revert,

Regards
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Suhaimi Saidi
Hp:93865752

For Wearnes Automotive Pte Ltd

On Wed, 29 May 2019 at 11:30, Suhaimi Saidi <suhaimisaidiB069 @gmail.com> wrote:

Hi Vic,

We refer to our email below.

Any update?

Regards,

Suhaimi

---------- Forwarded message -

From: Suhaimi Saidi <suhaimisaidi8069@gmail.com=
Date: Wed, 15 May 2019 at 08:05

Subject: Re: SLU1207L / SKD3107E DOA

To: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>

Dear Vic,

We refer to our emails below.

Please let us have your offer of settlement soonest as matter has been protracted.

Regards,

Suhaimi

11



On Mon, 29 Apr 2019 at 09:26, Suhaimi Saidi <suhaimisaidiB068 @egmail.com> wrote:

Dear Vic,

Any update?

Regards,

Suhaimi

On Tue, 16 Apr 2019 at 11:45, Suhaimi Saidi <suhaimisaidi8069@gmail.com> wrote:

Yr ref: CC4/ASM18021148/hb3

Dear Vic,

Refer to the above, please revert with your settlement.

Regards

Suhaimi Saidi

Hp:93865752

For Wearnes Automotive Pte Ltd

12
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WEARNES

Our Reference: SLU1207L/T015297 By Email / Mail
Your Reference: SKD310TE

07 February 2019

AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD C/0 LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS
Arin: Third Party Claim Department -

ACCIDENT INVOLYING SLUI207L & SKD3107E ON 16 Nov 2018.
Dear Officer,
We wish to inform you that the repairs to our client vehicle have been completed.

We hereby submit the claims as follows:

Details Remarks Amount (SGD)

Cost of Repairs : 10,967.79

Loss Of Rental ' 1,070.00 x 10 days 10,700.00

Others

TOTAL 21,667.79

Kindly let us have your offer to Christine.yow(@wearnes.com

¥ our soonest reply is much appreciated. Thank you,

Yours faithfully

Christine Yow

D (65) 6430 4899

Wearnes Automotive Pte Ltd
Bodyshop and Paint Division
249 Alexandra Road
Singapore 159935

This is a computer generated printout, no signature is required.

VWaearnes Automotiva Ple. Lid.
45 Leng Kee Hoad, Ssngapore 159103 T 685 6430 4700 www. wearnesaulo.com

Co reg no. 199501400R



WEARNES
SERYICE Tax 1MNYOloEe
0 = ADDOOS SL: AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD
AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD GST Req.Ho:MZB92062Z8X
& SHENTON WaY, Inv.Mo. . : BEP 7015297 Page 1
#27-01 AXA TDWER, Inv.date. : 29/01/201%
SINGAPORE 0&BB11 WIP HWo. . ¢ 39237
veh.In/Out: 05/12/2018 l4/01/2019
*Tel.No. . :© 6338 7288
Reg.ho. . » SEULZ0T7L
Closed by .... : Derek Oh Siong Wee Reg.date .: 23/11/2017
sve Consultant : ACC Mileage ..: 20,B&B
Remarks ...... : HMr Goh Koon Wee Chassis Mo: VFLRFAOQOLS8580730
Parts/0p.No Description Mech Qty Price Disc® Pkg Amount @&
a0z TO REPLACE FROMT BOMMET,FRT Q 1575.00 0 1,575.00 &

BUHMPER,FRT BRACKET,FRT LH
HEADLAMP,FRT LH FEMDER,FRT
WHEEL ARCH,ETC
800 TO PUTTY SFRAY PAINT OMN FRT 0 1200.00 O 1,200.00 3
BONNET ,FRT BUMPER,FRT LH
FENDER,ETC

0031 T0 REPLACE FROMNT LH RIH 0 530.00 0 50.00 5
419 COHPUTERISED WHEEL ALIGHENT 0 280.00 0O 280.00 3
230 10 FOCUS HEADLAMP 0 110.00 © 110.00 3
280 TO CHECK WIRING INCLUDE 0 I30.00 0O 330.00 3
RESETTING OF ALL ELECTRICAL
MODULES
&620223972R BUMPER FRT G54 1.0 EA 11465.30 10 1,048.95 3
5203584038 BUHMPER BRACKET FRT L 1.0 EA 104.50 10 94.05 8
I&61A248TIR FOG LAMP COVER CHORM 1.0 EA 191.30 10 172.17 8
&22907255R BUHPER FRT SUPPORT B 1.0 EA 21.80 10 82.62 3

Waames Automotlive Fte. Lid.
A5 Leng Kee Rosd, Singapore 155103 T +565 G430 4930 www, wsrmesauto.com

Co reg no, 199500400/ / GST reg no. M2B92062Ex



W

WEARNES

ZFERVYICE TAX IMNVYOICE

0 = AOQDOS SL: AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD

AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD G3T Reg.Ho:MZB920628X
8 SHENTON WaY, Inv.No. . : B&EP 7TO15297 Page 2
$27-01 AXA TOWER, Inv.date. : 29/01/201%
FINGAPORE 0&BE11 WIP Wo. . : 39237

Veh.In/Out: 05/12/201l8 14/01/2019

®Tel . Mo. . : 6338 728B

Reg.Ho, . © SLU1207L
Closed by .... : Derek Oh Siong Wee Reg.date. : 23/11/2017
Svc Consultant : ACC Mileage . : 20,8588
Remarks ...... : Mr Goh Koon Wee Chassis No: YFLRFAOOLSAS80930
Parts/0p.No Description Hech Oty Price Disct% PKa Amount G
269257264R SUPPORT BRACKET, HEA 1.0 EA & .60 10 E5.94 5
531012967R FEMWDER FRT LH G54 1.0 EA 512,70 10 461.43 5
6251322838 BRACKET, FEWDER FRT 1.0 EA 98.10 10 83_.2%9 3
&£20424559R FENWDER BRACKET FRT L 1.0 EA 89.90 10 BO.%1 S
TID3077435 WHEEL ARCH CLIP J5AL 10.0 EA 5.30 10 47.70 S
260606234R HEADLAHF LH R9A3 G34 1.0 EA &77.30 10 609.57 5
403007153R ALLOY RIH 20" R9A3 5 1.0 EA 986.40 10 BET.76 S
40TO04CEOE TYRE PRESSURE SENSOR 1.0 EA 119,10 10 107.19 3
£22540901R EBUHPER LOWER G54 1.0 EA 356.20 10 320.58 3
2692572464R  SUPPORT BRACKET, HEA 1.0 EA 6&.60 10 59.94 §
&38457730R WHEEL ARCH - FRT LH 1.0 EA 204.60 10 184,14 3
PSIA49995R  PARK SENSOR BOTH CTR 1.0 Ea 429,90 10 386.91 3
240704578R HARNESS- BUMPER FRT 1.0 EA 152.20 10 136.98 5
256685474R AIR IMTAKE HOSE, BUM 1.0 EA 195.80 10 95.22 S
&Z20901789R BUHPER FRT CENTER IN 1.0 EA 122,19 10 109.89 3
TT03101444 FENDER SCREW 10.0 EA 5.60 10 S0.40 3
620347324R BUMPER BRACKET FRT R 1.0 EA 104.50 10 24.05 3

Wearnes Automotive Pte, Lid,
45 Leng Kee Road, Singapore 159103 T +65 6430 4930 www.wearnesaulo.com

Co reg no. 1995014008 / GST rag no. M2B920628%



RYa

WEARNES

SERVICE TAX INVOICE

O - AQOO0DS SL: AXA INSURANCE FTE LTD
Aaxa INSURARNCE PTE LTD GST Reg.Ho:MZBP206Z8X%
A SHENTON WAY. Inv.No. BaP 7015297 Page 3
#27-01 AXA TOWER, Inv.date. 29/01/2019
SINGAPORE O&BELL WIP No. . : 39237
Yeh.In/Out: 05/12/2018 14/01/201%
*Tel .No. . : 6338 7288
Reg.No. . @ SLU1207L
Closed by .... : Derek Oh Siong Wee Reg.date, : 23/11/2017
Sve Consultant : ACC Mileage . : 20,868
Remarks ...... : Hr Goh Koon Wee Chassis Mo: YFLRFAOOLSBS580%30

Parts/0Op.No Description Hech Qty Price Disc% Pkg Amount G

26£1520089R
625005785R
£2235901eR
L22349675R
&20100101R

FOG LAMP MOULDING OU
GRILLA PANEL IHNNER A
EQUERRE G F

EQUERRE D F

ADHESIYE SEALER FLZ

191.30 10 172.17
820.60 10 T38.54
39.80 10 53.82

75.40 10 &67.86
549.10 10 494,179

Gross Total. 10,250.27

L.atbrouer Total 3,545.00 [ i o 10,250.27
Parts Total 6,705.27 G3T & 7.0% T17.52
Fackage rot-al Q.00 Tobaisoninzg 10,967.7%
Pafd. cowcans 0.00

Please Pay.. 10,967 .79

G5T: 5=3tdRated; 0=0utOfScope; I=ZeroRated
Enquiries must be lodged within 14 days from the invoice date
This is a computer generated invoice. Mo signature is required.

Waarnes Autemaotive Pte. Lid,
45 Leng Kes Road, Singapore 159103 T +65 6430 4530 www.wearnesaubs.com

Co g no. 199S01400R £ GST reg no. MEZBI20628X



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Libi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX. 6256 4315
Reg. Mo 199607198R GST Reg. Mo, 19-8607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD Ref : CC4/ASM18021148/R1pb3s2
RS TOWERSINGARORE 0601 owe: oz |
ATTHN: WINNIE HO Code: ASM
1: Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SKD 3107E Veh. Inspected SLU 1207L
Policy No. P1929461 Coverage () 0.00
Claim No. SEMO13TV Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From WINMIE HO Assign Date 2211/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model RENAULT GRAND SCENIC 1.5 |e.c 1461
Engine No. HIDDEMN Year of Reg. 2017
Chassis No. VF1RFADD158580930 Colour WHITE
Odometer 20833 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General FAIR
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre [195/55 R20 CONTINENTAL B mm
L/H Front Tyre [195/55 R20 CONTINENTAL & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |195/55R20 CONTINENTAL B mm
L/H Rear Tyre |[195/55 R20 CONTIMENTAL & mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE N/S FRONT PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  16/11/2018 Inspection Date D5/12/2018
Survey held at WEARNES AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD
249 ALEXANDRA ROAD
SINGAPORE 159935
Sa. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair
ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 8 Working Days




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Lbi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408533
TEL: B256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 198607198R GST Reg. Mo. 19-9607198-R Page Mo.:1of 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. 5LU 1207L
Qty Description of Parts Condition vf:i':::‘; ?:H Our ﬁ::g%ustad
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|BUMPER LOWER G54 (SN} (CONSISTENT) SCRATCHED 356.20 320.58
1|BUMPER FRT G54 (SN) (CONSISTENT) DEFORMED 1,165.50 1,048.95
1|BUMPER FRT CENTER IN (SN} (CONSISTENT) BENT 122.10 10889
1|BUMPER BRACKET FRT R (SN} (CONSISTENT) BENT 104.50 94.05
1|BUMPER BRACKET FRT L (SN) (CONSISTENT) NECESSARY 104,50 94.05
T|COVERGENT AIR KIT S (SN) (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 114.90 -
1|FOG LAMP MOULDING DU (SN} (CONSISTENT) CRACKED 181,30 172.17
1|FOG LAMP COVER CHROM (SN} (CONSISTENT) CRACKED 191.30 172.17
1|BUMPER FRT SUPPORT B (SN) (COMNSISTENT) MECESSARY 91.80 2.2
1|BUMPER FRT TOFP INNER (SN} (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 560.90 -
1|SUPPORT BRACKET, HEA (SN} (CONSISTENT) NECESSARY £9.94 50.94
1|SUPPORT BRACKET, HEA (SN) (CONSISTENT) NECESSARY 59.94 50.94
1|BUMPER FRT REINFORCE (SN) (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 510.00 -
1|FENDER FRT LH GS4 (SN) (CONSISTENT) DEFORMED 512.70 451 43
1|BRACKET, FENDER FRT (SN) (COMNSISTENT) NECESSARY £88.29 88.29
1|FENDER BRACKET FRT L (SN} (CONSISTENT) NECESSARY 80.91 80.91
1{WHEEL ARCH - FRT LH (SN} (CONSISTENT) DEFORMED 204,60 184.14
10|WHEEL ARCH CLIP JSAL (SN) (CONSISTENT) NECESSARY 53.00 47.70
1[{HEADLAMP LH RBA3 G54 (SN) (CONSISTENT) CRACKED EV7.30 608.57
1|ALLOY RIM 20" RSA3 S (SN) (CONSISTENT) SCRATCHED 8B7.76 BB7.76
1|TYRE PRESSURE SENSOR (SN} (CONSISTENT) MECESSARY 119.10 10719
1|ADHESIVE SEALER FL2 (SN) (CONSISTENT) NECESSARY 549.10 494 19
1|FOG LAMP LH/RH 53/ M (SN) (CONSISTENT) SERVICEAELE 185.50 -
4|PARK SENSOR BOTH CTR (SN) (CONSISTENT) gﬁﬁssmv 1PC 1,719.00 386.91
1|HARNESS - BUMPER FRT (SN} (CONSISTENT) SHORTED 136.98 136.98
[ADDITIONAL)
1|AIR INTAKE HOUSE, BUM (SN} (CONSISTENT) CRACKED 8522 8522
(ADDITIONAL)
1|FEMDER SCREW (SN} (CONSISTENT) (ADDITIONAL) MECESSARY 50.40 50,40
1|GRILLA PANEL INNER A (SN) (CONSISTENT) CRACKED 738.54 73854

(ADDITIONAL)
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Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop ($)) 8)
1|BUMPER FRT CENTRE IN (SN} (CONSISTENT) REFPEATED 100.80 -
(ADDITIONAL)
1|EQUERRE G F (SN} (CONSISTENT) (ADDITIONAL) CRACKED 53.82 53.82
1|EQUERRE D F (SN) (CONSISTENT) (ADDITIONAL) CRACKED 67.86 G67.86
9 962 85 6.705.27
LABOUR
TO REPLACE FRONT BONNET, FRT BUMPER, FRT 2,250.00 1.575.00
BRACKET, FRT LH HEADLAMP, FRT LH FENDER, FRT
VWHEEL ARCH, ETC.
TO PUTTY SPRAY PAINT ON FRT BONNET, FRT 1,600.00 1,200.00
BUMPER, FRT LH FENDER, ETC
TO REFLACE FRONT LH RIM. 50.00 50.00
COMPUTERISED WHEEL ALIGNMENT. 280.00 280.00
TO FOCUS HEADLAMP 110.00 110.00
TO CHECK WIRING INCLUDE RESETTING OF ALL 330.00 330.00
ELECTRICAL MODULES.
4,620.00 3,545.00
GRAND TOTAL 14,582 85 10,250.27
RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS I 10,250.27

U
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MOHAMMED RASUL BIN MOHD YUNUS

Automotive Assessor

HO LEONG CHUAN

Automotive Assessor
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