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Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Ltd 2 gy

BIk 1019, Yishun Industrial Park A #01-374/382, Singapore 768761

TEL: 67556142 (Y15) FAX: 6TS3TT19(YIS)  Email: chmotori singnet com sg
GST201000 ISRE ROB NO:201007 1 S8E

M/S:  AlG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE LTD

T8 SHENTON WAY

#07-16 AlG BUILDING

SINGAPORE 0792120
TEL: 64193000 FAX: 64153727
ATTN: Motor Claim riment

T Nt Ak,

WS Ref: TP/AIG/Y'S & ¥4
Claim Type: Third Party 4)(.“7 A p‘r' Gy

Accident Date; 2171172018
TP Veh Reg No:  SJL3882U

= e b —

E ate Repair C vV
Description

List Price

FRONT BUMPER

FRONT BUMPER RH SIDE RETAINER
FRONT BUMPER CLIPS

RH HEADLAMP

Labuour

PANEL BEATING
PUTTY & RESPRAY ON FRT RH FENDER, FRT BUMPER

L

, oAb
ot i - 2
Estimate No: ESI'HiJIUYIEHUN
Date: 22 Nov 2018
Policy No: MT101775

Veh Reg No:  SJZ1924Y
Make/Model:  HONDA CITY 1.5L I-

VTEC AUTO

Chassis No: MRERHGM26509P020430
Engine No: LI5SAT71810126
Reg. Date: 02/11/2010

e No :SJZ1924Y

[t ] n,u,:_d:'.

]
LA FEsLRYEY

Pl

[ %]
4 TERUTTR B

W SO0 DT e

Acirowestand by Hepumer
Seznailire

[igs

Frejudica” b

U/Price  Quantity List Price Amount
S8 S$
459,80 1 PC 4?“‘- 45980 L
27.50 IPC Yy 2750 —
3,70 6PCS A 2220 —
124,10 IPC A 32400 _—
£13.60
Less 208 16672 vl B8
500.00 1 LA S00.00 3ser
450,00 | LA 450,00 5";4'
950,00 950,00
Total S§ 161688
Add GST @ 7% 113,18
Total Amount Payable % 1,730.06
For Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Lid
AUTHORISED SIGNATURE
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PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owner ID Type;
Owner ID:

Vehicle Details
Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:

Intended Deregistration Date:

Vehicle Make:

| Vehicle Model:

| Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:
Engine No.:
th_assis No.:
Maximum Power Cutput:
Open Market Value:

| Driginal Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:
Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Elr_gihiritv:
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:

Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date:
COE Category:

COE Period(Years):
QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:
Total Rebate Amount:

The information contained herein is correct as at 21 Nov 2018

OK

Singapore NRIC
3B&ED

5JZ1924Y
No

21 Nov 2018

HONDA

CITY 15L I-VTEC AUTO
Silver

2009

L15A71810126
MRHGM26509P020430
B88.0kW (118 bhp)
$17,790.00

02 Nov 2010

02 Nov 2010

1

$17,790.00

Yes
01 Nov 2020
£5.784.00

0_1 Nov 2020

A-Car (1600cc & below)
10

$32,415.00

$6,309.00

$16,093.00

Page 1 of 1




Vehiéle Hub Page 1 of 1

. Enquire Vehicle & Owner Information [ Vehicle No. SJL3882U As At 21 Nov 2018 / 08:35:00)
Law Firm Search Detalls

Search Reason: Insurance claim in refation to traffic accident
Law Firm Case No CHM-S)Z21924

Current Owner Details

Owner |D Type: Singapore NRIC

Owner 1D 513454726

Owiner Name: JENNIFER TEQ GEOK HONG

Registered Address Type:  Private Residential (Condo Apt or House) / Shopping / Office Complesxes
Registered Block/House No.:é

Registered Street Mame:  ANGKLONG LANE

Registered Unit No.: ¥14-01

Registered Building Name: -

Registered Postal Code: 579980
Current Vehicle Details

Vehicle No;: SJL38BZUL
Make Description/Model:  SUZUMKI / SWIFT 1.5 AT ABS AIRBAG 2WD
Insurance Company Mame:  AIG ASLA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE.LTD.

hutps:/ivrl ha.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/lawFirmDetail ?FUNCTION ID=F1801071ET 21/112mR



_Hsiao an_wE !LI{KAutn!

From: Cheng Hoe Mator Pte Ltd (Yishun-June) <chmotor@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 28 November 2018 510 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: Re: Your ref: SIZ 1924Y *Our Ref; CC4/AIG18021111/Kpa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING
SIL 3882U(AIG) & SJZ 1924Y ON 21/11/2018]

Attachments: §JZ21924. mp4

Hi Hsiao Tong,
Attached the video footage.

Pls revert on liability soonest.
Thank you.

Rgds

June Phua

Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Ltd

Tel :67556142

Fax : 67557719

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, November 28, 2018 5:04 PM
To: mailto:chmotor@singnet.com.sg

Cc: Admin A

Subject: Your ref: SJZ 1924Y *Our Ref: CC4/AIG18021111/Kpa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SIL 3882U(AIG) & SJZ
1924Y ON 21/11/2018]

Your ref: SJT 1924Y WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Qur Ref: CC4/AIG18021111/Kpa3

Dear Sir/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING 5JL 3BB2U(AIG) & SJT 1924Y ON 21/11/2018
We refer 1o the above matier,

Attached here with a copy of our insured driver accident report for your easy reference.

We would like to request a copy of video footage as stated your client's GIA report for our necessary
action.



“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed [ inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settiement.”

Best Regards,

Hsino Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@]kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)



PAYMENT ADVICE
Your Ref : AlG Vehicle no. 1 |SJL3882u :
Claimant Vehicle No. : |SJZ1824Y J
Date of Accident (121/11/2018
Traffic Accident involving vehicle/s No. : |UPP THOMSON ROAD TOWARDS LORNIE
ROAD
BREAKDOWN OF PAYMENT/S
S/No. Items Amount Remark

1 Repair cost $ 1.516.06

2 Loss of Rental $ 272.85 $90.95 x 3 days (with GST)

3 LTA Search $ 8.00

TOTAL s 1,796.91

All payment should be made payable to Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Ltd.

Service Adviser : LKK
Contact No. : 6256 3561



2] UBLAVE 1, 201-25 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (0651 01564313

Our Ref: CC4/AIGI8021111/Kpa3
29 NOV 2018

JENNIFER TEO GEOK HONG
6 ANGKLONG LANE

#14-01

SINGAPORE 579980

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJL 3882U & SJZ 1924Y ALONG/AT JUNCTION OF
UPPER THOMSON ROAD AN MARYMOUNT LANE ON 21/11/2018

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster
appointed by your motor insurer, AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to deal with the third
party claim against your policy.

We have received a claim from SIZ 1924 against your motor insurance policy.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is not in your driver's favour
as your vehicle changed lane and collided with third party. Under Motor Accident Guide,
vehicles should keep in the proper lane and change lane only when it is safe. We will
therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and
settlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by
30% (20% for commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim.
However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this
claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

CHEW HSIAO TONG
Case Handler

DID: 6742 3197

FAX: 6741 4108

Email: chewht@lkkauto.com

ce.  AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pie Ltd
(Motor Claims Dept)



AUTHORISATIONTO ACT
(AIG Asia Pacific - Express Third Party Claim)

b G I SHD (the third party claimant) of __B1k 817 Yishun St 81
#02-680 Singapore 760817 (address), owner of SJZ1924Y (vehicle no.) hereby

authorize CHENG HOE MOTOR PTE LTD (“the workshop™) to act for me with respect to

my claim for repair costs and/or rental and/or loss of use (“claim™) for my vehicle no. SJ21924Y that

was damaged pursuant to the accident which occurred on 21{ 11/2018 (gate) along Upp Thomson Road
towards Lornie Road

(location) involving vehicle no/s SJL3882U (“the accident™).

I further authorize the workshop to settle my above mentioned claim in a manner that they deem fit and the
workshop is further authorized to receive payment further to settlement of my claim with payment cheque/'s

being made in favour of the workshop.

I further acknowledge that any settlement the workshop may reach on my behalf is on a without prejudice

and without admission of liability basis insofar as the driver/owner/insurers of the other vehicle's is

concerned.
Dated this 21 (day) of __NoV (month) IHE (vear)
7 N\
O S
L -':_.'
Signed by “the third party claimant™ Signed by “the workshop”

{with chop if applicable) {with chop)



RELEASE VOUCHER
(AIG Asia Pacific - EXPRESS THIRD PARTY CLAIM)

“We'l, _CHENG HOE MOTOR PTE LTD _ (“the workshop™) hereby confirm that we'l have
reached an agreement with the appointed surveyor of AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Lid LKK
AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (name of surveyor) with respect io the amount claimed for
551516.06 {Repair Cost), $$272.85 (Loss of Rental), S38.00 (Disbursement), for vehicle no
SJIZ1924Y that was damaged pursuant 1o the accident which occurred 21711201 8{date) along

Upp Thomson Road towards Lornie Road (locanon) involving vehicle no's SJIL3882U.
This is pursuant to the inspection conducted on 22/11/2018 (date) at “the workshop™,

We/l confirm that we'l are/am authorized by the owner Ong Gim San (“the third pany
claimant™) of vehicle no. 8JZ1924Y make the claim as set out in the above paragraph
and we/l have full authority to settle the matter on hisher behalf in a manner that we/l

deem fit. We/l enclose herein the letter of authority given by “the third party claimant”.

Wel further confirm that we/l will indemnify AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd for all damages,
loss and/or expense that they will or have already incurred in the event that “the third party claimant™
afier the above said agreement lodges & further claim against the former for any loss and expenses

suffered pertaining 1o costs of repairs and 'or rental and/or loss of use pursuant to the damage

S1Z1924Y (vehicle no.) as a result of the accident

Wesl confirm that the agreement reached above is in full and final settlement of any claim of
“the third party claimant™ pursuant to the accident and that further this settlement is reached on a

without prejudice and without admission of lability basis.

This agreement is subject to the application of Singapore law and the Singapore Courts have

exclusive junisdiction over any dispute arising out of the same.

Dated this !l,l {day) of lﬂ-‘n {month) 2019 (vear)

i

- . s
Signed by appointed surveyor Signed by “the workshop™ (with chop)

L |

|
.




Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Ltd

Bk 1019, Yishun Indusirial Pack A #01-3747382, Singapore THETH]
TEL: 675380142 (Y15) FAX: 7257719 (YIS} Emadl: chmtiriisingmet com sg
GST20100115S8E RCH NO:201001158E

TAX INVOICE
M/S:  AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTELTD
78 SHENTON WAY NO: CL8190019
#07-16 AlG BUILDING Date: 23 Jan 2019
SINGAPORE 079120 Policy No: MT101775
TEL: 64 193000 FAX: 64153727 Veh Reg No: SJZ1924Y
ATTN: Motor Claim Department Make/Model: HONDA CITY 1.5L 1-
VTEC AUTO
WS Ref: TPAIG/YS Job No: IC1599024
Claim Type:  Third Panty
Accident Date:  21/11/2018
TP Veh Reg No:  SIL3SR2U
PAGE:)
Description |  Quantity | List Price Amount
SS b ]
To Supply all replaced pans, all necessary and agreed labour & 1 PC SS 141688 S5 141688
miscellaneous charges.
(As recommended by your appointed survevor)
Total S8 141688
Add GST (@ 7% 0018
Total Amount payable 58 1.516.06

For Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Lid

¥
By
\

¥

—

v

E &% O.E AUTHORISED SIGNATURE



PERFECT DRIVING & SERVICE

38 WOODLANDS IND PARK E1 TAX INVOICE NO. . __ 180269
#05-05, SINGAPORE 757700 GST Reg No. : 530680271
TEL : 64505278
Bill to : ONG GIM SAN DATE:  24-Nov-18
S/NO. [DESCRIPTIONS UNIT | RATE |AMOUNTS _
1) |SGY8548U 3 $85.00 255.00
(22/11/18 TO 24/11/18)
NETT 255.00
GST (7%) 17.85
TOTAL 272.85




-

PERFECT DRIVING & SERVICE

38 WOODLANDS IND PARK E1 TEL : 64595278
7~05-05 SINGAPORE 757700 OPERATING HOURS
(ROC/GST NO. 53068827L) MONDAY TO SATURDAY
(SAM TO 6PM)
RENTAL AGREEMENT
Karne Deits of Birthy
f}hﬂ Lim Sqn 3. 2-14 b4
[Acdrmus ez pation
e 813 Yiwun & 5
‘FD Coda o
1 -Gkv F(u ¥
MWNM of Birth Mz Mo,
Ton ?vrmn.. Gunt / vt - 29.9. 5L S‘I:‘.;]u,;j"-:r -
Ry — _ ICCCUpation B [Oriving License Ne Obtained/ By
L1 ‘[hhu»\ 58 B Jo- ez
= Coda [Contact Mo Mobsia Phone No.
016w T adg | 962
IVEHICLE NO Ofy B4 IMODEL
_.k.‘HGH hETUHN “Emming Dot For ectusl et s CHECK (M
oHECKOUT ™ 2 u|\&” [ [2pirn g"w wl E % % % F
CHECK IN ™ duli % ™ ’}o‘;w ieage .
-
[MPORTANT NOTES - JUNIT] JRATE (S5) [TOTAL (S8)
1) This vefacie & resincted 1o SINGAPORE use only, TE
2 Mmmumd-ﬂmmm:—iﬁg SCOUNT
muthonsed. kcermed and signing thin agresmant may drive the vehics ST 5%
3} Tha twrer shal be liatie to pey the firet S52000 murencs poicy sxcess OTAL
for demage & vehicie pius i033 of 8MINGS Wil SAMAgET vehicie i unde! eI SION|
H)  Third party Lisoility = the first §2000.00 in sny sccident immlhving Third Party Claims
5]  Hirer in responsdbie lor 8l parking fines & raffic summan
[E] Vehicle should ba retumed af the sams time as collechan except on Saturdsy
wisre retum trne s belore 12pm
7] Hourly extermion is charged st 1/5 of the dally rate
f‘ hmmg—-mmlmwnw
For he comfort of atfer users, pleses refrain from smoking, sating or camying of
pets in ine car A cheaning charge 53100 will be imposed for srmoky or dirty vehicke
10] Flease check that you have not left any of your personal belongmgs in the
mmwm-mm-umum-hnhmmwm
11) Tha vehicie s NOT covered by & motos inaumences palicy covenng personil sccident
Insurance for the hirer, e passengens o BUthonssd drser
12) No repscement of vetncle in any accxent
[DEPOSIT (refundable) 55
ICHANGED OVER FROM VEH DATE

/e have resd and Bgres (o he =ms and condiions of the rental sgresment Bbove and an sat oveneat

1/We detiare hat all information green on this form (s frue and accursie w
&1{\&

[Hiter's Signature

MHMWEW&




A.C. SYED & PARTNERS

ADVOCATES & SOLICITORS

COMMISSIONER FOR OATHS
101A UPPER CROSS STREET, #13-23 PEOPLE'S PARK CENTRE, SINGAPORE 058358
TEL : 6536 7411 & FAX : 6534 1011

LA o T A

[T

TO OUR PROFESSIONAL CHARGES for acting for you in the above matier including where necessary perusals.
mmmmmmwm;mm.m.m.uw
- m_mwdmmmmmmmmnmm“umwhm

enirusied 10 w8 inclusive of all sowvce.
DDA
1 21172018 YP2882C SJT9825D 2112018
2 1172018 SGB11365 SJL3958K 171172018
3 3N1/2018 SDT64B0E SGR7629M 21112018
El 5/11/2018 YPST3IR SLT4539P 31/10/2018
5 5/11/2018 SLS8009G SCZ1441G SN12018
|6 12018 SLU2740G SKWI1123X 4/11/2018
7 8/11/2018 SKS476E SGD77197) T/11/2018
B 9-Nov SLZ923H SLU4765L 812018
o 1271172018 SGGE6TTA GBHSS32H 121172018
10 1271112018 SCR340M SLU9303* 1071172018
11 14/1172018 SGLI980T SLS1980Y 14/1172018
12 16/11/2018 GBC31X SKISTD 11/11/2018
13 1671172018 SFESBEBA SKAI1596F 21972018
14 177112018 SMD3641 SGSERITC 17/11/2018
15 19/11/2018 CB7347TH SLG29935 17/11/201 8
16 19/11/2018 SMD2865 SKES838K 151172018
17 1971172018 GY3326R SL1.4255A 17/11/2018
18 21/11/2018 SJL3882U SJZ1924 2111172018
19 21/11/2018 YL3188M GBG4939 2011172018
20 2111/2018 XD5006X YNIGBIL 20/112018
21 2171122018 SKE3089T SKAGIBIE 201172018
22 2271172018 SLM2198P SGF27418 22/11/2018
23 24/11/72018 SLE6665E  SLB278M 2371172018
24 26/1172018 SIX2743G SLD497L 23/11/2018
25 26/11/2018 SKV6777G  GBD2S6IP  26/1 172018
26 28/1172018 GBF4565E SFMI331Z  26/11/2018
27 29/11/2018 GBF5122T SJP4621T 28/11/2018
27 searches per search
|[SINGAPORE : TWO HUNDRED & SIXTEEN ONLY.)
M/s. AKI SYED & PARTNERS
ADV & SOLICITORS
SINi RE
k We reserved the right to forward a subseguent bill for any
disbursements omitied herein.
E&OE P

3 216.00




Merimen e-Claims Page | of |

.++CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Fastiang

iCL-AIH SUBFOLDER TRACKING -
ir Case 'Nntgl‘;lg Est Submitted | Ad) Assigned Ad) Rpt Ad] Submitted s Aith'ed | Geatus
g |72 Mo 2018 Bome P ssraess  |ss141688 [ R oy
mm] | ean Ad) Ree Edit Estimates | | view Aot | Cancel Case |

Referance Clalm Details

| [Created by adjuster]

JENNIFER TEQ GEOK HONG, [D: S1165472G
ONG GIM SAN, [0: 515338660

. 1 23/11/2018 0B8:00 - ;59
Ssegsey SRS R [#6 Months and 19 Days From LTA Reg Date (Man 7r)]
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Preview
NOTE: TO BE COMPLETED BY SURVEYOR TEAM
THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT
(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)
1'4":!1[::!: No: SJL3882U (Insd veh) Modal: HONDA CITY 1.5 L I-VTEC (A)
SJZ1924Y (TP veh)
|Date of Accident: |21/11/2018
Global Sum Settiement | - | [ ] Yes [ 1X] No
Repair Eslimate 5 1,730.084
Final Repair Cosl '8 1.516.06
Loss of Use $ days al $0.00 per day
Rental (if any) '3 27285| 3 days
LTA ! GIA Search Fee '8 800
Others: 5 0.00
3
Final Settlement Sum s 1,786 91
Is Third Party Workshop GIA Registered? [X 1] YES [ ] NOD (Kindly indicate
below)
A) For Non GIA Registered Workshop: Agreed Liahbility (%)
B) For GIA Registered Workshop: E%LA Applicable: Yes/ Me- BOLA Scenario No
BOLA Liability: 100 (%) Assessed Liability (*): (%)
" Assessed Liabilily fo be filled anly for chaln collsions and for cases where BOLA doas not apply.
Remarks
Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown
1) |Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Lid s 1,796.91
2) -1
3) 4
JOANNE LEE KHANG MIN 17 Jun
2018
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid Date

Please attach all the supporting documents to the form.
{Final Repair Bill; Rental Invoice; Release Voucher; Authorisation to Act; Survey Report; Medical
Report! Bill (if any)
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (coregne 1sss071sar)

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-B805 Emall: sur@ kkauto.com;assignments@|kkauto com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No: CC4/AIG18021111/KGA3IQ2

Date: 17/06/2018
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pla. Lid.  Palicy No: 2100464354
Sieman Yenicl s 26y Insured Vehicle No :  SJL3882U
Date of Loss: 21/117/2018 Nature of Claim: TP Claim No: 4B5073BBBTSG
ON OF VEHICL|
Reg No: SJZ1924Y
Make & Model: HONDA CITY, 1.5 L IL'WVTEC (A) Engine No: L15A71810126
Reg. Date: 021172010 (Man. Year; 2008) Chassis No: MRHGM28509P020430
Colour: Metallic Silver Odometer: 151137 km
Engine Capacity: 1487 cc
Market Value/New Car Price: N/A
Sum Insurad (S$): Market Value/Mew Car Price
ONDITION OF V| AT THE TI F h 4
General Condition: Sleering (Serviceable). Yes Footbrake (Serviceable); Yes
Handbrake [Serviceable), Yes Engine Modification No  Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 1B85/60 R15 Rear Tyre Size: 185/60 R15
Front Left Side: Yokohama 8 mm Rear Left Side: Yokohama 8 mm
Front Right Side: Yokohama 8 mm Rear Right Side; Yokohama 6 mm
The above valued represent he remaining yre reads depih
COST OF CLAIMS - _Repairer's Adjuster's  Difference _lefj_|
Parts 666.88 666.88 0.00 0.00
Miscellaneous llems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 850.00 750.00 200.00 21.05
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Gross Total (5§) 1,616.88 1,416.88 200.00 12.37
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (5§) 113.18 99.18 14.00 12.37
Nett Amount (5§) 1,730.06 1,516.06 214.00 12.37
+ Car Rental (3.0 x $§90.95/day) (S§) 27285
+ Doc/Search Fee (S§) 8.00
Nett Liability (55) 1,796.91
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 217112018
Date Inspected: 22/11/2018 Inspectad At Cheng Hoe Malor Pte Lid (Yishun)
Blk 1018 #01-374/382, Yishun Industrial
Park A
Singapore 768761
Estimated Period of Repair: 3.0days
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Adjuster: KENNETH KONG Manager: Chong Pui Lin

NOTE: This mport represants aur findings af the time and place of inspecton shsted hevem, Such inspection has been camed ouf fo the bes? of our
kniowigdge and abilty but any other Nability under any other circumatances (s hemby sxpressly axchaded.
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REPAIR DETAILS
Recommended Parts
No. Qty PartNo. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 1 *FRONT BUMPER Buckied 459 B0FL *459.80FL
2 1 *FRONT BUMPER RH SIDE RETAINER Distorted 27.50FL *27.50FL
3 6 *FRONT BUMPER CLIPS MNecessary 22 20FL 22 20FL
e 1 *RH HEADLAMP Cut 324.10FL *324 10FL
F=Franchise par. L=ListilemDisc
Sub Total (S$) 833.60 833.50
- List ltem Discount on L ltems 20.00/20.00% (S$) 166.72 166.72
Total Parts (SS) 666.88 666.88
Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. |
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Recommended Miscellaneous Iltems

There are no new miscellaneous llems selected.

Recommended Labour

Ne Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount

Labour ltems

1 PANEL BEATING New 500.00 350.00

2  PUTTY & RESPRAY ON FRT RH FENDER ,FRT BUMPER New 45000 400.00

Gross Labour Cost [S§) 950.00 750.00
Report was unsubmitied during this print-out ]
< END OF ESTIMATES >
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