Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 21 November, 2018 2:20 PM

To: lionel.tan@fwd.com; assignments; SUR

Cc: Asher Sng (LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: RE: SKF4162C- Hyundai Elantra (TP claim) Our Ref: 1201800015314/LT
Categories: HMK

Dear Lionel,

Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards,
Catherine Chong | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: lionel.tan@fwd.com [mailto:lionel.tan@fwd.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 21 November, 2018 2:14 PM

To: assignments@lkkauto.com; sur@lkkauto.com

Cc: AsherSng@Ikkauto.com

Subject: FW: SKF4162C- Hyundai Elantra (TP claim) Our Ref: 1201800015314/LT

Hi

Please attend to TP survey & direct settlement.

Regards,
Lionel

From: Muhammad Asyraf Noor Azman [mailto:muhammad.asyraf@hyundaimotors.com.sg]
Sent: Wednesday, 21 November, 2018 12:48 PM

To: Motor Claims SG - SG Common

Cc: Heng Swee Hee; Eddie Ang Khea Chwee; Chris Ang; Ismail B. Taib; Ng Leng Kiat

Subject: SKF4162C- Hyundai Elantra (TP claim) Our Ref: 1201800015314/LT

Hi,
Above attach to arrange survey at our workshop.

Thanks & Warmest Regard
Muhammad Asyraf

KOMOCO MOTORS PTE LTD

253 Alexandra Road, Singapore 159936
M: (65) 9070 0157 T: (65) 6473 5588

ATTENTION:
The email and any attachments transmitted with it are private and confidential and intended solely for the
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use of the individual or entity to whom they are addressed. If you have received this email in error, please
notify the sender immediately and delete this email and any attachments from your system. You should not
use, disclose, copy or store this email and any attachments.

Messages and attachments are scanned for all viruses known. However, you are advised that you open any
attachments at your own risk. If this message contains password-protected attachments, the files have NOT
been scanned for viruses by our mail domain. Please always scan for viruses before opening any
attachments.



