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CITY CAB PTE LTD L*'_"(\;' — Ll Q l R
REPAIR ESTIMATE*® >
VEHICLE X0 : SHC 328U DATE 2071172018 -
e Ler - Kalnn

MODEL : MERCEDES BENZ VIANO (REAR)

Quy Parts Description/ Labour Type Unit Price Amount
Rear Bumper o~ S 1,372.00
Bumper L'H Side, RR .~ 5
Bumper R’H Side, RR x s
Bumper Bracket 2 S 12050 | §

Tail Gate Assy g
Tail Gate Trim Cover < §
Tal Gate Weathership ~~ § 13340
Tail Gate Mercedes Star Logo — £ 45 46
Tml Gate "2.2" Logo g 78.00
3
£
s
5
5
b
5
S

473.60
473.60
241.00
1,051.98
320.00

Tail Gate "CDI " Logo .~ 78.00
Tail Gate Via No Logo .~ 78.00
Tail Gate Lock Hd 273,40
Tail Gate Lock Outer Handle =~ 175.54
Tail Gate Step Gamish 104.34
Tail Gate Bonom Handle o

[LIRAIL

Rear Windscreen Glass P 1.273.98
Windscreen Wiper Arm,RR b 201.88
SUB TOTAL S 9.284.18

LESS 20% S 1.856.84

DISCOUNTED TOTAL §$ 7.427.34

Reverse Sensor /

S 2BR.00 INett
Rear Bumper Rubber Mat o~~~ S 50,00 |[Nett
Tail Gate "MAXICAB" Logo  ~~ S 30,00 |Net
Rear Windscreen Sealam -~ \ 5 4600 |Nett
(s 41400
_,—'—""-_'_.---
/( : A,.L /R~
Labour Charge {ﬂ
Panel Beating / e / ” ﬁ{ $ 1,0800
Spray Painting Charge fos | § f}lﬂlﬁ
Wiring Charge x|$ 50
Tuff Kote 20|$ 3eT0
RemoveRefix Reverse Sensor ro|® bl
Remove/Relix Tail Gate feo | § IHT00
TOTAL LABOLUR S 1,.870.00
ESTIMATE TOTAL $9,711L.M

Ths is an initial estimate based on a visual inspection of the above vehicle. The final repair quanium will

be prepared afler the vehacle is surveved by a motor Survevar appointed by the insurance company.,




Asher Sng (LKKAuto

From: Jim Wong See Pah <jimwong@cdge.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 4 June 2019 2:55 PM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: Your Ref: CC18110575/SHC328U/JW(st), ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHC 328U & SKA

7144L ON 19/11/2018

Dear Ms Sng

Please process settlement in sum S 7380.00 for resolving our property damage claim amicably.
Thank you.

Best Regards

Jim Wong
Claims Dept / ComfortDelgro Engineering Pte Ltd

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 4 June 2019 12:57 PM

To: Jlim Wong See Pah

Subject: Your Ref: CC18110575/SHC328U/JW(st), ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHC 328U & SKA 7144L ON 19/11/2018

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE"
SAVEAS TO COSTS

Your Ref: CC18110575/SHC328U/1W(st)
Qur Ref; CC3/EQI18021060/K1ea3

Dear Sirs,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHC 328U & SKA 7144L ON 19/11/2018
We refer to the above matter.

On a without prejudice, for a quick and amicable settlement, we propose the settlement at Global Sum 557,380.00 (all-
in).

Pl=ase kindly let us have your acceptance.

Thank You.

Besl Regards
Asher Sng | Cose Handier
LEE Auto Consullants Pe Lid



phbne: 68416051 | emoll: gshersng@kkaulo.com | fox: 6741-4108
Bik 51, Paya Ut industial Pork, Ubi Avenue |, #02-25 | 5{408933)

This message and any attachments may contain confidential privileged or proprietary information. If you are not the intended recipient. kindly notify us
and delete this message and #s attachments immediately, and please be advised that using, copying, distributing or disclosing amy contents tharein is
nol allowed Statemants partaining ta any matter outside our business are not to be taken as endorsed by ComforiDelGro Corporation Limited or ds
ielated companies The commeants/propasals provided are for diecussion purpases only and are subject to approvals. Nothing herein shall constitute a
binding agreement between the parties. Nedher party shafl be bound in any way to any term or condition sxcept as agreed in & writlen agreement
signed by the duly authorised representatives of bath partles

ComfarDelGra - & Green Office certified by the Singapone Environment Council - is committed to presarnving the envinanment We encourage you 1o
print this anly If necessary

ComfortDelGro Enginesnng Pte Lid [Registration No. 199506048W]




Mei Kwan {LKKAutn!

From: Janet Tan <janel.tan@eqinsurance.com.sg>

Sent: Saturday, 23 February, 2019 11:53 AM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Cc: Asher Sng (LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: FW: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SKA7144L (O1 : EQI -DM18HO03180/T)
AND SHC328U (TP : LKK REF - CC3/EQI18021060/K1ea3) on 19/11/2018

Attachments: Preliminary Advice pdf, TP ESTIMATE + SUPP.pdf. TP GIA REPORT. pdf:
SAS2507477 PDF

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Completed

Categories: HMEK

Dear Mei Kwan
As attached.

Regards,

Janet Tan
Senior Executive | Claims

ec:insu ance

y ','?-l W Vel
EQ Insurance Company Limited

5 Maxwell Road #17-00 Tower Block MND Complex Singapore 069110
did 65 6496 9032 | tel 65 6223 9433 ext 032 | fax 65 6223 4190
www.eginsurance.com.sg

“
‘.‘Jmmwjrtnjualr- ‘.ﬂ"‘—'_'_

Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the

From: Mel Kwan (LEKAuto) [mailto:Melkwan@lkkauto.com|

Sent: Tuesday, Novemnber 27, 2018 7:12 PM

To: Janet Tan <janet.tan@eqginsurance.com.sg>

Cc: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-
a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SKA7144L (Ol : EQI - TBA) AND SHC328U (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/EQI18021060/K1ea3) on 19/11/2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Janet,

We refer to the above matter.



COMFORIDELGRO

OurRef : CC18110575/ SHC 328U /JW(st) ENGINEER'NG
Your Ref COGE Tex Clasms Dept
Date ; 26-Nov-18 58 Loyang Driva 4ih Fir

Singapors 306953

EQ Insurance Company Limited
5 Maxwell Road, MND Complex
#17-00 Tower Block

Singapore 069110

Attn : Motor Claims Department WITHOUT PREJUDICE ik
Dear Sir :
ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR TAXI SHC 328U YOUR INSURED SKA7144L

AND OTHER ON 18.11.18

We are the authorised repair workshop for Citycab Pte Ltd, the owner of motor Vehicle No
SHC 328U  which was involved in the captioned accident with your insured vehcile.

The vehicle owner and the taxi driver concerned have requested and authorized us to assist

them in presenting their claims against the party responsible for all aplicable matters

arising from the damage to the vehicle.

As the accident was caused by the negligent act of your insured driving . SKAT144L
we are submitting these claims for your consideration on behalf of the claimants

TAXI OWNER’S CLAIM

1 Cost of Repair $ 6,420.00
2 45 dayslossofRental@ $ 163.52 perday $ 73684 000000 L
3 Survey Report Fees (Surveyed by M/s LKK) 5 -
4 LTA / GlASearch Fees $ 7.49
5 GIA / Paolice Report Fees 5 =
6 Towing / Medical / Transporation Fees 5 -
SubTotal: § 7,163.33
HIRER'S CLAIM
7 45 dayslossofilncome@ $ 8000 perdays $ 360.00

TotalClaims: § 752333
We enclose herewith the following documents to support the claims: -

a)  Original repair bill and photocopies of photographs 4 pcs
b)  LTA search slip/s of - SKAT144L
)  GIA/ Police reportis of - SHC 3280

d)  Letter of authority from owner / hirer / operator
[ ) Witness statement/s ( ) Towing/Medical bill'receipts ( ) Cerlificate of Insurance
{ % ) Pholograph/s of Accident Sceni ( x ) Downtime/Mileage record { x ) Rental Rate lettar

Kindly lock into the matter and let us hear from you on the settlement of the said claims as
soon as possible.

Please note that it is a condition of any settlemeant reached that it shall be without prejudice
to any personal injury claim (if any) of the taxi driver

Yours faithfully

Jme Wong

COGE Claims Departmeni

Tel 6214 8374 Fax 6214 1843 Emall : imwong@cdge.com sg

This 1s a computer generated letter. No signature is required.

COMFORIDELGRO G 4



Asher Snﬂ SI.KKAutui

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 23 May 2019 5:03 PM

To: STANLEYCHANGED@GMAILCOM

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKA 71441 AND SHC 328U ON 19/11/2018

Our Ref: CC3/EQIIB021060/K lea3
23 MAY 2019
CHANG KWOK CHOY

Dear SirfMadam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SEA 71441 AND SHC 328U ON 19/11/2018

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LIMITED to resolve the
claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will therefore proceed to
negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Pany.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact
us within 10 days from the date of this letter,

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD)(if any) will be affected and reduced by 30% (20% for
commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your policy has a NCD
protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

Asher

Case Handler
DID: 6841 6051
FAX: 6741 4108

Email: Ashersng @ [kkauto.com

c.C. EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LIMITED
{Motor Claims Dept)



CDG.VARS.V LettofAuthorisation Page 1 of |

LETTER OF AUTHORISATION

[NAF / PAF)
ACCIDENT INVOLVING  VIAND (Maxi Cab) SHC328U , SKA7144L ON 19-Nov-18 14:15
ALONG BARTLEY ROAD EAST (SLIP RD ) AIRPORT RD,
I 7 We TAN BODON SENG (CHEN ... (Hirer] NRIC No.: 57130369A
and/for (R=laf) NRIC No.:

Tax) Number SHC32BU
héreby authorise ComfortDelGro Enginearing Pte Ltd[CDGE):

1, To submit myfour claims for damages, costs and expensa, including loss of income, loss of rental,
medical fee and legal costs

2. To nave absolule giscrelion 1o agres Lo any settignient o compensabon amount in respect of myfour claim
against third party (except personal Injuries and medical clalins),

3. To sign Cuscharge Voucher on my/our behall
4. To accept any payment (claim proceas] in respect of the danm against thirg party and payment by chegue

shall be forward directly to COGE in accordance with CODGE's instruction and made in favour of
“ComforiDelGro Englnearing Pte Lid",

Date 189-Nov-2018
Name of Hirsr TAN BOON SENG (CHEN WENCHENG)
Hirer NRIC 571303694 Signature
»
Adaress 261C PUNGGOL WAY #07-331
823261
Contact No. AB00O3555

hitp:/Vedgek 2srv: 82/Runtme/Runtime/Runtime/ Runtime View/CDG VAR ... 19112018



COMFORIDELGRO ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Lid
* ENGINEERING

r of COMFORTDELGRO

“FOMEARY REG. NO.: 199506048W

GST REG. NO. M2-8921817-3 TAX INVOICE Page: 1
8010325 VEHCLE NO NO/DATE
SHC 328U 91409897 26.11.2018
E0 INSURANCE COMPANY LIMITELD
MAKE JOB_ND.
MERCEDES BENZ 305241122

5 MAXWELL ROAD TOWER BLOCK #17-00 o

SINGAPORE 069110 MODEL . ODOMETER READING
VIANO CDI 2.2L

CONTACT NO: 82239433

DATE OF REG

13.06.2013

CHASSIS CODE JOB TYFE

o WDF&3981323797383

. Description : 3P 19.11.18

Invoice for Lump Sum Repair

Total Lump Sum Repair Amt &,000.00
Add GST @ 7.000 W 420.00
Total Invoice amount 6,420.00
Issied by : CHEWEEELENG 26,11,2018 11:33:52

Repair Type : CESO0/57/37
Payment ‘f'ype-- Term : /Credit 30 days

ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Lid
& membor of COMPORMDE CRg

ACCOUNT No INVOICE No AMOUNT BANK/CHQ No

Head Office:
205 Braddell Road
Singapore 3T9701

Kindly pote thist no receipt shall be issued uniess requested
CUSTOMER'S COPY




OurRef  CC18110575 's o CityCab

Date: 26 November 2018

TO WHOM IT MAY CONCERN

Dear Sir/Madam

ACCIDENT ON 19/11/2018 @ 14:15hrs

ALONG BARTLEY ROAD EAST (SLIP RD ) AIRPORT RD.
INVOLVING SKAT144L

We refer to the above-mentioned accident and wish to inform that CityCab Pte Ltd is
the registered owner of the taxi bearing vehicle registration number SHC0328U (the
"Taxi"). The Taxi was hired to TAN BOON SENG (CHEN WENCHENG) IC NO
S7130369A a registered hirer-operator of CityCab Pte Ltd at the time of occurrence of
the aforementioned accident at a rental rate $163.52 per day (inclusive of GST).

Please be advised that the Taxi was insured with MS First Capital Insurance Ltd on
a third party basis at the material time of the accident.

We wish to confirm that the aforesaid hirer-operator had obtained our permission (o
undertake repairs for damage on the Taxi arising from the said accident with a molar

warkshop of his cholee,

Please liaise with the said hirer-operator or his authorized workshop directly for
settlement of claims with third party's insurance company in respect of the said
accident.

Yours faithfully

Christine Tay
Assistant Manager, Fleet Safety

This is a computer generated letter. No signature is required.

383 Sin Ming Drive Singapare 575717 Mainline +65 8555 1188 Facsimile +65 6453 3183
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Enguire Vehicle Insurer
* VehicleMo.  Incident Date/Time SearchStatus  Insurance Company Coda Insarance Compary Mame
SHATI44L 1Moy 20187 1411500 Succ=sshil g0 EC) IMSURAMCE COMPANY LTD

Previous OK
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Company Reglstration Mo, 198607 198R

i
pt
ki
L
3
g

21 LREAVE L, #2258 PAYA DB INTHUSTHIAL PARK, SINGAPORE J08%33 TEL 1 (0651 62563561 FAX { (065) 62564015

To : Mis EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD Date: 18/06/2018
THIRD DIRE
Vehicls No SKa 7144L (Insd Veh) |Your Ref, No. : DM18HO03180/JT
ehicle No. -
SHC 328U (TP Veh) |Our Ref. No.: CGBJ’EQHEDZEED.FKME‘ME
Date of Accident 19/11/2018 -
Liability 100% B
Final Repair Cost |8 6.420.00 |. B
Loss of Income :$ 22500 | 4.5 days -
Rental (If any) : 9 735.84 | 4.5 days B -
Others: 3 7.49
$
7,388.33
Final Settlement Sum |: § 7.380.00 |GLOBAL SUM
Remarks _

Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown
1) |COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD ‘5 _T_.:'?.BIJ.GD

JOANNE LEE
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd




’ V L“’ LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

L :
Al A §1 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park. Singapors 408933
- TEL 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg No' 198607198R GST Reg Mo 19-9607198-R

Afflllated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD Ref : CCYEQIMBO21060/K1ealdq2
O TORER B AW
#17-00 TOWER BLOCK Date: 18-06-2018 .
MND COMPLEXSINGAPORE 063110
Code: EQI
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh, SKA T144L Veh. Inspected SHC 328U
Policy No. DMPPHQ18-001287 Coverage (%) 0.00
Claim No. DM18HOO03180AT Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 20/M1/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model MERCEDES BENZ VIAND c.c 2143
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2013
Chassis No. WDFB3061323767383 Colour WHITE
Odomaeter 676258 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification STANDARD ALLOY RIM
General FAIR
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |225/80 R16C HANKOOK T mm
L/H Front Tyre |225/60 R16C HANKOOK 7 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |225/60 R16C HANKOOK 7 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |225/60 R16C HANKOOK 7 mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS
5. General Information
Accident Date  19/11/2018 Inspection Date 201172018
Survey held at COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTELTD
59 LOYANG DRIVE
SINGAPORE 508865
5a. Remarks
A)JTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair
ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR 3 Working Days




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408833
TEL:! 6258 35681 FAX: 68256 4315

Reg. No: 189607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page No. 1 of 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SHC 328U
——— o —moaa Estimate By | Our Adjusted
aty Description of Parts Condition wm“gn ‘{;‘{
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR BUMPER DEFORMED 1,.372.00 1.372.00
1|BUMPER L/H SIDE RR CRACKED 47360 473.60
1|BUMPER R/H SIDE ,RR BUM SERVICEABLE AT3.60 -
2|BUMPER BRACKET @5120.50 SERVICEABLE 241.00 -
1|TAIL GATE ASSY DENTED 3,851.68 3851988
1|TAIL GATE TRIM COVER SERVICEABLE 320.00 -
1| TAIL GATE WEATHERSTRIP TORMN 133.40 133.40
1|TAIL GATE MERCEDES STAR LOGO NECESSARY 4546 45 46
1|TAIL GATE '2.2' LOGOD NECESSARY T78.00 78.00
1|TAIL GATE "CDr LOGO MECESSARY 78.00 78.00
1|TAIL GATE VIA NO LOGO NECESSARY 78.00 78.00
1|TAIL GATE LOCK JAMMED 27340 273.40
1|TAIL GATE LOCK DUTER HANDLE JAMMED 175.54 175.54
1|TAIL GATE STEP GARNISH CRACKED 104 34 104 34
1|TAIL GATE BOTTOM HANDLE SERVICEABLE 10.00
1|REAR WINDSCREEN GLASS SERVICEABLE 127368
1|{WINDSCREEN WIPER ARM ,RR SERVICEABLE 201.88
1|TAILLAMP LOWER GARNISH LH (ADDITIOMAL) MISSING 48.50 45 50
1|REAR WIPER MOTOR (ADDITIONAL) CRACKED §578.10 57B.10
LESS 20% DISCOUNT -1,982 38 -1,478.26
782842 5.913.06
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|REVERSE SENSOR (SN) SHORTED 288.00 288.00
1|REAR BUMPER RUBBER MAT (SN) NECESSARY 50.00 50.00
1|TAIL GATE 'MAXICAB' LOGO (SN) MECESSARY 30.00 30.00
1|REAR WINDSCREEN SEALANT (SN) MECESSARY 46.00 46.00
414,00 414,00
LABOUR
PANEL BEATING. 1,000.00 600.00
SPRAY PAINTING CHARGE. 500.00 400.00

Report Ref No. CC3/EQI18021060/K1ea3g2




’ VV LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

-H; ;; — 51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
- TEL: 6256 3581 FAX: 6258 4315
Reg. Mo 189607158R GST Reg. No. 18-8607188-R Page No..2of 2
: T Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition -
Waorkshop ($)) ($)
WIRING CHARGE. NOT NECESSARY 50.00 :
TUFF KOTE 50.00 20.00
REMOVE/REFIX REVERSE SENSOR. 120.00 30.00
REMOVE/REFIX TAIL GATE 150.00 100.00
1,870.00 1,150.00
GRAND TOTAL 10,213.42 T.477.06
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 16,000.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION) 2
Report Ref No. CC3/EQI1B021060/K1ealdq2
/
[l
KALVIN ANG WEI KUN HO LEONG CHUAN
Automotive Assessor | Investigator Automotive Assessor

SCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES - This Repor is mads salely (or the use snd benalll of ihe Clisrl named an the front pags of ihis Repart.




Joanne Lee !LKK Autn!

From: Joanne Lee (LKK Auto) <report@ikkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 20 June 2019 3:14 PM

To: ‘janet.tan@eqinsurance.com.sg'

Cc: ‘ashersng@lkkauto.com'

Subject: FW: TP Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SKA 7144L (Ql) and SHC 328U (TP) on
19/11/2018

Attachments: LKK REPORT & PHOTO.pdf: TP DS SUPPORTING DOCUMENT . pdf

Dear SirMadam,

Please be informed that the above-mentioned case had been settled.
Enclose herewith final report & relevant documents for your necessary action please.

Thank you,

Best Regards.

JOANNE | Reports

LKK Auto Consultants Pte.Ltd.

Phone: 6256-3561 Ext.111 Fax: 6741-4108 emall: report@lkkauto.com
Blk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #01-25 Singapore 408933



