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o i Consultants
A WE = Pt L Company Registration Mo 10860T198R
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S UBEAVE 1. #12-25 PAYA UBL INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065} 61563561 FAX : 1065 62504315

Yourref:  DI18008015MFSH

Our ref: CS/FCIIB02103% Avh Date : 21/12/2018

The Motor Claims Department
MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

Dear Sir/Madam,
INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. SLC 4918T

We thank you for your instruction on 21/11/2018

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on
21/11/2018 at the premises of M/s SUCCESS UNITED PTE
and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : 5512,240.74

Revised Estimate Amount : §%6,730.00 (LUMP SUM)
"Check" ltems Amount 8%

Markel Value : 5%

LTA Reimbursement Value =58

Nett Value : S$

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the
front and rear portion

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent

Yours faithfully,

ADRIAN LING WAI PING
B.Eng, AMS0E,AMIRTE AMSAE-A,M.MATAI
Licensad Appraiser



E
Msé Firstca pltal M5 First Capital Insurance Limited comeg Mo, 1550000060 O5T Reg Mo M2-00016769

E Raffles Quay 421-00 Singapore D4B5E0
Tel (65) 6222 2311 Fanc (65) 6222 3547

Claims & Hotor Underwsiing Dept: 36 Robinson Road #16-01 Gity House Singapore 068877
Tek (65) G507 3848 Fax: (65) 6507 3848
www. msfirsteapital.oom.sg

Date

Accident Date

Insured Vehicle

Survey Location
Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor
Contact Person

Contact Number.

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT
09-11-2018 Our Ref No. D18008015MFSH
07-11-2018 Claim Type. Third Party
SHC0332G Third Party Vehicle. SLCA4918T

2 KAKI BUKIT AVE 2 #01-33 / #02-29KAKI BUKIT AUTOHUB
SIRINA SOON
67461515/ 0 Fax No. 67485015

WITHOUT PREJUDICE:

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTELTD

MA Fax No. 68416315
MA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop

Cc : TP Solicitor

Oificer Incharge

SUCCESS UNITED PTE
LTD

MA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA

Attention. NIL

SITHARA

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.

This is a computer generated letter, no signature required.

o | EEEE wwsumance croue




Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

x

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 21 December 2018 10:15 AM

To: 'CW5S Motor Claims'

Cc: ‘Sithara'; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D1B008015MFSH/1, SLC 49187
Attachments: SLC 4918T PRELI ADVISED.pdf

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SLC 4918T
Date of survey: 21/11/2018
Number of days : 11 days

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Fhone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 22 November 2018 8:44 AM

To: 'CWS Mator Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Cc: 'Sithara' <Sithara@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@Ilkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18008015MFSH/1, SLC 4918T

Dear Sir/Madam,
Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SLC 4918T on 21/11/2018 .

We are pending estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email ;sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

8lk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent; Wednesday, 21 November 2018 10:17 AM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmaotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments lkkauto.com>
Cc: 'Sithara' <Sithara@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18008015MF5H/1

Dear Sir / Madam,



Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards,

Catherine Chong | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pre Lid

Fhone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: CWS Motor Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg]

sent: Wednesday, 21 November, 2018 10:01 AM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Ce: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Sithara <Sithara@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18008015MF5H/1

Dear 5ir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 22 November 2018 8:44 AM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims’

Cc: 'Sithara'; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18008015MFSH/1, SLC 49187

Dear Sir/Madam.
Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SLC 4918T on 21/11/2018 .

We are pending estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,
Veron Chen | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3561 | email ;sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

sent: Wednesday, 21 November 2018 10:17 AM

To: 'CWS5 Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: 'Sithara' <Sithara@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18008015MFSH/1

Dear Sir / Madam,
Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards,

Catherine Chong | Admin

LKE Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: b2sh-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408033)

From: CWS Motor Claims {mailtn:cwsmatnrclaims@msfirstcanitai.com,sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 21 November, 2018 10:01 AM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Sithara <Sithara@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: PRI SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18008015MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.
1



Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.



> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner |D Type:

Owner 1Dz

Wehicle Details

Wehicle Na.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Yehicle Make!

Wehicle Modek:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year

Engine Mo

Chassis Mo.:

M aximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid;

Intended PARF Rebate Detalls
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COFE Period(Years):

QF Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

The information contained herein is correct as at 20 Mov 2018

Singapore NRIC
ae07L

SLC4718T

Me

21 Mov 2018
HOMDA

CITY 155V CVT
Brown

2014
L15212720050
PARHGM&SS0GPO0045T
BE.O KW (118 bhp)
$1B,503.00

17 May 2016

17 May 2016

i

$13.503.00

Yes
16 May 2026
$10,127.00

14 May 2026

A - Carup to 1600cc & F7kW (130bhp)
10

47,889 00

£35,643.00

$45,970.00

OK
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| SUCCESS LNITED PTE LTO
2 Kaki Bukit Ave 2, #01-33 / #02-29 Kaki Bukit AutoHub Singapore 41 7921
= Fax: 6748 5015

Tel: 6746 1515 / 6747 1787

Hyypom=ss UrlTaE808 i L www. successunited.com.sg Co. | C5Teg r00402570C
MS First Capital Insurance Limited Estimate : TP18-125
A6 Robinson Road
#16-01 City House Date : 21/11/2018
Singapore 068877 Vehicle Mum. : SLC4818T

; g Make/Model - Honda City-2016

Attention : Motor Claim Department AareA Chassis/Eng# - PIRGMBNB0GPO00457L 1521272008
Contact : 65073848 Fax No. : 65073848 aceey . Accident Date : 21/11/2018

©laim No. - D18008015MFSH

Reference

Policy No. © (01/06/2019)

SIN - Quantity Particular Unit Price  Amount 33
LISTITEMS :
iz o Rear Boot lid Treelcécd 598,70
2 1 Rear Boot 'City' Emblem  + 28.70
a1 Rear Boot I-vtec Emblem |~ 3400
4 1 Rear Boot Weatherstrip =% 98.10"
5 1 Rear Boot Lid Mechanism Lock " 181.50°
g8 1 Rear Boot Reflector Lamp LH &% 94 80
7 1 Rear Boot Reflector Lamp RH = = 84 B0~
8. 1 Rear Lamp LH &% 235.70—
g 1 RearLamp RH &f 23570
0. 1 Rear Bumper Assy Joi— 514.70 —
1. 8 Rear Bumper Clips FEA ) 3.90 31.20
12. 1 Rear Bumper Side Holder LH .. 1920
13 1 Rear Bumper Side Holder RH ° 18.20
14, 1 Rear End Panel Seded 41010~
15 1 Rear Bumper Reflector Lamp LH /25 - 4500 &
16 1 Rear Bumper End Panel Inner Top Garnish %~ 116.86
17. 1 Rear Fender Inner upholstery Trim LH = 135.90-%
18, 1 Bonnet Too viag< 561.40 —
19, 1 Bonnet Hinge LH % o 4 <EE
20. 1 BonnetHingeRH ' =~ L% 1
21. 1 Bonnet Mechanism Lock %~ 87.70~
22, 1 Bonnet Weatherstrip A7~ 2610
a0 A Headlamp LH 2, ,, ¢ ¢ 43220 -
24 1 HeadlampRH ' 43220 -
25 1 Frt Grille Assy < 394 80
268, 1 Frt Grille Honda Logo ~ | 34.00
27 Frt Bumper Assy 7ot 698.12-
28. 10 Fri Bumper Clips =« 3.90 39.00 -
29 1 Frt Bumper Side Holder LH L . 1310
30, 1 Frt Bumper Side Holder RH 13.10
31,1 Frt Fender LH “Blacliras- 290.62~
32. 1 Frt Fender RH ey : 28062
33 1 Frt Bumper Lower Aif Grille /™ &= 98.00 *
34 1 Frt Grille Chrome Trim € ud—ﬁ( 218607
35 1 Frt Bumper Reinforcement ; d 268.00
3B 1 Headlamp Bracket LH @& et 3250
o S Radiator Assy 4 f 1.100.50+4
3B 1 Radiater Support Top Cover Gamnish T 'l=C 39.10 &7
39, 7 Radiator Support Top Cover Garnish Clips % 3.90 27.30 L

CONTINUE /...
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SUCCESS UNITED PTE LTO

2 Kaki Bulkit Ave 2, #01-33
Tel: 6746 1515 6747 1787

| #02-29 Kakl Bukit AutoHub Singapore 417921
Fax: 6748 5015

S rasAs URIrEnSAETR rel www.successunited. com.sg Ca. | ST Reqr 2004025700
MS First Capital Insurance Limited Estimate : TP18-125
36 Robinson Road
#16-01 City House Date : 21/11/2018
Singapore DBBETT \ehicle Num. : SLC4918T
TR L Claim D ¢ Make/Mode! : Honda City-2016
ttention : Motor Claim Departmen Chassis/Eng# - MRHGMEBB0GPO00457/L 1521272008
Contact - 65073848 Fax No. : 65073849 Accident Date - 21/11/2018
Claim No. : D1800B015MFSH
Reference -
Policy No. : (01/06/2019)
SN Quantity Particular Unit Price  Amount S§
40 1 Rear Spare Tyre Panel  #t 2626 508.90
~newbd  TEE e
List TotalS$ : colv 8,563.42
20.00% Discount 5% 1,712.68
6,850.74
NETTITEMS: . i
1. 1set Reverse Sensor © b‘) 0 480.00 “*
2 1 Frt No. Plate wirame He-t > 10000~
31 Rear Mo. Plate wiframe st A~ 100.00 ¢
Mett Total 5% . 680.00
LABOUR ;
To remove, rearrange electrical wirings, check lighting 60.00 -
To remove. reinstal inner trim garnishes & upholestery 300-00 .:.L
To remove, reinstal aircon parts, vacum, refill gas. 3 / g O 250.00 *
Respray tuff kote sealant 30080 &0
To remove, repair and replaced damaged bodyparts, 1,800:00 /¢4
realign bodyworks & where consistent to the accident
To putty and respray painting on affected area. 2.080:00 (e,
Labour Total $% 4,710.00
LK ——— fn‘l,- dean et Am
th Gy i
" L5 #‘J [ 'r’,lh F':
. ] | :;:]{47 3
E. &OE. Total S5 12,240.74

H—
far SUCCESS UNITED FTE LTD




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Indusirial Park, Singapore 4085933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: G256 4315
Reg. No 199807198R GST Reg. No. 19-0607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experis En Automobile

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref : CS/FCI1802103%Avbn2
seomeonrors o meae [N
Code : FCIZ
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHC 332G Veh. Inspected SLC 49187
Policy No. Coverage (3) 0.00
Claim No. D18008015MFSH Excess ($) 0,00
Assign From  SITHARA Assign Date 21/11/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model HONDACITY c.c 1407
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2016
Chassis No. MRHGMEBE0GP00045T Colour BLACK
Odometer 70879 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |185/55 R16 YOKOHAMA & mm
L/H Front Tyre |185/55R16 YOKOHAMA & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |185/55 R18 YOKOHAMA & mm
L/H Rear Tyre [185/55 R16 YOKOHAMA & mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE FRONT AND REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
8. General Information
Accident Date  07/11/2018 [inspection Date 2111172018
Survey held at SUCCESS UNITED PTELTD
2 KAKI BUKIT AVE 2
#£01-33 KAKI BUKIT AUTOHUB
SINGAPORE 417921
5a. Remarks
AJDAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
BITHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUGCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR, 11 Working Days




TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4215
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607138-R

ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SLC 4918T

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

54 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408533

Page No.:1of 3

: Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop ($)) ($)
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS

1|REAR BOOT LID BUCKLED 598 70 598.70
1|REAR BOOT "CITY" EMBLEM NECESSARY 28.70 28.70
1|REAR BOOT “I-VTEC" EMBLEM NECESSARY 34.00 3400
1|REAR BOOT WEATHERSTRIP cut 98.10 98.10
1|REAR BOOT LID MECHANISM LOCK DAMAGED 181.50 181.50
1|REAR BOOT REFLECTOR LAMP LH cuT 94 80 94 80
1|REAR BOOT REFLECTOR LAMP RH NOT NECESSARY 94 80 -
1|REAR LAMP LH cuT 235.70 235.70
1|REAR LAMP RH cuT 23570 23570
1|REAR BUMPER ASSY DEFORMED 514.70 514.70
8|REAR BUMPER CLIPS @%$3.90 NECESSARY 31.20 31.20
1|REAR BUMPER SIDE HOLDER LH MECESSARY 19.20 19.20
1|REAR BUMPER SIDE HOLDER RH NECESSARY 19.20 18,20
1|REAR END PANEL DENTED 410.10 410.10
1|REAR BUMPER REFLECTOR LAMP LH NOT NECESSARY 45.00 -
1|REAR BUMPER END PANEL INNER TOP GARNISH DEFORMED 116 .86 116.86
1|REAR FENDER INNER UPHOLSTERY TRIM LH NOT NECESSARY 135.90 .
1|BONNET DENTED 561.40 561.40
1|BONNET HINGE LH BENT 31.70 31.70
1|BONNMET HINGE RH BENT 31.70 31.70
1|BONNET MECHANISM LOCK DAMAGED A7.70 87.70
1|BOMNET WEATHERSTRIP NOT NECESSARY 26.10 .
1|HEADLAMP LH CRACKED 432.20 432 20
1|HEADLAMP RH CRACKED 432.20 43220
1|FRT GRILLE ASSY CRACKED 394 80 394 80
1|FRT GRILLE HONDA LOGO NECESSARY 34.00 3400
1|FRT BUMPER ASSY DISTORTED £98.12 §98.12
10|FRT BUMPER CLIPS @$3.90 NECESSARY 39,00 39.00
1|FRT BUMPER SIDE HOLDER LH NECESSARY 13.10 13.10
1|FRT BUMPER SIDE HOLDER RH NECESSARY 13.10 13.10
1|FRT FENDER LH BUCKLED 290 62 29062

Report Ref No, CS/FC118021039/Avbn2




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ui Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607T198-R

Page Mo.2of 3

2 Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Description of Parts Condition
o & Workshop (5))| _ (5)
1|FRT FENDER RH TO REPAIR SEE 200,62 F
LABOUR
1|FRT BUMPER LOWER AIR GRILLE NOT NECESSARY 98.00 i
1|FRT GRILLE CHROME TRIM CRACKED 218,60 218.60
1|FBRT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT BENT 266.00 268.00
1|HEADLAMP BRACKET LH CRACKED 32.50 3250
1|RADIATOR ASSY HWOT NECESSARY 1,100 50 -
1|RADIATOR SUPPORT TOP COVER GARNISH CRACKED 39.10 39.10
7|RADIATOR SUPPORT TOP COVER GARNISH CLIPS MNECESSARY 27.30 27.30
@$3.90
1|RADIATOR SPARE TYRE PANEL TO REPAIR SEE 508.90 .
LABOUR
LESS 20% DISCOUNT 171288 125272
6.850.74 5,010.88
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
11SET REVERSE SENSOR (SN} DAMAGED 480.00 200.00
1|FRT NO PLATE W/FRAME (SM) BENT 100.00 50.00
1|REAR NO PLATE WIFRAME (SN) NOT NECESSARY 100.00 -
§80.00 250.00
LABOUR
TO REMOVE REARRANGE ELECTRICAL WIRINGS.CHECK §0.00 60.00
LIGHTING.
TO REMOVE REINSTALL INNER TRIM GARNISHES & 300.00 60.00
UPHOLSTERY
TO REMOVE.REINSTALL AIRCON PARTS VACUM REFILL |[NOT NECESSARY 250.00 L
GAS
RESPRAY TUFF KOTE SEALANT. 300.00 £0.00
TO REMOVE REPAIR AND REPLACED DAMAGED 1,800.00 1,400.00
BODYPARTS REALIGN BODYWORKS & WHERE
CONSISTENT TO THE ACCIDENT INCLUSIVE OF THE
REPAIR OF FRT FENDER RH AND RADIATOR SPARE
TYRE PANEL
TO PUTTY AND RESPRAY PAINTING ON AFFECTED 2,000.00 1,600.00
AREA
4 710.00 3,180.00
GRAND TOTAL 12,240.74 8,440.88

Report Ref No. CS/FCI18021038/Avbn2




Page No.3of 3

RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 6,750.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CS/FCI18021039/Avbn2

% 2‘
ADRIAN LING WAI PING
B.Erlng..ﬁHSDE.AHIRTE.AMSAE-&.M.H#TAI

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:: This Report s ma

da sobaly for the use and benelit of the Clent named on tha front page of this Report.




