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Bda mEm ™ Pleltd Company Registration No. 199607 198R

SEURLAVE 1, #0225 PAYA URHINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (65) 62564315

Y our ref: DMI18HOO3118-1G
Our ref CC4/EQII8020986/Gpa3 Date: 06/1272018

The Motor Claims Department
M/s EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO. SCL 2222P /SLW 5844K

We refer 1o the above matter.

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on 03/12/2018
at the premises of M/s Hua Hong Pte Lid have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : 5% 4,604.37
Revised Estimate Amount : 5% 1,909.39
"Check"” Items Amount : 5§ 652.32
Total (Including Check Items) 1 5% 2.561.71
Marker Value : 8% -
LTA Reimbursement Value : 5% -
Nett Value . 8% -

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the —
Rear Portion

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent
Estimated normal period for repairs: 2.0 days

Yours faithfully,

XING GUO QIANG
Licensed Appraiser
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HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED

250 Sunged Kodut Sirest | Singopore 729337
Tuk (65} 6441 9688 Fooc (45) &641 PASF Emolt Imfo@huohong comuag

p

ti ir t
15 November 2018 HHTPClaims18-125

EQ Insurance Company Ltd

5 Maxwell Road

#17-00 Tower Block MND Complex
Singapore 065110

Attn: Motor Claims Department

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLW 5844 K & GBG 1451 P ON 15-“”2013 AT BLK, 154 BUKIT. .
BATOK CARPARK AT ABOUT 0520 HOURS

Insured . SEE SIEW ENG JULIN . wsurveyed i
Vehicle Registration No :  SLWS844 K ' ' Gt
Vehicle Make . BMW
Vehicle Model : XEXL
Vehicle Chassis No L GJ11118442
Policy No . GA230850/1
Date of Accident :  15/4/2018 Type of Claim: Third Party
SN Quantity Description Unit Price S5 AmountSs 475 4
1 1 Rear Bumper ~~ ce $ 154685
2 10  RearBumpercip ~ # & 5 500 $ 50.00
3 1 Rear Bumper Tow Cover - Sl $ 36.60
4 Rear Bumper Sensor X HN s 23685 $ 947 40
5 1 Rear Reinforcement S $ 724,80
' $ 330485
Less 10% § (330.48)
] 2,974 37
To dismantie & change rear bumper, rear reinforcement, knocking & pull $ 600.00 200
straight rear panel and all area affected by accident
To perform wire checking $ 2000 X AL
To dismantle & refit rear bumper sensor $ 80.00 (Lo
To perform P/Steering and 4x4 diagnostic check $ 25000 X W7
To spray rear panel, rear reinforcement and tail gate $ 700.00 20¢
3 4,604 .37
5 ; 7%GST § 322.31
$

WW %”/W ’g"“[“‘m T

et S
s}, / w/ (% -

Co, Reg No 20090030 | fhuohongoomag | GSTReg. No. 200900309M



Hsiao TonE (LKKAuto)

From: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto)

Sent Tuesday, 15 Octaber 2019 519 PM

To: Ashley Tan

Cc SUR: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto]

Subject: RE- Finalisation for Vehicle No, SLW5844K
Dear Ashley, \

Finalize COR $1764.89 before GST (@ 2 working days

]

Regards, |
Guo Qiang—

From: Ashley Tan [mailto:ashley@huahong.com.sg]
Sent: Tuesday, 8 COctober, 2019 11:41 AM

To: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto)

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: Finalisation for Vehicle No, SLWSB44K

Dear all

Any update on finalisation?

Thanks & Regards

Ashley Tan
e HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED
f‘ 250 SUNGEI KADUT STREET 1 SINGAPORE 729332
_;' T.6661 9690 | M. 9816 4151 | F. 6661 9659
Follow us @ huahong.com.sg 5 7’h- q 4 Fr

£ Mlin GG

From: Ashley Tan <ashley@huahong.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 24 September 2019 2:12 PM

To: ‘guogiang®@lkkauto.com' <guogiang@lkkauto.com>

Ce: 'SUR' <sur@lkkauto.com>; 'vivianlau@lkkauto.com' <vivianlau@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Finalisation for Vehicle No. SLWS844K

Dear all

Any update on finalisation?

Thanks & Regards

AshLeH Tan



HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED

25D SUNGEI KADUT STREET 1 SINGAPORE 729332
T. 6661 9690 | M. 9816 4151 | F. 6661 9699
Follow us @ huahong.com.sg

£ llin CING)

From: Ashley Tan <ashley@huahong.com. sg>

Sent: Monday, 16 September 2019 10:34 AM

To: 'guogiang@/kkauto.com' <guogiang@lkkauto.com>

Ce: "SUR' <sur@lkkauto.com>; ‘vivianlau@Ilkkauto.com' <vivianlau@|kkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Finalisation for Vehicle No. SLW5B44K

Dear all

Any update on the finalisation?

Thanks & Regards

Ashl.ag Tan
P HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED
},\"' 25D SUNGEI KADUT STREET 1 SINGAPORE 729332
i T.6661 9690 | M. 9816 4151 | F. 6661 9699

Follow us @ huahong.com.sg

 fMlin OO

From: Ashley Tan <ashley@huahong.com.sg>»

Sent: Monday, 1 July 2019 9:39 AM

To: 'guogiang@lkkauto.com' <guoaiang@Ilkkauto.com>

Ce: 'SUR' <suri@lkkauto.com>; 'vivianlau@lkkauto.com' <vivianlau@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Finalisation for Vehicle No. SLW5844K

Dear all
| refer to my emall sent on 11 June & 23 May 2019,

Any update on the finalisation?

Thanks & Regards

Ashley Tan
e HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED
e 25D SUNGEI KADUT STREET 1 SINGAPORE 729332
T. 6661 9690 | M. 9816 4151 | F. 6661 9699

Follow us @ huahong.com.sg

@ ®
G
 fin

From: Ashley Tan <ashley@huahong.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 11 June 2019 4:26 PM

To: 'guogiang@lkkauto.com' <guogiang@lkkauto.com>



Cc: 'SUR' <sur@lkkauto.com>; ‘vivianlau®@lkkauto.com' <yivianlau@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Finalisation for Vehicle No. SLW5844K

Dear all
| refer to my emall sent on 23 May 2019

Any update on the finalisation?

Thanks & Regards

Asthg Tawn
- HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED
!/" 250 SUNGEI KADUT STREET 1 SINGAPORE 729332
J T.6661 9690 | M. 5816 4151 | F. 6661 9699

Follow us @ huahong.com.sg

 {in MO

Fram: Ashley Tan <ashley@huahong com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 23 May 2019 12:04 PM

To: 'guogiang @lkkauto.com’ <guoqiang@lkkauto.com>
Ce: 'SUR' <sur@|kkauto.com>
Subject: Finalisation for Vehicle No. SLW5844K

Dear Guogiang

Please refer to the files attached for:-
- Before & After paint

- Checked item (rear reinforcement)

Please confirm part by part finalisation.

Thanks & Regards

ASMLISU Toawn
= HUAHONG PRIVATE LIMITED
f}"‘ 25D SUNGEI KADUT STREET 1 SINGAPORE 729332
i T. 6661 9690 | M. 9816 4151 | F. 6661 9699

Follow us @ huahong.com.sg

fMinlCNe



R TR T PARFICNF Rahata Fomoare

> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Owner ID Type: Singapore NRIC
Owner ID: 6668F
R/ R T T = - = s
Vehicle No.: SCL2222P
Vehicle to be Exported: No
Intended Deregistration Date: 04 Dec 2018
Vehicle Make: B.MW.
Vehicle Model: X5 XL
Primary Colour: Silver
Manufacturing Year: 2008
Engine No.: 048268B63N52B30AF
Chassis No.: WBAFE42010LK94738
Maximum Power Output: 200.0 kW (268 bhp)
Open Market Value: $80,745.00
Original Registration Date: 17 Apr 2009
First Registration Date: 17 Apr 2009
Transfer Count: 3
Actual ARF Paid: $80,745.00
PARF Eligibility: Yes
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: 16 Apr 2019
PARF Rebate Amount; $40,372.00
COE Expiry Date: 16 Apr 2019
COE Category: E - Open Category
COE Period(Years): 10
QP Paid: $7.326.00
COE Rebate Amount: $268.00
Total Rebate Amount: $40,640.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 04 Dec 2018

OK

nipEer, ta.gov sg/itanTifachon/enguireHabatedyrubbctetoraUanginput/FUNL | TN _ID=HUsusuud | )



PARF/€OLE Rebate Enquiry

" > Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owener 1D Type:

Owner 10
Vehicle Details
Wehicle Mo
Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:
Vehicle Model:
Primary Calour:
Manufacturing Year:
Engine No.:
Chassis Na.:
Maximum Power Out put:
Open Market Value:
Original Registration Date:
First Reglstration Date:
Transfer Count
Actual ARF Paid:
Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:
COE Category:
COE Period[Years):
QP Paid:
COE Rebate Amount:
Total Rebate Amount:
The information contained herein is correct as at 03 Dec 2018

OK

Singapore NRIC
AHEEF

SCL2223P

Yes

03Dec 2018

B MWW

NS NL

Silver

2008
D4826863N52BI0AF
WBAFE42010LK947 38
2000 kW {268 bhp)
$B0D.745.00

17 Apr 2009

17 Apr 2009

3

SB0,745.00

Yes
16 Apr 2019
£40,372.00

16 Agr 2017

E - Open Category
10

£7.32400
$270.00
$40,642.00

hitps://vrl.lta.gov.sg/la/vrl/action/enquireRebate By PublicBeforeDereglnput ?ZFUNCTION ID=F030...

Page | of |

3122018



Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuUto) <shupei®@|kkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 20 November 2018 907 AM

To: assignments

Subject: FW: Accident Involving SLW 5844 K & GBG1451P (EQ) on 12/1 1/2018 at 604
Woodlands Or 42 (DM18H003118-1G)

Attachments: ESTIMATE.PDF

4-4Lam@ 2071 |16

Rﬂﬁﬁﬁqn

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: G366-0055 | emall: thupel @ kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubil Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, g02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Joel Goh <joel.goh@eqinsurance.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 20 November 2018 9:01 AM

To: Jerleen Tang <jerleen@huahong.com.sg>

Cc: yvonne @huahong.com.sg; Admin A <admin-a@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Accident Involving SLW 5844 K & GBG1451P (EQ) on 12/11/2018 at 604 Woodlands Dr 42
(DM18HO03118-JG)

Without Prejudice
Dear lerleen

Thank you for your attachment.
We will assign LKK to handle this direct settlement.

Dear LKK
Please assist on the following DS.
Best Regards,

Joel Goh

Executive | Claims

eqnsurance

“-"—t-.....-'.-t- Gfl :E'-.i_.-ﬂd.r

EQ Insurance Company Limited
5 Maxwell Road #17-00 Tower Black MND Complex Singapore 089110
did 65 6500 6772 | tel 65 6223 9433 ext 772 | fax 65 6223 4190

wWww.egqinsurance.com.ss

...numﬂcnrnm



. ﬁr}uﬂeged,fmnﬁdennaf information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify tf

From: Jerleen Tang [mailto:jerleen@huahong.com.sa]
Sent: Monday, November 19, 2018 5:39 PM
To: Joel Goh

Ce: yvonneihuahong.com.sg
Subject: RE: Accident Involving SLW 5844 K & GBG1451P (EQ) on 12/11/2018 at 604 Woodlands Dr 42

Dear loel

Please find attached Estimated cost of Repair as per your request. Kindly advise on appointed surveyor

Thank you.

Regards
Jerleen Tang
Claims Department

HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED
/ 25D SUNGEI KADUT STREET 1 SINGAPORE 729332
T. EEEIEE-‘!SI F. 6661 9699 | W. huahong.com.sg

From: Joel Goh <joel.goh insurance.com.
Sent: Wednesday, 14 November 2018 2:33 PM
To: Jerleen Tang <jerleen@huahong.com.sg>
syvonne@huahong.com.sg
Subject: RE: Accident Involving SLW 5844 K & GBG1451P (EQ) on 12/11/2018 at 604 Woodlands Dr 42

Without Prejudice

Dear Jerleen

Kindly email all liability or PRS request to egiprs@eaqinsurance.com.sg.

Accident liabllity clear.
Please assist to forward us the repair estimates in order for us to advice on direct settlement.

Best Regards,

Joel Goh
Executive | Claims

eq“nsuronce
L& B ,5‘:.4--. il

EQ Insurance Company Limited

£ Maxwell Road #17-D0 Tower Block MND Complex Singapore 069110
did 65 6500 6772 | tel 65 6223 9433 ext 772 | fax 65 6223 4190
WWWLeqInsurance.com.sg



:l‘ A Mermber of Cirptane

~
Y —

Privileged/Canfidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify tl

From: Jerleen Tang [mallto:jerleen@huahong.com.sa]
Sent: Wednesday, November 14, 2018 10:04 AM

To: Janet Tan; Elaine Cheong; Joel Goh; Tan Wel Yin
Cc: yvonne@huahong.com.sg
Subject: Accident Involving SLW 5844 K & GBG 1451 P on 12/11/2018 at 604 Woodlands Dr 42

Dear Sir/Mdm
Kindly advise liability for this accident case.
Qur insured claiming third party. GIA report as per attached,

Should you have any clarification, please contact us @ 6661 9688.

Thank you.

Regards
Jerleen Tang
Claims Department

@.

HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED
250 SUNGEI KADUT STREET 1 SINGAPORE 729332
T. EﬁElBEl! IF 6661 9693 | W. huahong.com.sg




Hsiao Tnna (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 19 December 2019 9:51 AM

To: Ashley Tan

Ce: Admin A; Jerleen Tang’

Subject: RE: Finalisation for Vehicle No. SLWSB44K //LKK REF: CC4/EQITBD20986/Gpa3

Without Prejudice

Dear Ashley,

We refer to your below email.

We confirm settlement at 52,211.43(all-in).

Please provide the following documents for our closure: -

s Authorisation to Act signed by your client, See Siew Eng Julin
* Rental Invoice/ Receipt

Thank you.

“please note that our above settlement Is made on a without prejudice basls, and should not be construed as an admission of liability on
our part or on the part of our Insured/driver. Terms of such settiement should also not be disclosed in any other related matter{s) in
respect of the accident. Our affer made in respect of this present matter is made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be
made to this offer or any settiement arising from this offer in any other related matters.

Settlement and payment are subject to production of original documents on demand at any time and execution of Discharge Voucher (for
settlement sum above $20,000/-) by the Plaintiff/Claimant. Further all original documents shall be retained by us after we have made
payment on the settlement sum.”

“Best Wishes for Merry Christmas, and Happy New Year 20207

Best Regards,

Hsino Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LEKK Auto Consultants Pre Lid

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewhi@]kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Bik 51, Paya Uhi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Ashley Tan <ashley@huahong.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 18 December 2019 3:06 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; "lerleen Tang' <jerleen@huahong.com.sg>
Subject: RE: Finalisation for Vehicle No. SLW5844K

Dear Hsiao Tong



Any update on my email sent below?

Thanks & Regards
Ashl,cg Tan

- HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED

-

25D SUNGEI KADUT STREET 1 SINGAPORE 729332
T. 6661 9690 | M. 9816 4151 | F. 6661 9699
Follow us (@ huahong.com.sg

Mm@ ®

From: Ashley Tan <ashle uahong.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, 18 November 2019 11:25 AM

To: 'Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)' <chewht@lkkauto.cam>
Cc: ‘Admin A' <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Finalisation for Vehicle No. SLWSE44K

Dear Hsiao Tong
Please refer to the LOD as attached.

Please note that we are claiming as below:-

COR S 1,BBE.43
TP SearchFee 5 2.00
LOR 5 321.00
Total s 2,211.43

Thanks & Regards

AsthU Tawn
e HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED
f" 250 SUNGEI KADUT STREET 1 SINGAPORE 729332
4 T. 6661 9690 | M. 9816 4151 | F. 6661 5699

Follow us @ huahong.com.sg

@ ®
|

From: Hsiao Tong [LKKAuto) <chewht@Ilkkauto.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 5 November 2019 10:21 AM

To: Ashley Tan <ashley@huahong.com.sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Finalisation for Vehicle No. SLW5844K

Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs/Mdm,

Further to our below email.



Kindly forward your LOD with all the relevant documents(ie: final repair bill, authorisation to act, rental receipt) to
us (LKK) for our necessary action.

Please note that all the finalisation subject to insurer approval.

"Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed [ inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence an the lssues
of liability/damages, either party Is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsino Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewhtidlkkauto com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #o2-25 | S{408933)

From: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang @ |kkauto.cam>

Sent: Tuesday, 15 October 2019 5:19 PM

To: Ashley Tan <ashl huahong.com.sg>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) <vivianiau@lkkautn.com>
Subject: RE: Finalisation for Vehicle No. SLW5844K

Dear Ashley,
Finalize COR $1764.89 before GST @@ 2 working days.

Regards,
Guo Qiang

From: Ashley Tan [mailto:ashley@huahong.com.sg]
Sent: Tuesday, 8 October, 2019 11:41 AM

To: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto)

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: Finalisation for Vehicle No. SLW5B44K

Dear all

Any update on finalisation?

Thanks & Regards
Ashley Tan



— HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED

‘," 25D SUNGE! KADUT STREET 1 SINGAPORE 729332
F T. 66619690 | M, 9816 4151 | F. 6661 9699
Follow us @ huahong.com.sg

£ llin NG

From: Ashley Tan <ashley@huahong com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 24 September 2019 2:12 PM
To: 'guogiang@Ikkauto.com’ <guogiang@|kkauto.com>

Cc: 'SUR' <sur@lkkauto.com>;: "vivianlau@lkkauto.com' <vivianlau@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Finalisation for Vehicle No. SLW5844K

Dear all

Any update on finalisation?

Tharnks & Regards
Ashley Tan

HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED

250 SUNGEI KADUT STREET 1 SINGAPORE 729332
T. 6661 9690 | M. 9816 4151 | F. 6661 9699
Follow us @ huahong.com.sg

(@ @
L)

From: Ashley Tan <ashley@huahong.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 16 September 2019 10:34 AM

To: 'guoqiang@lkkauto.com' <guogiang@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'SUR' <sur® lkkauto.com>: 'vivianlau@lkkauto.com' <yivianiau@|kkauto com>
Subject: RE: Finalisation for Vehicle No. SLWSE44K

Dear all

Any update on the finalisation?

Thanks & Regards

Ash ch Tawn
- HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED
:’.r'" 25D SUNGEI KADUT STREET 1 SINGAPORE 729332

T. 66619690 | M. 9816 4151 | F. 6661 9699
Follow us @ huahong.com.sg

 fMin MG

From: Ashley Tan <ashley@huahong com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 1 July 2019 9:39 AM

To: 'guogiang@lkkauto.com' <guoaiang @lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'SUR’ <sur@lkkauto.com=; "vivianlau@lkkauto.com' <vivianlau@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Finalisation for Vehicle No. SLW5844K




Dear all
| refer to my email sent on 11 June & 23 May 2019.

Any update on the finalisation?

Thanks & Regards
Ashley Tan

HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED

25D SUNGE! KADUT STREET 1 5INGAPORE 729332
T. 6661 9630 | M. 9816 4151 | F. 6661 9699
Follow us @ huahong.com.sg

fMinMUNC)

From: Ashley Tan <ashley@huahong.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 11 June 2019 4:26 PM

To: 'gungiang@Ilkkauto.com' <guogiang@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'SUR' <sur@lkkauto.com>; "vivianlau@/kkauto.com' <vivianiau@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Finalisation for Vehicle No. SLW5844K

Dear all
| refer to my email sent on 23 May 2019.

Any update on the finalisation?

Thanks & Regards
AshLz@ Tan

HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED

25D SUNGE| KADUT STREET 1 SINGAPORE 729332
T.6661 9690 | M, 9816 4151 | F. 6661 9699
Follow us @ huahong.com.sg

E@me®

From: Ashley Tan <ashley@huahong.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 23 May 2019 12:04 PM

To: 'guoglang@lkkauto.com’ <guodiang@lkkauto.com>
Ce: 'SUR' <suri@lkkauto.com>

Subject; Finalisation for Vehicle No. SLW5844K

Dear Guogiang

Please refer to the files attached for:-
- Before & After paint

- Checked item (rear reinforcement)

Please confirm part by part finalisation.



Thanks & Regards
Ash L""H Tawn
_— HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED

[

25D SUNGEI KADUT STREET 1 SINGAPORE 729332
T. 6661 9690 | M. 9816 4151 | F. 6661 9699
Follow us @ huahong.com.sg
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Company Registration No. 1959607 158R

S1UDBIAVE L #02-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTHRIAL PARK, SINGAORE 408933 TEL @ (0651 62563561 FAX ; (M&5) 62564315

To : M/s EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD

Date: 068/03/2020

HIRD PARTY DIRECT SETTLEME

— GBG 1451P (Insd Veh) |Your Ref No. . DM18HO03118-JG
ic ;
SCL 2222P (TP Veh) |OurRef. No. - CC4/EQI180205986/Gpadq2
Date of Accident 12/11/2018
Liability 100% .
Final Repair Cost 1 1,888.43
Loss of Use 1 days
Rental (Ifany) s_ 32_1:l:_l_ﬂ 2 days - B
Dﬂ'!aars:_ 1 2.00
. $ L S

2,211.43
Final Setllement Sum |: § 221143
Remarks — — — E—
P nt | ion: P 's Break: n

1) |HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED

221143

JOANNE LEE

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid




Y 74 V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

S Inix = 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408333

’.—5—“ -
TEL: 8256 3561 FAX: 5256 4315

Reg No: 198607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9807198-R

EQINSURANCECOMPANYLTD. T Rat GWEDHW

Ao NI
#17-00 TOWER BLOCK Date .  06-03-2020
MND COMPLEXSINGAPORE 069110

insured Veh.  GBG 1451P ] Veh. Inspected  SCL 2222P(SLW 5844K)

Policy No. DMCPHQ18-003465 Coverage ($) 0,00
Claim No. DM18HO03118-JG Excess ($) 0,00

Assign From  JOEL Assign Date 20/11/2018

Make & Model BMW. X5 c.c 2006

Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2009

Chassis No. WBAFE42010LKS6738 Colour SILVER

Odometer 96632 Steering IN ORDER

Brakes IN ORDER Modification STANDARD ALLOY RIM

R/H Front Tyre |255/55R18 MICHELIN 6 mm
L/H Front Tyre |255/55 R18 MICHELIN 6 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |255/55R18 MICHELIN B mm

THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES HT THE REA.R FDFITICIN
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.

Accident Date  12/1172018

Survey held at HUA HONG PTELTD
25D SUNGEI I(A.DUT STFIEET 1 SINGAFOHE 728332

h]THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON AWI“HDLIT PREJUDICE' BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR:




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 68258 1561 FAX. 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607188R GST Reg. No. 18-8607198-R
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SCL 2222P(SLW 5844K)

Page No. 1 of 1

] g .“= & '.T'-" 3 =] ".]h'_'-_ ; timati )
ay| Description of Parts | condition | oe e
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR BUMPER DEFORMED 1,546.05 1,385.50
10|REAR BUMPER CLIP @55.00 NECESSARY 50.00 50.00
1|REAR BUMPER TOW COVER SCRATCHED 358.80 36.60
4|REAR BUMPER SENSOR @%236.85 NOT NECESSARY 947 40
1|REAR REINFORCEMENT SERVICEABLE 724 .80
LESS 10% DISCOUNT -330 .48 -147.21
2.974.36 1,324 B9
LABOUR
TO DISMANTLE 8 CHARGE REAR BUMPER ,REAR 600.00 200.00
REINFORCEMENT .KNOCKING & PULL STRAIGHTEN
REAR PANEL AND ALL AREA AFFECTED BY ACCIDENT
TO PERFORM WIRE CHECKING. NOT NECESSARY 20.00
TO DISMANTLE & REFIT REAR BUMPER SENSOR £0.00 40.00
TO PERFORM P/STEERING AND 4X4 DIAGNOSTIC NOT MECESSARY 250.00
CHECK.
TO SPRAY REAR PANEL REAR REINFORCEMENT AND 700.00 200.00
TAIL GATE
1.630.00 440.00
GRAND TOTAL 4,604.36 1.T64.89
[ RECOMMENDED COSTOFREPAIRS | T T veass)
Report Ref No. CC4/EQI18020986/Gpa3q2
XING GUO QIANG HO LEONG CHUAN
M.MATAI, AMSAE-A Automotive Assessor

Automotive Assessor

DEISTLAIMER OF LIABILITY 7O THIRD PARTIES: - This Aspor s made salsly for the use and benefi of ite Clisnt named on the fronl pege of ihis Repon.




