Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)
Sent: Friday, 7 December, 2018 1:14 PM
To: 'Joel Goh'
Cc: Admin A; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: Accident Involving SLW 5844 K & GBG1451P (EQ) on 12/11/2018 at 604
Woodlands Dr 42 (DM18H0O03118-JG)
Attachments: TP REPLACE VEH.pdf; TP ESTIMATE - MARKED.pdf; Preliminary Advice.pdf
Categories: HMK
‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS

EQI ref: DM18H003118-JG
LKK REF: CC4/EQI18020986/Gpa3

Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.
Enclosed revert of vehicle: SCL 2222P /SLW 5844K
We have not authorized repairs.
Enclosed for your perusal is:
e TP estimated cost of repair
e Preliminary advice
Please take note that the case handler in-charge is Hsiao Tong and she can be contacted at DID: 6742 3197.
To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@Ikkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 20 November, 2018 10:44 AM

To: 'Joel Goh' <joel.goh@eginsurance.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Accident Involving SLW 5844 K & GBG1451P (EQ) on 12/11/2018 at 604 Woodlands Dr 42
(DM18H003118-JG)

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed vehicle not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.



BEST REGARDS,
G.Nivitha | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Joel Goh <joel.goh@eginsurance.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 20 November 2018 9:01 AM

To: Jerleen Tang <jerleen@huahong.com.sg>

Cc: yvonne@huahong.com.sg; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Accident Involving SLW 5844 K & GBG1451P (EQ) on 12/11/2018 at 604 Woodlands Dr 42
(DM18HO03118-JG)

Without Prejudice
Dear Jerleen

Thank you for your attachment.
We will assign LKK to handle this direct settlement.

Dear LKK
Please assist on the following DS.
Best Regards,

Joel Goh
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EQ Insurance Company Limited

did tel fax

Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the .

From: Jerleen Tang [mailto:jerleen@huahong.com.sq]

Sent: Monday, November 19, 2018 5:39 PM

To: Joel Goh

Cc: yvonne@huahong.com.sg

Subject: RE: Accident Involving SLW 5844 K & GBG1451P (EQ) on 12/11/2018 at 604 Woodlands Dr 42

Dear Joel
Please find attached Estimated cost of Repair as per your request. Kindly advise on appointed surveyor
Thank you.

Regards



Jerleen Tang
Claims Department

o nc HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED
25D SUNGEI KADUT STREET 1 SINGAPORE 729332
T. 6661 9688 | F. 6661 9699 | W. huahong.com.sg
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From: Joel Goh <joel.goh@eqginsurance.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 14 November 2018 2:33 PM

To: Jerleen Tang <jerleen@huahong.com.sg>

Cc: yvonne@huahong.com.sg

Subject: RE: Accident Involving SLW 5844 K & GBG1451P (EQ) on 12/11/2018 at 604 Woodlands Dr 42

Without Prejudice
Dear Jerleen

Kindly email all liability or PRS request to eqgiprs@eginsurance.com.sg.

Accident liability clear.
Please assist to forward us the repair estimates in order for us to advice on direct settlement.

Best Regards,

Joel Goh
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Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the .

From: Jerleen Tang [mailto:jerleen@huahong.com.sq]

Sent: Wednesday, November 14, 2018 10:04 AM

To: Janet Tan; Elaine Cheong; Joel Goh; Tan Wei Yin

Cc: yvonne@huahong.com.sg

Subject: Accident Involving SLW 5844 K & GBG 1451 P on 12/11/2018 at 604 Woodlands Dr 42

Dear Sir/Mdm
Kindly advise liability for this accident case.

Our insured claiming third party. GIA report as per attached.
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Should you have any clarification, please contact us @ 6661 9688.

Thank you.

Regards

Jerleen Tang
Claims Department

G pum HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED
25D SUNGEI KADUT STREET 1 SINGAPORE 729332
T. 6661 9688 | F. 6661 9699 | W. huahong.com.sg
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