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Ci™ CABPTELTD

REPAIR ESTIMATE* \/ W
VEHICLE NO : SHB 3557K DATE 20/11/2018 9:35 -
MAKE
MODEL : HYUNDAL 40
Qty Parts Description/ Labour Unit Price
Rear Bumper ~ $ 55300
Rear Bumper Clip 10 pcs — ~°< § 2200
Rear Bumper Bracket g 5 5608 71.20
Rear Bumper Sponge Y~ $ 103350
SUB TOTAL b 749.70
LESS 20% % 149,04
DISCOUNTED TOTAL 5 599,76
z o z y
Rear Bumper Advertisement Logo $ 50.00 [Nett
Rear Fender Advertisement Logo (LH/RH) W § 100,00 | & 20000 [Nett
' S 250,00
Labour Charge 2oo
Panel Beating 5 M
Spray Painting Charge S ;smﬁr 2w
Wiring Charge S M e,
Remove/Refix Reverse Sensor s W},_
TOTAL LABOUR $ 730.00
ESTIMATE TOTAL § L570.76
e e
. Ji e e
Lﬂ / 7t / 4-! b / ¥ /l
Ls =
Lt
ﬁ e e r
This is an mitial estimate based on a visual mspection of the above vehacle. The final reparr quantum wall
be prepared afier the vehicle 15 surveyed by a motor Survevor apponied by the msumnce company.




COMFORIDELGRO

ENGINEERING

Our Job Ref No : 305241011

- ComionDeiGm Enginessnng P Lk
Date ! 211118 59 Loyang Drive Sngapors 508960

= Fas: 8546 B156

FINALIZATION FORM
To : LKK Fax
Attn KALVIN
Wehicle Reg No SHB355TK 17112018

The survey and estimates of the repairs of the sbove-mentioned vehicle are as follows:-

1 Tha repair job shall Bl to: FWD SLES413P

2 The finalized amount shall be;
(a) Spare Pans after List discount

(b} Lebour Charges

Total for Part-By-Part Repair Cost

{e.) Lumpsum Repair (if applicable)
Total for Lumpsum repalr cosl after Less

Final Lumpsum Repair cost $900.00
3 Estimatad normal penod for repains: 2 working days
4 We shall treat the above amount as Correct and Confirmed If there Is no reply from you within 7
working days
B Thank you for your B;.iﬁ;nﬁ We confirm the estmates and
a finalized amount

&\

Signature f.\ Signature
Name  CHIANG Name Lahs
Tel 62148314 Date 33v/u )t
Fax 65468156
For Official Use Only
Documant
Item Amount Attached gmﬁi Remarks
Yes or No
1. Rental Rate PiDay YES
2. Loss of Income Paid M
3. Survey Feas
4. LTA Search Fes T 408
5. Medical Feas (on behalf
of driver, if applicable)
E Ovarmun

Remarks:




_OMFORIDELGRO
ENGINEERNC.

) rrr&rn‘cﬂ-." ol Eﬂmmﬂtm

ComfortDelGro Enginearing Ple Lid
S Bkl Mamt Tomgayobe VT
Mipisnpe « 80 RANT ATED P bonte - 00 W0R0 TN
'lb-'l-—

5:‘1#

.I'?F"IF
|rr|:"r1m1.'-ti P mege KA Wi Begapay TVEY
I&!'I.r';hall-ﬂ P Vg ot Py & Tepapey TR &

Eatef"flmé‘“”r"!"m 17:05 Page : 1

ok Serosi o mn Sramear ML

Teamn: ARC Repair TP(CFS0)1 JOB CARD Sales Ordsr: Jono. 305241011
TONER mmm;mas&m LHLEAE
= CITYCAE PTE LTD v o
7010070 HYUNDAIL 5. :
TOMER MO SRR 1 - SRS ERE
383 SIN MING DRIVE S
Singapore SINGAPORE 575717 1-40 Jﬂmﬁ 13:40
65551188
g " ROFMANG 09.2013 preeE
CHASSIS 0o COMPETION DETETIME
- RfiB41UMDUD40079 =

JOB DESCAFTION
Accident Date: 17.11.2018
NATURE: 3P 17.11.2018
8/NO LABOR CODE DESCRIPTION i
]
. n
AEAR ]
HOKED & PASSED QUT BY!
SERVICE ADWVTSOR CLUSTOMERS SIGNATURE
T
wiFogeEmEn| Sin Exitt Pass
B \eniche Mo
s b SHBA55TK CHIANG SHB3557K
of Servion Advisor Signature/Dats Harme of Servics Advisor Diate
rigrnee 12 Sarvice Reception upon collsction To be kot by Sscurity Guard




CITY CAB PTE LTD \\

REPAIR ESTIMATE® VW
|
VEHICLE NO : SHB 3557k DATE 20/11/2018 9:35
MAKE
MODEL : HYUNDAL 40
QI} Parts Description’ Labour Ty Unit Price Amount
Rear Bumper i S 35300
Rear Bumper Clip 10 pes ~~ . 2,00
Rear Bumper Bracket S 3560 | S 7120
Rear Bumper Sponge S 10350
SUB TOTAL $ T749.70
LESS 20% $ 149,94
DISCOUNTED TOTAL 5 599.76
Rear Bumper Advertisement Logo »— b 5000 [Net
Rear Fender Advernisement Logo (LH/RH) - $ 100,00 | % 200,00 |New
S 250.00
Labour Charge 2o
Panel Beating s 3560
Spray Painting Charge $ 25610 Roe
Wiring Charge S 30 be
Remove/Refix Reverse Sensor $ w}.
TOTAL LABOUR s 730,00
ESTIMATE TOTAL - $ | 1,579.76
@ i rttew |
2'_0 / I /«( /} K j . \
)
.-."-'-.-'__r =3
/5
LA
/} b G r

This is an initial estimate based on a visual inspection of the above vehicle. The final repair quantum will

be prepared after the vehicle 1s surveyed by a motor Surveyor appotnted by the insurance company,




Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: lioneltan@fwd.com

Sent: Tuesday, 20 November 2018 12:48 PM

To: assignments@Ilkkauto.com; sur@lkkauto.com

Ce: AsherSng@lkkauto.com

Subject: FW: SHB3557K VS SLE9413P THIRD PARTY CLIAM  Our Ref.
PNPV2018-00010482/JL

Attachments: img-Y20115105-0001,pdf 19,69 ?m@ a0/n1t

vthitde In

Please attend to the PRS & direct settlement. SUF-E) Kﬁl A

Regards,

Lionel

From: Chiang Liat Choon [mailto:chianglc@cdge. com.sg]
Sent: Tuesday, 20 November, 2018 11:55 AM

To: Motor Claims 5G - SG Common
Subject: Fw: SHB3557K VS SLE9413P THIRD PARTY CLIAM Our Ref: PNPV2018-00010482/JL

Dear Sir,

Attached herewith repair estimate & gia.
Best Regards

Chiang Liat Choon

Taxi Crash Repair ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd
Off: 62148314 Fax: 65468156

From: ApeosPort-IV C5570 <sbs-singnalling@sbstransit. com.sg>
Sent; Tuesday, 20 November 2018 11:51 AM

To: Chiang Liat Choon

Subject: Scan Data from CDG_LO_AW_AS5570

Number of Images: 9
Attachment File Type: PDF

Device Name: ApeosPort-IV C5570
Device Location:

This message and any attachments may contain confidential, privileged or proprietary information. If you are not

1



the intended recipient, kindly notify us and delete this message and its attachments immediately, and please be
.advised that using, copying, distributing or disclosing any contents therein is not allowed. Statements pertaining to
any matter outside our business are not to be taken as endorsed by ComfortDelGro Corporation Limited or its
related companies. The comments/proposals provided are for discussion purposes only and are subject to
approvals. Nothing herein shall constitute a binding agreement between the parties. Neither party shall be bound in
any way to any term or condition except as agreed in a written agreement signed by the duly authorised
reprasentatives of both parties.

ComfortDelGro - a Green Office certified by the Singapore Environment Council - is committed to preserving the
environment. We encourage you to print this only if necessary.

SBS Transit Ltd [Registration No. 199206653M]

This message and any attachments may contain confidential, privileged or proprietary information. If you are not
the intended recipient, kindly notify us and delete this message and its attachments immediately, and please be
advised that using, copying, distributing or disclosing any contents therein is not allowed. Statements pertaining to
any matter outside our business are not to be taken as endorsed by ComfortDelGro Corporation Limited or its
related companies. The comments/proposals provided are for discussion purposes only and are subject to
approvals. Nothing herein shall constitute a binding agreement between the parties. Neither party shall be bound in
any way to any term or condition except as agreed in a written agreement signed by the duly authorised
representatives of both parties.

ComfortDelGro - a Green Office certified by the Singapore Environment Council - is committed to preserving the
environment. We encourage you to print this only if necessary,

SBS Transit Ltd [Registration No. 199206653M|

This message and any anachments may contain confidenual, prvikeged or proprismry informabon If you are not the intended recipent, kindly nalify
us and delete thm messags and its attachments mmediatealy, and pleass be advisad that using, copying. distnbuting o disciosing any contants
therein is not allowed. Statements pertaining 1o any matter outside our business ane not to be taken as endarsed by ComfontDelGro Corporation
Limitad af its meiated companies The comments/proposals pravided are for discusson purposes anly and ang subject 1o approvals Nothing herein
shall canstitute & binding agreement baiwean the paries. Neithar party shall be bound in any way to any tarm or condition except s agresd In &
wrilten agreement signed by the duly authonesd representatives af both parties

ComforiDelGro - 8 Green Office carified by the Singapore Environment Council - is commitied to preserving ihe environment. We sncourage you
1o print this only if necessary

ComfarDelGro Enginearing Pt Lid [Registralion No. 19950E046W)

ATTENTION:

The email and any attachments transmitted with it are private and confidential and intended solely for the
use of the individual or entity to whom they are addressed. If you have received this email in error, please
notify the sender immediately and delete this email and any attachments from your system. You should not
use, disclose, copy or store this email and any attachments.

Messages and attachments are scanned for all viruses known. However, you are advised that you open any
attachments at your own risk. If this message contains password-protected attachments, the files have NOT
been scanned for viruses by our mail domain. Please always scan for viruses before opening any
attachments.



Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

S —————————————————————— e e —————

From: Jjosey loh@fwd.com

Senl: Thursday, & June 2019 3:08 PM

To: Jimwong@cdge com.sg

Cc assignments; SUR; Admin A; Admin-D (LKKAuto); Asher Sng (LKKAuto),
motorclaims sgi@fwd com

Subject: RE: Yref 1201800015300/JL, Oref CC18110565/SHB3S5TK/jw

Without Prejudice

Dear Jim,

We refer to the above matter

We have repudiated all liability.

Kindly re-direct your client’s claim to our insured for handling.
Thank you

*Please note that contents of this emall should not be construed as any admission of liability en the part of our
insured and/ or insurers. We hereby maintain full reservation of rights and afl defences available to us.

Kind Regards
S ¥

Executive, Claims

FWD Singapore Pre. Ltd.
b Temasex Boulevard, #18-01 Suntec Tower Four, Singapore 038986

T [65)6727 5872
E josey.loh@iwd.com

W fwd.com.sg

5

insurance




From: Jim Wong See Pah [mailto:jimwong@cdge.com.sg|

Sent: Friday, 17 May, 2019 12:13 PM

To: losey Loh Kah Wal - SGUser <josey. loh@fwd com>

Subject: Yref PNPV201B-0010482/IL, Oref CC18110565/SHB3SSTK/jw
Dear Ms Loh

We refer the attached mail of 01.03.2019.

Please advise the status of our property damage claim.

Thank you,

Best Regards
Jim Wong
Claims Dept / ComfortDelgro Engineering Pte Ltd

Thia ITRRFEES MY red] any mfachmanid may contam comhoarTin nlluﬂl@ﬂc o propratary infarmalion, T you nre NGl Tha wiTonde] ieceerd. = indiy NOnTy Wl

il ddeshese e recsange pod it plitaehmesbs ommecately, Bnd paonae e Eeivised that wseng. coprping. dlatibiling o felclosd g @y combemes T o
ol mioweed, Siatemenis Rt mrming 10 ary moiker oultahe O DUSIRess e not 10 B lEsn il endors e by ComionDeltEn S Harnficn Lirmiad or A8
L] COMmgaT R Thee coxmimrenin Procorals o are i SSDuSEeon FUrfE TS '.'Ir‘|f Al & St WG o sl Mot hee s=all oonsluls A

bindirig) agroamedi botwoon thi partios. Neithot Saity shall be bound in any way 10 Bny lorm oF conditicn oxceo! as agrood iH & weithed agroemon
sgned by the duly awthonsed represantalives of both parties

comign DG - a Grean Office conifen oy 1ne Singapore Emaroamen] Cauncil - 18 somminiead 1o presaning NG srvonment. YW encaursge you 10
orimt e only d recrs sy

ymtor DG Eng neseng Poe Lt [Rogooranon o, 180610 45w

ATTENTION:

The email and any attachments transmitted with it are private and confidential and intended solely for the use of the
individual or entity to whom they are addressed. If you have received this emall in error, please notify the sender
immediately and delete this email and any attachments from your system. You should not use, disclose, copy or store
this email and any attachments.

Messages and attachments are scanned for all viruses known. However, you are advised that you open any attachments
at your own risk_ If this message contains password-protacted attachments, the files have NOT bezn scanned for viruses
by our mail domain, Please always scan for viruses before opening any attachments,



Merimen e-Claims Page | of 1

Direct Settlement

|CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING _I
Case | Wotified Est Submitied Ad] Assigned Ad] Rpt Ad] Subrmittd Ire Auth’ed Status
wa |19 Nev 2018 tomg M8 |sse00.00 $4900.00 e for.SvveY.
Edit fleg £ax Adj st | Edit Entimates | | view Aot Cancat Casa |

Hain Raferance Claim Details
/CLATM SUBFOLDER DETAILS [Created by adjuster]
Insasred: | Jin Chensu, [D: SH2813%4B

| Mabn )
Ciamant: | CITYCAB PTELTD,  Co. Reg. No.: 199502839G

1771172018 21:00 - :59
[63 Months and 18 Days From LTA Reg Date (Man vr)]

Claim Type: | TP / 1201800015300 POCYICOVET | any2018-00010482

Policy Mo,
(Claimant):

e he3 sHB3ISSTK Date of Loss:

Vehicke Reg. |
Mo | SLE9413P
(Insured):

- 1808893ITMESH

| Excess:
Repairer: | ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd {Loyang) 5% Lovang Drive, 508965 Loyang - Tel: 6714 8300
:*"""""“ | FWD Singapore Pte. Lid. (HQ) - Tel 6727 5700 . [Handled by Josey Loh]
Claimant's
Insurer:

|u:nm Capital Insurance Ltd (HQ) - Tel: £2222311

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6356-3561 .. [Handied by KALVIN ANG WET KUN | ... [Hl'l-ll Rpt dug
Adpster:  |99/11/2018)

|ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED view Al |  Compase Case mail |
There are no mall for this case.

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS™ view All | Search Tasks | Creste New Task | complete |

Due Date  Priority Type  Task Group Subject  Handler Assigned By Completed On Created On Done?

| ho results.
|

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=dsp_... 25/6/2019



Merimen e-Claims

Upload Documents | _Upiosd Photos | _Composs New Letter |

Claim Documents

*SHB3557K (1201800015300)
[SLES413P]
TP
CITYCAB PTE LTD
Nov 17 2018 9:00PM
[Jin Chensu]
ComfertDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd

Page | of 2

View | View in Browser | v

_Assessmant Reports |1 per poge |
[ho_[Finalired On | LKK Auto Consuitants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnall| Print
1 311718 15:04 | Adjuster Immediate Advice p Load HTM

Photos/Images [perpoge v &
No | Relabel/Resrder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnail| Print
1231118 16:14 | General View D | s | A
2 23/11/18 16:14 | General View D | oeaws | A
3 [23/11/18 16:14 | General View O | coaws | A |
4 [23/11/18 16:14 General View 0 | adws | A
S |2311/18 16:14 | General View 0 weaws |4
& [23/11/18 16:14 General View ﬁ Load 195
72311718 1614 | General View 0D  iwdws | 4
B |23/11/1816:14 | General View 0 s || B
5 |23/11/1816:14 | General View 0 | s | A
10 |2311/18 16:14 | General View @ | lssdwc | B
11 |[23/11/18 16:14 | General View 0| oades | &
{12 |23/711/18 16:14 Ganeral View | paaws | A
g_u 23/11/18 16:14 General View g Load 3G | A
(14 |291118 18114 | General View 0 | Laaws | A
15 IN11/18 1814 | General View O | wowrs | M
16 2311718 16:14 | Ganeral View 0| s | &
117 |23/11/18 16:14 | Chassis Number 0| osaws | I
l18 (33/11/18 16:14 | Odometer Reading O | v | &
19 (331118 16:15 | Reinspection Photo O | adiws | M
'tzn 23/11/16 16:15 | Relnspection Photo O | e | M
|21 |23/11/18 16:15 | Relnspection Phato O | adws |
Documentation [Loerpege  1v] M
No |Reiabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnall| Print
! |20/11/18 14:51 | EMAIL FROM FWD DD 20112018 ) | LoasFoF

2 |20/11/18 14:53 | TP EST & GIA REPORT ) | Lowa POF

3 |2Y11/18 18:57 TP ESTIMATE- MARKED D | LoadFoF

4 |10/06/19 1031 EMAIL FROM FWD DD 06062015, 0  oearr

Documents Checklist
DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST meset | Save | Prmt |

Trere are no document checklists configured.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_doc...

25/6/2019



Merimen e-Claims Page 2 of 2

Show Remarks To: [] Handling Insurer
hiotm: EEMATEE AV pOreME GnSSED i BROWw 8 1D arher DEFDEE.

https:/singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_doc... 25/6/2019



Adjuster Report

Page | of 4

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (co reg ne 1essoriser

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408833
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@Ikkauto.com;assignments@ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our Flle No: CC4/FWD1B020858/K1EB30Q2
Data: 25/06/2019
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: FWD Singapore Pte. Lid.  Palicy No: PNPV2018-00010482
Ciaimant Vehicle stBass7k Insured Vehicle No: SLE9413P
Date of Loss: 17112018 Matura of Claim: TP Claim No: 1201800015300
DESCRIFTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No: SHBI55TK
Make & Model: HYUNDAI 140, 1.7 D (A) Engine No: HIDDEN
Reg. Date 300972013 (Man. Year: 2013) Chassis No: KEMHLB41UMDUO4007a
Colour: Yallow Odomeler: 810890 km
Engine Capacity: 1685 cc
Market Value/New Car Price: N/A
Sum Insured (58): Market Value/New Car Price
NDITION OF VEHI AT TH F
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable); Yes Foolbrake (Serviceable), Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable) Yas Engine Modification: No  Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 205/80 R16 Rear Tyre Size: 205/60 R16
Front Left Side: West Lake 7 mm Rear Lefi Side: Wes! Lake 7 mm
Front Right Side: West Lake 7 mm Rear Right Side: West Lake 7 mm
The above values reprasen! (he remaining lyve reads depth
COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's Adjuster's Difference  DIff %/
Parts B40.76 710.00 138.76 16.45
Miscallaneous Items 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 730.00 430.00 300.00 41.10
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (55) 1.579.76 1,140.00 439.76 27.84
Approved Total (Overridden) (S$) 900.00
(S8) 1,579.76 900.00 679.76 43.03
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (S$) 110.58 63.00 4758 4303
Nett Amount (5§) 1,690,34 963.00 T27.34 43.03
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 20/111/2018
Date Inspecied. 20/11/2018 Inspected At ComforiDelGro Engineering Pte Lid
(Loyang)
59 Loyang Drive
Singapore 508868
Estimated Panod of Repair: 2.0 days
https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen_... 25/6/2019



Adjuster Report Page 2 of 4

Adjuster: KALVIN ANG WEI KUN Manager: Asher Sng Rong Yl

NOTE: This report reprasens our findings ar e fme and place of ingpection stafed hann. Such Mapechon hes been camied ouf 1o the best of our
knowdedge and ablity but ary ather fabiity under any ather croumstances is by axpressly oxcludedg.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen_... 25/6/2019



Adjuster Report Page 3 of 4

REPAIR DETAILS

'Reference

Part Source: MRM-SG Version: 1.0 (Last Synchronised: 20 Jun 2018)

|Parts: 143 HYUNDAI 140 1.7 D (A) (Catalogue:Menmen Singapare 1.0)
| Labour: Repairers (Price-denominaled Standard List)

[Print Code:  (Unsubmitted, no print-code for SHB3557K)

Validity: These estimates are valid only if they contain the print code (above) on all estimate pages. running page
numbers with the END OF ESTIMATES marker on the last estimate page

Further Info: llemaivalues not in reference catalogue are prefived wilh an aslerisk *

Recommended Parts

No. Gty Part No. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount

1 1 *REAR BUMPER Deformed 553.00FL *553.00FL
2 10 *REAR BUMPER CLIP Necessary 2200FL *2200FL
3 2 *REAR BUMPER BRACKET Serviceable 71.20FL *.FL
4 1 *REAR BUMPER SPONGE Serviceable 103.50 FL *-FL
5 1 *REAR BUMPER ADVERTISEMENT LOGO Necessary 50.00FS “*50.00FS
6 2 *REAR FENDER ADVERTISEMENT LOGO (LH/RH) Necessary 200.00FS *20000FS

F=Franchuse part. S=SpcNatt. L=LisiemDisc
Sub Total (S§) 909,70 825.00
- List Item Discount on L Items 20.00/20.00% (55) 14994 115.00

Total Parts (55) 849.76 710.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-oul. |
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Adjuster Report

Recommended Miscellaneous Items

There are no new miscellaneous items selecied.

Recommended Labour

Page 4 of 4

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour ltems
1 PANEL BEATING New 350.00 200.00
2  SPRAY PAINTING CHARGE New 250.00 200.00
3 WIRING CHARGE New 50.00 0.00
4  REMOVE/REFIX REVERSE SENSOR New BO.0O 30.00

Gross Labour Cost (S$) 730.00 430.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-oul.
< END OF ESTIMATES >
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