Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 20 November 2018 10:59 AM

To: lionel.tan@fwd.com; assignments

Cc: Asher Sng (LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: RE: Accident involving GY1897H & SGZ2860B on 11/11/2018 Our Ref:
1201800014707/JL

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed vehicle not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

BEST REGARDS,
G.Nivitha | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: lionel.tan@fwd.com [mailto:lionel.tan@fwd.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 20 November 2018 10:47 AM

To: assignments@lkkauto.com; sur@lkkauto.com

Cc: AsherSng@Ikkauto.com

Subject: FW: Accident involving GY1897H & SGZ2860B on 11/11/2018 Our Ref: 1201800014707/IL

Attn: LKK Team

Please attend to TP survey & do direct settlement.

Regards,
Lionel

From: simoi [mailto:simoi@singnet.com.sg]

Sent: Tuesday, 20 November, 2018 10:24 AM

To: Motor Claims SG - SG Common

Subject: Accident involving GY1897H & SGZ2860B on 11/11/2018 Our Ref: 1201800014707/JL

Hi,

Please find attached repair estimate and accident report and arrange for survey soonest possible.
Thanks & Regards,

Irene Leong

SOC LEON MOTOR WORKS
Tel : 67477858
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