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£1 UBIAVE 1, #02.25 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL: (B5) BIE6A501 FAX ; (165 (64315

Your Refl: XE8558U/5L/pl Date: 27 November 2018

Our Ref: CS/EGI18020954/Usb

The Motor Claims Department
ERGO INSURANCE PTE LTD

Dear SirfMadam,

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO._PC 733 3M .

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle
on 26/11/2018 at the premises of M/s Think One Autocare Pte Lid and have the
following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : 8% 28.396.30 .
Revised Estimate Amount :§8  9.082.90
“Check” Items Amount : 8% -

Market Value : S8 -

LTA Reimbursement Value 153 -

Nett Value : 5% -

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages
at the front ofs portion.

Comments/ Present Status:
Damages Consistent.
Repair days: 3 Days

Yours faithfully,
Marcus Chua
Automotive Assessor



Date; 2':'111513 Sent via Fax

Our Reference:  XE 8558U/SL/pl
Your Reference: PC 7334M

or

) THINK ONE AUTOCARE PTE LTD

Pra-Repair Survey [PRS] Acknowledgement

Vehicle For Inspection: PC7333M

Insured’s Vehicle: HE 8558U

Date OF Accldent: 31.10.2018

We acknowledge recelpt of your request for PR3 on: 19.11.2018

karentan@thinkone.com.sg

In compliance with "State Courts Practice Directions Amendmant No.1 of 2016", do select an assessor from

the [ist below and indicate your selection in the box marked *,

* KK

AlS Automobile Inspection Services Pie Lid LAS LB.5 Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
FTA FormTeam Consultancy Pte Ltd LEK LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
IAS Infiniti Appraisal Service PS5 Priprity Services

JRK P Knights Pte Ltd VAL Wicom Ltd

Our Imsured's driver has not reported the accldent to us todate.

V |others:  OFFICER-IN-CHARGE - STEVE LIM

Your request for inspection does not have your client's GIA report, kindly forward a copy.

Vv lvour request for Inspection does not have your client's cost of repair estimate, kindly forward a copy.

We acknowledge your Interast for direct settlement, we will assess & revert soon upon receipt of astimate.

Prepared by: Q‘@-\_/ Pei Li 6825 51594 claims@er
Signature: ¢ FAX : 6829 9247

Assessor use only: kshao
fssessor attended workshop on:
Assignment Date: Date:
Asslgnment Time: Time
Inspectar:
Remarks: [T vehicle not available at the appointed date and time.

Kindly acknowledge our Assessor presence for the above job .

Worlishop Acknowledgement & Stamp.
Mote: Our Inspection is on a without admissien to liability bosis.



PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owner ID Type: Company

Owner ID: 6025N

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.: PC7333M

Vehicle to be Exported: No

Intended Deregistration Date: 26 Nov 2018

Vehicle Make: YUTONG

Vehicle Model: ZK6119H AUTO
Primary Colour: Multi-Colour
Manufacturing Year: 2018

Engine No.: ISB67E6C29022315096
Chassis No.: LZYTBTE6XJ1020634
Maximum Power Output: -

Open Market Value: $144,538.00

Original Registration Date: 10 Aug 2018

First Registration Date: 10 Aug 2018

Transfer Count: 0

Actual ARF Paid: $7,227.00

Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility: No

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: -

PARF Rebate Amount: $0.00

Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date: 09 Aug 2028

COE Category: C - Goods Vehicle & Bus
COE Period(Years): 10

QP Paid: $30,889.00

COE Rebate Amount: $29,975.00

Total Rebate Amount: $29,975.00

Page 1 of 1

The information contained herein is correct as at 26 Nov 2018

OK

hitps://vrl.lta.gov.sg/ltalvrl/action/enquireRebate By PublicBefore Dereg Input ZFUNCTION_ID=F030... 26-Nov-18



Shirlez Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 27 November 2018 5:54 PM

To: ‘Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.)

Cc: SUR: assignments; Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: XEB558U / TP : PCT333M/LKK / DOA : 31/10/2018
Attachments: PC 7333M - Preli Advise.pdf

Dear Pei Li,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle PC 7333M.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@|kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408033)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) [mailto:admin-d@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 20 November 2018 1:33 PM

To: 'Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.)' <Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg>
Cc: SUR <sur@Ilkkauto.com?>; assignments <assignments@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: XEB558U /TP : PC7333M/LKK / DOA : 31/10/2018

Dear Pei Li,
Thank you for the assignment.
Please be informed that vehicle currently not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

Best Regards,

Catherine Chong | Admin

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-84:34 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.) [mailto:Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg]
sent: Tuesday, 20 November, 2018 12:06 PM

To: 'admin-d@lkkauto.com' <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Cc: SUR (sur@lkkauto.com) <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Ol : XEB558U / TP : PC7333M/LKK / DOA : 31/10/2018

Dear Catherine/Nivitha,



In compliance with “State Courts Practice Directions amendment No.1 of 2016" in regards to the Pre Repair Survey,
both TP repairer and ERGO Insurance Pte Ltd have agreed on your company LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD to be

the “Single Joint Expert”.

please assist to conduct this survey from THINK ONE AUTOCARE PTE LTD

ADDRESS : NO 18 DEFU AVENUE 2
SINGAPORE 539522
PERSON TO CONTACT . KAREN TAN @ 9128 8488 / 6844 3300

ERGO OFFICER-IN-CHARGE @ STEVELIM

Note: To survey on WITHOUT PREJUDICE basis. Please advise the consistency of damages to third party vehicle and
inform the repairer in_writing, that you are require to conduct a re-survey before vehicle is returned to
claimant. They are to contact your office directly. Please do keep us in the foop

Please fill up the necessary on ERGO PRS Form from workshop and return to us together on your update of the survey
status via Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg.

Attached are estimate, insured and third party’s SAS (note: reports not to be released to any Third Party).

Kindly acknowledge receipt of this email.

Regards,
Yee Pei L
Claims Assistant (Motar)

ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.

5 Temasak Boulevard, #04-01 Suntes Tower Five
Singapore 0358985

DID - +65 G629 9154

Tel | +55 58299199

Fax @ +85 GAZ9 9247

ERGO

ERGO is one of the major insurance groups in Germany and Eurape Warldwide. ERGO is represenitad in more than 30 countries and concentrates
on Europe and Asia, ERGO is part of Munich Re (Group). one of the world's leading risk carrners

WY ET00.COM S5



Catherine Chnng (LKK Auto)

From: Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.) <Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 20 November, 2018 12:06 PM

To: ‘admin-d@lkkauto.com’

Cc SUR (sur@Ikkauto.com)

Subject: Ol : XE8558U / TP : PC7333M/LKK / DOA : 31/10/2018

Attachments: XEB558U - SAS.pdf; PC7333M - SAS.pdf; PC7333M - ESTIMATE.pdf PC7333M - PRS
FORM.pdf

Dear Catherine/Nivitha,

In compliance with “State Courts Practice Directions Amendment No.1 of 2016” in regards to the Pre Repair Survey,
both TP repairer and ERGO Insurance Pte Ltd have agreed on your company LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD to be
the “Single Joint Expert”.

Please assist to conduct this survey from THINK ONE AUTOCARE PTE LTD,

ADDRESS : NO 18 DEFU AVENUE 2
SINGAPORE 538522

PERSON TO CONTACT - KAREN TAN @ 9128 8488 / 6844 3300

ERGO OFFICER-IN-CHARGE : STEVELIM

Note: To survey on WITHOUT PREJUDICE basis. Please advise the consistency of damages to third party vehicle and

inform the repairer in_writing, that you are require to conduct a re-survey before vehicle is returned to
claimant. They are to contact your office directly. Please do keep us in the loop

Please fill up the necessary on ERGO PRS Form from workshop and return to us together on your update of the survey
status via Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg.

Attached are estimate, insured and third party’s SAS (note: reports not to be released to any Third Party).
Kindly acknowledge receipt of this email.

Regards
Yee PeilLi
Claims Assistant (Motor)

ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.

& Temasek Boulevard, #04-01 Suntec Tower Five
Singapare 0384985

DID.- +65 G329 9194

Tel, . +55 6829 3199

Fax: +55 B8B29 9247

ERGO

ERGO & one of the major insurance groups in Germany and Eurcpe. Worldwide, ERGO is representad in more than 30 countries and concenirales
on Eurape and Asia. ERGO is part of Munich Re (Graup), one of the world's leading risk carmers

WA . Ergo.Comm.sg



Think One Autocare Pte Ltd
No.18 Defu Avenue 2
Singapore 539522
Tel: 6844 3300 Fax: 6842 4988

PC7333M Yutong ZK6119H
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Front bumper complete assy A 7 §  3.800.00 X
Front bumper right bracket 1 5 s 175.00 X<
Front panel assy $  8.900.00 X
Front centre logo -1 = £ 250.00 LX
Front right headlamp ~* ™ S 1,013.00 X
Front right bumper lower fog lamp 1 7 $  280.00 Ji
Front windscreen glass assy "E?/Wﬂ?:ﬂ'/{ $9%0 $ 8,175.00 —
Front windscreen glass top moulding g0 Fr¢7 S 606.00 —
Front wiper assy s s 708.00 <

§ 23,907.00
Less 10% $ 2,390.70

$ 21,516.30
Special Nett [tems
Front no plate a7 $ 80.00
Front panel sticker ) $  350.00 5/

$ 430.00
Total Parts $ 21,946.30
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Think One Autocare Pte Ltd
No.18 Defu Avenue 2
Singapore 539522
Tel: 6844 3300 Fax: 6842 4988

PC7333M Yutong ZK6119H

1 Labour for panel beating, cut, weld, straighten front right affected area S 2,500.00 ‘;4 dﬁb
and replace front right damaged parts.

2 To putty and spray painting front right portion. § 250000 S0
3 To check wiring and focus front headlamp. A 8 50.00 o/

4 To apply anti rust proofing to front right affected area. 18 250.00 >

5 To remove and install front windscreen glass to facilitate the repair. ~ $ 800,00 4427
6 To remove and install front wiper assy. A1 8 350.00 ¢

Total labour : §  6,450.00

Total parts : § 21,946.30

Total labour: § 6,450.00
Total repair cost: § 28,396.30
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¥y Ll LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
;‘- = ;; ; 51 Libi Ave 1 801-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408833
- TEL: 6256 31561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo: 199607 198R GS5T Reg. No, 19-8607 198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automoblle

ERGO INSURANCE PTE LTD Ref © CS/EGI18020954/Usbn2
IR
#04-01 SUNTEC TOWER FIVE Date 18-12-2018
SINGAPORE 038985
Code . EGI
i1 Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. XE 85580 Veh. Inspected PC 7332M
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. XE8558L/SLIpl Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From YEE PEI LI Assign Date 201172018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model YUTONG ZKG118H c.c 6620
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2018
Chassis No. LZYTBTEGXJ 1020634 Colour WHITE / GREEN
Odometer 16431 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Maodification MIL
General GOoOoD
3 Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |11 R225 DOUBLE COIN & mm
L/H Front Tyre |[11R225 DOUBLE COIN & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |11 R22.5(0) DOUBLE COIN &/6 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |11 R22.5 (D} DOUBLE COIN B/6 mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE FRONT VS PORTION,
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS
5. General Information
Accident Date  31/1012018 |Inspection Date 26/11/2018
Survey held at  THINK ONE AUTOCARE PTE LTD
NO.18 DEFU AVENUE 2
SINGAPORE 539522
5a, Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
BjIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 3 Working Days




' 7dl V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
“l';,""_i: 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 406933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607196-R Page Mo.1 of 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. PC 7333M
" Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition |y "k chop ‘;n {';'i]
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT BUMPER COMPLETE ASSY NOT NECESSARY 3,800.00 -
1|FRONT BUMPER RIGHT BRACKET NOT NECESSARY 175.00 :
1|FRONT PANEL ASSY TO REPAIR SEE 8.900.00 :
LABOUR
1|FRONT CENTRE LOGO NOT NECESSARY 250.00 -
1|FRONT RIGHT HEADLAMP NOT NECESSARY 1,013.00 .
1|FRONT RIGHT BUMPER LOWER FOG LAMP MOT NECESSARY 280.00 -
1|FRONT WINDSCREEN GLASS ASSY DENTED / WARPED 8,175.00 3,980.00
1|FRONT WIPER ASSY TO REPAIR SEE T08.00 -
LABOUR
1|FRONT WINDSCREEN GLASS TOP MOULDING NECESSARY 606.00 315.00
LESS 10% DISCOUNT -2,390.70 -429.80
21 516.30 3.865.50
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|FRONT NO PLATE (SN} NOT NECESSARY 80.00 =
1|SET FRONT PANEL STICKER (SN) NOT NECESSARY 350.00
430.00
LABOUR
LABOUR FOR PANEL BEATING,CUT WELD,STRAIGHTEN 2,500.00 480,00
FROMNT RIGHT AFFECTED AREA AND REPLACE FRONT
RIGHT DAMAGED PARTS.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF
FRONT PAMEL ASSY AND FRONT WIPER ASSY.
TO PUTTY AND SPRAY PAINTING FRONT RIGHT 2,500.00 300.00
PORTION.
TO CHECK WIRING AND FOCUS FRONT HEADLAMP. NOT NECESSARY 50.00
TO APPLY ANTI RUST PROOFING TO FRONT RIGHT NOT NECESSARY 250.00 :
AFFECTED AREA.
TO REMOVE AND INSTALL FRONT WINDSCREEN GLASS 800.00 400.00
TO FACILITATE THE REPAIR,
TO REMOVE AND INSTALL FRONT WIPER ASSY MWOT NECESSARY 350.00 -
6,450.00 1,180.00
GRAND TOTAL 28,396.30 5,045.50

Report Ref No. CS/EGI18020954/Usbn2




Page Mo..2 of 2

RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS
(TOITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

4,000.00

Report Ref No. CS/EGI18020954/Usbn2

CHUA KANG SENG

Licensed Appraiser

MSCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is made sobely for the use and banefit of the Client named on the fron page of this Repon.
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