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51 UBLAYE 1, #01-25 PAYA UKD INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408233 TEL : (065} 62563561 FAX : (065} 62564315

Your Ref: CDMPG18000719 Date: 05" December 2018

Our Ref: CS/EGI18020854/Aqd3 Without Prejudice

The Motor Claims Department
ERGO Insurance Pte Ltd

Attn: Pei Li
Dear Sirs/Mdm

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO._SKT 9786X

We thank vou for the instruction on _16/11/2018.

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle
on 23/10/2018 at the premises of M/s CUSTOM SPRAY PAINTING and
have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : 5% 274375 .
Revised Estimate Amount : S8 1.300.00 (Lump Sum)
*Check” Items Amount : 8% -

Market Value - S$ -

Salvage Value : 5% -

Nett Value :S% -

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the

o/s portion.

rear

Comments/ Present Status:
Damages consistent.

Days of repair: 3 days.

We have NOT authorise repair.

Yours faithfully

ADRIAN LING WAI PING
B.Eng, AMSOE, AMIRTE, AMSAE-A, M.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser



Nivitha (LKK Auto)

e ==
From: Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.) <Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg>
Sent: Friday, 16 Novermnber 2018 5:14 FM
To: 'admin-d@lkkauto.com’
Cc: SUR (sur@Ikkauto.com)
Subject: Ol : SGE9B0A4D / TP : SKT9786X/LKK / DOA : 18/10/2018 (CDMPG18000719)
Attachments: SGE9804D - SAS.pdf; SKT9786X - SAS.pdf; Re: Request for outcome liability accident

on 18,10.2018 SKT 9786 X with... (14.2 KB)

Dear Catherine/Nivitha,

In compliance with “State Courts Practice Directions Amendment No.1 of 2016" in regards to the Pre Repair Survey,

both TP repairer and ERGO Insurance Pte Ltd have agreed on your company LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD -
ADRIAN to be the “Single Joint Expert”.

Please assist to conduct this survey from CUSTOM SPRAY PAINTING PTE LTD,

ADDRESS : BLK 3019A UBI ROAD 1
SINGAPORE 408713

PERSON TO CONTACT :  FRANCIS NEO @ 9673 3893

ERGO OFFICER-IN-CHARGE : SITI

Note: To survey on DIRECT SETTLEMENT basis. Obtain estimate and advise the consistency of damages to third party

vehicle and inform the repairer in writing, that you are require to conduct a re-survey before vehicle is returned to
claimant, They are to contact your office directly. Please do keep us in the loop

Please fill up the necessary on ERGO PRS Form from workshop and return to us together on your update of the survey
status via Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg.

Attached are insured and third party’s SAS (note: reports not to be released to any Third Party).
Kindly acknowledge receipt of this email.
Fegards

Yee Pei Li

Claims Assistant (Motor)

ERGO Insurance Pte, Ltd.

ERGO

ERGO is ane of the malor insurance groups in Germany and Europe. Worldwide, ERGO is represented in more than 30 countries and concentrates
e

on Europe and Asia. ERGO is part of Munich Re (Group), one of the world's leading risk carmers



Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 5 December 2018 5:36 PM

To: ‘Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.)’; assignments; 'Siti A Thikah AB Rahman’
Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: SGE9B04D / TP : SKTI786X/LKK / DOA : 18/10/2018 (CDMPG1800071 g9)
Attachments: CSEGI18020854Aqd3.pdf

Dear Siti,

Enclosed herewith preliminary advice of 5KT 9786X.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

sent: Wednesday, 21 November 2018 3:47 PM

To: 'Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.)' <Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg>; assignments
<assignments@I|kkauto.comz; 'Siti A Thikah AB Rahman' <siti.rahman@ergo.com.sg=

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SGE9804D / TP : SKT9786X/LKK / DOA : 18/10/2018 (COMPG18000719)

Dear Siti,
Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SKT 9786X on 23/10/2018.

We are pending for estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan {Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pre Lid

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@]kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

sent: Monday, 19 November 2018 10:48 AM

To: 'Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte, Ltd.)' <Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg>; assignments
<assipnments@lkkauto.coms>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SGE9804D / TP : SKT9786X/LKK / DOA : 18/10/2018 ({CDMPG18000719)

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

BEST REGARDS,
G.Nivitha | Admin
LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid



Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 21 November 2018 3:47 PM

To: ‘Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.): assignments; ‘Siti A Thikah AB Rahman’
Ce: SUR

Subject: RE: SGE9804D / TP : SKT9786X/LKK / DOA: 18/10/2018 (COMPG18000719)

Dear Siti,

Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SKT 9786% on 23/10/2018.
We are pending for estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Fhone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Elk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park. Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

sent: Monday, 19 November 2018 10:48 AM

To: 'Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.)' <Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg=; assignments
<assignments@|kkauto.com>

Cec: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SGE9804D / TP : SKT9786X/LKK / DOA : 18/ 10/2018 [CDMPGIEU&G?H}

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email; assignments@lkkauto.com | fax; 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | Si408033)

Erom: Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.) ImaiIm:Suwev.nepon@erﬂm.mm.sg]
Sent: Friday, 16 November 2018 5:14 PM

To: 'admin-d@Ilkkauto.com' <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Ce: SUR (sur@Ikkauto.com) <sur@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: O : SGE9804D / TP : SKT9786X/LKK / DOA : 18/10/2018 (COMPG 18000719)

Dear Catherine/Nivitha,

In compliance with “State Courts Practice Directions Amendment No.1 of 2016" in regards to the Pre Repair Survey,
both TP repairer and ERGO Insurance Pte Ltd have agreed on your company LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD -
ADRIAN to be the “Single Joint Expert”.

Please assist to conduct this survey from CUSTOM SPRAY PAINTING PTE LTD,

ADDRESS :  BLK 3019A UBI ROAD 1



> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner |ID Type:

Owner ID:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

Singapore NRIC
39418

SKT9786X

No

21 Nov 2018

TOYOTA

TOYOTA COROLLA ALTIS 1.6L CVT
Grey

2015

1ZRX519647
MRO53REH104535568
90.0 kW (120 bhp)
$19,589.00

29 Jun 2015

29 Jun 2015

0

$14,589.00

Yes
28 Jun 2025
$10,941.00

28 Jun 2025

A - Car up to 1600cc & 97kW (130bhp)
10

$66,000.00

$43,578.00

$54,519.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 21 Nov 2018
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CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE

AUTOPLUS PRIVATE VERICLE

Name of Folicyhoider Tan Toaw Mir Wehicle No Sk TOTARN
Period of Insurance 2p Jun 2018 To 2 n 2016 Policy No ZIND& 1T TR12-00
Engine No. E Endorsement No

Chassis No MROBIREM 104535563 Hasued Date + Z5Way 2018
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DRIVER NRIC & LICENSE Pg. 1
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CUSTOM SPRAY PAINTING PTE LTD

BLK 30194, UBI ROAD 1, #01-32, SINGAPORE 408713

TEL: 6742 0982 FAX: 6748 8318
Email; csp.ubl@gmail.com

M/s:ERGO Insurance Pte Lid.
5, Temasek Boulevard.

#04- 01,Suntec Tower Five.
Singapore 038985,

Date:19-10-2018.

Motor Claim Department
Dear Sir/ Madam.

Re;Estimate of repair
Regn No: SKT 9786 X Toyota Altis 4 Door Saloon Auto.

'Tr-i;p

Yiao (bt

With abovementioned vehicle the Estimate Of Repair as follow:-

Spare parts supply.
1pc Rear Door O/S  eucted -
1pc Rear Door rubber O/S AL b~
Labour to Repair

$
1280.00 1250
245.00 X .

Less 25%

1525.00 160
381.25

Labour to panel beat rear accident affected
portion straighten and align back to shape.

Labour to putty and spray painting on
accident affected portion and spray

anti-rust.

Total estimate of repair

1143.75

80 30Y

$ 2,743.75

This estimate is not inclusive of additional parts and repair

at current status.

L H & nohly
" | parding

. f i nyryay
* Thirg party hasis
- s
® Suppeprmantary temis) must be rescrieyed and

15 subject to final approval fram [ksurance C:-rﬂ:ﬂn:.-
Acknowledged by Repaires
Signature;
Date:
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'’ Ve LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
B BE B 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
- TEL 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo 199607198R GST Repg. No 15:-8607128-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Autemobile

ERGO INSURANCE PTELTD Ref : CS/EGHB020854/Aqd3n2
| IRIERIN
#04-01 SUNTEC TOWER FIVE Date : 12-12-2018
SINGAPORE 038885
Code: EGI
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SGE 98040 Veh. Inspected SKT 9786X
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. CDMPG18000719 Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From YEE PEI LI Assign Date 16/11/2018
2 Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTAALTIS c.c 1598
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2015
Chassis No. MRO5S3IREH104535568 Colour GREY
Odometer BOG32 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Medification SPORTS RIM
General GOoD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |205/55 R16 MICHELIN & mm
L/H Front Tyre |205/55 R16 MICHELIN & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |205/55 R16 MICHELIM & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |205/55 R16 MICHELIN & mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE O/S BODY.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  18/10/2018 Inspection Date 23M0/2018
Survey held at CUSTOM SPRAY PAINTING PTELTD
BLK 3019A UBI ROAD 1
#01-31/32
SINGAPORE 408713
5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON AWITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS,
B}IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR! 3 Working Days




1 Vel V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

/‘,;g 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Unbi industrial Park, Singapare 408933

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg No- 109807198R GST Reg. Mo. 19-9607198-R Page No.:1of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SKT 9786X

: Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Description of Parts Condition
Qty pe Workshop ($))]  (8)
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR DOOR 0/S DENTED 1,280.00 1,280.00
1|REAR DOOR RUBBER /5 MNOT NECESSARY 245.00 -
LESS 25% DISCOUNT -381.25 -320.00
1.143.75 960.00
LABOUR
LABOUR TO PANEL BEAT REAR ACCIDENT AFFECTED 800.00 300.00
PORTION STRAIGHTEN AND ALIGN BACK TO SHAPE.
LABOUR TO PUTTY AND SPRAY PAINTING ON BOD.0O0 400.00
ACCIDENT AFFECTED PORTION AND SPRAY ANTI-RUST.
1,600.00 700.00
GRAND TOTAL 2,743.75 1,660.00
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 1,300.00
(TOITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CS/EGI18020854/Aqd3n2

2

ADRIAN LING WAI PING

B.Eng,AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-AM.MATA|

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:. This Report is made solely for the use and banefit of the Cllent named on tha front page of this Report.

third party acting or replving en this




