IOD Number
MID Veh

Civilian Veh
DOA

SAF Documents

1.5AF 1201

2. SAF Police Report

3. MID Final Bill

4. MID Damage Photos

Liability
Action

Remarks

: FY 18/19/0029
: MID 34674

:SME 7111L
:02/10/2018

Yes
Yes

Yes
Yes (in CD)

: SAF not at fault

: Recovery claim
: Submitted recovery claim amount at $17,073.00 to 3rd party insurer

(AIG). Pending offer from AIG.
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Hsiao TanE (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 10 May 2019 12:03 PM

To: ‘Ler, Bernard-JQ'

Cc Joy Irene (LKKAuto); Olivia Lau (LKKAuUto)

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING MID 34674 AND SME 7111L ON 02/10/2018 *Our
RefvCC2/MIDATB020832/p

without Prejudice
Dear Bernard,

We refer to our tele-conversation earlier, we understand thaf there is a complication of the cases and
unable to settle the matter at this moment. We, LKK only have until 15/05/2019 to handle cases of MINDEF.

wWe will get MINDEF to ligise with your good office in future correspondencea.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong. Chew | Case Handler
LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

sent: Monday, 6 May 2019 4:20 PM

To: Tan, Bennie-WZ (Bennie-WZ.Tan@aig.com) <Bennie-WZ.Tan@aig.com:>

Ce: Joy Irene (LKKAuto) <Joylrene@Ikkauto.com>; Olivia Lau (LKKAuto) <plivialau@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING MID 34674 AND SME 7111L ON 02/10/2018 *Our Ref:vCC2/MIDA18020832/p

Your Ref; To be advised
Our Ref: CC2/MIDA1B020832/p WITHOUT PREJUDICE

M/s AlG Asia Paclific Insurance Pte Ltd

Afttn: The Motor Claims Department

Dear Sir,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING MID 34674 AND SME 7111L ON 02/10/2018
We refer to the above matter.

We have been appointed by MINDEF as claims adjuster to handle all fraffic accident claims invelving military
vehicles with effect from 013 April 2007,



we are instructed that the accident was caused by your insured’s negligent driving and / or management
of his vehicle. As a result of the accident, our principal's vehicle was damaged and our principal has been
put to loss and expense, parficulars of which are as follows: -

1. Cost of Repair (MID 34674) $14,571.00
2. Loss of Use (25days x $100.00)  § 2,500.00
3. LTA/ GIA Search Fee $ 200

TOTAL $17,073.00

A copy of the supporting documents is enclosed.

Please note that repairs of MINDEF vehicles involved in accidents are caried out by MINDEF list of
appointed confractors or at the unit's zonal workshops and for security and sensitivity/restricted reasons -
There is no survey report for MINDEF vehicles.

To settle our principal's claim please forward your cheque made payable to “P§ DEFENCE" within 1 4working
days of your receipt of this letter,

Thank you,

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@]kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(4084053)



Hsiao Tung (LKKAuto)

From: HQ TPT Safety Branch <tptsafety@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, 6 May 2019 9:26 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: <5eek Approval for Recovery Claim=> FY18/19/0029 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING

MID 34674 AND SME 7111L ON 02/10/2018]
Hi Hsiao Tong,
Approved.

Regards,
Raveen

On Wed, Apr 17, 2019 at 8:40 AM Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto] <chewht@lkkauto.com> wrote:

» | CFT Merlin/ | WO Rovesn [FY18/19/0029)
- According to SAF soccident report, the accident sccurred
solely cavsed by the negligence driving of clivilan driver by
rear-ended cur MID 34574 As such, SAF driverisnot ioble for
causing the cccident.
- We have odjusted claim amount for MID34474 as below:-
- For your approval please.

Hsico Tong
LKK Avuto Consultants Pte Lid
17 April 20019
Your Ref: To be advised
Our Ref; CCEJ’M]DMBGED&SEID WITHOUT PREJUDICE

M/s AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Ple Lid

Attn: The Motor Claims Department



Dear Sir,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING MID 344674 AND SME 7111L ON 02/10/2018

we refer to the above matter.

We have baen appointed by MINDEF as claims adjuster to handle all traffic accident claims involving military
vehicles with effect from 01¢ April 2007,

We are instructed that the accident was caused by your insured's negligent driving and / or management
of his vehicle. As a result of the accident, our principal's vehicle was damaged and our principal has been
put to loss and expense, particulars of which are as follows: -

I, Cost of Repair (MID 34474) $14,571.00
2. Loss of Use (25days x $100.00)  $ 2,500.00
3. LTA/ GlA Search Fee 3 2.00

TOTAL 3517,073.00

A copy of the supporting documents is enclosed.

To setfle our principal's claim please forward your chegque made payable to “PS DEFENCE" within
1 dworki f your rece] this letter.

Bast Repards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408033)
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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
From: Hslao Tong (LKXAuto)
Sent: nesclay, 10.ApHl 2019 8:10 AM
Tor tptsafety@gmail.com
Ce: Joy frens (LKKAUto); Olivia Lau {LKKAuto)
Subject: . |<Seek Approval for Insurance Searchs FY 18/13/0029 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING MID
_3451-?4 & SME 71171L ON 02/10/2018]
Date 1 10 APRIL 2019 |
1o  MINDEF -~ Arm :
Aftention : CPT MERLINS 1WO RAVEEN
4
Your Ret | FY 18/19/0029
Qur Ref:

ACCIDENT INVOLVING MID 34674 &/SME 7111L ON 02/10/2018
We refer fo the r::b:::_w: matier, [ Al

According e SAF's accident report, the accident cocumas selsly caused by the negligence diiving of
chvilian driver by rear-ended cun kAl

We are processing potential Trecovery for Mindef.

process Potenfial R&qggemf{prﬂ_m’

4 Cﬂﬁ'mmﬁpmﬂm

.‘ i

34674, As such, SAF driver s not licbie for causing the accident.

respective insurer. Plecse note the Insurancs Search fee is $2.00/-.

Therefore, we are seeking your ﬁlpp;v\‘ﬂi o apply the Insurance Search for vehicle SME 7111L fo enable us to

For yow approval please, il : I ! .
N . |
Best Regurds, i
Hslao Tong, Chew [ Casg Handler = : dEE g Ee A : |
LEK Auto Consultants Pte td | |
Phoue: 6742-3197 | smail: gh X | fox: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Uls :

ue 3, #02-25 | 8(408933)

51842144

| : =t )
[l 1 wommowx APPROVED
: HD TRANSPORT




. 41162018

Our Ref Mo:
Date of Reguest.

GENERAL
INSURANCE

ASSOCIATION
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

Invoice

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
& Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 8224 0030
Operating Hours: Monday o Friday 9am to Spm
GST Registration No: M400017735

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

GR-19-060051
18/04/2079

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25

Paya Ubi industrial Park

Your Ref No: Online Purchase

Singapore 408933
Dear SirMadam,
Enquiry Date 16/04/2019
Fnaguiry By CHEW HSIAD TONG
2 \ehicle No. SMET111L
Accident Date 0210/2018
Enquiry Result
TP Vehicla No. Insurer Peariod of Insurance Insurer Tel. No.
SMET111L AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid. 25/08/2018-24/02/2020 65-6419-3000
SMET111L AlG Asla Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid, 27/09/2018-26/00/2020 §5-6419-3000
Thank You.

The images provided 1o you are lak
Singapore and we laka no responsi

ar in connection with the reparts or their images.

en from the original reports forwarded to the centre by the me
bility for their accuracy of contents and shall be under no libility

\his is a computer generated document and requires no signature,

hitns:isinganore mernimen.com/cl

almafindex. efmPusebox=MTRsas&fuseaction =dep_geninvip&refid=

mbers of the Genaral Insurance Association of
whatzoever for any loss or damage arising oul of

21186858 CFID=5145343124CFTOKEN=369... 12



416/2018

GENERAL
INSURANCE

ASSOCIATION
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

Our Ref No: GR-19-060051
Date of Reguest: 16/04/2019

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25
Paya Ubi Industrial Park

Invzice

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
& Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
Operating Hours: Monday to Friday Sam to Spm
GST Registration No: M400017735

TAX INVOICE

Your Ref Nao; Online Purchasea

Singapore 408933

Dear SirMadam,

Enguiry Date 16/04/2019

Enguiry By CHEW HSIAC TONG

2 Vehicle No. SMET111L

Accident Date 02/10/2018

DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (55)

TP Insurer Enquiry 1.87

GST Amount 0.13

| Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 2.00

Thank You.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

For GIARMC Official use;

Date:

[X] GIRO [] Cash [ ] Chegue
htips./singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsas&fuseaction=dsp_geninvipfrefid=21186E58CFID=514343124CFTOKEN=969. . 2/2



RESTRICTED

FIGURE H-1 — STATEMENT OF TRANSPORT OPERATOR (MID 34674




RESTRICTED

FIGURE H-3 — STATEMENT OF REAR PASSENGER (1)

H-3
RESTRICTED




RESTRICTED

POLICE REPORT




ES PO received on 12/02119 02:32 PM HRS

QA184898

PONo 4001699138 . g

item No 2 ' B '3 4 |

|Sem¢,a C}paratmn - | GENERAL SERVICE | ASSESSMENT FEE e 'SUBCON SERVICE __l

MO No 8202177811 ' 8202177811 8202177811 3 ';

‘MO Text 'REFER TO STK 92FMDMOS/ | REFER TO STK 92FMD MOS/ 'REFER TO STK 92FMD MOS/ |

R (<7 - — \CLEMENTI (CLEMENTI !

Mo Type o Curraclwe Maintenance {Piatfnnn} | Corrective Maintenance (P! LP!arn‘nnn‘J Gun‘emhre Maintznance {FIatEornT_}l

‘MO Priority ‘Routine - 'Routine Rautlﬁe |

‘Equipment No MID34674 MID34674  MID34674 il

'Equipment Description " TRUCK AMBULANCE: F550 CBT | TRUCK AMBULANCE: F550 CBT TRUCK AMBULANGE: F560 CBT |
- |TPT72TON TPT 7.2 TON ~ TPT72TON |

iFEquip Maodel Mo | e i i

| Equip Serial No MID34674 _ MID34674 MID34674 |

 Assembly No | '. =

MaterisiNo 0320856216 0320856216 0320856216 B

|'. erial Description ' TRUCK AMBULANCE:FORD | TRUCK, AMBULANCE:FORD 'TRUCK AMBULANCE:FORD

o o 'F550,CBT TPT,7.2TON F550,CBT TPT,7.2TON 'F550,CBT TPT,7.2TON

'Device Data S . |

' Service Qty ~ |1.000 1,000 11.000 '

Operation Wark Center Clementi Camp B Weh Workcentre | | Clementi Camp B Veh Workcentra Clementi Camp B Veh

. IWF | IWF Workgentra IWF

Matanat arial Transfer '_Transferrecﬁ {10 STK ,Transjerred to STK Transferred to STK

‘Warranty Claim 'Not Applicable ' Not Applicable Not Applicable

ServieeGrowp General ASSESSMENT_FEE Subcontracting

Plant ~ AoD1 A0O1 |AQO?

Item Qty o 11.000 11,000

‘uomM  ldeb Job | Job ;

ltem Price($) 516,64 1599.36 |13455.00 j

Plan Del Date ~ [11-Feb-2018 | 23-Jan-2019 23-Jan-2019 |

| Tracking No 8202177811 8202177811 18202177811

ContractNa B |8017100888 8017100888 |B017100888 1

| Contract Item No 00008 00007 00005

ANe 15000473128 5000473128 15000473128

RFQMtemNo 00005 | 00006 00004

Amend Ind - | New ENE.;_ | New ]

| Line No = i1 I |1 b

‘Senice No | AB01623464 CB01631001 | AB01622035

| Service Description ;Transportatian Svo | AssmntEER/BR Fees | Sub-Con Svcs

Line Qty o [1.00 1.00 1.00 |

oM - JB Job JB Job |JB Job

Unit Price($) 516.64 599.36 13455.00

Total Price($) - |s1664 599.36 113455.00

Valid Ind Yes Yes \Yes




Customer Ref Na: 8202177811
RFQ Ref Na: 5000473128
Customer: JAMB/92FMD
Ship Te: S3AMB/O2FMD

KRANJI CAMP BLK 807 CHOA CHU

KANG
Vehicle No: MID34674
Description: ACCIDENT REPAIR

Dear Sir,

Sub-contracting
Subcaon

Agzessment Fes
Aszazsment Feg

General Sarvice

Transportation

Walidity of Quatation ; a0 Days

Yours faithfully

MName:
Designation/Date;

ST Englneering Land Systems Ltd,
249 Jal2n Boon Lay, Singapare 619523
T: (65) 8285 1086 F: {B5) 6285 9763
{Regn. No.: 1871002630

Page

T

5.¢ ST Engineering

Date:

Tatal Delivery Period {days):
Subcon Delivery Period (days):

Amaount(3)
5 13,455.00
Sub-total: 5 12.455.00
Amount()
& 589,36
Sub-total: % 589.36
Amount($)
3 16.64
Sub-total: g 516.64
Grand Tatal: 3 14,571.00

BER/MNot Approved/Rejected” by:

*{Delate whare applicable)

Land Systems

21 Jan 2019

Mame ;
Date :

of 3

WAL Slang g, com



2"% ST Engineering

Land Systems
PARTICULARS OF VEHICLE
VEHICLE NO.: MID34674 CHASSIS/HULL NO.: 1EDAFEHTIDEASS4 SWD READING: &
WEHICLE NSN: 0320856218 ENGINE/COMP: MID34ETS ENGINE HRS: a
VEHICLE MODEL: F{'J‘Rg AMBULANCE [TRLIGK,AMBULANCE:FGRD F550.CBT TPT, SPEEDO READING: 4528.70
7.2TON)
CUSTOMER REFERENCE
DATE OF RFQ: 08 Oct2018 UNIT: LEMENT| CAMP FREPARED BY: GHANI
CUSTOMER NO: NA MR/MO NO.: B202177811
ZONAL: aAMB/92FMD Job No: 11 MKAR120006
Scopa Of Work & Labour
TaskID SN  Description Work Dana Q;?-!de MHR Type Remarks
10 SUB-CONTRACTOR JOB (VANTAGE)
20 L Job camed out by sub-contracter as sccordingly to RPL & REP SUBCONS  §11,700.00
their guotation attachad
30
4 Sub-Can Delivery Period - 87 working days from PO
receivad
50
=] 1 Diagnostic fee for Equipment chargsd under BMR DFAL £500.26
7a
80 TOWING SERVICES
a0 1 Callaet vehicle from Clamenti camp, raturn to same TOWGEAT $5168.64
location
100 POC - ME3 Suhenderan 97898847
110 BOC - David Lee 81006184 (Vantage)
120
Sub-contracting
“Task Description Unit Price Markup Selling Price Sea Air Fraight Total Price
o Fraight
Subcon Cost £11,700.00 15% $13,455.00 $0.00 £0.00 £13,455.00
Sub-total %13,455.00
Assessment Feeg
Type Description Unit Price Markup Total Price
OFA4-55  Diag Fee for Equip charged under BMR - t500.36 $585.36
(1J0r18-30Ju n'18)
Sub-total £590.36

pote - tams that cannot be checked by QA will be written &5 NA
LEGEND: REP - REFAIR, RPL - REFPLALCE, IMFO - INEORMATION QNLY, TiA - TIME ADJUSTED

ST Engineering Land Systams Ltd.

249 Jalan Boon Lay, Singapora 818523

T: (65) 6265 1066 F: (B5) 8285 9763

{Ragn. No.: 187 100283N) WAL SIBNGE.COMm

Paga 2 of 3



$.% ST Engineering

Land Systems
General Sarvicas
Type Descripticn Unit Price ity Tatal Prica
TOWG3T-58 Towing Sanvice for Wheelad Vehicles {*= 3 Ton) §258.32 2 5516.64
except far M3G - (1Jul8-30Jun'1g)
Sub-total §518.84

Mote : llems that cannat be chackad Dy QA will be writtan as NA
LEGEND: REP - REFAIR, RFL - REPLACE, INFC - INFORMATION OMLY, Ti4 - TIME ADJUSTED

Mataral Class: 001-35 MPL FP, 002-55 MPL Non-FP, 003-25 MPLAgency, 004-85 MPL Valua Addad, 005-55 Non MPL PR, 006-55 Non MPL Mon-
PP, D07-55 Nan MPL Agency, 008-53 Nan MPL Vaiue Added, 009-55 MNon MPL Mon-PP{Supplier Contract), 201-SDDA S35 MPL PP, 202-53D0A 55
MFL Non-PP, 203-3004A 55 MPL Agency, 204-S0DA 55 MPL Value Added, 205-5DDA S Nan MPL PP, 206-300DA &5 Nan MPL Nen-P?, 207-
SDDA 53 Man MPL Agency, 208-5004 55 Nan MPL Yalue Added

ST Engineqring Land Systems Ltd,

243 Jalan Baon Lay, Singapare 819523

T: (B5) 8265 1066 F: (85) 5265 47683

(Regn, Now: 197100283N) www.stanpg,.com

Page 3 aof 3



VANTAGE AUTOMOTIVE

VEHICLE REPAIR

Data; 17th Jan 2018 Vehicle Na. 34874 MID CCA
Te Mr Ghani Chassis No, 1FDAFEHTIDEAZB4E2
Mileags NA,
Na, Work Description Labour Material Amount
1 Feplace RH rear under hung box assy (No stock) 5 1800001 % &10000)% 10.000.00
2 Remaove & Replace RH rear under hung box wiring 3 800.00 MNA £ 800.00
Last Entry
Note: Back order duration (4-5 weeks from the
date of approval) Repair duration 25 working days
upon receiving B/O parts from factory.
Sub -Total: 5 11,700.00
TR GST: §  B19.00
Grand Total: 3 12,519.00

Name & Signaturs

Regent Motors

A mivision of Yamlage Audomotive Limited
BSIFESS MG, KO, S1E55E0TL

308 Alevardra Red Singoporn 155842
Tel: 85-8477 7400 Fax: 63-8477 7303
A martiior of tha lﬁ' Sima Singapera Group



