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SEUBEAVE |, 80225 PAYA UBLHINDUSTRIAL PARK., SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (0651 61563561 FAX : (065) b2564315

Yourref:  DI1SD0ROGTIMESH

Owr ref: CS/FCL18020809/Avd3 Date : 21/12/2018

The Motor Claims Department

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

Dear Sir/Madam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. SLQ 3649C

We thank you for your instruction on 16/11/2018

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on

20/11/2018 at the premises of M/s SUCCESS ED PTE LTD
and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : 554,288.08

Revised Estimate Amount + §52,050.00(LUMEP SUM)
"Check"” Items Amount k]

Market Value h

LTA Reimbursement Value : 5%

Nett Value .

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the s
rear portion

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent

Yours faithfully,

ADRIAN LING WAl PING
B.Eng, AMSOE AMIRTE.AMSAE-A M.MATAI
Licensed Appraiser



MS @ FirstCapital

M5 Firs? Capital Insurance Limited ©oReg %o 1950001060 CST Reg Mo M2 DO0DLETS S
6 fatfles Quay #21-00 Singapone 48580
Tel (B5) 6222 2311 Fax (B5) 6222 3547

Claims & Hater Underwriting Depr: 35 Robinson Road #1E-01 Gty House Singapore 058877
Tel: (65) 6507 3648 Fax (65 6507 3849

wownwd mafirsteapital com.sg

Date

Accident Date

Insured Vehicle

Survey Location
Contact Person.

Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor

Contact Person

Contact Number.

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

12-11-2018 Qur Ref No. D180080681MFSH

08-11-2018 Claim Type. Third Party

SHAO320B8 Third Party Vehicle. SLO3648C

2 KAKI BUKIT AVE 2 #01-33 & #02-20KAKI BUKIT AUTOHUB
SIRINA SOON

B67461515/ 67471787 Fax No. 67485015

WITHOUT PREJUDICE: WE ADMIT LIABILITY QUANTUM TO BE AGREED:

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

NA Fax No. 68416315
MNA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop

Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

SUCCESS UNITED PTE Aiteriticn. Tl
LTD
MNA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA
LURENE

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection,

This is 2 computer generated letter, no signature required

wee ot [GEEERTRY msvesn




Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veran Chen (LKKAUtO)

Sent: Friday, 21 December 2018 11:18 AM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims'

Cc 'Lurene Jaw’; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18008061MFSH/1, 5LQ 3649C
Attachments: SLQ 3649C PRELI ADVISED.pdf

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SLQ 3649C
Date of survey: 20/11/2018
Number of days : 4 days

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email ;sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Veron Chen [LKKAuta)

Sent: Wednesday, 21 November 2018 8:53 AM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg=>

Ce: 'Lurene Jaw' <Lurenelaw@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18008061MFSH/1, SLQ 3645C

Dear Sir/Madam,
Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SLQ 3649C on 20/11/2018 .

We are pending estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

FPhone: 6256-3561 | email sur@ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 16 November 2018 3:55 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: 'Lurene Jaw' <Lurenelaw@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18008061MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,



Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed vehicle not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

BEST REGARDS,

G Nivitha | Admin

KK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: gssignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4313
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

Erom: CWS Motor Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg)

Sent: Friday, 16 November 2018 2:01 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Lurene Jaw <Lurenelaw@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18008061M FSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

‘ AUG This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
! T WWW.AVE.COm



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 21 November 2018 8:53 AM

To: 'CWS Motaor Claims'

Cc 'Lurene Jaw'; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18008061MFSH/1, SLQ 3643C
Dcar Sir'Madam,

Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SLQ 3649C on 20/11/2018 .

We are pending estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 5256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

sent: Friday, 16 November 2018 3:55 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Ce: 'Lurene Jaw' <Lurenelaw@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18008061MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed vehicle not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: B256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{a08033)

From: CWS5 Mator Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg]
Sent: Friday, 16 November 2018 2:01 PM
To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Ce: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Lurene Jaw <Lurenelaw@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18008061MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.



Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

‘ IWG This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
. WWW.aveg.com



PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner |D Type:

Crwner 10

Vehicle Details

Vehicle Mo.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Wehicle Make:

Vehicle Model;

Primary Colour:
manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

M aximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date;

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

The information contained herein is correct as at 10 Nov 2018

Sinzapore NRIC
88308

SLO3849C

Yes

11 Nov 2018
HONDA

VEZEL 15X CVT
Blue

2014
L15B84409101
RU11209102
96.0 kW {128 bhp
$22,704.00

06 Jul 2017

O Jul 2017

o

$13.786.00

Yes
05 Jul 2027
$10,33%.00

05 Jul 2027

A - Car up to 1600cc & P7kW (130bhp)
10

$42.801.00

$34,240.00

$44,579.00

OK

https://vrl.lta.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/enquireRebate By PublicBefore DeregInput 7FUNC TION 1D=F03...

Page 1 of 1

10/11/2018



SUCCESS UNITED PTE LTD

2 Kaki Bukit Ave 2, #01-33 / #02-29

Kaki Bukit Autohub. Singapore 417921

Tel No. : 67461515 / 67471787 Fax No. : 67485015
Website : www.successunited.com.sg

Buss. Reg. No. : GST No. 200402570G

Page 112

MS First Capital Insurance Limited Estimate : TP18-120
36 Robinson Road
#16-01 City House Date : 1211172018
Singapore 068877 IIrr eon Vehicle Mum. : SLO3648C
S . Sl Make/Model : Honda Vezel-2018
Attention : Motor Claim Department Chassis/Eng# | RU11209102/L 1584409101
Contact : 65073848 Fax No. : 65073849 accident Date : 12/11/2018
Claim MNo. :
Reference : SHA3Z0B
Policy No. : (05.07.2019)
S/N  Quantity Particular Unit Price  Amount 5%
LISTITEMS : i
11 Rear Bootlid 220 1.053.70
2.1 Rear Boot Mechanism lock " e, . 138.50 7
a1 Rear Boot Weatherstrip i [ o8 ) 106.80 1 _
4, 1 Rear Boot "Vezel" Emblem o~ " 2 668.20 -
5 Rear Windscreen Moulding »~~~ a0y a A 96.70
6 1 Rear End Panel P~ Y ol o 365.70 -
7. 1 Rear Bumper Assy Lyl or——" 680.50.
List TotalSs . 2,510.10
20.00% Discount 5% 502.02
2,008.08
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS : f
1. 1 Reverse Sensor el “~+ 0 280.00
2 1 Windscreen Sealant s 40.00 —
Special Nett Total 55 320.00
LABOUR :
To remove, rearrange electrical wirings, check lighting BO.OD" 5
To remove, reinstal rear windscreen 20000
To remove, replace & transfer rear boot lid companents 18000 o
;rc remove, repair and replaced damaged bodyparts,
realign bodyworks & where consistent to the accident.

CONTINUE/ ...



SUCCESS UNITED PTE LTD

2 Kaki Bukit Ave 2, #01-33 | #02-29

Kaki Bukit Autohub. Singapore 417921
Tel No. : 67461515/ 67471787 Fax No
Website : www.successunited.com.sg
Buss. Reg. No. : GST No. 200402570G

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
36 Robinson Road
#16-01 City House
Singapore DGBEYT

Attention . Motor Claim Department
Contact : 65073848 Fax No. : 650738458

.1 67485015

Page 2/2

Estimate : TP18-120

Date : 12/11/2018
Vehicle Num. | SLO3643C
MakeModel : Honda Vezel-2016

Chassis/Eng# - RU11209102/L15B84400101
Accident Date : 12/11/2018

Claim No.

Reference : SHA3Z20B

Folicy Mo. : (05.07.2019)

S/MN  Quantity Particular Unit Price  Amount 5%
To putty and respray painting on affected areas 600700
Labour Total S5 ¢ 1,960.00
o N 2o[u ¢
n.ﬂl s J'I
/
Hoted 2
, 2650
E.&0E. Total 5% : 4 288.08

for SUCCESS UNITED PTE LTD



e 74 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Bl BE B 51 Ubi Ave 1 801-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
- TEL: 5256 35681 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo 100607T198R GST Reg No. 19-0607108-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref CSFCIB020808/Avdan2
soromsonson eworeosssr 0% 2z |[NTHN
Code: FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHA 320B Veh. Inspected 5LQ 3848C
Policy No. Coverage (5) 0.00
Claim No. D1B00B061MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From LURENE Assign Date 16/11/2018
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model HONDAVEZEL c.C 1496
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2017
Chassis No. RU11209102 Colour BLUE
Odometer 42645 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOD
5 Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |215/60 R16 DUNLOP & mm
L/H Front Tyre |215/60 R16 DUNLOP & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |215/60 R16 DUNLOP & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |[215/60R16 DUNLOP & mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION,
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  0B8/11/2018 Iinspar.tinn Date 20/11/2018
Survey held at SUCCESS UNITED PTE LTD
2 KAKI BUKIT AVE 2
#01-33 KAKI BUKIT AUTOHUB
SINGAPORE 417921
5a, Remarks
AIDAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
B)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS,
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS
5b. Estimate Days of Repair

IESTII'.MTED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 4 Working Days




ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SLQ 3645C

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

51 Ubi Ave 1 £01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 189807198R GST Reg. No. 19-0807108-R

Page No.:1 of 2

Estimate By | Our Adjusted
aty Description of Parts Condition | Stmate t;}] “{.
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR BOOT LID DENTED 1,053.70 1,053.70
1|REAR BOOT MECHANISM LOCK NOT NECESSARY 138.650
1|REAR BOOT WEATHERSTRIP NOT NECESSARY 106.80
1|REAR BCOT "VEZEL" EMBLEM NECESSARY 68.20 58.20
1|REAR WINDSCREEN MOULDING NECESSARY 96.70 85,70
1|REAR END PANEL TO REPAIR SEE 365.7T0 -
LABOUR
1|REAR BUMPER ASSY DEFORMED 680.50 BB0.50
LESS 209 DISCOUNT -502.02 -379.82
2,008.08 1,619.28
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|REVERSE SENSOR (SN) NOT NECESSARY 280,00 -
1|WINDSCREEN SEALANT (SN) MECESSARY 40.00 4000
320.00 40.00
LABOUR
TO REMOVE REARRANGE ELECTRICAL WIRINGS,CHECK 80 00 30.00
LIGHTING.
TO REMOVE REINSTALL REAR WINDSCREEN 200.00 120.00
TO REMOVE,REPLACE & TRANSFER REAR BOOT LID 180.00 BO.00
COMPONENTS.
TO REMOVE,REPAIR AND REPLACED DAMAGED Q00.00 400 00
BODYPARTS REALIGN BODYWORKS & WHERE
CONSISTENT TO THE ACCIDENT.INCLUSIVE OF THE
REPAIR OF REAR END PANEL
TO PUTTY AND RESPRAY PAINTING ON AFFECTED 600,00 400.00
AREAS.
1,960.00 1,030.00
GRAND TOTAL 4,288.08 2,589.28

Report Ref No. CS/FCI18020809/Avd3n2
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RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 2,050.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CS/FCI18020809/Avd3n2

Page Mo.2 of 2

LR

ADRIAN LING WAI PING

B.Eng. AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-AM.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser

MSCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report 8 made solsly for the use and benefit of the Clisnt namad on the front page of this Repart.

Mg Bakillty o responsibiity whatsseves, In contact oo lor, s accepted to any third party wive may reply on the Report wholly or in par. Any third party acting or replying on this
Repor. in whele or in pan. does so al his o et ewn fsk




