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Mivitha !LKK Auto)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkayto.com=

Sent: Wednesday, 17 April 2019 10:29 AM

To: ‘Albert Hong', assignments

Ce: 'Lincoln Yeo'

Subject: RE: Appoint LKK to conduct TP survey; Our Ref: C10002245
Cwear Albert,

Thank yeu for the email.

Please be informed that according to the repairer TP owner already withdraw claim.

Bast Regnrds,

G.Nivitha| Admin
LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Pisone: bB41-1972 | emall: gasignmentsiidautocom | fitx: 6es6-4315
Blk 51, Poyn Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Albert Hong [mallto:albert.hong@budgetdirect.com.sg]

Sent: Tuesday, 16 April 2019'5:33 PM

Tia: "assignments' <assignments@lkkauto.com>

€z: 'SUR' <sur@lkkauto.com>; Lincoin Yeo <lincoln yeo@budgetdirect.com.sg>
Subject: RE: Appoint LKK to conduct TP survey; Our Ref: C10002245
Irnportance: High

Hi Team,

Any update/finalisation on this survey?

Our insured is requesting from an update on TP claim and we need your assistance to provide us an update,
Thank you.

Regards,

Albert Hong
Senior Executive, Claims

T +65 6540 2182
F +B65 6725 0853

E albert.hona@budgetdirect,com.sg

Budget
Direct

insurance

AR
we sty



Customer Care +65 6221 2111
Claims +65 6221 21599
Claims (Int.) +65 6540 2199

190 Clemenceau Avenue, #03-01
Singapore Shopping Centre
Singapore

39924

budgetdirect.com.sg

auto&general

Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited (Co. Reg. No. 201626103G) trading as Budget
i u ;

This emall is sent by Auto & General (SEA) Services Pte, Limited or a related body corporate (Auto B
General) and Is for the intended addressee. The views expressed in this email and attachments (email)
rzflect the views of the stated author but may not reflect views of Auto & General. This email is
confidential and subject to copyright. It may be privileged. If you are not the intended addressee,
confidentiality and privilege have not been waived and any use, interference with, or disclosure of this
email is unauthorised.

From: Albert Hong
Sent: Friday, 16 November, 2018 10:18 AM

To: ‘assignments’ <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: 'SUR' <sur@lkkauto.corn>
Subject: Appoint LKK to conduct TP survey; Our Ref: C10002245

Hi Team,

Please accept survey assignment and liaise with TP workshop.
Thank you.

Regards,

Albert Hong
Senior Executive, Claims

T +65 6540 2182
F +65 6725 0853

E albert.hong@budgetdirect.com.sg

Budget
_Direct
insurance

Customer Care: +65 6221 2111
Claims: +65 6221 2199
Claims (Int.): +65 6540 2199

150 Clemenceau Avenue
#03-01, Singapore Shopping Centre
Singapore 239924



Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited (co. Reg. No. 201626103G) trading as Budget Direct Insurance.

From: Dynamic Autowork <dynamicautowork@gmail.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 14 November, 2018 4:12 PM

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect. com.sg>; Albert Hong <albert. hong@budgetdirect.com.sg>
Subject: SKHB7425 (Pre-inspection) / Your vehicle : SIA2408X

Cear parson in charge,

Please refer to attach file and arrange for pre-inspection,
Fope we can do Direct Settle. and please provide the surveyor firm or surveyor name list to canduct the joint pre-repair
sJrvey as a single joint expert

** PLEASE ADVISE LIABILITY**

Thank You.
Yaurs Sincerely,

Michelle
HP: 9856 4815

8 Kakl Bukit Avenus 4

#38-09Premier @ Kaki Bukit

Singapore (415875)

T2l: 63416789

Fax: 53416778

This email is sent by Auto & General (SEA) Services Pre. Limited or a related body corporate (Auto &
Ceneral) and is for the intended addressee. The views expressed in this email and attachments (email)
reflect the views of the stated author but may not reflect views of Auto & General. This email is confidential
a1d subject to copyright. It may be privileged. If you are not the intended addressee, confidentiality and
privilege have not been waived and any use, interference with, or disclosure of this email is unauthorised.

. AVG This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
! WWW, aVE.COm




Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Albert Hong <alberthong@budgetdirect com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 16 November 2018 130:18 AM

To: ‘assignments’

Cc: 'SUR’

Subject: Appoint LKK to canduct TP survey,  Our Ref: C10002245
Attachments: 1411201816105 1.pdf

Hi Team,

Plense accept survey assignment and liaise with TP workshop.
Thank you.
Regards,

Albert Hong
Senior Executive, Claims

T +65 6540 2182
F +65 6725 (0853

E 7 |bert, hong@budoetdirect. com.sg

Budget
Direct

insurance

Customer Care; +65 6221 2111
Claims: +65 6221 2199
Claims (Int.): +65 6540 2199

191 Clemenceau Avenue

#03-01, Singapore Shopping Centre
Singapore 239924
budaetdirect.com.sq

Ao & General Insurarice |Singapore) Pte. Limited (co. Reg. No. 201626103G) trading as Budget Direct Insurance.

Frem: Dynamic Autowork <dynamicautowork@gmail.com>

Sent:'Wednesday, 14 November, 2018 4:12 PM

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>; Albert Hong <albert hong@budgetdirect.com.sg>
Subject: SKHE7425 (Pre-inspection] / Your vehicle : SIAZ408X

Dear persan In charge,
Piease refer lo attach file and arrange for pre-inspechon

Hoope we can do Direct Settla and please provide the surveyor firm or surveyor name list to conduct the joint pre-repair
survey as a single joint expert

"% PLEASE ADVISE LIABILITY**



Thank You,
You's Sincerely,

Micoelle
HP': 9856 4815

& Kalil Bukit Avenue 4

HOB 0%Premier @ Kaki Bukit

Singapore (415875}

Tel 63416789

Fak : 634] 6778

This email is semt by Auto & General (SEA) Services Pte, Limited or a related body corporate (Auto &
Gierieral) and is for the intended addressee. The views expressed in this email and attachments (email)
reflzet the views of the stated author but may not reflect views of Auto & General. This email is confidential
and subject w copyright, It may be privileged, If vou are not the intended addressee, confidentiality and
privilege have not been waived and any use, interference with, or disclosure of this email is unauthorised.



DYNAMIC AUTOWORK PTE. LTD.
& KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 4, #08-09, PREMIER @ KAKI BUKIT, S'PORE 415875
Tel: 6341 6789 Fax: 6341 6778
Co. Reg. No. : 201436361C

Date: {\{)H)[E\ By Fax & Email
To: I?,lud:_.w 4 ;)i f'Ef.-‘{
Attn : Motor Claimis Departisent

Re:  Accident involving motor wehicle Nos. SN H342 6 i STR 24094
a!@ngJ:P -‘L‘{i{l of @Mbu}(m%simﬂwﬁ Gt s Pesulon f&!lfilzi&l'b

We refer 1o the above matter.

Wie dre instructed by Sze Wa Jie EW?(W to notify you of a road tratfic-accident

o b2 !” W avabout &40 @ SILF Poge of gﬁmbﬂm Road foudards Genses Ave
involving our client's/customer’s vehiole registration number Sk @34-1 S and vehicle

reglstration number 51h2408 Kdriven by you at the material time.

As a result of the aceident, our client’s /customer’s vehicle has been damaged. Before our
lient/we proceed 1o repair the damaged vehicle, please let us know within 2 working days of
vour receipt of this notice whether you or your insurer would' like to conduct a pre-repair
survey of the vehicle. 1fwe do not receive any reply from you within the stipulated timeline,
our chent/we shall proceed to repair the vehicle without further reference to you,

Thank You

Yours faithfully

[V

L.
Albby

Hp : 9856 4815




