Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.coms

Sent: Tuesday, 26 February 2019 8:34 AM

To: Poh Kin (LKKAULD)

Cc: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: RE: SEEK MANDATE; ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NOS. GT

3864R (Ol) AND SDZ 110G (TP) ON 14-11-2018; LKK ref : CC4/LPC18020773/T1fa3;
Lonpac ref; 18/18/18/VC00/021119 [External Confidential]

Lonpac External - Confidential
Dear Poh Kin

Kindly proceed as proposed

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555

The all { ¥&% ) lonpac.com.sg

Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only.

From: Poh Kin (LKKAuto) [mailto:pohkin@Ilkkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 19 February, 2019 7:34 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc: MT_Claim_SG; Admin A

Subject: SEEK MANDATE; ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NOS. GT 3864R (OI) AND 5DZ 110G (TP)
ON 14-11-2018; LKK ref : CC4/LPC1B020773/T1fa3; Lonpac ref: 18/18/18/VC00/021119

Importance: High

Without Prejudice

Our Ref: CC4/LPC18020773/T1fa3
Your Ref: 18/18/18/vC00/021119

Dear Gerald,

ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NOS. GT 3864R (O1) AND SDZ 100G (TP) ALONG ANG MO
KIO AVENUE 5 ON 14/11/2018

We refer to the above matter.

Liability: The accident occurred when our Insured Driver collided into rear of third party vehicle. Liability is
down against our Insured.

Summary to offer to third party repairer, Hitachi Capital Asia Pacific Pte Ltd is as follows: -

1



Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

From: Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 19 February 2019 7:34 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc: MT_Claim_5G; Admin A

Subject: SEEK MANDATE; ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NOS. GT 3864R

(Ol) AND 5DZ 110G (TP) ON 14-11-2018; LKK ref : CC4/LPC18020773/T1fa3; Lonpac
ref: 18/18/18/VC00/021119

Attachments: LKK Adjustment report.pdf; LKK Inspection report pdf: LKK Resurvey photo.pdf; LKK
survey photo.pdf; TP LOD_ SDZ 110G.pdf

Importance: High

Without Prejudice

Our Ref: CC4/LPC18020773/T1fa3
Your Ref: 18/18/18/vC00/021119

Dear Gerald,

ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NOS. GT 3864R (Ol) AND SDZ 100G (TP) ALONG ANG MO
KIO AVENUE 5 ON 14/11/2018

We refer to the above matter.

Liability: The accident occurred when our Insured Driver collided into rear of third party vehicle. Liability is
down against our Insured.

Summary to offer to third party repairer, Hitachi Capital Asia Pacific Pte Ltd is as follows: -

Claimed Amount Revised Amount
1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) S 7,485.45 (56,995.75 + 7%gst) S 4,721.91 (54,413.00 + 7% gst)
2. Loss of Rental S  749.00 ($140.00 x 5 days) S 749.00 ($140.00 x 5 days)
3. GIA search fee S 2.00 S 2.00
Total | $ 8,236.45 S 547291

**05 days recommendation for repair
Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and reference.

The above is for your approval.




@ Hitachi Capital Asia Pacific Pte. Ltd.

Jun Taiyo Service Centre

Mo. 8 Fourth Lok Yang Road

Singapore 628705
Lonpac Insurance Bhd Date ; 01/02/2018
300 Beach Road i i _ -‘.--,-'_'/
#17-04/07 The Concourse hous Riy CEA|LPC !E,-?__{ f 5
Singapore 199555 Mas

Re : Accident involving vehicle no.: SDZ110G and vehicle no(s): GT3864R on 14/11/2018 at Along Ang Mo Kio Aven
Dear Sir,

Reference to the above accident, we are submitting the following claims on damages to our client's vehicle caused by your
insured's vehicle,

¥ Workshop repair bill (Cost of repairs) TP20087257 $4721.91
[ Loss of use vehicle for O days at ($0.00 /day)

] Medical expenses

[ Surveyor report fee

] Rental invoice $749,00
Ll Pain & suffering

LU Traffic police investigation fee

¥] Search fee $2.00
L1 Others

Grand Total : £5,472.91

Please find the following documents enclosed,

] Accident Report [ Police Investigation Result
¥ Repair Bil [J Medical Receipt

\ehicle Rental Receipt [ Surveyor Bill

Search Fee Receipt L] Excess Bill

[ My Insurance Company

O Palicy No

O] Others

We look forward to your settlement within 30 days failing which you have to bear all costs incurred for engaging a solicitor to
enable us to recover full settlement from your company.

Thank you.
7
St

Hitachi:Capltal Asia Pacific Pte. Ltd,




HITACH]

Inspire the Next

AUTHORISATION TO ACT

I'We, e W Wiey _of 319224 b6 +

{ -
o . owner of Unziie G hereby
authorized HITACHI CAPITAL ASIA PACIFIC PTE LTD, (“The Waorkshop™) to act for mefus with

respect to my'our claim for the repair costs and/or rental andor loss of use for my/our vehicle number

Sontoy that was damaged pursuant to the accident occurred on l‘{"lli['lﬂtf’: _at
- ﬂ[,;;p_f il*vq e b A 5 ____ involviag vehicle number

T 3604 L

['We further authorise the Workshop to settlz my/our above mentioned ¢laim in a manner that they deem
fit and The Workshop is further authorised to receive payment further to settlement of my'our claim with

payment cheque being made in favour of HITACIHI CAPITAL ASIA PACIFIC FTE LTD.

The settlement The Workshop may reach on my/our behalfis on without prejudice and without admission

of liability basis insofar as the driver/owner/insurers of the other vehicle's is concernad.

Pursuant to Personal Data Protection Act 2012, ['We hereby agree that The Workshop may discloss or
share my personal data to any authorized service providars whom The Workshop would necessarily nead

le cooperate, interact or work in one way or another in serving me or meeting my requests.

If Dwe are not able to recover full amount for the repair cost from the 37 Party's Insurance Company
in 6 (six) months time from Invoice Date, HITACHT CAPITAL ASIA PACIFIC PTE LTD (HCAP)
shall bill ta yousyour Campany for the bal ance/full amount of the repair cost. HCAP will clase this

case without prior notice If we are unable to recover within 2 years,

D IWe understood the explanation done by HCAP,

(Fignearura)
Diated this 1> dayof [ (month) Dol

Signed by Claimant Signed by Hitachi Capital Kaia Pacific Pe
Ltd

{with Co's stamp for vehicle under Co’s nama)

& Hitachi Capital Asia Pacific Pta. Ltd, {Main Oifica) cn Reg He 199400309
108 Somasiat Soard 511 DE-Birgapare 230740 Ta @3 ETIL 1222 Faa BT Bdis

WiraLiech-Cagital oM gy

dun Taiyg Sarvics Sentre [(Sutamabila Lawaiivg & Warkahop;
1 Fourtiv Lob vang Fioad Singapars L3555 Tl 1451 455 0 WU Ew W EATE BE



" LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

DATE . wh wﬂ
DISCHARGE VOUCHER

CLAIMNO : 18/18/ \8.-"\«’(.’00;‘!]3 119

I/'We, LEE HEE LIANG confirmed acceptance from M/s LONPAC INSURANCE
BHD and/or the owner of GT 3864R the sum of Singapore Dollars Five Thousand
Four Hundred Seventy-Two and Cents Ninety-One Only ($5,472.91) in full and final
satisfaction. liquidation and discharge of property claim competent to me/us upon the
said M/s LONPAC INSURANCE BHD in respect of property claim sustained by
me/us whether now or hercafter to become manifest. arising either directly or
indirectly from an accident to my vehicle. SDZ 110G on 14" November 2018 along/at
Ang Mo Kio Avenue 5.

I /We hereby agree to indemnify and keep indemnify (NEW ART FRAME &
POSTER CENTRE /LONPAC INSURANCE BHD) against all claims and any
claims whatsoever made by any person/persons on our behalf in respect of the said
accident.

I'We further authorize you to pay the above settlement sum directly to M/s
HITACHI CAPITAL ASIA PACIFIC PTE LTD.

I/'We hereby acknowledge that this payment is made on a without admission of

liability basis and without prejudice to all related claims and in respect of our
insured’s recovery action.

Signature of vehicle owner/Date

lee Mee Livy 1218119

Name of vehicle owner/Date



® Hitachi Capital Asia Pacific Pte. Ltd.
Jun Taiyo Service Centre
MNo. 8 Fourth Lok Yang Road Singapore 629705

Tel: 64663022 Fax: GESGE591
Co.Reg.No. 199400399N GST Reg. No. M2-0118999.3
TAX INVOICE
/S - Lonpac Insuranca Bhd Invoice Mo - TP20087257
300 Beach Road Accident Date @ 14/11/2018
#17-04/07 The Concourse Veh Regn : SDZ110G
Singapore 199555 Madel : Toyota Estima 2.4 Aeras- WP
end 03/11/2018
Attn : Motor Claim Dept Date L 3012014
Terms ¢ O days
Due Date C 302019
Your Insured : GTABG4R
Total Pages =it
Qty S5Unit SEAM! Silabor
1. Body Repair P r Ch
1 Parts 2,513.00
2 Labour 1,900.00
SubTotal: 000 441300
Grand Total : 4,413.00
Add 7 % GST : 308,91

Met Total After GST : 4,721.91

INTEREST OF 1% PER MONTH WILL BE CHARGED ON ANY AMOUNT DUTSTANDING FROM DUE DATE

All cheques should be crossed and made payable o
Hitachi Capital Asia Pacific Pte. Lid,

==l

Sarvice Manager
Job done by



® Hitachi Capital Asia Pacific Pte. Ltd.

Jun Taiyo Service Centre
Mo. B Fourth Lok Yang Road Singapore 628705

Tal: BABE3022 Fax: 68066501
Co.Reg.Mo. 192400309N GST Reg. No. M2-0118998-3
TAX INVOICE
MJ’S ; Mr Lee H'ﬂﬁ L|aw Inwaice Ma b NRdUﬂBT?EQ
3 West Coast Walk Accident Date  © 14/11/2018
#01-07 The Pare Condominium Veh Regn ; SDZNM0G
Singapore 127140 Madel © Toyola Estima 2.4 Aeras- WP
end 03M11/2019
Aftn: Mr Lee Hee Liang Date : 31/01/2019
Terms - Odays
Due Date s 3012019
Your Insured o GT3864R
Total Pages E R
Qty S$Unit S$Amt SSlabor
1. Rental Fag
1 Rental of SKB2619L for 5 days 5.00 140.00 700.00
SubTotal: 70000 0.00
Grand Total T00.00
Add 7 % GST: 48.00

Met Total After GST : 742.00

INTEREST OF 1% PER MOMTH WILL BE CHARGED ON ANY AMOUNT QUTSTANDING FROM DUE DATE

All cheques should be crossed and made payable to :
Hitachi Capital Asia Pacific Pte. Lid

Service Manager
Job done by :




Raplacement Vehicle Report

| Particulars of Hirer ",

Mame Mr Lee :-ic-i Liang
Company's Name i Mr Lee Hee Liang
Addrass 3 Wesl Coast Walk #01-07 The Parc Condominium Singapora 127140
Wehicle No L SDZ10G
Tel 04230308
HP ;84220309
Vehicle Particulars Reason for Replacement :
Vehicle No SKB2e1aL L1 Accident
Maker : Tayota O Repair
Madel : Estima 2.4 O others
ouT Petrol: 100 [ “ Petrol: 100 [
| Date : 28/11/2018 — Date by LTS
Time ; 1535 S0 b— Time : L Highet o -
Mileage (km) : a0 b | Mileage (km) : 2o < P
Mo of Keys {pcs) 1 o | No of Keys (pcs) A —
—_— : 7
4] o =
Others:
|Mark "X" on Damage Parts N - e

|/ We hereby confirm our acceptance:

s

N/

| Nar.ne. ﬁ{Lﬂi \/ﬂ iy MName: ﬁ\\'h\a\.&/ -

Farfon behalf of Hitachi Capital Asia Pacific Pte. Lid. o Faorlan behalf of Hitachi Capital Asia Pacific Pte Lid.

1. Excess $1,000 in Singapore [ $1,500 in Malaysia. Additional Excess of 3,000 for young driver age 25 years &

below or driving license less than 2 years.
2. In case of vehicle's Insurance is under Third Party only, Excess is to cover for any third party damage or injury claims.
3. The Lessee shall be responsible for same petrol level ($25.00 / quarter) and all traffic ofences.

| Othars:

1af1




Invoice

;m, GENERAL
.~ INSURANCE

“WET ASSOCIATION

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

Dur Ref No GR-18-177058
Date of Request: 15M11/2018

Hitachi Capital Asia Pacific Pte. Lid
Mo 8 Fourth Lok Yang Road

Singapora 629705

Dear SirMadam,

Enqguiry Date 15M11/2018
Enguiry By Mg Jiong How
TR Wehicle Na GT3864R
Accident Date 14/11/2018

Enquiry Result

Page 1 of 2

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
5 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580

Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 9am o Spm

GST Registration No: M400017735

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Your Ref Na: Online Purchase

TP Vehicle No. Insurer Period of insurance Insurer Tel. Mao.
GT3BE4R Lenpac Insurance Bhd 01/M10/2018-30/09/2019 +65 G2507368
Thank You.

The images provided to you are taken from the original reports forwarded to the centre by the mambers of the Ganeral Insurance
Association of Singapore and we take no responsibility for their accuracy or contents and shall be under na liability whatsoever for any
loss or damage arising out of or in connection with the reports or their images.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

hitns:fsineanare. merimen.com/claimsfindex cfmhicehav=MTR cac® liceartion=den 1s19me



lnvoice

LY
il

| B § Raffles Q 00, 048580
W B INSURANCE Pmieeie;ﬁa;zﬁ'lgut;uﬂ E;:g?%%rgzga 0030

S0 ASS0CIATION Cperating Hours: Monday to Friday 8am o Spm

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

TAX INVOICE

Dur Ref Mo: GR-18-177058

Date of Request: 15/11/2018 Your Ref Mo

Hitachi Capital Asia Pacific Pte. Lid
Mo 8 Fourth Lok Yang Road
Singapore 628705

G5T Registration No: M400017735

Online Purchase

Page 2 of 2

A GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
""" GENERAL  RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

Dear Sir'Madam,

Enguiry Date 15/11/2018

Enquiry By Ng Jiong How

TP Vehicle No GT3864R

Accident Date 14112018

DESCRIPTION [AMOLUNT (5%)

TP Insurer Enguiry 1.87
GST Amount 0.13
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 2.00|
Thank You

This is a computer generated document and requires no signaturs

For GIARMC Official use:

Date:

[X] GIRO [] Cash[] Cheque

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsas& fuseaction=dsp ... 15/11/2018



