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From: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>
Sent: Monday, 26 August, 20159 1:18 PM
To: Vic (LKKAUta);, Admin A
Cc: Ong Chin Kiat; Alfred Toh; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Chee So Chow
Subject: RE: <SEEK MANDATE> RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBC9613H (O6

SNM18D05290C02/3(ock) and SHCA712S (TP : LKK REF - CC3/CTI18020740/Nha3)
on 08/11/2018

LKK REF - CC3/CTI118020740/Nha3
CTPIS REF - SNM18D05290C02/3(ock)

Dear Vic

We refer to your email of 23 August 2019 pertaining to above matter.

Please proceed to resolve the property damage claim at $11,590.40.
We await your payment advice to enable Chin Kiat to act accordingly.

Best Regards

Alfred Toh

Senior Executive

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

3 Anson Road #XX-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079908
DID : (65) 6389 6183

FAX: (65) 6224 7478

W: www.sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsal | WeChat: A F#ii Taiping SG

Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential
information. Any unautherized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are nat
the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately. Ploase delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter.

From: Vic (LKKAuto) [mailto:vicalpeh@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, 23 August, 2019 2:09 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com=

Cc: Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com=; Admin A <admin-a@Ilkkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto)
<vicalpeh@lkkauto.com=>; Chong Boon 5en <boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com=

Subject: <SEEK MANDATE> RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBC9613H (Ol: SNM18D05290C02/3(ock) and
SHCA712S (TP : LKK REF - CC3/CTI18020740/Nha3) on 08/11/2018

CTI REF - TBA
LKK REF — CC3/CTI118020740/Nha3

Dear 5ir/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES GBC 9613H (01) AND SHC 47125 (TP) ON 08/11/2018

We refer to the above matter.

It was reported that Insured vehicle was changing lane when collided to the TP vehicle.



We had spoken to the Insured Company PIC Mr Alex and was informed of the TP claim. A letter was also sent out to
the Insured company to notify TP claim and NCD issues. No feedback received till date.

As such, under MCF and BOLA scenario 15, liability is not to our Insured's favour and we have to settle the claim
from the TP vehicle and the damages sustained to TP vehicle were consistent to the nature of the accident.

summary to offer to repairer SMRT AU TOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD is as follows:

TP CLAIMED REVISED - TO OFFER
Cost of Repair S 2855824 S 10,311.00
Loss of Rental ($118.24 x 11.5 days) ¢ 1,359.76 ¢ 1,182.40(5118.24x10
days
Loss of Income ($60 x 1.5 days) 5 30.00 o 5 90.00 (replacement)
LTA Search Fee 5 7.00 S 7.00
TOTAL 5 30,015.00 $ 11,590.40

Breakdown of days is as follows:

Recommended Days 6 days
Weekends / Downtime 4 days
TOTAL | 10days

Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and reference.

For your approval and/or further instructions please.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vie Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh @lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)
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This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Ong Chin Kiat [mailto:chinkiat.ong@s .cntaiping.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 20 Movember, 2018 3:02 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Cc: Poh Kin (LKKAuto); C5 A Team; Admin A

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBC9613H (Ol : CTI - TBA) and SHC47125 (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/CT118020740/Nfa3) on 08/11/2018

Without Prejudice

Dear Mei Kwan,



Vic (LKKAuto)

From:
Sent:
To:
Subject:

Attachments:

Dear All,

We quantify our claim as follows:-

Tan Lee Gek (Auto Sves/Claims & IA/Claims & [A/Taxis) <LeeGek@smrt.com.sg>
Wednesday, 17 July, 2019 5:13 AM

CS A Team; Admin A

LOD Re: Accident on 8/11/2018 involving SHC 47125 & GBC 9613H (China
Taiping's insured) Our Ref: TAX/11/18/2032/lg

TAX 11 18 2032 pdf; img-717083926-0001.pdf;
viesnap-2019-07-17-09h11m28s473.png; vicsnap-2019-07-17-09h11m37s846.png

Cost of Repair 510,311.00
Loss of Rental $1,359.76 (| 115 daysx 511824 )
Loss of Income $90.00 ( **1.5 dayx $60.00 )
LTA Search Fee 57.00
Total 511,767.76

We enclose the following documents:

1) Repair invoice

2) Proof of rental rate
3) Police/GIA reports
4) Accident vehicle laid-up report

5) LTA search

6) Hirer's letter of authorisation

7] Screen shot

Please let us have your offer soon. Thanks.

** our hirer has taken a replacement taxi on 9/11/2018 at 2.37pm. Please refer to the attached vehicle attachment

history.

Regards
T

Claims Department

SMRT Automotive Services Pte L1

an Lee Gek (DID: 6866 2647T)

&5 SMRT

AUTOMOTIVE
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51 UBIAVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL ; (065) 62563361 FAN : (65167414108

Our Ref: CC3/CTI18020740/Nfad

25" January 2019

Shipblast Marine Pte Ltd
9 Tech Park Crescent,
Singapore 638123,

Dear Sir/Madam,

ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NOS. GBC 9613H AND
SHC 47128 ALONG PIE ON 08.11.2018

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance
(Singapore) Pte Ltd to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under
the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will
therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and
settlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

Poh Kiny Chong

Case Handler

DID: 6841 2132

FAX: 6741 4108

Email: vicalpeh(@lkkauto.com

cc.  China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd
(Motor Claims Dept)




AUTHORIZATION TO ACT

[. SMRT TAXIS PTE LTD (the third party claimant™) of 60 LANDS IS y
PARK E4 (8)757705 (address). owner of SHC 47128 (vehicle no.) hereby authorize SMRT
AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD (“the workshop™) to act for me with respect to my claim

for repair costs and/or rental and/or loss of use (“claim™) for my vehicle no SHC 47128 that was
damaged pursuant to the accident which occurred on 08/11/2018 (date) along PIE (TUAS) NEAR
EXIT 26A (location) involving vehicle no/s GBC 9613H (“the accident™).

[ further authorize the workshop to settle my above mentioned claim in a manner that they deem fit
and the workshop is further authorized to receive payment further to settlement of my claim with

payment cheque/s being made in favour of SMRT TAXIS PTE LTD.

I further acknowledge that any settlement the workshop may reach on my behalf is on a without
prejudice and without admission of liability basis insofar as the driver/owner/insurers of the other

vehicles 15 concerned.

Dated this .% (day) of @3 h?,gif (month) 2019 (year)

Signed by “the third party claimant™ Signed by “the workshop™

(with chop if applicable) (with chop)



Date: &/ [wr.‘

Qur Ref. No.;

Letter of Authorisation

I TAN LI LIAM (NRIC No.: $15050%0C ) the

registered hirer / relief driver / contract hirer of SMRT taxi registration number
& SHCATISS hereby authorise SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd
(“AutoSvs”) to deal with all matters arising out of the accident between my taxi

and &&“‘:-‘ qf:.]?,. H happened on 8 - 2l T-A5 ﬁm%
along 4 To TuRS ( AFT  RKE )
(the "Accident”) on my behalf, including but not limited to instituting and any claims or

proceedings against such party or parties (as AutoSvs deems fit in its absolute
discretion) in respect of any claim, demand, loss, cost, expense, liability, damages or
action made against us or incurred or suffered by us.

Without prejudice to the foregoing, | further authorise AutoSvs to negotiate, resolve
and settle any proceeding or claim arising out of the accidents, including but not limited

. to doing any act or executing any document or signing the Discharge Voucher on my
behalf as may be required.

Name Tﬁﬂ : ”‘}1‘1‘“ HF\M .......... Signature: ,.é/

NRICNo. - S15020H0C ’
Tel No. 4864 N2,

address B 2T9A 'Iirﬂf‘l}lls <{ 23 % 06618
(513)

FR-AS-CLM-03 REV 3



Policy Mo @ DMCVSN1410481804 claim Mo ¢ SNM1BD0S5230C02/3 (ock)
Claimant ¢ SMRT T&XIS PTE LTD

Amount :  B511,580.00
SINGAPORE DOLLARS ELEVEN THOUSAND FIVE HUNDRED NINETY ONLY

I/We agres to accept the above mentioned amount to be paid to mefus in full &
final sertlement of all claims, costs & disbursements for injuries / damages
sustalned by me/us through an accident invaelving

Claimant Wehicle Ho. : SHC 47123
Insured Vehicle Mo. : GBRC 9B13H
Cate of Loss : pBS1l1/2018
FPlace of Accident : PIE (TUAS)

IN COMSIDERATION of the payment made to mefus  of the aforementcicned sum by
CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPCRE) FTE. LID., 1/We agree absolutely to
discharge CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE {(SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD. and/or

insured Name : SHIPBLAST MARIME PTE LTID
Driver Hame : TAMN KOK KWEE
from all claims, present or future in respect of all less, injury or damage

sustained by me/us arising out of the said accident.

1 acknowledge that this payment is made without admission of liability on the
part of CHINA TAIFING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE]! FTE. LID.

(1} Global Sum (all in) 55 11,550:00
TOTAL & ¢ ¥ € B ¥ b g enRigta o 5o MY 11,590.00
s -5 s T ek

1 \ _.-I &
Claimant MName : 1"{ o ¥ MRIC Mo Sﬁ(ﬁxxilﬁb\r

26 Ao 2018
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