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B V4 P4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ukl Ave 1 #801-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapare 408933

-
. A I
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6206 4315

Reg Mo 199607198R GST Reg Mo 19-8507158-R

Afflllated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (S) PTELTD Ref : CCICTI18020722/NMb3
SPRINGLEAF TOWERSINGAPORE 079909 D= cBfHaNe MII"MNIIMN
Code : CTI
12 Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh.  PH 8558H Veh. Inspected SMB 5081T
Policy No Coverage (5) 0.00
Claim No. Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 151172018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.c 0
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer - Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4, Description of Damages
5. l General Information
Accident Date 071/11/2018 Inspection Date 14/11/2018

Survay held at SMRT AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD
60 WOODLANDS INDUSTRIAL PARK E4 SINGAPORE 757705

5a. Remarks

A)JTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS,
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS
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Yourref: To Be Advised Date; 15112018

Owr ref: CC3/CTI18020722/Nib3

The Motor Claims Department

M/s CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (5) PTELTD

Dear SinMadam,

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO. SMBS081T

We refer 1o the above mutter.

Pleuse be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on 14.11.2018
at the premises of M/s_SMRT Automotive Services Pre Lid and have the following to report:-

Warkshop Estimate Amount - S% 2,138.00
Revised Estimate Amount : 55 1.700.00
"Check” Tiems Amount : 58 .
Murket Value : 8% -
LTA Reimbursement Value 58 -
Nett Vilue : 55 -

Description of Damage:

The vehicle sustained damages at the = ! 17 4 =
—————

N/S Portion —

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent
Estimuted normal period for repairs: 2 days

Yours Faithfully,

MOHD. NAZRIL
Licensed Appraiser



SMRT Accident Vehicla Repair Estimates
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SMRT Accident Vehicle Repair Estimates
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SMRT Accident Vehicle Repair Estimates

SMRT Aulomolive Sarvices Pl

B0 Woodiamds Industrial Park E4

IFAX Nurribier  E3ERSSEY

Enlrnatar Talaphons Numter 5

Acpoam Repomng Mumber 6F

Date Ganeraiod 14112018

Usar iD TanihLeo:

Section A - Accident Details
Fanairaticn Mumita: [smmw
Casta Reterencn Murmbes [BuEs1 118004
Regatation Data L2015
Company Tyoe SMRT Buses Lid
Mase ALEXNANDER DEMNIS
Maed |EMVIRD 500
Mama of Drver Zamuddin Bin Abu Badar
Tyoe of Accident Bt Swina
Accident Dabe and Tima L2018 4:D0 PM
Accident Rapored Date and Time 2112018 151 PW
Is Surveyor Roauird ¥ Mo
Survey v
Vahicke s Towed Back? ho
Towed Back Date and Time
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Progared Date and Time

HNI018 12:50 PM

Chanss Mumibar

Mileags

‘Work Shog
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Summary of Repair Estimates
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Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

e e ———————————— e ——

From: Lucas Lee <|ucaslee@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Friday, 21 December 2018 2:24 PM

To: Shu Pei (LEKAuto)

Cc: Catherine Thia

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving PHS553H (01 : CT1 - SNM18D05353C02) and
SMBSOB1T (TP ; LKK REF - CC3/CTIB020722/Nfb3) on 01.11.2018

Attachments: MSAT18148060-GBHA280R pdf

Dear 5ir,

Case Handler : Catherine Thia

Lucas Lee

Claims Departmen [Mator)

China Talping Insurance (Singapore] Pte. Lid.

3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleal Tower Singapore 079308
Ciirect (65) /389 6181

Fax (B5) 6222 71756224 7478

Email! lucas lea@@sn. cntaiping.com

Website www, sa cntalplng.com

¥ I.u.-'-n-nnﬁl"il.l

iy

VT

Tty seesminge dn cownficbenitoed, Bea o vartimis aoe meld comtstitiele of oottt fy Chitetat Taldpdng Tnseeranice (Sinpapare ) Pe. L, esoep
where prondded for in o wrnien agreement Beiwe e v it Clyiing Tadprbang Jivnrsomes (¥ Ingapre ) ' il Amy s thsriz e dive v
e dbF et el g, .|"I”|-‘l i ||J|uh il lm_r.'ruuf_ ix I|-J.|-rnlrnrll.'.r'.'.l' _“ Wikl diFe el r.rll; |rﬂrr.lq|rr.l|r u.'alrn}-nr |Ii'.hru' HICERiRre ﬂh'l'nn.r' notify the
sianiber immnediontely

From: Shu Pel (LKKAuto) [mallto:shupei@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Monday, 10 December, 2018 9:12 AM

To: Claims Dept of CTi

Cc; Lucas Lee; Catherine Thia; Alfred Toh

Subject: RE: Direct Settlemeant - Accident Involving PHS559H (Ol : CT1 - TBA) and SMB5081T (TP : LKK REF -
CC3fCTI18C20722/Nfb3) on 01.11.2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir / Madam,



We refer to the above matter.
Kindly let us have a copy of insured'’s accident report for our necessary action.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Aute Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: BI66-0055 | emall: shupe 0 lkhauto com | fae 6741-4108
Bik 51, Pava Ubn Industrial Park, Ut Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408533)

From: Shu Pel (LKKAUtD)

Sent: Tuesday, 27 November 2018 12:42 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping. coms

Ce: Lucas Lee <lucas lee@sg cntaiping com>; Catherine Thia <catherine.thi cntaiping com>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Invalving PHI559H (OI : CTI - TBA) and SMB5081T (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/CT118020722/Nfb3) on 01.11.2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
PDear Catherine,

We refer to the above matter.
Kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA repart for our necessary action.

Thank You.

Best Regands,

Shu Pel| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | emall: shuperidlbkauto com | fax: 6741-4108
Bl 51, Paya Ubi tndustrial Park, Ubl Avenuse 1, 802-25 | S(40B333)

From: 5hu Pel [LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 15 November 2018 5:36 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTl sclaimsdept Esg cntalping coms

Cc: Lucas Lee <lucas.lee@sg cntaiping.com>; Catherine Thia <cathenne thiai@sg crtalping.com>; Poh Kin (LKKAuta)
<pohkin@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@|kkauto.coms=

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving PHI559H (01 : CTI - TBA) and SMBSOB1T (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/CTI18020722/Nfb3) on 01.11.2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Catherine,

We refer to the above matter.

We have inspected TP vehicle SMB 50B1T at M/s SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd on a WP basis and TP repairer
proposed for a direct settlement,



Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.

En<losed for your perusal is:
TF's GIA report
- Estimated cost of repair
- Preliminary advice

Our case handler in-charge is Poh Kin and he can be contacted at DID: 6841-2132.

Thank You.

Best Aegards,

Shu Pel| Admin

LKK Auto Conultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email; shupeidiikkauto com | fax 6741-4108
8k 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408333)

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit hitp://w ww syvmunteccloud com
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by P

Without Prejudice
SIMRT V'L sMRT AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD
& Ang Mo Kio Strest 52
AUTOMOTIVE Singapore 568140

Tel: +65 6556 2521
Faux +85 Bag1 2221

Ll R I " " Vie H I] C (N www smit.com sg
Blk 5 ) fave U, T furfed 1ol X Your Ref.:
L&y faeviae | F C Y ] YOur Ref, 1‘.?L-':7J1'\7'E:’|f.n" \‘
el Yok
- J Date
Dear Sirs,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING 6 5021 T anp (H 15594
ON | v/ 7018 ALONG Ay

CLAIMS RESPONSE

Wae refer to your letler dated and our letter dated
We claim on behalf of
We acknowledge the receipt of your latter/claims dated

We have forward your claim 1o our Insurer. They will lialse directly with you
We enclose our documants marked "E” in the list below

Please give us your documents marked “R" in the list below:

Polica/SAS report of [€
Investigation Results |
Phatographs |
Confirmation of Taxi Rental |

UROO0o

Discharge Voucher [ ] Others

Letter of Claims
Survey Repart

£l
| Repair Invoice
|
|

We are looking Inta this matter and will revert 1o you.

We disclaim our liabflities. The accident was caused by your driver

Without admission of liability, we offer you S% all in 1o settle the case amicably
D Please quantify your claims

D We wish to survey / re-survey your vehicle. Please arrange and |ef us know the date & time
D We have no other allermatives but have to take legal action against you.

D Your offer of 58 is accepted. Please let us have your Discharge Voucher.
D Your offer of S§ is rejected. Please increase your offer lo 5%
D Please lel us have your cheque payable to

[C] others

ooo

for Manﬂgér'. iflénms LAY ™
Claims Department '

: FR-AS-CLM-01 REV 2



Audﬂ Woo (Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & IA/Buses)

From: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 4 September, 2019 5:29 PM

To: | Audrey Woo (Auto Sves/Claims & IA/Claims & IA/Buses)

Cc: Admin A; Vic [LKKAuto); Karen Chan Siau Chin (Auto Sves/Claims & 1A/Claims & [A/Buses);
Tan Wei Teck (Auto Sves/Claims & [A/Claims & 1A/Buses)

Subject: RE: LOD to China Taiping - SMRT BUS/11/18/1004/AW - Accident involving SMRT Bus
SMB5081T and PHI559H on 1 Nov 2018 along AYE after bus stop 17141 - LKK REF
CC3/CT118020722/Nhb3

Attachments: DV.pdf ATA pdf

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Audrey,

We refer to your below email.

On a without prejudice basis and purely for an amicable settlement on a without admission of llability to our Insured’s part,
we confirm acceptance of your offer of $2,407.00 (all in] to settle your client’s claim,

Kindly chop and sign the attached DV and ATA an forward back the original signed hard copy to us (LKK) for payment
processing.

The above amount is to be made payable to SMRT BUSES LTD.

Thank you.

"Pledaye note thar onre above affer and ooy sestlement ariving from the whove offer ore made on a withows prejudice basix, wmd Shosdd not he
constrned ay an admission of Babiline on one part or on the part of oure Inspred Dreiver. Terms of vaech settfement xhowdd afso not be diseloved
fin aniy ather related maater(sd b respect of the accldent, O offer muade in respect aof this present mattes is made sifely To resalve this matrer
andv. Nevreferenice shall be made to this offer ar any settlement arising from this affer in any other related malters

Best Regards,

Vie Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-2006 | email: vicalpehér |kkatocom | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408q931)

PIE B
— =i - Sove the Fartkh Prind ooy when pecessary-

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged materal, and are for the acle use of the intended reciplent, Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient [a prohibited, and may be a violation of [aw. If you balisve that you received this e-mall in &mor, please do nol read 1his
e-mail or any attached tams. Please deleie the &mail and all attachmenis. mcluding any comes thereal, and miorm the sender hal you
have deleted the e-mail, all attechments and any copies thereof, Thank you

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday. 11 February, 2019 7:43 PM

To: audrey@smrt.com.sg

Ce: Admin A: claimsdept@sg.entaiping.com; Naz (LKKAuto); Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

Subject: FW: LOD to China Taiping - SMRT BUS/11/18/1004/AW - Accident involving SMRT Bus SMBS081T
and PH9559H on 1 Nov 2018 along AYE after bus stop 17141

Importance: High



-

Poh Kin !LI{HAutn]

Subject: FW: LOD to China Taiping - SMRT BUS/11/18/1004/AW - Accident involving SMRT
Bus SMB5081T and PH9559H on 1 Nov 2018 along AYE after bus stop 17141

Attachments: img-211151725-0001.pdf

Importance: High

From: Audrey Woo (Auto Sves/Claims & IA/Claims & |A/Buses) <audrey@smrt.com sg>

Sent: Monday, 11 February 2019 3:29 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; 'claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com' <claimsdept@sg.cntaipi m>

Subject: LOD to China Taiping - SMRT BUS/11/18/1004/AW - Accident involving SMRT Bus SMB5081T and PH9559H
on 1 Nov 2018 along AYE after bus stop 17141

Importance: High

SMRT Ref : BUS/11/18/1004/AW
China Taiping Ref : PH9559H

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We claim on behalf of SMRT BUSES LTD, owner of the vehicle registration number SMBS0B1T. Your client’s negligent
driving has caused the above accident. As a result, my client has suffered the following losses,

Cost of Repair $ 1700
Loss of Use (2 Days x 5350

Double Decker Bus) 5700
LTA Search Fee S7
Total $ 2407

We enclose the following documents,
* Repair Invoice
* GIA Report
* LTA Search
« Survey Report and Bus Photos to be furnished by LKK.

We look forward to your confirmation to settle our claims within 15 days from the date of this email. Payment by
cheque shall be crossed and made payable to SMRT BUSES LTD.

Audvey Woo | DID: 65563521 | FAX:64819221 | Email : audrey@smrt.com.sg | Claims
Department | 6 Ang Mo Kio Street 62 Singapore 569140

S smRT

AUTOMOTIVE



I,I’ Aufo
- Ewm esm Consultants
Ml BB B Ple Lid

« SLUBTAVE [, #01-15 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (065) 67414108

Our Ref: CC3/CTI18020722/Nfb3

31T JULY 2019

I'ANG BUS TRANSPORT SERVICES
653A JURONG WEST STREET 61
#09-420

SINGAPORE 641653

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING PH 9559H AND SMB 5081T ALONG/AT AYE
TOWARDS CLEMENTI AVENUE 6 ON 01/11/2018

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance
(Singapore) Pte Ltd to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under
the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will
therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and
settlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

DID: 6841 2132
FAX: 6741 4108

Email: pohkin@lkkauto.com

c.e.  China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd
{Motar Claims Dept)



AUTHORISATION TO ACT

I/We, SMRT BUSES LTD (“the third party claimant”) of 60 WOODLANDS
INDUSTRIAL P INGAPORE 757705(address), owner of SMB S081T (vehicle
no.) hereby authorize SMRT AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD (“the workshop™) to
act for me with respect to my ¢laim for repair costs and/or rental and/or loss of use (“claim™)
for my vehicle no. SMB S081T that was damaged pursuant to the accident which occurred
on 01/11/2018 (date) along AYE TOWARDS CLEMENTI (location) involving vehicle
no/s PH 9559P. (“the accident™).

I further authorize the workshop to settle my above mentioned claim in a manner that they
deem fit and the workshop is further authorized to receive payment further to settlement of
my claim with payment cheque/s being made in favour of the claimant, SMRT BUSES LTD,
I further acknowledge that any seitlement the workshop may reach on my behalf is on a
without prejudice and without admission of liability basis insofar as the driver/owner/insurers

of the other vehicless is concerned.

{month) 20 l (year)

P

4 # r L
Signed by “the third party claimant” Signed by “the workshop”
{with chop if applicable) (with chop)



Policy No : DMBISNID343217T00 Claim Mo :SNM18D05353C02

Claimant : SMRT BUSES LTD

Amount :  5%2,407.00

SINGAPORE DOLLARS TWO THOUSAND FOUR HUNDRED SEVEN ONLY
I/We agres to accept the above mentioned amount to be psid te me/us ip full &
final settlement of all claims, costs & disbursements for injuriss / damages
sustained by me/us through an accldent Llnvelving

Claimant Vehicle WNo. ¢ SME 50817

Insured Vehicle No. : PH 95599
Date of Loas + 01/11/2018
Place of Accident t AYE TOWARDSE CLEMENTI

IN CONMSIDERATION of the payment made to mefus of the aforementloned sum by
CHINA TAIPIMG INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD., IfWe agree absolutely to
discharge CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD. and/er

Insured Name : I"ANG BUS TRANSPORT SERVICES
Oriver Name : ANG GUAN JOO [HONG YUANYU)

from all claims, pressnt or futurs In respect of all less;, injury or damage
sustalned by mefus arising out of the said accident.

I acknowledge that this payment is made without admissien of liability on the
part of CHIMA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE)} PTE. LTD.

{1) General Damages 55
{2) Cost of Repalr/Excess 55 1,700.00
{3) Loss of Use/Rental/Earning 55 700.00
(1) GIASPolice Reports/
Investigation Reaults/Search Feea 55 T.00
{5} Medical Reports/Expenses 55
(6} Survey Fees/P.T. Fees 5%
{7) Coat including Dishuraement 54
TOTAL o o s o o o o o 5 o o w2 « =+ 88 2,407.00
I
&)
SMAT Buses 1T ﬂO‘
v g
Claimant Hame : E' "n’ HRIC Mo :

Signature : M"Q(j"lﬁ (%



SIRT

AUTOMOTIVE

Customer Code: 3000066

BMRT Autsmstive Services Poe Ltd

251 Worth Bridge Road Bingapore 179102
Tel: 65 63311000 Fax: 65 63340247

Tax Invoice
GST Reg Ho. 1 MA-8500001-7

CRN : 1950042802

SMART BUSES LTD Q:_, Invoice No. : IV130100160
E Date : 10.01.2019

Block Unit a Vehicle Ho. : SMBS0B1T
STREET 62 - i, Your Ref No. : BUS/11/18/1004
& ANG MO KIO Depatiment & Our Ref No. : 24098787
SINGAPORE 569140 Nve <& » Terms : 30 Days
Dascription oty Unit Add / [Discount) Amount
. Cost Amount
Labour
TO REFAIR LH PORTION CENTER 1.00 § 800.00 .00 $ 0.00 $ ®00.00
Othars
PROVIDE LABOUR AND MATERIAL TO 1.00 § 700,00 0.00 5  0.00 & 700,00
PUTTY AND RESPRAY ABOVE HREPAIR
TTEMS
PIXEL STEMCIL LHS MID 1.00 5 200.00 0.00 5 0.00 -3 200.00

GRAND TOTAL 5 1,700.00

Femark :

Hake /Model + ENVIRO 500
Accident Date : 01.11.2018

.0, Puymsnt by chequs should bs crossed and

sads payable to ‘SMET Automotive Sazvices Fts Led',

¥o receipt will ba issusd unless cequested.

/D

=

Authorised Signature
for SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd

Fage 1/1

E. & 0.E
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‘Enquire Transaction History

ransaction History Details

I Log Date/Time 02 Nov 2018/ 15:55:33

Assit Type: Vehicls Transaction Amount: §749

Asset 0= PHYSS%P )

Tramsaction Type: 18.32 Insurance Enguiry (GIRO Payment] Channet External Agancy

User ID: ESASBAMHO - BALGISH BINTE ABDLUL Business Transaction 20181102155533142552

HALIL Referance No.
Search Date / Time: 01 Now 2018 16:00:00
Insurance Company: CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE [SINGAPORE) PTELTD

" information displayed ls correct a4 3t the log date and time.

Enguire Related Logs Back to List

MRS YTLIE GO ST T A0 LAGENTY | MILCHLAIEE (T urrL | L L

LR
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Libi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park. Singapore 408933

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg Mo 1986807108R GST Reg No. 19-8607198-R

Affilisted to Federatlon Internationale Des Experts En Automoblie

CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (S) PTE LTD

Ref CC3/CTI18020722/Nhb3g2

saeonnono s eneoncoros o oo [N
Code: CTI
1 Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. PH 9550P Veh. Inspected SMB S081T
Policy Ne. DMB1SN3084321700 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No, SNM18D05353C02 Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 1471172018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model ALEXANDER DENNIS c.c BBE4D
ENVIROS00
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2015
Chassis No. SFOTECLRSFMTL4037 Colour MULTI COLOUR
Odometer 236165 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification STANDARD ALLDY RIM
General FAIR
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |305/70 R22.5 FIRENZA B mm
L/H Front Tyre [305/70 R22.5 FIRENZA B mm
R/H Rear Tyre |30570R225 CONTINENTAL 7 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |305/70R225 CONTINENTAL 7 mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE N/S BODY.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS
5. General Information
Accident Date 01/11/2018 Inspection Date 14/11/2018
Survey held at SMRT AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD
60 WOODLANDS INDUSTRIAL PARK E4 SINGAPORE 757705
5a. Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS
5b. Estimate Days of Repair
ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR 2 Working Days




’ V V LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

e v 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
- TEL 82568 3581 FAX: 52568 4315
Reg No: 188507196R GST Reg Mo 18-8607198-R Page No.:1of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SMB 5081T
Description of Parts Condition Estimate By |Our Adjusted
Qty | rip Workshop S)|  (5)
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|PIXEL STENCIL LHS MID (SN) NECESSARY 200,00 200.00
200.00 200.00
LABOUR
TO REPAIR LH PORTION CENTER 1,060.00 800.00
PROVIDE LABOUR AND MATERIAL TO PUTTY AND 878.00 700.00
RESPRAY ABOVE REPAIR [TEMS
1.838.00 1.500.00
GRAND TOTAL 2,138.00 1,700.00
RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS | | | 1,700.00]

Report Ref No. CC3/CT118020722/Nhb3g2

I g
MUHAMMAD NAZRIL BIN ABDULLAH HO LEONG CHUAN

Automotive Assossor Automotive Assessor

DISCLAMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Rapor s mads salely for the dss snd banefit of ine Cllent namsd an tha froni page of this Repart.




