
Hsiao Tono (LKt(Auto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Wednesday, 23 January ZOlg 11:O4AM
To: 'Joel Goh'
Cc: Admin A
subject RE: Direct settlement - Accident lnvolving yN6478x (ol : EQt - TBA) AND SLX3153D

(l-P : LKK REF - cC6/EQt18020717/Kpb3) on 13.1 1.2018

Hi Joel,

We refer lo lhe obove molter.

we undersiond thot third porty hod possed ihe cose lo Iowyer for further hondling.

ln view of this, we will proceed to close fire ond subm repori to you good office.

Thonk you.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew j Case Handler

LKKAuto Consultants Fte Ltd
Phojl€: 6242-gag7 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com I fax: 674t-4to9
Blk 51, Pa}? Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenne 7, #o2-2S l S(4o89gg)

From: Justin Wong <justin.wong@eqinsurance.com.sg>
Sent: Friday, 15 November 2018 9:29 AM
To: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@lkkauto.com>
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>
subiect: RE: Direct settlement - Accident tnvolving yN6478x (ot : Eet - TBA) AND sLx3153D (Tp : LKK REF -
cC6/EQtt8O2O717 / Kp b3) on 13.11.2018

Dear Shu Pei,

Please find our insured's GIA report and proceed with direct settlement.

Thank you.

Regards,

Justin Wong
Executive I Claims

1



EQ lnsurance Company Limited
5 Maxwell Road #17-00 Tower Block MND Complex Singapore 069110
did 65 6496 9115 I tel 65 6223 9433 ext 115 | fax 65 6223 4!90
www.eqinsurance.com.sq

Privileged/Confidentiol informotion moy be contdined in this message. lf you ore not the intended recipient, pleose notify tl

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) [mailto:shupei@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Friday, November 16, 2018 8:58 AM
To: J ustin Wong <justin.wong@eq insura nce.com.sg>
Cc: Admin A <admin-a @lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@ lkkauto.com>
Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident lnvolving YN6478X (Ol : EQI - TBA) AND SLX3153D (TP : LKK REF -

CC6/EQII8O2O7 !7 lKpb3) on 13.11.2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear fustin,

We refer to the above matter.

We have inspected TP vehicle SLX 3153D at M/s Wei Lee Motor Works on a WP basis and TP repairer
proposed for a direct settlement.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
- TP's GIA report
- Estimated cost ofrepair
- Preliminary advice

Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy ofyour insured's GIA report for our necessary action.

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Hsiao Tong and she can be contacted at DID: 67 42 3797.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

shu Peil Admin

LK( Auto Corsultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 I email: shupei(alkkauto.com I fax:.6747-47Oa

Blk 51, Paya Ubi lndustrial Parl! UbiAvenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)


