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From: PB5P <pml-pbsp@simedarby.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 14 November, 2018 5:04 PM

To: SG AXA Insurance SM AXA SGP - Motor Survey

Subject: REQUEST FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT - SGR622C & EU2442A ON 13/11/2018
Attachments: 5GR622C.PDF, 5SKM_558e18111417010.pdf

Categories: Shailendra

Dear Sirs,

We refer to the above matter.

We have instructions from our client to seek repair cost and loss of use/car rental from you through Direct
Settlement.

Attached is the estimates and supporting documents for your consideration,
Please let us have your confirmation that you agree that liability is clear and we may proceed with Direct Settiement.

If Direct Settlement is approved, kindly let us have your offer for LOU / rental.

Thank you,

Regards,

Caroline

Clo Performance Motors Limited - Body and Paint

303 Alexandra Road Singapore 159941

DID: 6319 0174 Fax: 6479 4601

“This electronic mail content and any accompanying attachments ("the Message") is intended only for the
named addressee ("the Recipient”) and may contain information that is confidential, privileged and/or
proprietary to the Sime Darby group of companies ("Sime Darby") and/or protected under applicable laws.
If you are not the intended Recipient, you are strictly prohibited from using, disseminating, forwarding
and/or printing the Message. Please notify the sender immediately by return e-mail and permanently delete
all copies of the Message. Sime Darby disclaims all liability for any error, loss or damage arising from the
Message being infected by computer virus or other malicious software. Any views and/or opinions
expressed in the Message are solely those of the author's and do not necessarily represent those of Sime

Darby's.”



Ju: Irene (LKKAuto)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 15 May 2019 8:48 PM

To: Joy Irene (LKKAuto)

Subject: FW: New message for service request 81760, vehicle number SGR622C

Report Remarks Entry - CC4/ASM18020713/ja3

Remarks P

13/519454PM  RePls engage Ol on TP's -
claim & propose DS. Thank you. *** Message Hi, pls cancel this |
|assignment. TP had reverted to OD. TY. - ANG Richard

Remarks

New remarks Added

_ Remarks 1 : -On
[F]|SGR 622C ; EU 24424 o 15:1”41
EST:$ — SUR : ? — WKSP : PERFORMANCE MOTORS LTD [HMK 15_'1”41
SBMO12VK fl 81760 If RA HMK ;i_f

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: Meikwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 13 May, 2019 4:59 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: New message for service request 81760, vehicle number SGR622C

Best Regards,

summer Lee | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue

1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

----- Original Message-—-
From: richard.angbs@axa.com.sg [mailto:richard.angbs@axa.com.sg]
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