Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 16 September, 2019 3:05 PM

To: bonejointspecialist@gmail.com

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKP 3210B AND SKA 7002M ON 29/10/2018

Without Prejudice

Dear Sir,

We refer further to our below email.

We were informed that you are also making a claim against the Third Party vehicle’s insurer.
Kindly advise to us any update of the matter.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh @lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

RERER W Suve the Larthe Print only when necessary-

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Joy Irene (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 4 December 2018 1:38 PM

To: bonejointspecialist@gmail.com

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKP 3210B AND SKA 7002M ON 29/10/2018

OUR REF: LKK: CC4/AIG18020690/ja3

S.S. SATHAPPAN
Policy Holder

Dear Sir,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKP 3210B AND SKA 7002M ON 29/10/2018




We refer to the above accident where we are acting for AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to resolve the claim against
you under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

As spoken, we have seen your video (from front camera) and of the video of the Third-Party claimant (attached for
your viewing). Based on the scenario observed, our initial assessment is at equal basis and thus, we cannot be absolved
from liability. However, we understand that you have a rear-view video recording, kindly send us a copy of your video
for our further review.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD)(if any) may be affected and reduced by 30% (20% for commercial
vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will
be deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Best Regards,

Joy Irene | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841-2409 | email: joyirene@Ikkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

All contents of this email is intended strictly for the addressee(s) only.It may contain confidential and/or privileged
information.If you are not the intended recipient (or have received this email in error) please notify the sender immediately and
destroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution of the material in this email is strictly forbidden.



