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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Ng Wai Yin <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 17 December 2018 11:59 AM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Cc: 'Jasmine Tan'; SUR; Accounts (LKKAuto)

Subject: FW: III REF: MC2014/3687/02/kl; TCS REF: AAD1409-358--Accident involving 

SGX4868C & SHC5269Z on 27.09.14

Attachments: image003.wmz; image010.emz; image018.emz; image021.wmz; LKKInvoice1.pdf; 

AAD1409-358 - SURVEY PAYMENT.pdf

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

 

Dear All 

 

Please refer to the attachment for survey payment, hope to receive the survey report soon. 

 

Thank You 

Best Regards, 

Ng Wai Yin 

Finance Department 

TEL: 6603 1265  Ext.308 

 

*** Please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg 
 

 
 
This message is confidential. It may also be privileged or otherwise protected by work product immunity or other legal rules. If 
you have received it by mistake, please let us know by e-mail reply and delete it from your system; you may not copy this message 
or disclose its contents to anyone. Please send us by fax any message containing deadlines as incoming e-mails are not screened 
for response deadlines. The integrity and security of this message cannot be guaranteed on the Internet. 

 

 

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) [mailto:veronchen@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Tuesday, 11 December, 2018 5:12 PM 

To: claims <claims@transcab.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Accounts (LKKAuto) <account@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: jasminetan@transcab.com.sg; calvin.er@transcab.com.sg 

Subject: RE: III REF: MC2014/3687/02/kl; TCS REF: AAD1409-358--Accident involving SGX4868C & SHC5269Z on 

27.09.14 

 

Dear Wai Yin, 

 

Kindly make the payment first before we release the survey report. 

 

 

Dear Account Dept, 

 

Please take note. 

 

 

 

 

 
TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD 

No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63, Singapore 569111 

Main Line: (65) 6287 6666   Fax Line: (65) 6287 7764  

Website: www.transcab.com.sg 



2

Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: claims <claims@transcab.com.sg>  

Sent: Wednesday, 13 June 2018 3:33 PM 

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: jasminetan@transcab.com.sg; calvin.er@transcab.com.sg 

Subject: RE: III REF: MC2014/3687/02/kl; TCS REF: AAD1409-358--Accident involving SGX4868C & SHC5269Z on 

27.09.14 

 

Hi Veron 

 

Can you help to double confirm with Kenneth’s? 

 

We enclosed the GIA report and estimate marking for your attention. 

 

Our system record is Kenneth’s survey the vehicle. 

 

Thank You 

Best Regards, 

Ng Wai Yin 

Finance Department 

TEL: 6603 1265  Ext.308 

 

*** Please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg 
 

 
 
This message is confidential. It may also be privileged or otherwise protected by work product immunity or other legal rules. If 
you have received it by mistake, please let us know by e-mail reply and delete it from your system; you may not copy this message 
or disclose its contents to anyone. Please send us by fax any message containing deadlines as incoming e-mails are not screened 
for response deadlines. The integrity and security of this message cannot be guaranteed on the Internet. 

 

 

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) [mailto:veronchen@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Monday, 11 June, 2018 5:28 PM 

To: claims <claims@transcab.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: jasminetan@transcab.com.sg; calvin.er@transcab.com.sg 

Subject: RE: III REF: MC2014/3687/02/kl; TCS REF: AAD1409-358--Accident involving SGX4868C & SHC5269Z on 

27.09.14 
 

Dear Wai Yin, 

 

No record in our system. 

 

 

 

Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

 
TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD 

No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63, Singapore 569111 

Main Line: (65) 6287 6666   Fax Line: (65) 6287 7764  

Website: www.transcab.com.sg 



3

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: claims [mailto:claims@transcab.com.sg]  

Sent: Monday, 11 June 2018 5:06 PM 

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: jasminetan@transcab.com.sg; calvin.er@transcab.com.sg; claims@transcab.com.sg 

Subject: RE: III REF: MC2014/3687/02/kl; TCS REF: AAD1409-358--Accident involving SGX4868C & SHC5269Z on 

27.09.14 

 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

 

Dear Sir/Madam 

 

May we request a copy of the survey report. 

 

Thank You 

Best Regards, 

Ng Wai Yin 

Finance Department 

TEL: 6603 1265  Ext.308 

 

*** Please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg 
 

 
 
This message is confidential. It may also be privileged or otherwise protected by work product immunity or other legal rules. If 
you have received it by mistake, please let us know by e-mail reply and delete it from your system; you may not copy this message 
or disclose its contents to anyone. Please send us by fax any message containing deadlines as incoming e-mails are not screened 
for response deadlines. The integrity and security of this message cannot be guaranteed on the Internet. 

 

 

From: claims [mailto:claims@transcab.com.sg]  

Sent: Tuesday, 5 June, 2018 2:27 PM 

To: 'Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto)' <KennethKong@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: 'Jasmine Tan' <jasminetan@transcab.com.sg>; 'claims' <claims@transcab.com.sg> 

Subject: FW: III REF: MC2014/3687/02/kl; TCS REF: AAD1409-358--Accident involving SGX4868C & SHC5269Z on 

27.09.14 
 

Dear Kenneth, 

 

Could you provide us with a copy of the survey report? 

 

Our ref AAD1409-358  

 

Accident involving SGX4868C & SHC5269Z on 27.09.14 

 

Thank You 

Best Regards, 

Calvin Er 

Finance Department 

TEL: 6603 1265  Ext.307 

 
TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD 

No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63, Singapore 569111 

Main Line: (65) 6287 6666   Fax Line: (65) 6287 7764  

Website: www.transcab.com.sg 
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*** Please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg 

 

 
 
This message is confidential. It may also be privileged or otherwise protected by work product immunity or other legal rules. If 
you have received it by mistake, please let us know by e-mail reply and delete it from your system; you may not copy this message 
or disclose its contents to anyone. Please send us by fax any message containing deadlines as incoming e-mails are not screened 
for response deadlines. The integrity and security of this message cannot be guaranteed on the Internet. 

 

From: Gabriel Wee [mailto:Gabriel@iii.com.sg]  

Sent: Monday, 4 June, 2018 4:40 PM 

To: 'claims' <claims@transcab.com.sg> 

Cc: 'Jasmine Tan' <jasminetan@transcab.com.sg>; Lalitha Krishnan - III <lalitha@iii.com.sg> 

Subject: RE: III REF: MC2014/3687/02/kl; TCS REF: AAD1409-358--Accident involving SGX4868C & SHC5269Z on 

27.09.14 

 

Dear Sirs, 

 

We refer to the matter above. 

 

We regret to advice that without a proper survey report, we are unable to entertain your claim. 

 

Best Regards, 

Gabriel Wee 
Motor Claims Dept.  
India International Insurance Pte Ltd  
64 Cecil Street | #05 IOB Building | Singapore 049711  
Tel: 6347 6100, Ext - 248 

 

 

 

From: claims [mailto:claims@transcab.com.sg]  

Sent: 31 May, 2018 4:20 PM 

To: Gabriel Wee <Gabriel@iii.com.sg> 

Cc: 'Jasmine Tan' <jasminetan@transcab.com.sg>; 'claims' <claims@transcab.com.sg> 

Subject: RE: III REF: MC2014/3687/02/kl; TCS REF: AAD1409-358--Accident involving SGX4868C & SHC5269Z on 

27.09.14 
 

Dear Gabriel, 

 

We enclosed survey report for your perusal and action. 

 

Hope you can review this matter and let us have your best offer 

 

Thank You 

Best Regards, 

Calvin Er 

Finance Department 

TEL: 6603 1265  Ext.307 

 

*** Please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg 

 

 
TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD 

No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63, Singapore 569111 

Main Line: (65) 6287 6666   Fax Line: (65) 6287 7764  

Website: www.transcab.com.sg 
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This message is confidential. It may also be privileged or otherwise protected by work product immunity or other legal rules. If 
you have received it by mistake, please let us know by e-mail reply and delete it from your system; you may not copy this message 
or disclose its contents to anyone. Please send us by fax any message containing deadlines as incoming e-mails are not screened 
for response deadlines. The integrity and security of this message cannot be guaranteed on the Internet. 

 

From: claims [mailto:claims@transcab.com.sg]  

Sent: Thursday, 31 May, 2018 3:27 PM 

To: 'Gabriel Wee' <Gabriel@iii.com.sg> 

Cc: claims@transcab.com.sg; 'Jasmine Tan' <jasminetan@transcab.com.sg> 

Subject: RE: III REF: MC2014/3687/02/kl; TCS REF: AAD1409-358--Accident involving SGX4868C & SHC5269Z on 

27.09.14 

 

Dear Gabriel, 

 

We do not have the survey report but these are some photos of our taxi post accident 

 

 
 

 
 

 

Thank you.  

Best Regards, 

Jonas Ong 

Finance Department 

TEL: 6603 1265  Ext.308 

 

*** Please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg 
 

 
 

 
TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD 

No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63, Singapore 569111 

Main Line: (65) 6287 6666   Fax Line: (65) 6287 7764  

Website: www.transcab.com.sg 

 
TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD 

No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63, Singapore 569111 

Main Line: (65) 6287 6666   Fax Line: (65) 6287 7764  

Website: www.transcab.com.sg 
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This message is confidential. It may also be privileged or otherwise protected by work product immunity or other legal rules. If 
you have received it by mistake, please let us know by e-mail reply and delete it from your system; you may not copy this message 
or disclose its contents to anyone. Please send us by fax any message containing deadlines as incoming e-mails are not screened 
for response deadlines. The integrity and security of this message cannot be guaranteed on the Internet. 

 

 

From: Gabriel Wee [mailto:Gabriel@iii.com.sg]  

Sent: Wednesday, 30 May, 2018 11:07 AM 

To: 'jasminetan@transcabservices.com.sg' <jasminetan@transcabservices.com.sg>; 'claims@transcab.com.sg' 

<claims@transcab.com.sg> 

Subject: FW: III REF: MC2014/3687/02/kl; TCS REF: AAD1409-358--Accident involving SGX4868C & SHC5269Z on 

27.09.14 

 

 

 

From: Gabriel Wee  

Sent: 30 May, 2018 10:55 AM 

To: 'Ng Wai Yin' <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg> 

Subject: RE: III REF: MC2014/3687/02/kl; TCS REF: AAD1409-358--Accident involving SGX4868C & SHC5269Z on 

27.09.14 

 

Dear Wai Yin, 

 

Kindly furnish us with a copy of the survey report along with photographs of your taxi to enable us to revert with our 

offer. 

 

Best Regards, 

Gabriel Wee 
Motor Claims Dept.  
India International Insurance Pte Ltd  
64 Cecil Street | #05 IOB Building | Singapore 049711  
Tel: 6347 6100, Ext - 248 

 

 

 

 

From: Ng Wai Yin [mailto:waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg]  

Sent: 23 May, 2018 1:42 PM 

To: Motor Claim - III <motorclaim@iii.com.sg>; Lalitha Krishnan - III <lalitha@iii.com.sg> 

Cc: JASMINETAN@TRANSCAB.COM.SG; claims@transcab.com.sg 

Subject: III REF: MC2014/3687/02/kl; TCS REF: AAD1409-358--Accident involving SGX4868C & SHC5269Z on 27.09.14 

 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

 

Dear Sir/Madam 

 

Please refer to the preceding email, we enclosed the PIR for your attention. 

 

Base on the PIR your client was charger for dangerous driving. 

 

Hope you can review this matter and let us have your best offer. 

 

Thank You 

Best Regards, 

Ng Wai Yin 

Finance Department 

TEL: 6603 1265  Ext.308 
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*** Please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg 
 

 
 
This message is confidential. It may also be privileged or otherwise protected by work product immunity or other legal rules. If 
you have received it by mistake, please let us know by e-mail reply and delete it from your system; you may not copy this message 
or disclose its contents to anyone. Please send us by fax any message containing deadlines as incoming e-mails are not screened 
for response deadlines. The integrity and security of this message cannot be guaranteed on the Internet. 

 

 

From: jasminetan [mailto:jasminetan@transcabservices.com.sg]  

Sent: Sunday, 19 April, 2015 11:22 PM 

To: 'Lalitha Krishnan - III' <lalitha@iii.com.sg> 

Cc: 'tzeyong.lui' <tzeyong.lui@transcabservices.com.sg>; Zhe Wei <zhewei.kek@transcabservices.com.sg> 

Subject: RE: India REF: MC2014/3687/02/kl ; Transcab Ref : 1409-358 - Acc invl SGX4868X[III] & SHC5269Z on 

27.9.14 along Cantonment Link 

 

Without Prejudice 

 

Dear Lalitha 

 

Kindly let us have your offer as soon as possible as your insured had been charged by Traffic Police. 

 

Please see attach. 

 

Thank you. 

 

 

Regards 

Jasmine Tan 

19.4.2015 

 

From: Lalitha Krishnan - III [mailto:lalitha@iii.com.sg]  

Sent: Thursday, 5 February 2015 11:55 AM 

To: jasminetan@transcabservices.com.sg 

Subject: FW: India REF: MC2014/3687/02/kl ; Transcab Ref : 1409-358 - Acc invl SGX4868X[III] & SHC5269Z on 

27.9.14 along Cantonment Link 

 

Dear Jasmine 

 

We refer to the above matter. 

 

According to our driver, the traffic light was green in his favour when he was hit by vehicle SHC5269Z.  As such, 

kindly furnish evidence to show that our driver was negligent in this case so as to enable us to review file. 

 

In absence of any evidence and independent witness statement and/or police results, we are denying liability. 

 

Best Regards, 

 

LalithaKrishnan 

Motor Claims Department 
India International Insurance Pte Ltd 
DID : 63476139 
 

 
TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD 

No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63, Singapore 569111 

Main Line: (65) 6287 6666   Fax Line: (65) 6287 7764  

Website: www.transcab.com.sg 
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From: Sam Koh [mailto:barristersam@singnet.com.sg]  

Sent: Wednesday, 4 February, 2015 12:13 PM 
To: Lalitha Krishnan - III 

Subject: YOUR REF: MC2014/3687 AND OUR REF: SK/2241/14 
 

 

04 February 2015                                                             
 
                                                                                                REMINDER    

Dear Lalitha, 
 
As you know that it has been for almost 3 months now since our letter of demand dated 11.11.2014 to you, and 
telephone conversation earlier January  2015. 
 
Please expedite and let us have your offer of settlement without further delay. 
 
Regards, 
 
Sam Koh 

M/s. Sam Koh & Co      
 

From: Sam Koh [mailto:barristersam@singnet.com.sg]  
Sent: Tuesday, December 23, 2014 2:28 PM 

To: 'Lalitha Krishnan - III' 
Subject: YOUR REF: MC2014/3687 AND OUR REF: SK/2241/14 
 

             

23 December 2014                     

 

      M/s. India International Insurance Pte Ltd                                  

Insurer of motor vehicle SGX 4868 C 

 

Attn:     Miss Lalitha Krishnan 

             Motor Claims Department 

--------------------------------------------  

 

 

Dear Sirs, 

 

ACCIDENT ON 27.09.2014 AT ABOUT 04.20 A.M. AT THE TRAFFIC LIGHTS JUNCTION OF  KEPPEL 

ROAD AND CANTONMENT LINK TOWARDS MCE INVOLVING MOTOR VEHICLES SHC 5269 Z 

(CLIENT) AND SGX 4868 C  

 

We refer to our letter of demand dated 11.11.2014 in respect of our client’s personal injury claim,  NG LEE CHYE 

(NRIC No. S1793603D), the taxi driver of motor taxi SHC 5269 Z. 

23 December 214  

 

Please assist to expedite in letting us have offer of settlement without delay. 

 

 

Regards, 

 

Sam Koh 
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M/s. Sam Koh & Co 

(Advocates & Solicitors) 

Commissioner for Oaths 

Tel: 6737 4471;Fax: 6737 2076 
 

 

 

This email has been checked for viruses by Avast antivirus software. 

www.avast.com  

 

No virus found in this message. 

Checked by AVG - www.avg.com 

Version: 2015.0.5577 / Virus Database: 4257/8789 - Release Date: 12/22/14 

DISCLAIMER: 

This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.  

It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.  

If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has 

reached  

you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be 

hereby  

notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination  

of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be 

unlawful. 

Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be 

intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses.  

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of 

this  

message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission  

or any modification.  

Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of 

environment.  

India International Insurance Pte Ltd.  

Registration No. 198703792-K 

Kindly note that by submitting this claim to us, you are deemed to have agreed to us collecting, using, 

disclosing and processing your personal data, sharing your personal data with our service providers (located 

both inside and outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry, including 

the General Insurance Association of Singapore. This enables us to ensure proper processing, handling 

and/or dealing with your claim, which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with applicable 

laws. If you do not agree to the same, kindly let us know immediately.  

DISCLAIMER: 

This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.  

It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.  

If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached  

you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby  

notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination  

of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. 

Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be  

intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses.  

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this  

message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission  

or any modification.  
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Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.  

India International Insurance Pte Ltd.  

Registration No. 198703792-K 

Kindly note that by submitting this claim to us, you are deemed to have agreed to us collecting, using, 

disclosing and processing your personal data, sharing your personal data with our service providers (located 

both inside and outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry, including 

the General Insurance Association of Singapore. This enables us to ensure proper processing, handling 

and/or dealing with your claim, which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with applicable 

laws. If you do not agree to the same, kindly let us know immediately.  

DISCLAIMER: 

This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.  

It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.  

If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached  

you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby  

notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination  

of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. 

Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be  

intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses.  

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this  

message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission  

or any modification.  

Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.  

India International Insurance Pte Ltd.  

Registration No. 198703792-K 
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