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MG SOLUTION PTE LTD
23 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4 (South Wing) #02-03 Singapore 415933
Tel: (+65) 6243 1373 | Fax: (+65) 6243 1376
Reg. No: 201427944N

Email: mg3solutioni gmail.com

T0 : CHINA TAIPING DATE  : 12-Nov-18
ATTENTION : MOTOR CLAIMS DEPT JOB TYPE : T/P CLAIM
ESTIMATE REPORT
” M
VEHICLE DETAILS e
VEHICLE NO . SUK458)
£ )
MODEL : TOYOTA VELLFIRE
CHASSIS NO
ACCIDEN Al DATE : B8-Mov-18
TIME : 1315HRS
THIRD PARTY REQUESTOR / CONTACT JACK LI
CLAIM DETAIL : PARTS o
SIN DESCRIPTION Qry ur;g;:r TD;;,"EI:ET
iRearBuMPER B F—d 1 |s s2030]s £20.30
2|REAR BUMPER SIDE REATINER Lt P—d 2 |s 72.30 | § 14460
3|REAR QUARTER PANEL OUTERLH Rt 1 |s  zm72s|s 277.25
4| TAILLAMP LH A 1 |s  76690]s 766.90-
5| TAILLAMP OUTER GARNISH LH (-4 1 |s 1e020(s 180.20
BlTAaILLAMP PANEL LH Tl & 1 |s 401208 401.20
7|REAR FENDER LH 2“1u-'t~f 1 |§ 1988705 1,688.70
’ TOTAL PRICE $  4,559.15
LESS 25% $ 113979
A SUBTOTALPRICE §  3,419.36
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
S/N DESCRIPTION QTY | UNITS/NETT | TOTAL S/NETT
1|REAR BUMPER CLIP (SET) pmte— 1 g 2500 | S 25.00
2|REVERSE SENSOR /&4 — 1 |$ 22000]5% 220.00
TOTAL $ 245.00

o™

CLAIM DETAILS: LABOUR AND SPRAY PAINTING (FRONT)

TO PANEL BEAT, REMOVE AND
REPLACE PARTS

.

3 00

o
$  1,000000
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& 7 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ul Ave 1 801-25 Pays Ubi Indusirial Park. Singapore 408831
TEL: 8256 3561 FAX G256 4315

Reg No 159807198 GST Reg No. 18-89507188-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (S) PFTELTD

3 ANSON ROAD #16-00
SPRINGLEAF TOWERSINGAPORE 0785809

Rel CCBICTI18020587/AM3

Date 14-11-2018

RN

Code: CTI
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SGV 4429Y Veh. Inspected SJK 458
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. Excess (5) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 14112018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.c ]
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mirm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4, Description of Damages
5. General Information
Accident Date 08/11/2018 Inspection Date 1211112018
Survey held at MG SOLUTION PTE LTD
23 KAKI BUKIT AVE 4
(SOUTH WING) #02-03B
VICOM INSPECTION CENTRE.
SINGAPORE 415933
5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS
BjIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.




Shu Pei {LI(KAm'uz T ——

From: Catherine Thia <catherine.thiafsg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Friday, 16 November 2018 3:15 PM

To: Shu Pei (LKEAUtD)

Cc: Pah Kin (LKKAuto);, Admin A

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Acadent Invalving SGV4429Y (Ol - CT1 - TBA) and 5JK459) (TP
LKK REF - CC6/CTI1B020587/Afb3) on 0B.11.2018

Attachments: SGV4429Y repart pdf

Dear Shu Pei
Attached Ol report
Thanks

Catherine Thia
Senior Executive
Motor Claims Department

China Talping Insurance (Singapore) Ple, Lid,

3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleal Tower Singapore 072908
Direct (65) 6389 6163
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From: Shu Pel |LKKAuUto) [mailto:shupei@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 14 November, 2018 4:37 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping. coms

Cc: Lucas Lee <lucas.lee@sg.cntaiping.com:; Catherine Thia <catherine thia@sg.cntaiping.coms; Poh Kin (LKKAuto)
<pohkin@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident involving SGVa429Y (01 : CTI - TBA) and 5JK453) (TP : LKK REF -
CCB/CTILBDZ0587/Afb3) on 08.11.2018



WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Catherine,

We refer to the above matter.

We have inspected TP vehicle SJK 459] at M/s MG Solution Pte Ltd on a WP basis and TP repairer proposed for a
direct settlement.

Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured's GIA report for our necessary action.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
TFs GIA report

Please be informed that estimated cost of repair and preliminary advice is not ready yet.

Our case handler in-charge is Poh Kin and he can be contacted at DID: 6841-2132.

Thank You.

Host Regardy,

Shu Pel| Admin

LKK Auto Cansultants Pre Ltd

Phane: 6366-0055 | email: thupel S lkaito com | fax: 5741-4108

Ak 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Fark, Uts Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service,
For more information please visit hurp/fwww svimunmece lowd com




Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From:
Sent:
To:
Ce:

Subject:

Tracking:

Our Ret: CC4/CTI18020587/Akb3g2

Your Ref: 5JK 459

Without Prejudice
[save as lo costs)

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter,

Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Thursday, 15 August 2019 3:52 PM

MG Solution

Admin A

OFFER - ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEH NO
08/11/2018

Recipient

MG Solution

Admin &
olivialau@lkkauto com
shupei@lkkauto.com

Meikwan@lkkauto.com

We propose settiement as follows: -

SIK 459] & SGV 4429Y (Ol) ON

Delivery

Delivered: 15/8/2019 3:52 PM
Delivered. 15/8/2019 3:52 PM
Deliverad: 15/8/2019 3:52 PM

1. Cosl of Repair (w/GST) $ 1.926.00
2. Loss of Use [4 days x $80) $ 32000
3. LTA/GIA Search Fee 5 7.45

TOTAL | $2,253.45

Please confirm acceptance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties an this matter s purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole Intention of resolving the
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission af liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / Inferred from this

negotiation of terms/settlement,

In the event of new evidence being discoverad or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settiement.”

Best Regards,
Khanchna| Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| emall: Khanchna@|kkauto.com |Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

1



MG SOLUTION PTE LTD
23 Kaki Bukit Ave 4 (South Wing) #02-03B
Vieom Inspection Centre, Singapore 415933
Tel: 6243 1373 Fax: 6243 1376
GST Reg. No.: 201427%44N

MOTOR CLAIM DISCHARGE

NsuReD: . SUPRENE  LEASING ¢ LimouCINE cepviceS

CAR/LORRY/CYCLE: REG NO: _S\]K-’-‘lgqj POLIEYND: v liensesi

ACCIDENT CLAIM NO-: ..oiiaisissicssssmnsias s messspons o s

I/ We confirm that | / we have taken delivery of Car / Lorry / Motor Cycle

459
Registerad No. ...... .E:;I..K“S_j_,_ wess s fTOM the repairers,
MG CoLvTioN PTE LTD

1Y [T oS

And that all repairs necessary as a result of an accident in which the said vehicle was Involved on or

9]
aboutthe qua.ﬂ day of _"HIH 20...!..&. have been completed to my / our satisfaction, and that

| / we have no further claim on the above company in Respect thereof.

DA R S i s e v SIBNBUIE! s ssisne ses e ses sassre e sees

Ca’s STBMP: wicyie i pmmrebrrerrmraressenses INRIC N ciitiet s sesseresres rossssasmsssmsessansnne
. s n Dy .I-lf"(;tu’d
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Date

MG SOLUTION PTE LTD

23 Kaki Bukit Ave 4, AAS Kaki Bukit Gentre #02-03 Singapore 415833
Tel: 6243 1373 Fax: 62431376
(G5T Reg. No. 201427844N)

: 15/03/2019

Your Ref : SGV4429Y

To : CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE LTD
Attn : Motor Claims Department
Dear Sir'Mdm,

RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE SJIK459) & SGV4429Y ON 08/11/2018 AT
OPEN CAR PARK OF PREMISES NO. 64 JALAN JURONG KECHIL.

We refer to the above matter.

Attached copies of the following for your kind perusal:

1
2)
3)
4)

5)

Proforma Bill No.198056 @ $51,926.00 (Inclusive Of 7% GST)
Loss of Use @ $$1,000.00 (4 Days x S$250)

LTA Search @ S$7.45

Authorisation to Act

GIA Report

Hope the above is in order and kindly let us have your confirmation soon.

Tax invoice will be issue upon amount finalized.

Thank You.

Yours faithfully,

HP: 9188 693]
E-mail: mg3solution(@gmail.com



LETTER OF AUTHORITY

Name  QUPEEAME  LBASIAL, 4 LIMOUSINE SEEVICES
Addrass % EREVBUET-AVE 4 Hudyoz
As KRE\ BuerT cenTee S( 4 15933)

Contact No

TO:  CHINA TFAIPING (NSWERNCE ( SINGAPDEE) PTE (TP

Dear Sirs,
ACCIDENTINVOLVING __ SJ K459 anp SGVA4IQY oy 08[1 [rotd

at/ALoNG_OFEN CAE PAPK oF PRE WMISES AR (4 JAWIN Juem(,
EECHL -

I/We, _SE[’ FEME  LEASING 4 LIMvSING SR C'E:ramfam the registered owner of
motor car no. ‘SJ k 49q :]

Pleasa note that | have assigned all compensations monies due to me/us in the above sald accident
to M/S MG SOLUTION PTE LTD.

I/We, hereby authorize you to release all compensation manies pertaining to the above-mentioned
accident to M/5 MG SOLUTION PTELTD and forward your settlamant chequa to M/SMG SOLUTION
PTELTD whom | had authorized to collect the sald compensation monies.

Signature of Claimant Witness By



MG SOLUTION PTELTD
23 Kaki Bukit Ave 4 (South Wing) #02-038
Vicom Inspection Centre, Singapore 415933
Tel: 6243 1373 Fax: 6243 1376
GST Reg. No.; 201427344N

MOTOR CLAIM DISCHARGE

NSURED: . SUPREVE  LESSING & LIMOUSINE  S€pvIcES

----- B T T e T e e PR

CAR/ LORRY/CYCLE: REG NO: -:gljjfﬁléqj.. POLICY NO: ... e =RV

ACCIDENT CLAIM ND: ..o s orrmissssssisssssiwssssimsasissssssensios

|/ We confirm that | / we have taken delivery of Car / Lorry / Motor Cycle

Registered No. ......coocovneecs ‘5 ;“.C.. _45? .ﬁj i wnfTOm the repairers,

Mﬂﬂiﬁ R B R ot 000 0 SR R o e N 000 s 1 i - e 4 5 B e e Ty PR

And that all repairs necessary as a result of an accident in which the said vehicle was Involved on or
about the ...,.mg. ‘% day of h.__...l...i ..... 2n._!..3_ have been completed to my / our satisfaction, and that

| / we have no further claim on the above company In Respect thereof,

DR siinisiiiiiinsinisimmiioivnisiin SERMBBUNDS wiiviomiismmmbrerovsorrmressrresseomms messms
s.'..nf;‘}
Y, ‘{:}.
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MG SOLUTION PTE LTD

23 Kakl Bukit Ave 4, AAS Kakl Bukit Centra #02-03 Singapore 415933

Tal: 6243 1373 Fax: 6243 1376
(GST Reg. No. 20-1427844-N)

PROFORMA BILL

Bill Te:

CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE LTD

NO. 3 ANSON ROAD
#16-00 SPRINGLEAF TOWER

SINGAPORE 0784909

ATTN : MOTOR CLAIMS DEPARTMENT

Bill No : 198056

Date : 15-March-2019

Vehicle Number : SJK 459J

Tax Invoice will be issue upon amount finalised.

aTy CLAIM AMOUNT
1 |To carried out accident repair as per surveyor's recommendation s 1,800.00
(Lump Sum)
BEFORE GST 1,800.00
7% GST 126.00
TOTAL | § 1,826.00

Please note that our above offer and any settiement arising from the above offer are made on a without

prejudice basis with sole intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal
proceeding. deﬂ%%&ﬂknﬁﬂﬁhwmmmﬂ)m

mmmmmmmmwwmmmmm
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» Back to OneMotoring
Vehicle Insurance Particulars Result

iehicle Mo, Incident Date/Time Insurance Company Mame
SGVa429Y 08 Nov2018/13:15:00 CHINATAIPING INSURAMNCE (SINGAPORE) PTE
LTD
OK Save as PDF
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110 1R H primi 1t

» Back to OneMotoring

Liind Transp .'I'R";h[l'.-ﬂﬂ_‘

Lend Transport Authority

10 Sir Ming Drive

Singapore STSTO1

GST Regstration No. - M4-D006528.2

Print Data/Tima 08 MNov 2018 / 15:06:33
Rocaipl Date/Time : 08 Nov 2018/ 15:06:33

Tax Invoice/Receipt
Recwipl No, : [TNET-00000-181108-001482
Previous Receipt Mo,
SIN Item Descriptian/ Amount GST
Business Transaction Reference Befors Amount
Na, GST [5%] {5%)
Result of Insurance Enquiry - SGV4428Y
Az al 08 Nov 2018/M13:15:00
Insuranca Ca: CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE LTD
1 Irsurance Enquiry - SGVE428Y
Enquiry Fes 7.00 0.9
201817081 50545909507
Sub-Total T.00 029
Total Before Rounding T.00 0.48
Rounding Difference
Total Amount Payabie
Paid By
Direcl Debit: eNETS Debll
20TBNDSI 50555547 (intermet )
Total
Cash Changs
Tencered Amount
Excess RAsfundabis Amount
THANK YOU AND HAVE A NICE DAY

Amount
Afar GST

(5%)

T.48

749
T48
004
TA5

TAS

745
000
TAS
0.00

Please ensure that all payments to the Authority are good and promptly settled by the payment service
provider / financial institution, Otherwise, the transaction and receipt is considerad veld and late fee

may apply.
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Khanchna (LKK Auto

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Sent: Monday, 16 September 2019 4:32 PM

To: MG Solution

Ce: Admin A

Subject: RE: OFFER - ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEH NO SJK 459) & SGV 4429Y (OI) ON 08/11/2018
Attachments: CTI DV pdf

Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
We reler fo the above matter.

We propose setflement as lollows:

1. Cost of Repair [w/G5T) $1.925.00
2. Loss of Use |4 days x $100) % 400.00
3. LTA/GIA Search Fee h 1 7.45

TOTAL | §2,333.45

we attach herewith a copy of the DV for your further action.

"Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of llability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this
negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially atfect/influence on the issues of
liability/damages, either party Is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchnaf@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: MG Solution <mg3solution@gmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, 15 August 2019 4:12 PM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com>
Ce: Admin A <admin-aalkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: OFFER - ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEH NO SJK 459) & SGV 4429Y (OI) ON 08/11/2018

Your Ref: CCHCTI]EUZDSSTIAkthI (SGV4429Y)
Our Ref: SIK459)

Dear Khanchna,

We refer to below email, we would like to counter propose as per below:

1



MG SOLUTION PTE LTD

23 Kaki Bukit Ave 4, AAS Kaki Bukit Centre #02-03 Singapore 415933
Tel: 6243 1373 Fax: 6243 1376
(GST Reg. No. 20-1427944-N)

PROFORMA BILL

CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE LTD

NO. 3 ANSON ROAD
#16-00 SPRINGLEAF TOWER

Bill No : 198056

Date ; 15-March-2019

SINGAPORE 079909 Vehicle Number : SJK 459J

ATTN : MOTOR CLAIMS DEPARTMENT

aTty CLAIM AMOUNT
1 |To carried out accident repair as per surveyor's recommendation 5 1,800.00
(Lump Sum)
BEFORE GST 1.800.00
7% GST 126.00
TOTAL | § 1,826.00

Tax Invoice will be issue upon amount finalised.

Please note that our above offer and any settlement arising from the above offer are made on a without
prejudice basis with sole intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal
proceeding. Terms of such settiement should also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in

in any Z matters.

dent. No reference shall be made to this offer or any settlement arising from this offer




7

L7 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Sl B B 51 Ubi Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park. Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 129607188R GST Reg. No. 19-8607188-R
Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automablle
CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (S) PTELTD Ref CCH/ICTIB020587/Akb3g2

s SN ROAD 160 owe:rzare—— [N

SPRINGLEAF TOWERSINGAPORE 079909

Code: CTI

1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM B
Insured Veh, SGV 4429Y Veh. Inspected SJK 4590
Policy No. DMPCSN1351281704 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. SNM18D05299 Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 121172018

2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTA VELLFIRE &.c 2362
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2008
Chassis No. ANH208009029 Colour WHITE
Odometer 118866 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOD

3. Conditions of Tyres

Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |205/85R16 MAXXIS 8 mm
L/H Front Tyru 205/85 R18 MAXCKIS 8 mm
R/H Rear Tyre 205/65 R16 MAXXIS & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |205/85R18 MAXXIS B mm

4. ‘Description of Damages T
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR N/S PORTION,

DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.

S0 ‘General Information .. b A" et
Accident Date 0B/11/2018 Inspection Date 12112018
Survey held at MG SOLUTION PTELTD

23 KAKI BUKIT AVE 4

(SOUTH WING) #02-038
VICOM INSPECTION CENTRE.
SINGAPORE 415833

5a. . Remarks L
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT FREJUDICE" BASIS
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS _

5b. Estimate Days of Repair . W NEe

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 4 Working Days




ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SJK 459J

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ut Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL 6258 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg No: 199607188R GST Reg. No. 18-9607188-R
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ay ocrptonotpars | conaton [ eetime By Jour Adhated
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR BUMPER DEFORMED 820.30 820.30
2|REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINER N/S DAMAGED 144 60 72.30
1|REAR QUARTER PANEL OUTER LH DEFORMED 27725 27725
1| TAIL LAMP LH curt 766.90 489.70
1| TAIL LAMP OUTER GARNISH LH curt 16020 160.20
1| TAILLAMP PANEL LH TO REPAIR SEE 401.20 -
LABOUR
1|REAR FENDER LH TO REPAIR SEE 1.888.70 -
LABOUR
LESS 25% DISCOUNT -1,138.79 -454 04
3.418.36 1,364 81
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|SET REAR BUMPER CLIP (SN) NECESSARY 25.00 25.00
1|REVERSE SENSOR (SN) NOT NECESSARY 220.00 -
245.00 2500
LABOUR
TO PANEL BEAT, REMOVE AND REPLACE PARTS. 1,000.00 300.00
INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF TAILLAMP PANEL LH AND
REAR FENDER LH
TO SPRAY PAINT AFFECTED AREA. 1.000.00 500.00
TUFF COAT NOT NECESSARY 180.00 -
TO CONDUCT WATER LEAKAGE TEST. NOT NECESSARY 250.00 -
WIRING CHECK 150.00 30.00
TO DIAGNOSTICS REAR SENSOR OF VEHICLE. NOT NECESSARY BO.0D -
REMOVE AND REFIX REVERSE AND DISTANCE 100.00 50.00
SETTING
2.760.00 880.00
GRAND TOTAL 6,424.36 2,269.81

Report Ref No. CCE/CTI1B020587/Akb3g2
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S
ADRIAN LING WAI PING
B.Eng, AMSOE AMIRTE,AMSAE-A M. MATAI

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Repar s meoes sodsiy (or the ues snd benefii of ihe Clisni nemed on the front page of this Repart,




