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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: lionel.tan@fwd.com

Sent: Tuesday, 27 November 2018 11:56 AM

To: etmotorsportsg@gmail.com

Cc: motorclaims.sg@fwd.com; Asher Sng (LKKAuto); assignments; SUR

Subject: RE: 回复：FBC919K AND SKX5581A Date of Accident 26/09/2018 Our Ref:   

1201800012362/LT

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

 

Hi Thomas, 

 

Liability is clear. 

 

Please finalise repair cost with surveyor & submit your claim documents to them. 

 

Thank you. 

 

 

Regards, 

Lionel  

 

From: etmotorsportsg@gmail.com [mailto:etmotorsportsg@gmail.com]  

Sent: Tuesday, November 27, 2018 11:26 AM 

To: Lionel Tan Tian Pei - SGUser 

Subject: 回复：FBC919K AND SKX5581A Date of Accident 26/09/2018 Our Ref: 1201800012362/LT 

 

Hi Iionel, 

 

how liability for this case?    

 

 

 

发自我的华为手机 

 

 

-------- 原始邮件 -------- 

主题：RE: FBC919K AND SKX5581A Date of Accident 26/09/2018 Our Ref: 

1201800012362/LT 

发件人：lionel.tan@fwd.com 

收件人：etmotorsportsg@gmail.com 

抄送： 

 

Hi Thomas, 

 

Any police investigation outcome? 

 

Regards, 

Lionel  
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From: ET MOTORSPORT [mailto:etmotorsportsg@gmail.com]  

Sent: Friday, November 23, 2018 11:01 AM 

To: Lionel Tan Tian Pei - SGUser 

Subject: Re: FBC919K AND SKX5581A Date of Accident 26/09/2018 Our Ref: 1201800012362/LT 

 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE  

 

Hi Iionel, 

 

May i Know liability for this case?    

 

 

Your Sincerely, 

Thomas Ee 

ET MOTORSPORT PTE LTD 
BLK 36 TOH GUAN ROAD EAST #01-34 ENTERPRISE HUB SINGAPORE 608580 
TEL NO.: +65 67952509 
 

 

On Mon, Nov 19, 2018 at 4:01 PM <lionel.tan@fwd.com> wrote: 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

  

Hi Thomas, 

  

We wish to do a direct settlement with you. 

  

Can you confirm drop hands on your lawyer, Island Law? 

  

  

Regards, 

Lionel  

  

From: ET MOTORSPORT [mailto:etmotorsportsg@gmail.com]  

Sent: Monday, November 19, 2018 10:44 AM 

To: Lionel Tan Tian Pei - SGUser 

Subject: Re: FBC919K AND SKX5581A Date of Accident 26/09/2018 Our Ref: 1201800012362/LT 

  

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
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Good Day, 

  

Hi Lionel, 

  

1,  May i Know liability for this case?  

  

2, Is it directly with our company to handle repair payments? 

  

  

  

Your Sincerely, 

Thomas Ee 

ET MOTORSPORT PTE LTD 

BLK 36 TOH GUAN ROAD EAST #01-34 ENTERPRISE HUB SINGAPORE 608580 

TEL NO.: +65 67952509 

  

  

On Mon, Nov 19, 2018 at 10:09 AM <lionel.tan@fwd.com> wrote: 

Hi Thomas, 

  

I am the OIC. What’s your enquiry about? 

  

  

Regards, 

Lionel  

  

From: ET MOTORSPORT [mailto:etmotorsportsg@gmail.com]  

Sent: Saturday, 17 November, 2018 11:42 AM 
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To: Motor Claims SG - SG Common 

Subject: FBC919K AND SKX5581A Date of Accident 26/09/2018 Our Ref: 1201800013526/LT 

  

Dear OIC, 

  

Without prejudice  

  

  

May i Know which official is handling this case. 

  

  

I look forward hearing from you soon. 

  

  

  

  

Your Sincerely, 

Thomas Ee 

ET MOTORSPORT PTE LTD 

BLK 36 TOH GUAN ROAD EAST #01-34 ENTERPRISE HUB SINGAPORE 608580 

TEL NO.: +65 67952509 

 

ATTENTION: 

The email and any attachments transmitted with it are private and confidential and intended solely for the 

use of the individual or entity to whom they are addressed. If you have received this email in error, 

please notify the sender immediately and delete this email and any attachments from your system. You 

should not use, disclose, copy or store this email and any attachments.  

Messages and attachments are scanned for all viruses known. However, you are advised that you open 

any attachments at your own risk. If this message contains password-protected attachments, the files have 

NOT been scanned for viruses by our mail domain. Please always scan for viruses before opening any 

attachments. 
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