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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Susan Low <liusbro@ymail.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 28 November 2018 3:14 PM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Subject: Fw: Accident on 15/08/2016  Along  PIE Towards Jurong      Involving GBE5684T 

and  SGL7502B

Refer to your email 28/11/2018. 
 

"We noted that the DOA was on 15/08/2016. However you have only requested for third party claim 
survey on 09/11/2018 which is 2 years later. 

We would like to know the reason on delaying before we could proceed necessary action." 
 
We hereby enclosed our client's replied email for your perusal. 

Thank. 

Best Regards, 

 

Susan Low 
M/s Liu's Brother Auto Engineering Workshop  
No. 1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #01-01  
AutoBay @ Kaki Bukit  
Singapore 417883  
Tel: 67411730 Fax: 67445746 
 
 
----- Forwarded message ----- 
From: Isaac Ng Cheng Long <IsaacNgCL@goldbellcorp.com> 
To: Susan Low <liusbro@ymail.com> 
Sent: Wednesday, 28 November 2018, 3:07:43 PM SGT 
Subject: RE: Accident on 15/08/2016 Along PIE Towards Jurong Involving GBE5684T and SGL7502B 
 

Hi Susan, 

  

Hirer did not send in the vehicle for the claims until their contract ends recently. 

  

Thank you 

  

Regards 
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Isaac Ng Cheng Long | Goldbell Corporation Pte Ltd  
Executive, Operations Admin (FIM) 
Representing STVE Pte Ltd, Goldbell Leasing Pte Ltd  
& Aviation Equipment Leasing Pte Ltd 
 
DID: +65 6494 2897 | Tel: +65 6861 0007 | Fax: +65 6807 0431 |
Mobile: +65 9829 8836 | Web: http://www.goldbellgroup.com/ 
Address: 18 Tuas Ave 10, Level 6, Singapore 639142 
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From: Susan Low [mailto:liusbro@ymail.com]  
Sent: Wednesday, November 28, 2018 2:55 PM 
To: Isaac Ng Cheng Long <IsaacNgCL@goldbellcorp.com> 
Subject: Accident on 15/08/2016 Along PIE Towards Jurong Involving GBE5684T and SGL7502B 

  

We refer to TP email. 

  

Kindly advise. 

  

Thank. 

  

Best Regards, 

  

Susan Low 

M/s Liu's Brother Auto Engineering Workshop  

No. 1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #01-01  

AutoBay @ Kaki Bukit  

Singapore 417883  

Tel: 67411730 Fax: 67445746 

  

  

----- Forwarded message ----- 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
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To: Susan Low <liusbro@ymail.com> 

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

Sent: Wednesday, 28 November 2018, 2:27:54 PM SGT 

Subject: RE: Request for 3rd party claims survey GBE5684T Claims against SGL7502B *** LKK REF: 
CC6/AIG18020423/Upa3 

  

Without Prejudice 

  

Hi Susan, 

  

We refer to the above matter. 

  

We noted that the DOA was on 15/08/2016. However you have only requested for third party claim survey on 
09/11/2018 which is 2 years later. 

  

We would like to know the reason on delaying before we could proceed necessary action. 

  

Thank you. 

  

  

  

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

 

  

From: Susan Low <liusbro@ymail.com>  
Sent: Thursday, 15 November, 2018 4:17 PM 
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To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: Request for 3rd party claims survey GBE5684T Claims against SGL7502B *** LKK REF: 
CC6/AIG18020423/Upa3 

  

The vehicle was under STVE PTE LTD, Co. Reg. No.: 198703585C during and that moment of time. 

Thank. 

Best Regards, 

  

Susan Low 

M/s Liu's Brother Auto Engineering Workshop  

No. 1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #01-01  

AutoBay @ Kaki Bukit  

Singapore 417883  

Tel: 67411730 Fax: 67445746 

  

  

On Tuesday, 13 November 2018, 4:35:44 PM SGT, Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com> wrote:  

  

  

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’ 

  SAVE AS TO COSTS 

  

Dear Susan, 

  

We refer to the above matter. 

  

Kindly assist to confirm your client’s particular. 

  

GOLDBELL LEASING PTE LTD, Co. Reg. No.: 199001196N or STVE PTE LTD, Co. Reg. No.: 198703585C. 

  

Thank you. 
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Best Regards, 

Mei Kwan | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)  
Sent: Monday, 12 November, 2018 7:25 PM 
To: Susan Low <liusbro@ymail.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: Request for 3rd party claims survey GBE5684T Claims against SGL7502B *** LKK REF: 
CC6/AIG18020423/Upa3 

  

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’ 

  SAVE AS TO COSTS 

  

Dear Sir / Madam, 

  

We refer to the below email. 

  

Please be informed that we are currently pending for our principal to release OI GIA report. 

  

Kindly note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contact Hsiao Tong at 6742 3197. 

  

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course. 

  

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned. 

  

Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Mei Kwan | Admin  
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Susan Low <liusbro@ymail.com>  
Sent: Friday, 9 November, 2018 4:09 PM 
To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Marcus Chua (LKKAuto) 
<MarcusChua@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Request for 3rd party claims survey GBE5684T Claims against SGL7502B 

  

Accident on 15/08/2016  Along  PIE Towards Jurong   

  

Involving GBE5684T and  SGL7502B     

  
We refer to the above accident and 3rd party claims. 

  

We hereby write to request of 3rd party claims pre-repair inspection for our client’s vehicle. 

  

Please let us have your single joint expert motor surveyors list (SJE) to conduct a pre-repair survey of the damage to 
our client's vehicle jointly with our client/our motor workshop at No. 1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #01-01 AutoBay @ Kaki 
Bukit Singapore 417883 as soon as possible. 

  

Kindly arrange. 

 
Thank you. 

  

Best Regard! 

  

Susan Low 
M/s Liu's Brother Auto Engineering Workshop 
No. 1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #01-01 
AutoBay @ Kaki Bukit 
Singapore 417883 
Tel: 6741 1730 
Fax: 6744 5746 
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Date of Survey:-                     _______________________________________ 

 
Name of Authorise Surveyor:-  _______________________________________ 

 
Surveyor Email:                      _______________________________________ 

 
Remark :-                              _______________________________________ 

  


