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Consultants
Pie Lidf Campany Ragistration No, 199807 198R

| B 74 74RE

2 UBLAVE 1, 80225 PAYA URI INDUSTRIAT PARK. SINGAPORE H08933 TEL : (065] 62563561 FAN : (065 hl5a4315

Your ref: D1R00RO10MESH

Our ref: CS/FCI18020354/T1vb Date: 15/11/2018
The Motor Claims Department

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

Dear Sir'Madam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO_SKZ 3089H

We thank you for your instructionon ~ 9/11/2018

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on
14/11/2018 at the premises of M/s CHARN'S CUSTOMCRAFT

and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount 1:8%5,151.76
Revised Estimate Amount : §32,204.32
"Check” Items Amount : 8%2,567.44
Total 188
Market Value 155
LTA Reimbursement Value 1 5%
Nett Value 5%

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the rear
front nfs portion

Comments/Present Status:

Damages Consistent

Yours faithfully,

MOHAMAD TAUFIKH
M.MATAIL AMSAE-A
Automobile Assessor



! H 1 MS First Capital Insurance Limited comes o 1950001060 GST Reg Mo M2 00016769
MS‘ F|r5tca p‘tai 5 Ratfles Quay #21-00 Singapore D4B5E0

Tel: {R5) 6222 2311 Faix(65) 6222 3547

Clsie & Mator Underweiiing Dept: 36 Robinsan Road #16-01 City House Singapore 06877
Tek |65) B507 3048 Fax: [65) 6507 3849
wasrw mafirsteapital. com.sg

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

Date 09-11-2018 Our Ref No. D18008010MFSH
Accident Date 03-11-2018 Claim Type. Third Party
Insured Vehicle SHD4806A Third Party Vehicle. SKZ3085H
Survey Location BELK 1010 BUKIT MERAH LANE 3 #01-105
Contact Person. SHARON LEE
Contact No. 62717054/ 62733304 Fax No. 62736676
Survey Type WITHOUT PREJUDICE: LIABILITY UNCLEAR:

inted
fopalie LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD
Surveyor
Contact Person MA Fax No. 68416315
Contact Number. A

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on
NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report,

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

CHARN'S
: Worksh jon. MIL
Ce orkshop CUSTOMCRAFT Attention
Cec : TP Solicitor MA TP Solicitor Fax No. MNA
Officer Incharge KARENT

IMPORTANT NOTE
Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection,
This is a computer generated letter, no signature required.

& Mpmoer of KRR IRSURANCE GROUT




Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

f

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 15 Novemnber 2018 12:30 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims'

Cc: 'Karen Tan'; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18008010MFSH/1, SKZ 3089H
Attachments: SKZ 3089H PRELI ADVISED.pdf

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SKZ 3089H
Date of survey: 14/11/2018
Number of days : 4 days

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :suri@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 9 November 2018 4:31 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims’ <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: 'Karen Tan' <karentan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18008010MFSH/1

Dear Sir / Madam,
Thank you for the assignment.
Please be informed that vehicle currently not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

Best Regards,

Catherine Chong | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408a933)

From: CWS Motor Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, 9 November, 2018 4:02 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LEKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmaotorclaims@msfirsteapital.com.sg>; Karen Tan <karentan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18008010MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

1



Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From:

Sent:
To:

Cc:
Subject:

Sensitivity:

Dear Sharon,

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Veron Chen (LKKAUtS)

Wednesday, 12 December 2018 1:50 PM
‘Charn's Customcraft’; Taufikh (LKKAuUtD)
SUR

RE: Finalization - SKZ 3089 H - Mazda 6

Confidential

Confirmed $4910.08 (before GST) @ 4 working days.

Kindly send Final invoice and all supporting documents to First Capital Ins Ltd.

Best Regards,
Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Charn's Customcraft <charns@singnet.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 11 December 2018 5:01 PM
To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@Ikkauto.com>

Ce: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com=

Subject: Finalization - SKZ 3089 H - Mazda 6

Importance: High
Sensitivity: Confidential

Hi

Kindly find attached for finalization.

Parts: $3920.08
Lab: $990.00

Total: $4910.08 (before GS5T)

Please confirm

Thanks & Regards,
Sharon Lee
Charn's Customcraft

[el: 6272 5429 Fax: 6273 6676
Email; charnsi@singnet.com.sg




~ GST Reg. No: M90367863L
‘Company Reg No: 25151500M



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Charn's Customcraft <charns@singnet.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, 12 December 2018 2:48 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Finalization - SKZ 3089 H - Mazda 6
Sensitivity: Confidential

Hi

OK accepted

Regards,
Rina Chua
CHARN'S CUSTOMCRAFT

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) [mailto:veronchen@lkkauto.com)
Sent: Wednesday, December 12, 2018 1:50 PM

To: Charn's Customeraft; Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: Finalization - SKZ 3089 H - Mazda &

Sensitivity: Confidential

Dear Sharon,
WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Confirmed $4910.08 (before GST) (@ 4 working days.

Kindly send Final invoice and all supporting documents to First Capital Ins Ltd.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Charn's Customcraft <charns@singnet.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 11 December 2018 5:01 PM

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@Ilkkauto.com>

Ce: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Finalization - SKZ 3089 H - Mazda 6

Importance: High
Sensitivity: Confidential




~ Hi
Kindly find attached for finalization.

Parts: $3920.08
Lab: $990.00

Total; $4910.08 (before GST)

Please confirm

Thanks & Regards.

Sharon Lee

Charn's Customcraft

Tel: 6272 5429 Fax: 6273 6676
Email: charns@singnet.com.sg
GST Reg. No: M90367863L
Company Reg No: 25151300M



0712018 PARFICOE Rebate Enguiry

= Back to OneMaotaring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owiner 1D Type: Singapore NRIC
Chwner |0 3533G

Wehicle Details

Wehicle No.: SKZ3089H

Vehicle to be Exparted: Yes

Intended Deregistration Date: 30Mev 2018
Vehicle Make: BAZ DA

Wehicle Model: MAZDAS 4-DOOR SEDAN 2.50 SPAEAT SR LED
Primary Colour: Blue

Manufacturing Year; 015

Engine Mo P¥20705085
Chassis No.: IMAGITI032G022%284
Maximum Power Output; 1410 kW (18% bhp)
Open Market Value: $23.5656.00
Original Registration Date; 18 Jan 2014

First Registration Date; 18 Jan 2014
Transfer Count: o

Actual ARF Paid. $24,993.00
Intended PARF Rebate Detalls

PARF Eligibility: Yes

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: 17 Jan 2024

PARF Rebate Amount: $18.744.00
Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date: 17 Jan 2026

COE Category: E - Open Category
COE PeriodiYears): 10

OP Paid: $60,003.00

COE Rebate Amount: 34277400

Total Rebate Amount: %61,518.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 07 Nov 2018

OK

MRS AVTLILE. QOV.SGAIRNVTIaCION/Enf LI REDRa18 5y FUDNCEE ToreLmEraginpul «r i | AN _ IS UIUsuusl |



Contact us at

direct Hotline: (65) 6532 2888

E-mail: CustomerService@Directisia.com

CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE

Motor Vehicles (Third-Party Risks and Compensation) Act (Chapter 189) (Singapore) (the "Act”™)

Motor Vehicles [ Third-Party Risks and Compensation) Rules, 1960 [Singapore)

Road Transport Act, 1987 (Malaysia)

Motor Vehicles [Third-Party Risks) Rules, 1959 (Malaysia)

This document forms part of your contract with us and shouid be read together with your Policy Schedule and your Policy
Details. Do let us know if any of the details shown here need to be amended or updated

| Certificate No. ¢ MT/00438748
Type of Coverage / Driver Plan : Car Comprehensive (Value Plus Plan)
1) Vehicle Registration No. . SKZ3089H
Chassis No. . IMeGI1032G0229.285

2) Name of Policy Holder Jauhari, Saurabh

3) Effective Date / Time of Commencement
of Insurance for the Purpose of the Act i 18/01/2018 00:00

4) Date/Time of Expiry of Insurance 17/01/2019 23:59

5) Persons or Classes of Persons Entitled to Drive

{a} The Insured
{b) Any named person under the policy who is drving on the Insured's order or with his permission.

(e) Any authorised person, provided such person is aged 30 and above and holds a valid driving licence of 2 years ar
mare, who i5 driving on the Insured’s order or with his permission L

The person driving must have a valid driving licence to drive in Singapore and must not be under suspension or
disqualification from driving.
,
6) Limitations as to use®

Use anly for private purposes, in accordance with the declared car usage stated on your Policy Schedyle. The palicy
does not cover use for hire or reward, tuition, driving test, racing, pace-making, reliability trials, speed tests, the
carriage of goods for payment or for any purpese in connection with the motor trade business.

“Limitations rendered inoperative by Section 8 of the Act and Section 95 of the Road Transport Act, 1987 (Malaysia],
are not to be included under this heading.

Sum Insured : Market Value

Own Damage Excess : S4% 800.00 [before any applicable G5T)
Windscreen Excess 3 5% 100.00 {before any applicable G5T)

Choice of workshop : My Workshop/ My Authorised Distributor Workshop
Finance company / Hire Purchase : HONG LEONG FINANCE LTD

Main driver - Jauharn, Saurabh

Mamed driver : MNane

Important Note: This policy does not cover drivers below the age of 30 and drivers who hold a valid driving
licence of less than 2 years with the exception of the named drivers above.

1/'we hereby certify that the Policy to which this Certificate relates is (ssued in accordance with the provisions of the
Motor Vehicles (Third-Party Risks and Compensation) Act (Chapter 189) and the Road Transpgt Act, 1987 (Malaysia).

Direct Asia Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

Issued on: 28/12/2017 ‘;é’;‘g““

Edip Okur
Chief Underwriting Officer

Direct Asia Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd
88 South Bridge Road Singapore 058716
www DirectAsia.com
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Arcident Claim Repair, Carroston Welding, Bady Dent Repairs,
Spway-Painting, Mechani al Repair Ard Customizing of Cars
BLOCK 1010, BUKIT MERAH LANE 3, #01-105, SINGAPORE 150724 '
BLOCK 1009, BUKIT MERAH LANE 3, #01 -2, SINGAPOHRE 158723
TEL: 62717054, G2733304 FAX. B27366T6 EMAIL charns @ singnet.com 59

Bus, Reg, Mo. 25151 3/00M

DA/FC(SHD4806A)
DOA: 03/11/2018@ 1840

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE PTE LTD 08/11/2018

ATTN: THE MOTOR CLAIMS DEPT

THIRD PARTY CLAIM
ESTIMATE COST OF REPAIR FOR VEHICLE NO:
SKZ 3089 H - MAZDA 6 4-DOOR SEDAN 2.5L SP.6EAT SR LED

CHASSIS NO: IM6GJ1032G0229286 (01/2016) 7 b

1 pe Front headlamp LH $ 3.209.30 °
Ipe  Front fender LH § 3393047
I pc Front bumper $ 11541074 ~
I pc Front bumper retainer LH $ 24.50 «te
$ 4.727.20
LESS 20% b 945.44
$ 3.781.76
-
Repair and putty front rim LH $ 100.00 &
fe
Alignment S 70.00 —

Remove necessary parts: jacking, panel beating, repair and
straighten front bumper, front fender LH & front bonnet Pz
5 600.00 ?

Putty and respray front bumper, front fender LH & front

bonnet § 60000 480
£2%0.08 § 5151.76
ADD 7% GST 3 360.62
$ 551238
Note: The above is an estimate only. IF other parts require %, T\a»u ™ r? ;LT & 5}\{?
duri . : st N :
uring the course of repair, we will inform you accordingly \\ o F,
. | T, N
All parts gre subject to av |!ag§_ﬁ;ﬁ'-= Lonsultants hence notify | 1{{“ (E] (’ 25V
CHARN'S CL.'_ST]UML‘R}LFT_' s isd . I8 ;thtm{ i

\ * Sy 33 o S““‘E‘-' _.f','{ff(ﬁ_.,:.?/ﬁ-:-h -
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Accident Claim Repair, Corrosion Welding, Body Dent Repairy,
Spray-Painting, Mechanical Repair And Customizing of Cars
BLOCK 1010, BLIKIT MERAH LANE 3, #01-105, SINGAPORE 159724
BLOGK 1008, BUKIT MERAH LANE 3, #01-82. SINGAPDRE 159723
TEL- &271 7054, B2T33304 FAX: §2TI85TE EMAIL: charns@singnat.com.sg
Bug. Rag. No. 251513/00M

DA/FC(SHD4806A)
DOA: 03/11/2018@1840

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE PTE LTD ' 08/11/2018

.}T’[N: THE MOTOR CLAIMS DEPT

IRD PARTY CLAIM
ESTIMATE COST OF REPAIR FOR VEHICLE NO:

SEZSOSEF- MAZDA 6 4-DOOR SEDAN 2.5L SP.6EAT SR LED

CHASSIS NO: IM6GJ1 032G0229286 (01/2016)
: 7 seh Vo
1 pc Front headlamp LH : $ 3,209.30 °
1 pc Front fender LH g 339.30
1 pe Front bumper $ 1,154.111"{6 -~
1 pe Front bumper retainer LH $ 24.50 “re—"
3 4,727.20
LESS 20% g 945.44
$ 3,781.76
Repair and putty front rim LH $  100.00 8>
{o
Alignment _ $ 70.00 ~

Remove necessary parts: jacking, panel beating, repair and
straighten front bumper, front fender LH & front bonnet oo
5 600.00 ?

Putty and respray front bumper, front fender LH & front

bonnet s 60000 48O

———————

$ 5,151.76
ADD 7% GST $ 36062
$ 5,512.38
Note: The above is an estimate only. IF other parts required . T Cf ?‘TT ‘ﬂ%?
during the course of repair, we will inform you accordingly. ~) |7,
%\Q'\Gl L

All parts gre ubject to availability. lezd \{\M"'
/
~KU% w é;z,\gf\‘o ﬁﬁf
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Accident Clatm Repair, Corrogion Welding, Body Dent Repairs,
Spray-Painting, Mechanical Repair And Cusiomizing of Cars
BLOCEK 1010, BUKIT MERAH LANE 3, #01-105, SINGAPORE 158724
BLOCK 1008, BUKIT MERAH LANE 3, #01-82, SINGAPORE 158723
TEL: 62717054, 62733304 FAX: 62738676 EMAIL: charns@singnel.com.sg
Bus. Reg. No. 251513/00M

DA/FC(SHD4806A)
DOA: 03/11/2018(@ 1840

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE PTE LTD 08/11/2018
ATTN: THE MOTOR CLAIMS DEPT

THIRD PARTY CLAIM

ESTIMATE COST OF REPAIR FOR VEHICLE NO:

SKZ 3089 H - MAZDA 6 4-DOOR SEDAN 2.5L SP.6EAT SR LED
CHASSIS NO: IM6GJ1032G0229286 (01/2016)

Supplementry
1 pec Front fender inner shield LH $ 11500 -;LL/
4 pcs Front bumper rivets @ £8.70 § 3480 s
6 pes Front fender inner shield clips (@ $3.85 $ 23.10 pu
$ 172.90
LESS 20% $ 3458
$ 13832
ADD 7% GST b 9.68
$ 148.00
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408533
TEL; B256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199807198R GST Reg. MNo. 19-9807198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Exparts En Automobile

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref : CS/FCI18020354/T1vbn2
#16.01 CITY HOUSESINGAPORE 068877 Ome; w2200 M“wml“l“"‘ml“
Code: FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. ~ SHD 4808A Veh. Inspected SKZ 3088H
Policy No. Coverage (§) 0.00
Claim No. D18008010MFSH Excess () 0.00
Assign From KARENT Assign Date 09/11/2018
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model MAZDAG c.c 2488
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2016
Chassis No. JMBGJ1032G0229286 Colour BLUE
Odometer 50796 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |225/55R17 BRIDGESTONE & mm
L/H Front Tyre |225/55 R17 BRIDGESTONE & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |225/55 R17 BRIDGESTONE & mm
L/H Rear Tyre 225/55 R17 BRIDGESTONE & rmrm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE FRONT N/S PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  03/11/2018 ]Inspactlon Date 14/11/2018
Survey held at CHARN'S CUSTOMCRAFT
ELK 1010 BUKIT MERAH LANE 3
#01-105
SINGAPORE 159724
5a. Remarks
A)DAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
BITHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair

]ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 4 Working Days




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

;.J‘. ;; ; 51 bl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
A TEL® 6256 3561 FAX, 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. Mo. 18-9507198-R Page No.:1of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SKZ 3083H
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop {gj} ($)
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT HEADLAMP LH CcuTt 3,200.30 3,209.30
1|FRONT FENDER LH BENWT 33930 339.30
1|FRONT BUMPER DEFORMED 1,154.10 1,154.10
1|FRONT BUMPER RETAINER LH NECESSARY 24,50 24 50
1|FRONT FENDER INNER SHIELD LH (ADDITIONAL) DEFORMED 115.00 115.00
4|FRONT BUMPER RIVETS @$8.70 (ADDITIONAL) NECESSARY 34.80 34 80
6|FRONT FENDER INMER SHIELD CLIPS @$3 85 NECESSARY 23.10 23.10
(ADDITIONAL)
LESS 20% DISCOUNT -080.02 -S80.02
3,920.08 3,520.08
LABOUR
REPAIR AND PUTTY FRONT RIM LH 100.00 80.00
ALIGNMENT 70.00 60.00
REMOVE NECESSARY PARTS.JACKING PANEL 600.00 400.00
BEATING REPAIR AND STRAIGHTEN FRONT
BUMPER,FRONT FENDER LH & FRONT BONNET
PUTTY AND RESPRAY FRONT BUMPER FRONT FENDER 600.00 450.00
LH & FRONT BONNET.
1,370.00 990.00
GRAND TOTAL 5,290.08 4,910.08
RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS | | 4,910.08

Report Ref No, CS/FCI18020354/T1vbn2

M"‘"

MOHAMAD TAUFIKH
M.MATAI, AMSAE-A

Automotive Assessor

KL

ADRIAN LING WAI PING

B.Eng AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-A MMATAI

Licensed Appraiser

MECLAIMER OF LIRBILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Repcdt s made solely for the wse and benefit of tha Client named on the front page of this Repo,




