Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Saturday, 24 November 2018 2:53 PM

To: PBSP

Subject: RE: REQUEST FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT - SBR1628P & SBV1398G (ntuc) & SKL2976C

(AIG) ON 15/10/2018

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Hi Caroline,

We refer to the above matter.

Based on the above accident scenario insured shall not be liable for this accident.

Under such a circumstances, we regret to inform you that we have our principal instruction to deny liability and unable
to look into your client’s claim.

Please redirect the claim to SBV 1398G.

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

phone: 6841-6051 | email: ashersng@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: PBSP <pml-pbsp@simedarby.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 9 November 2018 4:37 PM

To: CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: REQUEST FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT - SBR1628P & SBV1398G (ntuc) & SKL2976C (AIG) ON 15/10/2018

Dear Sirs

We refer to the above matter and NTUC advised us to claim against your insured SKL2976C.
We have instructions from our client to seek repair cost and loss of use/car rental from you through Direct Settlement.
Attached is the estimates and supporting documents for your consideration.

Please let us have your confirmation that you agree that liability is clear and we may proceed with Direct Settlement.



If Direct Settlement is approved, kindly let us have your offer for LOU / rental.

Thank you.

Regards,

Caroline

C/o Performance Motors Limited - Body and Paint
303 Alexandra Road Singapore 159941

DID: 6319 0174 Fax: 6479 4601
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