Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 16 November 2018 3:50 PM

To: clara.li@fwd.com; josey.loh@fwd.com; assignments; SUR

Cc: motorclaims.sg@fwd.com

Subject: RE: ARRANGE FOR SURVEY-OD / YOUR REF: SKA470R (Our Ref: 1201800013089/CL)
Attachments: SMC586 Adjustment.pdf; SMC586 Inspection.pdf; SMC586 Invoice.pdf

Dear Clara,

Please find the attached of SMC 586G report.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 9 November 2018 3:03 PM

To: clara.li@fwd.com; josey.loh@fwd.com; assignments <assignments@Ilkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Cc: motorclaims.sg@fwd.com

Subject: RE: ARRANGE FOR SURVEY-OD / YOUR REF: SKA470R (Our Ref: 1201800013089/CL)

Dear Clara,
Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards,
Catherine Chong | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: clara.li@fwd.com [mailto:clara.li@fwd.com]

Sent: Friday, 9 November, 2018 2:18 PM

To: admin-d@Ikkauto.com; josey.loh@fwd.com; assignments@I|kkauto.com; sur@lkkauto.com; admin-
a@lkkauto.com

Cc: motorclaims.sg@fwd.com

Subject: ARRANGE FOR SURVEY-OD / YOUR REF: SKA470R (Our Ref: 1201800013089/CL)

Hi LKK team,

Please conduct a paper resurvey for this matter and email us the soft copy soonest possible.

Thank you.

Regards,
Clara



From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) [mailto:admin-d@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, 15 October, 2018 11:26 AM

To: Josey Loh Kah Wai - SGUser; assignments; SUR; Admin A

Cc: Motor Claims SG - SG Common; Clara Li Zirong - SGUser

Subject: RE: ARRANGE FOR SURVEY-OD / YOUR REF: SKA470R (Our Ref: 1201800013089/CL)

Dear Josey,
Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards,
Catherine Chong | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: josey.loh@fwd.com [mailto:josey.loh@fwd.com]

Sent: Monday, 15 October, 2018 11:12 AM

To: assignments@Ikkauto.com; sur@Ikkauto.com; admin-a@Ikkauto.com; admin-d@lkkauto.com
Cc: motorclaims.sg@fwd.com; clara.li@fwd.com

Subject: FW: ARRANGE FOR SURVEY-OD / YOUR REF: SKA470R (Our Ref: 1201800013089/CL)

Hi LKK team,

Please refer to the email below and liaise with the repairer for OD survey arrangement. Policy excess $1,000.00.
Attached is the repair estimate & Ol GIA report.

Please create the case in Merimen and revert to us with your preliminary report.

Thank you.

Kind Regards

Josey Loh
Executive, Claims

FWD Singapore Pte. Ltd.
6 Temasek Boulevard, #18-01 Suntec Tower Four, Singapore 038986

T (65)6727 5872
E josey.loh@fwd.com

W fwd.com.sg

>

insurance

il FWD

insurance




From: ronald.yap@eurokars.com.sg [mailto:ronald.yap@eurokars.com.sg]
Sent: Monday, 15 October, 2018 10:36 AM

To: Josey Loh Kah Wai - SGUser

Cc: jess.francis@eurokars.com.sg; samuel.ng@eurokars.com.sg

Subject: ARRANGE FOR SURVEY-OD / YOUR REF: SKA470R

Dear Josey,
Kindly assist us to arrange the survey of your client’s car as attached.

Let us have your appointed surveyor please.

Thank You,

Ronald Yap
Insurance Claims

Trans Eurokars Pte Ltd
5 Ubi Close, Singapore 408605
T:6395 8899 H: 9127 7928
ronald.yap@eurokars.com.sg

This email, including any attachment, is intended for the sole use of the recipient(s) named above and may contain information that is
confidential and/or proprietary to the Eurokars Group. If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then
delete this message from your system. Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other
person. Thank you.

ATTENTION:

The email and any attachments transmitted with it are private and confidential and intended solely for the
use of the individual or entity to whom they are addressed. If you have received this email in error, please
notify the sender immediately and delete this email and any attachments from your system. You should not
use, disclose, copy or store this email and any attachments.

Messages and attachments are scanned for all viruses known. However, you are advised that you open any
attachments at your own risk. If this message contains password-protected attachments, the files have NOT
been scanned for viruses by our mail domain. Please always scan for viruses before opening any
attachments.

ATTENTION:

The email and any attachments transmitted with it are private and confidential and intended solely for the
use of the individual or entity to whom they are addressed. If you have received this email in error, please
notify the sender immediately and delete this email and any attachments from your system. You should not
use, disclose, copy or store this email and any attachments.

Messages and attachments are scanned for all viruses known. However, you are advised that you open any
attachments at your own risk. If this message contains password-protected attachments, the files have NOT
been scanned for viruses by our mail domain. Please always scan for viruses before opening any
attachments.



