Vic (LKKAuto)

From:

Sent:

To:

Cc:

Subject:
Attachments:

Hi

Winnie Chai <connect3winnie@gmail.com>

Friday, 30 November, 2018 11:26 AM

Naz (LKKAuto)

Mei Kwan (LKKAuto); Vic (LKKAuto); Admin A; Olivia Lau (LKKAuto)

Re: 3rd Reminder : Finalization for PA9396D *** LKK REF: CC4/ASM18020335/Nha3
LOA jpg; CCTV l.avi; CCTV 2.avi; 484 - PA9396D.jpg; LOD.jpg

Attached is the LOD, LOA & Tax Inv for yr ref.

PIs kindly revert on the offer for this case.

Thanks

On Fri, Nov 30, 2018 at 11:01 AM Winnie Chai <connect3winnie @ gmail.com> wrote:

Noted with thanks.

On Fri, Nov 30, 2018 at 10:28 AM Naz (LKKAuto) <Naz@Ilkkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Ms Winnie,

Apologies for the late reply. Attached herewith is the amended marked estimate following a check on the
part prices. We will proceed to finalize if you are agreeable with the amended COR;

PARTS - $3,394.5

LESS 25% - $2545.90

SPECIAL NET ITEMS - $365
LABOUR - $1,220

SPRAY - $1,000

LESS LUMP SUM 20% - $4,104.72
TOTAL - $4100/ 6 REPAIR DAYS
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Nazl Technical Investigator

LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 6841-2157 | Email: Naz @lkkauto.com | Fax: 6256-4315




Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Winnie Chai <connect3winnie@gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, 29 November 2018 9:20 AM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Cc: Naz (LKKAuto); Vic (LKKAuto); Admin A; Olivia Lau (LKKAuto)

Subject: 3rd Reminder : Finalization for PA9396D *** LKK REF: CC4/ASM18020335/Nha3
Hi

Pls kindly revert on the finalization.

Thanks

On Tue, Nov 27, 2018 at 6:22 PM Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan @lkkauto.com> wrote:

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’

SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Sir / Madam,

Thank you for your email.

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course.
Hi Naz / Vic,

For your necessary action please.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@Ikkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Winnie Chai <connect3winnie @ gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, 26 November, 2018 4:01 PM

To: Naz (LKKAuto) <Naz@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Olivia Lau (LKKAuto)
<olivialau @lkkauto.com>

Subject: 2nd Reminder : Finalization for PA9396D

Hi Naz

PIs kindly revert on the finalization.



Thanks

—————————— Forwarded message ---------

From: Winnie Chai <connect3winnie @ gmail.com>
Date: Tue, Nov 20, 2018 at 12:10 PM

Subject: Reminder : Finalization for PA9396D

To: Naz (LKKAuto) <naz@lkkauto.com>

Hi Naz
PlIs kindly revert on the finalization.
Thanks

On Thu, Nov 15, 2018 at 10:11 AM Winnie Chai <connect3winnie @ gmail.com> wrote:

Hi Naz
Attached is the after repair photos.

PlIs kindly revert on the finalization.

Thanks

Winnie Chai
Connect3

HP:9850-9666

Winnie Chai
Connect3

HP:9850-9666

Winnie Chai
Connect3

HP:9850-9666



Winnie Chai
Connect3
HP:9850-9666

Winnie Chai
Connect3
HP:9850-9666

Winnie Chai
Connect3
HP:9850-9666



