Vic (LKKAuto)

From:

Sent:

To:

Cc:

Subject:
Attachments:

Hi Vic

Winnie Chai <connect3winnie@gmail.com>

Thursday, 6 December, 2018 1:21 PM

Vic (LKKAuto)

Admin A

Re: 3rd Reminder : Finalization for PA9396D *** LKK REF: CC4/ASM18020335/Nha3
DV.pdf

Re-attached DV in PDF format for yr ref.

Thanks

On Thu, Dec 6, 2018 at 11:59 AM Winnie Chai <connect3winnie @ gmail.com> wrote:

Hi

Attached is the duly chopped & signed DV for yr ref.

Thanks

On Wed, Dec 5, 2018 at 1:21 PM Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh @lkkauto.com> wrote:

Without Prejudice

Dear Winnie,

We refer further to your below email.

Purely for an amicable settlement on a without prejudice basis and without admission of liability to our Insured’s
part, we have our principal’s mandate and we confirm acceptance of your offer of $4,987.00 (all in).

Kindly let the owner sign the attached DV then forward back to us a copy for payment processing.

The above amount is to be made payable to CONNECT3.

Thank you.



Please note that our above offer and any settlement arising from the above offer are made on a without prejudice basis, and
should not be construed as an admission of liability on our part or on the part of our Insured Driver. Terms of such settlement
should also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of the accident. Our offer made in respect of this present
matter is made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be made to this offer or any settlement arising from this
offer in any other related matters.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Litd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

W Save the Earth Print only when necessary-

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by
an unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please
do not read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and
inform the sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Winnie Chai [mailto:connect3winnie@gmail.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 4 December, 2018 1:30 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: Re: 3rd Reminder : Finalization for PA9396D *** LKK REF: CC4/ASM18020335/Nha3

Hi Vic

We have email Naz on the after repair photos

Thanks & regards

On 4 Dec 2018, at 1:25 PM, Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh @lkkauto.com> wrote:

Without Prejudice

Dear Winnie,



We refer to your below email and the contents were noted.
We will get back to you for an update/offer in due course.
Meanwhile, kindly forward to us the after repair photos if any.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh @lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the
intended recipient. Use or distribution by an unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be
a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not read
this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including
any copies thereof, and inform the sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments
and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Winnie Chai [mailto:connect3winnie @ gmail.com]

Sent: Friday, 30 November, 2018 11:26 AM

To: Naz (LKKAuto)

Cc: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto); Vic (LKKAuto); Admin A; Olivia Lau (LKKAuto)
Subject: Re: 3rd Reminder : Finalization for PA9396D *** KK REF:
CC4/ASM18020335/Nha3

Hi

Attached is the LOD, LOA & Tax Inv for yr ref.
PlIs kindly revert on the offer for this case.
Thanks

On Fri, Nov 30, 2018 at 11:01 AM Winnie Chai <connect3winnie @ gmail.com> wrote:

Noted with thanks.

On Fri, Nov 30, 2018 at 10:28 AM Naz (LKKAuto) <Naz@Ilkkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Ms Winnie,



Apologies for the late reply. Attached herewith is the amended marked estimate
following a check on the part prices. We will proceed to finalize if you are agreeable
with the amended COR;

PARTS - $3,394.5

LESS 25% - $2545.90

SPECIAL NET ITEMS - $365

LABOUR - $1,220

SPRAY - $1,000

LESS LUMP SUM 20% - $4,104.72

TOTAL - $4100 / 6 REPAIR DAYS

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Nazl Technical Investigator

LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 6841-2157 | Email: Naz @lkkauto.com | Fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Winnie Chai <connect3winnie @ gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, 29 November 2018 9:20 AM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Cc: Naz (LKKAuto); Vic (LKKAuto); Admin A; Olivia Lau (LKKAuto)
Subject: 3rd Reminder : Finalization for PA9396D *** LKK REF:
CC4/ASM18020335/Nha3

Hi
PIs kindly revert on the finalization.
Thanks

On Tue, Nov 27, 2018 at 6:22 PM Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan @Ilkkauto.com>
wrote:

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’

SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Sir / Madam,



Thank you for your email.

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course.
Hi Naz / Vic,

For your necessary action please.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan @lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Winnie Chai <connect3winnie @ gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, 26 November, 2018 4:01 PM

To: Naz (LKKAuto) <Naz@Ikkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Olivia
Lau (LKKAuto) <olivialau @lkkauto.com>

Subject: 2nd Reminder : Finalization for PA9396D

Hi Naz
PIs kindly revert on the finalization.
Thanks

—————————— Forwarded message ---------

From: Winnie Chai <connect3winnie @ gmail.com>
Date: Tue, Nov 20, 2018 at 12:10 PM

Subject: Reminder : Finalization for PA9396D

To: Naz (LKKAuto) <naz @lkkauto.com>

Hi Naz
PIs kindly revert on the finalization.
Thanks

On Thu, Nov 15, 2018 at 10:11 AM Winnie Chai <connect3winnie @ gmail.com> wrote:

Hi Naz

Attached is the after repair photos.



PlIs kindly revert on the finalization.

Thanks

Winnie Chai
Connect3
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