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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Henry, Irene James <irene.henry@sompo.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 27 November 2018 7:11 PM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Cc: SUR; Gnoh, Pau Loong; Ashley Nguyen

Subject: RE: Sompo ref : CMTD1804847  ;  GBH4798P  (DOA: 06/11/2018) - OD Invoice

Dear Catherine, 

 

We refer to the below matter. 

 

We seek your assistance in completion of the final survey report/status as our authorised workshop will like to 

upload their repair bill onto Merimen. 

 

 

Best Regards 

Irene Henry 

Claims Division 

D: 6322 4618 | T: 6461 6555 | F: 6221 3147 

 
 

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd.            

50 Raffles Place, #05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623 

Website: www.sompo.com.sg | Facebook: www.facebook.com/SompoSG  

 

Quick & Easy Claims Submission1 & Product Purchase2 via Sompo SG 
 

Download now @  or  
1 For Travel, Personal Accident & Home Insurance | 2 For Travel, Personal Accident, Home & Private Motor Insurance  

 

Disclaimer: This e-mail, including attachments, is intended for the person(s) or company named and may contain confidential 

and/or legally privileged information. Unauthorised disclosure, copying or use of this information may be unlawful and is prohibited. 

If you are not the intended recipient, please delete this message. 

Privacy Policy Notice: Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. may collect, use and disclose your personal data for the purposes 
stated in our Privacy Policy. This may include disclosure to holding and associated companies, credit bureau, parties to whom 
disclosure is permitted/required by laws, our third party service providers and agents (acting on our behalf). Please click here for 
our Privacy Policy 

 

 

 
 

From: Ashley Nguyen <Ashley.Nguyen@ethozgroup.com>  

Sent: Monday, 26 November, 2018 4:02 PM 

To: Gnoh, Pau Loong <PauLoong.Gnoh@sompo.com.sg> 

Subject: Sompo ref : CMTD1804847 ; GBH4798P (DOA: 06/11/2018) - OD Invoice 

 

Hi Pau Loong 

 

GBH4798P accident on 06/11/2018. 

 

Please put up offer in Merimen in order for us to upload final invoice and close this case, thank you. 
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Warmest Regards, 

Ashley Nguyen 

Claims Settlement 

 

ETHOZ GROUP LTDETHOZ GROUP LTDETHOZ GROUP LTDETHOZ GROUP LTD  

22 Tampines St 92  S(528876) 
DID: 6654 7920 | Fax: 6654 7699 

Website:Website:Website:Website: www.ethozgroup.com  

            

 

Disclaimer: This message may contain confidential information intended only for the use of the addressee 

named above. If you are not the intended recipient of this message you are hereby notified that any use, 

dissemination, distribution or reproduction of this message is prohibited. If you received this message by 

mistake, please notify the sender by reply email immediately. Please conduct your own virus checks before 

opening any attachment as ETHOZ Group does not guarantee the integrity of this email or attached files has 

been maintained nor this communication is free of viruses, interceptions or interference. Any views 

expressed in this message are those of the individual sender and may not necessarily reflect the views of 

ETHOZ Group. ETHOZ Group shall not be responsible nor liable for the improper and incomplete 
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transmission of the information contained in this communication nor for any delay in its receipt or damage 

to your system.  


