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F Ly As LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
;_(; ;; ; 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408533
= il TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No 158607158R GST Reg No. 18-96071598-R
| Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile
EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD Rel : CC4/EQI1B020301/hb3
o TowER oL AR
#17-00 TOWER 8LOCK Date: 08-11-2018
MND COMPLEXSINGAPORE 0689110
Code: EQI
1. Policy Particulars - THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. GBD 5538 Veh. Inspected SKV B8GTE
Policy No. Coverage (§) 0.00
Claim No. Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 09/11/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.c 0
Engine Nu. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer . Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre i
L/H Front Tyre mmm
RfH Rear Tyre mm
LIH Rear Tyre mm
4, Description of Damages
5. General Information
Accident Date  07/11/2018 |Inspection Date
Survey held at WEARNES AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD
45 LENG KEE ROAD
SINGAPORE 158103
5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
BJIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS. WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
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Your ref; To Be Advised
Owur tel: CCHEQIIB020301/TThb3 Date: 15.11.2018

The Motor Claims Department

M/s EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD

Dear SirfMadam,

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO, SKVBSYTE
We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on 14.11.2018
at the premuses of Mis _Wearnes Automotive Pre Lid and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount 1 5% 047230

Revised Estimate Amount : 5% 742090

“Check” ems Amount 1 5% 20140

Marke! Value : 5% x

LTA Reimbursement Value : 5% -

Nen Value : 5% -

Description of Damage: e

The vehicle sustained damages at the - —' i -_:¢ Al
Front (/S Portion ——r*_—'—-‘f

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent
Estimated normal period for repairs; 3 days

Yours faithfully,

MOHD: TAUFIKH
Licensed Appraiser



ESs
SERVICE ESTIMATE
93811 - CO000L SL: SERYICE SALES - pC
Hr Carl Skadiang BST R
S2E Elite Terrace Ihv.No. . : B&P
Inv.date., : 09/11
WIP No. . : 37318
Singapore 458816 Veh. In/0ut:
fTel.No. . : Hobil,
Reg.No. . : S5KvVBB8
Closed by .... : Paul Ong Qing Yong Reg.date .: 13/06,
Sve Consultant : Hileage .. )
Remarks ...... : Hr Carl Skadiang Chassis No: SAJAB: Che! St
0p.MNo Description Hech Oty Price [
802 T0 REPLACE FRT BUMPER, 0 1800.0¢
FRT RH HEADLAMP, GRILLE, ETC
800 TO PUTTY SPRAYPAINT DN 0 1600.00 v 1:600.00 § © -
FRT BUHPER, ETC
RO6 FRT NUMBER PLATE & WOLDER 0 60.00 0 60.00 3 R
280 T0 FOCUS HEADLAMP 0 162,00 0 162.00 § 7
280 TD CHECK WIRIMG IMCLUDE 0 d86.00 0 486.00 § _--
RESETTING OF ALL ELECTRICAL
MODULES
COVER-BUMPER 1.0 EA 1720.801CWA2) 720.80 5 Lo~
TOWING COVER FRT XE 1.0 EA 30,00 “hoe 35 o0 gad—
HEADLAMP RH 1.0 EA 3322.10 TEMAMA 32210 S el
BRACKET-FEND RH 1.0 EA  34.30 34.30 ST w g
MESH-GRILLE 1.0 EA  257.10 257.10 37 % 4w
Total. 9,472.30
Labour Total shmfedit 00" %  Net..f...... 9.472.30
Part= Tota T7.0% LAX, 06
Package Tota]l *Pmpicssad, 00, . = rorall 10,135.35
...... 0.00
Pay. 10, 135.35
G5T: S=StdRated; 0=Out0ffsc . “kmmﬁi Iﬁﬁmﬁf}:ﬁ 4G
e Ow"@ o4 C 20 ¢
Date e apt

45 Lang Wes Road, Singapere 15101 T -85 8430 4530 W WERITHESAUED. Com

Co req no. 199500008 £ GET reg no. MIABI0EIR

Gue @

a o
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Catherine Chnna sl.l(l{ Autu!

From: - Janice Lee (LKKAuUto) <JaniceLee@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Friday, 9 November, 2018 10:20 AM
To: assignments
Subject: FW: TP Claim - Our customer SKVBB897E; TP Vehicle GBD553B
Attachments: SA52501637.PDF; 4385_001.pdf; OI GIA - GBD553B PDF
Sensitivity: Confidential
n
L RAwLs @ WM
ank you. .
Best Regards,
Jannice Lee (Ms) | Case Handler
LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: janicelee@lkkauto.com | fax: bas6-4:315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Justin Wong [mailto:justin.wong@eginsurance.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, November 09, 2018 10:19 AM

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Ce: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: TP Claim - Our customer SKVB8I7E; TP Vehicle GBD553B8
Sensitivity: Confidential

Dear LKK,

Kindly assist with PRS and DS for this matter,
Thank you.

Regards,

Justin Wong
Executive | Claims

EQ Insurance Company Limited
5 Maxwell Road #17-00 Tower Block MND Complex Singapore 069110
did 65 6496 9115 | tel 65 6223 9433 ext 115 | fax 65 6223 4190

Www.eginsurance.com.sg.
|

Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify t}




From: Paul Ong Qling Yong [mailto:paul.ong@wearnes.com)
Sent: Friday, November 9, 2018 9:38 AM

To: EQI PRS <EQIPRS@eqinsurance.com.sg>

Subject: TP Claim - Our customer SKVBB97E; TP Vehicle GBD553B
Sensitivity: Confidential

Attached for TP Claim,
Please advise if we can settle direct.

Best Regards,

Paul Ong

Service Consultant
Bodyshop & Paint

Weames Automotive Ple Lid
249 Alexandra Road Singapore 158935

M (65)B126 1237 D (63) 6378 9336
WEARNES

This email, including any altachment, is confidential and may also be privileged.
If you have received It in ermor, plaase nofify us immediately by reply email and than delete this message from your system,
Piease do not copy if or use if for any purpose. or disciosa its confents or any altaschmant to any other person. Thank your.




(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)
TR | owigRe  (mdven Mol 1] Steeus
‘| Gppesag (Pveh)
Date of Accident | : U"l'\""lﬁ
Global Sum Settlement | : | o YES @NO ]
Liability : /00 % | (Agreed/Assested)
Final Repair Cost H & 3393 %6
Loss of Use S g0 (> daysat$ |20 perday
Rental (if any) | $ daysat$ (incls of GST) per day
Others .S
- It
- : s S
5 _
Final SettlementSum | :[§ <3 <(,
Remarks:
Payment Instruction: Payee’s Breakdown
1) By PArlomafrmi  Ppa i 18 T159 -3¢
2) Vhis S e vty $ @&
3) 5
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SERVICE
5L: SERVICE 4ALFS
*ingapore 4%HHJE
Claozed by _ : Paul 'Onyg Bing ¥ ;
Bve Cansultant

E=N

-

Fv b

v date
WP ke

Vah., In/Out;
fTel . Mo.
Reg. No

Weg. date

Hileage

LT E

Y &

WEARNES

F20628X

Hage 1

Reqg.No:H2E
E&F
091172016

§7318

Hobile: 96180359
VARSI TE

13/06/2018

; anJAbBdAXZICPIS1 2R

Henariks Ar Carl Skadiang Chassis Ne
Op . No Jescription Hegh Aty Frice Discl Pkg Amsunt G
A I o Feo:
803 D REPLACE FRT BUMEDER, ] 180 D L.B800.00 &
FAT RH MEADLAMP, BRILLE. ETC s -
B0 TO PUTIY SPEAYPAINT OM 1600.00 © 1L.600.00 3 'i::'
FRT BUMPER_ ETC
HD& FRT NUHEER PL&RTE & MOLDER y L0. 00 50.00 §
200 Y0 FOCUS HEADLANF 0 Z2.00 © 162.00 3
28I TD CHECK WIBING IMCLUDE o d8s OO i $B6.00 § _-
HESETTINE OF ALl ELECTRICAL
HODULES
COVER-BUMPER 1.0 Ea 1720.80 1,720,80 5 A&~
TOWING COVER FRT XE £l %0.00 L0.00 S aff
HEAOLANP RH 0 EA 3322.10 3,322.10 S .t
BRACKET-FENMD RM Eh T4.30 34.30 587
MESH-GRILLE | En 25T.1 £7.10 §
Bross Toral. ¥,472_30D
Labour frotal 4.108.00 Net 9 477 A0
Part= Total 5.564.30 BST & T7.01 &63.06
FPackadges Tottal 0.00 Tatal itz 10,135.35%
Paid A a.0n0
Flease Say 10,135 .35
IST: 3I=3tdRated; D:DutOfScope: I=leroRated

Waarnes Automative Pte. Lid.

45 Leng Kew Rosd. Singapore 159103 T 485 B30 4930  werw, sEnRSALT.COM

Co reg oo, IESTIM00R / GST g fio. MIESI063EN

'Ta»albk e S
.‘Jf;
laleC 20 (-

[hy«s b "'“F*

Cuv @ e e rin
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AYS

WEARNES

Our Reference: SKVSS9TET014961 By Email / Mail
Your Reference: GBD553B

11 January 2019

EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LIMITED C/O LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS
Attn: Third Party Claim Department -

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKVS897E & GBDS53B ON 07 Nov 2018.

Dear Officer,

We wish to inform you that the repairs to our client vehicle have been completed.
We hereby submit the claims as follows:

Details Remarks Amount (SGD)
Cost of Repairs 7.397.56
Loss Of Rental 120.00 x 3 days 360.00
Others

TOTAL 7.,757.56

Kindly let us have your offer to Christine yowii wearnes.com
Your soonest reply is much appreciated. Thank you.

Yours faithfully

Christine Yow

D (65) 6430 4899

Wearnes Automotive Pre Ltd
Bodyshop and Paint Division
249 Alexandra Road
Singapore 159935

This is a computer generated printout, no signature is required.

‘Wearnen Automotive Pie. Lid
45 Leng Mee Road, Singapore 155103 T 65 8430 4700  www_ wearnesauto.com

Co reg no. 1995014008
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SLUREANE L #001-25 PAYA URLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563361 FAX ; (063} 62564315

Our Ref: CC4/EQI18020301/hb3
12 NOVEMBER 2018

LSA LOGISTICS PTE LTD
36 HONGKONG STREET
HOLY BUILDING
SINGAPORE 059675

Dear Sir'fMadam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBD 553B AND SKV 8897E ON 07/11/2018

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for EQ INSURANCE COMPANY
LIMITED 1o resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto
Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the accident report, accident scenario and available evidence at hand, liability is
down against us. We will therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with
the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and
settlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD)if any) will be affected and reduced by
30% (20% for commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim.
However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this
claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faj(hﬁlllf,

Vie JII]:al*." anghilan

Case Handler

: 6841 2096

"AX: 6741 4108

Email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com

c.c.  EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LIMITED
(Motor Claims Depr)




AUTHORIZATION TO ACT

T L (“the third party Claimant’)
of__SLE ®ilE TpeafcE ASET\A (address),
ownerof YA FETHE (vehicle no.)

hereby authorize_ wwmsos  fumasnve  pwE TE (“The workshop®)

to act for me with respect to my clalm for repair costs and / or rental and / or loss of use

(*claim”) for my Vehicle No, _ ¥ 1€ that was damaged
i pursuant to the accident which occured on_ O | [ 15 (date) along
) TIE FUTe TERRALE 4EL (location)
Involving Vehicle Nofs =P 5556 ("The accident”).

| further authorize the workshop to sign the discharge voucher on my behalf to sattle my above
mentioned clalm In a manner that they deem fit and the workshop is further authorized to receive
payment further to settiement of my claim with payment cheque/s being made In favour of the
workshop,

| further acknowledge that any settiement the workshop may resch on my behalf is on a without
prejudice and without admission of llability basis Insofar as the driver { owner / insurers of the other
vehicle/s Is concerned.

eveths 'L dwor " (month)20___| &

A N I\(ﬂr

(vear)

Signed by “the third party claimant” Signed by “the workshop”
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WEARMNES
SERVICE TAaX INVOICE
0 - E00004 3L: EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD
EQ IHSURANCE COHMPANY LTD GST Reg.No:H2B920628%
5 MAXWELL ROAD Inv.No. . : BAP 70149461 Page 1
#¥17-00 TOWER BLOCK Inv.date. : 06/12/2018
HND COHPLEX WIP No. . : 37318
SINGAPORE 069110 Yeh.In/Out: 14/11/2018 29/11/2018
2Tel . No. . : 622394313
Reg.No. . : SKV8897E
Closed by .... : Paul Ong Qing Yong Reg.date .: 13/06/2018
Svc Consultant : ACC Mileage ..: 5,923
Remarks ...... : Mr Carl Skadiang Chassis No: SAJAB4AN2ICP35128
Parts/Op.No Description HMech Qty Price Disct Pkg Amount G
802 TO REPLACE FRT BUMPER, 0 900.00 O S00.00 8
FRT RH HEADLAMP, GRILLE, ETC
800 TO PUTTY SPRAYPAINT ON 0 800.00 O 800.00 8
FRT BUMPER, ETC

280 TO FOCUS HEADLAMP 0 162.00 O 162.00 §
280 TO CHECK WIRING INCLUDE (] 486.00 O 486.00 8

RESETTING OF ALL ELECTRICAL

HODULES

T4N13173LH COVER-BUMPER 1.0 EA 1720.80 10 1,548.72
T4N5802LML TOWING COVER FRT XE 1.0 EA 30.00 10 27.00
TaN17205 HEADLAMP RH 1.0 EA 3322.10 10 2,989.89

w uw w

Gross Total. 6,913,561

Labour !«tal 2,348.00 Net..ooouuuns 5,915.61
Part=s J1otal 4,565.61 GST @& 7.0% 483.95
Package |.tal 0.00 Total....... 7,397.56
Pald........ 0.00

Please Pay.. 7,397.56

GST: S=StdRated; 0=0utOfScope; I=IeroRated
Enquiries must be lodged within 14 days from the invoice date
This is a computer generated invoice. No signature is required.

! Automotive Pto. Lid.
A L) Mo Bissit, Sipigasere 15001 T +85 5430 4030  www. waRrmEsaLL). com

Co reg no. TRESONE00R / GST rag no. MIBEI0EIAX




Company Regisiration No, 199607 188R

UL AVE 1, H2-25 PAVA URLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 4089338 TEL : (063) 62563561 FAX : (063) 62561315

To : M/s EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD Date: 07/03/2019
THIRD PARTY DIRECT SETTLEMENT
£
GBD 5538 (Insd Veh) |Your Ref. No. : DMCFHQ17-000203
Vehicle No. — -
SKV BBSTE Our Ref. No, ; CC4/EQI18020301/T1hb3q2
Date of Accident 7112018 ;
Liability 100% B
Final RepairCost | § 7,397.56
Loss of Use - 360.00 -
Rental (If any) '$ o |
Others: 'S o
e '8 -
7,757.56

Final Settlement Sum |: $ 7.757.56

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Remarks o
Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown
1) |WEARNES AUTOMOTIVE PTELTD. '8 7,757.56
r o o —S
= — 7
JOANNE LEE
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubd Ave 1 201-25 Paya Ubi Industnal Park, Singapore 408833

TEL: @256 3551 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg No: 166607198R GST Reg No. 19-9807198-R

| Affiliated to Federation mn— Exparts En Automoblle TP
EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD Red CGIJ'EEHBBEDSU!.‘T 1hb3q2
o0 ToNER B HWRIRTE TN
#17-00 TOWER BLOCK 1 Date: 07-03-2018
MND COMPLEXSINGAPORE 069110
Code EQI
Insured Veh.  GBD 553B Veh. Inspected SKV BB97E
Policy No. DMCFHQ17-000203 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From  JUSTIN Assign Date 0O/11/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition Ol -
Make & Model JAGUAR XE c.c 1988
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2018
Chassis No. SAJAB4AX2JCP35128 Colour RED
Odometer 5890 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOD
3. ! mﬂw R . ¥
Size Make Balance
R/ Front Tyre |225/45R18 PIRELLI |6 mm
L/H Front Tyre |225/45 R18 PIRELLI 6 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |225/45R18 PIRELLI 6 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |225/45R18 PIRELLI 8 mm
e e ~ Description of Damages
THE VEHIGLE SUSTA! NED DAMAGES AT THE FRONT /S PORTION
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. e | General Information
Accident Date  07/11/2018 Inspection Date  14/11/2018
Survey held at WEARNES AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD
45 LENG KEE ROAD
SINGAPORE 159103 ;
[T i i Remarks RN 1 s
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CﬂNDUGTEEI ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS,
BJIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED, REPAIRS —
5b. I Estimate Days of Repair S31L SNy T
]ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 3 Working Days




! ” ” LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Sdn BE = 51 Ubil Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Indusirial Park. Singapore 408933
TEL: 6258 3561 FAX: 6256 415
Reg, No: 169607 188F GST Reg Mo 19-09607108-R Page No. 1af 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SKV BBITE
ay| 0 Deecriplionof Parts|
] o tor Forers
[REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|COVER-BUMPER (SN) DEFORMED 1.720.80 1.548.72
1] TOWING COVER FRT XE [SN) cuT 30,00 27.00
1|HEADLAMP RH (SN) cuT 332210 2.989.89
1|BRACKET -FEND RH [SN) NOT NECESSARY 34.30 -
1|MESH -GRILLE (SN) NOT NECESSARY 25710 -
5,364.30 4568581
LABOUR
TO REPLACE FRT BUMPER FRT RH 1,800.00 900.00
HEADLAMP ,GRILLE ETC.
TO PUTTY SPRAYPAINT ON FRT BUMPER ETC 1,600.00 800.00
FRT NUMBER PLATE & HOLDER NOT NECESSARY 60.00 -
TO FOCUS HEADLAMP 162.00 162.00
TO CHECK WIRING INCLUDE RESETTING OF ALL 4B6.00 486.00
ELECTRICAL MODULES
4,108.00 2,348.00
GRAND TOTAL l.ﬂ'!.lp 6,9132.61

. REPAIRS

M.

MOHAMAD TAUFIKH
M.MATAI, AMSAE-A
Automolive Assessor

MSCLAMER OF LIARILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report ls made solely fer e use end benafit of the Cliani nemod on ihe frsm pags of this Aeporl

Report Ref No. CC4/EQI1




Joanne Lee (LKK Auto)

From: Joanne Lee (LKK Auto) <report@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, 8 March 2019 4:06 PM

Te: ‘egiprs@eqinsurance.comsg’

Subject: TP Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBD 5538 (Ol) and SKV 8897E (TP) on
07/11,2018

Attachments: LKK REPORT & PHOTO pdf; TP DS SUPPORTING DOCUMENT.pdf

Dear SirModom,
Menase be informed that the above-mentioned case had been settled.
Enclose herewith final report & relevant documents for your necessary action please.

Thank you,

Best Regards,

JOANNE | Reports

LKK Auto Consultants Pte.Ltd.

Phone: 6256-3561 Ext.111 Fax: 6741-4108 email: report@Ikkauro.com
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #01-25 Singapore 408933



