Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 9 November 2018 10:26 AM

To: ‘Justin Wong'; Admin A

Cc: assignments; SUR

Subject: RE: TP Claim - Our customer SKV8897E; TP Vehicle GBD553B
Sensitivity: Confidential

Dear Justin,

Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed that vehicle currently not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

Best Regards,
Catherine Chong | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Justin Wong [mailto:justin.wong@eginsurance.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, November 09, 2018 10:19 AM

To: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: FW: TP Claim - Our customer SKV8897E; TP Vehicle GBD553B
Sensitivity: Confidential

Dear LKK,
Kindly assist with PRS and DS for this matter.

Thank you.

Regards,
Justin Wong
Executive | Claims

EQ Insurance Company Limited

5 Maxwell Road #17-00 Tower Block MND Complex Singapore 069110
did 65 6496 9115 | tel 65 6223 9433 ext 115 | fax 65 6223 4190
WWww.edinsurance.com.sg




Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the senc

From: Paul Ong Qing Yong [mailto:paul.ong@wearnes.com]
Sent: Friday, November 9, 2018 9:38 AM

To: EQI PRS <EQIPRS@eginsurance.com.sg>

Subject: TP Claim - Our customer SKV8897E; TP Vehicle GBD553B
Sensitivity: Confidential

Attached for TP Claim,
Please advise if we can settle direct.

Best Regards,

Paul Ong

Wearnes Automotive Pte Ltd
249 Alexandra Road Singapore 159935

M (65) 8126 1237 D (65) 6378 9336
WEARNES

www.wearnesauto.com paul.ong@wearnes.com

This email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged.
If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your system.
Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank you.



