LOT -

Referenm%mm‘@w%aim No.

Priority - NORMAL / URGENT

IN OPS: Yes/ No DOA:

From (Person) -k@] ZhuanoQnou of PXA Ref:
Date/Time - M}O\% é E‘-{%?m MV @ §

TYPE: M.Car /M. Cycle / Bus / Van / Lorry / Taxi / Prime Mover / Truck / Trailer or

vehicle No - QR I C D.0.A/As At %\%\QO%'

Make & Model: Tovofo Ko NEW CAR PRICE:$
Registration Date: Jq/l,"]\me 2006 MV:$ B~ Quote by :%@4
COE Expiry Date: FS:$ Date MWM
LTA Total Rebate Amount: (PARF) + (COE) = SV:§
Calculation for LTA Rebate: Calculation for Valuation:

(a) COE Period: X112 = __ Mths Average MV $
As At :

- = Mths Calculation for Repossessed vehicle:
- = Mths  |High demand vehicle: Yes/No -5
(b") Balance Moriths : Parallel Import vehicle: © Yes / No - $
C More than 10yrs ofd: ~ Yes /No - 8
|(d) Residue COE . QP X _____(b) = MV for Repossessgd Vehl‘,(.:lg =3
‘ (a) o :

IR Engine Capacity: High/lLow | - $
(2)_ -(b)_ =__ M2=__ <___yr§ Europe / Asia Car - - %
Register Before/After MAY 2002 Car Condition: Good/Fair/Poor/Burnt | - $
(e) PARF = (OMV) X X = No. of transfer : ' - 3
LTA Total Rebate Amount: (d)+(e) Other deduction ' . 1- %
Salvage Value(LTA Rebate - 5%):. Forced Sales Value derived = $
Date / Time Action / Instruction Additional Information:
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~ PAF/COE Rebate Enquiry
> Back to OneMotoring

Enqulre PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars

Page 1 of 1

Owner 1D Type: Singapore NRIC
Owner ID: 3602H
Vehicle Details
Vehicle No: SFW1141C
Vehicle to be Exported: Yes
Intended De-registration Date: 29 Aug”2018
Vehicle Make: ' TOYOTA
Vehicle Model: ’ VIOS 1.5EM
Primary Colour: Blue
Manufacturing Year: " 2005
EngineNo.: ’ INZX285389
Chagsis No.: A MR053HY4204137744 o

“Maxlmuin Power outpat:~ ———800 kW{107Blp) ¥
Open Market Value: $11,559.00

' Original Reg|stratnon Date 27 Jun 2005
First Registration Date: ’ 27 Jun 2005

Transfer Count: 0

Actual ARF Paid: '$12,715.00
Intended PARF Rebate Detalls
PARF Eligibility: ‘ Forfeited
VPARF Eligibility Expiry Date: -
PARF Rebate Amount: $0.00
Intended COE Rebate Detalls
COE Expiry Date: 26 Jun 2020
COE Category: A-Car(1600cc gbelow)
COE Perlod(Years) 5 N
PQPPaid: ’ $3305400
COE Rebate Amount: $12,081.00
Total Rebate Amount: $12,081.00
Massage

The information contained hereln Is correct as at 29 Aug 2018

https://villta.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/enquireRebateByPublicBeforeDeregInput?FUNCTION_ID=F030...

Please note that the 5-year COE for this vehicle cannot be further renewed. The vehicle must be de- reglstered upon COE explry or when the
vehicle reaches its statutory hfespan (if applicable) whichever is earher
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Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

From: Olivia Lau (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 30 August 2018 9:41 AM

To: LKK Valuation; ANG Yvonne

Cc: zhuangchou.han@axa.com.sg; HO Vincent; KKLau

Subject: [AXA]: Assistance required: Effect MV for SFW1141C - Toyota Vios
Attachments: SFW1141C.pdf

Hi Valuation Team,
Kindly get back to AXA Yvonne.

Thanks.

Best Regards, . L ¥y 7N
Olivia Lav | Admin Manager ' .

LKK Auto Consultants M
phone: 6256-3561 | email: olivialay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 : 06,,

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933) W ]

From: HAN Zhuangchou [mailto:zhuangchou.han@axa.com.sg]
Sent: Wedr :
To: admin@autoprobe.com.sg; benson@Ibs-auto.com; bhtay@autoprobe.com.sg; Bryan Ang (LKKAuto)
<bryanang@lkkauto.com>; collin.wong@a-pac.sg; cynthia.ong@priorityservices.sg; Elgene Teng
<elgene@rta.com.sg>; elson@rta.com.sg; Frankie Pang <frankie@fta.com.sg>; FTA <motorsurvey@fta.com.sg>;
jimmy.lee@priorityservices.sg; KKLau <kklau@Ilkkauto.com>; nick@Ibs-auto.com; Olivia Lau (LKKAuto)
<olivialau@lkkauto.com>; patrick.soo @a-pac.sg; ricky@rta.com.sg

Cc: ANG Yvonne <yvonne.ang@axa.com.sg>; HO Vincent <vincent.ho@axa.com.sg>

Subject: Assistance required: Effect MV for SFW1141C - Toyota Vios

Dear Partners,

Please assist to provide Ms Yvonne Ang with the Market Value for this case.

DOA: 28/08/2018

Best Regards,

Han ZC | Specialist | SIU & SITF




