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SMRT Accldent Vehicle Repair Estimates
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SMRT Accident Vehicle Repair Estimates
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an Irene {LI{KAutn!

From: Elleen Bay Yee Ling (Auto Sves/Claims & |A/Claims & 1A/Buses)
<eileenbay@smrt.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 8 April 2019 5:48 PM

To: CS A Team; Admin A

Subject: LOD - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMB102A AND SLKB735K ON 27/10/2018 ALONG
SOMERSET ROAD

Attachments: SMB102A.PDF; img-408174417-0001.pdf

Our Ref: BUS/10/18/1045/EB

Dear Sir / Madam,

We claim on behalf of SMRT BUSES LTD, owner of the vehicle Reg. No.: SMB102A.
Your driver's negligent driving has caused the above accident. As a result, my client has suffered the following losses:-

Cost of Repair $1,450.00
Loss of Use 55000 | 2 daysx 527500 |
LTA Search Fes 57.00
Total $2,007.00

We enclose the following documents:
1) Repair Invoice
2) LTA Search
3] SASreport

We look forward to your confirmation to settle our claims within 15 days from the date of this email.
Kindly issue payment in favour to SMRT BUSES LTD.

Thanks and regards,

Eileen Bay
Claims and Insurance Agency

DID: +65 6556 3549 | E: gileenbay@smrt.com.sg
b Ang Mo Kio Street 62

Singapore 569140

@SMRT

AUTOMOTIVE




.Inx Irene !LRKAutu} s

From: Joy Irene (LKKAULD)

Sent: Friday, 23 November 2018 5:35 PM

To: ‘insurance@lioncityrentals.com.sg’

Co: Admin A Vivian Lau (LKKAuta), Hsiao Tong (LKKAUto)

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLK B735K (LCR) & SMB 102A ON 27/10/2018 ALONG

SOMERSET/GRANGE ROAD

23 November 2018

LCRF PTE LTD
Policy Holder

Your Ref: SLK 8735K
Our Ref: CC3/LCR18020253/ Nja3

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLK 873 MB 102A ON 27/10/2018 ALONG SOMERSET/GRANGE ROAD

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to resolve the
claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

We have received a claim from SMB 102A against your insurance policy.

Based on the information on hand, we are of the opinion that we cannot be absolved from liability.
We will therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please
contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Best Regards,

Joy Irene | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841-2409 | email; joyirene@lkkauto.com |Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

All contents of this emall is intended strictly for the addressee(s) only.It may contain confidential and/or privileged
information.If you are not the intended recipient (or have received this email in error) please notify the sender
immediately and destroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution of the material in this email
is strictly forbidden.



AUTHORIZATION TO A
(AIG Asia Pacific - Express Third Party Claim)

. SMRT BUSES LTD (the third party claimant”) of § ANG MO KIQ STREET 62 (51569140

(nddress), owner of SMB 102A (vehicle no.) hereby authorize TA M RVI
PTE LTD (“the workshop™) to act for me with respect to my claim for repair costs and/or rental
and/or loss of use (“claim™) for my vehicle no SMB 102A that was damaged pursuant to the accident
which occurred on 27/10/2018 (date) along GRANGE ROAD (location) involving vehicle no/s SLK
8735K (“the accident™),

I further authorize the workshop to settle my above mentioned claim in a manner that they deem fit
and the workshop is further authorized to receive payment further 1o settlement of my cluim with

payment cheque/s being made in favour of the claimant, “SMRT BUSES LTD".

I further acknowledge that any settlement the workshop may reach on my behalf is on a without
prejudice and without admission of liability basis insofar as the driverfowner/insurers of the other

vehicle/s is concerned,

A
Dated this ks (day) of __ ™ 5 (month) 20__ (year)

W

]
L]

SC ) 1/ f;_%‘i[ri

.r-:.xs.."_.-"" foe
Signed byﬁw;ﬁifd party claimant”

(with chop if applicable) (with chop)




RELEASE VOUCHER
Al - Claim

“We/l, SMRT AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD (“the workshop™) hereby confirm that we/I
have reached an agreement with the appointed surveyor of AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Lid LKK
AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (name of surveyor) with respect to the amount claimed for
S$81.450.00 (Repair Cost), $$550.00 (Loss of Rensai/Use), S$ 7.00 (Disbursement) for vehicle no.
SMB 102A that was damaged pursuant to the accident which occurred on 27/10/2018 (date) along
GRANGE ROAD (location) involving vehicle no/s SLK 8735K. This is pursuant to the inspection

conducted on 01/11/2018 (date) at “the workshop™,

We/l confirm that we/l are/am authorized by the owner SMRT BUSES LTD (“the third party
claimant”) of vehicle no. SMIB 102A make the claim as set out in the above paragraph and we/l have
full authority to settle the matter on his/her behalf in a manner that we/T deem fit. We/l enclose herein
the letter of authority given by “the third party claimam™,

We/l further confirm that we/l will indemnify AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd for all damages,
loss andfor expense that they will or have already incurred in the event that “the third party claimant”
after the above said agreement lodges a further claim against the former for any loss and expenses
suffered pertaining to costs of repairs and/or rental and/or loss of use pursuant to the damage to SMB
1024 (vehicle no.) as a resuli of the accident.

We/l confirm that the agreement reached above is in full and final setlement of any claim of “the
third party claimant” pursuant to the accident and that further this settlement is reached on a without
prejudice and without admission of liability basis.

This agreement is subject to the application of Singapore law and the Singapore Courts have
exclusive jurisdiction over any dispute arising out of the same.

Dated this __14- {day) of E;-g &“# (month) 2019 (year)

i

F |Iz_":}4'_ oy '.II;

Signed by appointed surveyor




SIMRT

SMRT Mtomotive Sarvices Pta Ltd
351 Horth Bridge Rosd Sisgepars 179102
Tel: &5 E3311000 Fax: 65 £3340247

AUTOMOTIVE
Tax Invoice
Custamer Coda: 3000066 GST Reg MNo. : MR-8500001-7
CRN : 1950042802
SHRT BUSES LTD Invoice No. : IV190300513
Data : 29.03.2015
Slock Unit Vehicle Ho. : SMB1OZA
STREET 62 Your Ref Mo. : BUS/10/18/1045
6 ANG MO KIO Our Ref No. : 24098571
SINGAPCRE 569140 Terms : 30 Days
Dasoription Qty Unit Add / (Discount) Amount
Cost 4 Amount
LUMF SUM AMOUNT FOR REPRIR 1.00 3 1,450.00
AS PER SURVEYOR'S RECOMMEWDATION
CGRAND TOTAL 5 1,450.00

Remark

Make /Model + MBOCS00
Bocident Date : 27.10.2018

.8, Payment by chequs should bs crossad and
mde payabls to 'SMAT Automctive Secvices Pta Ltd*.
N receipt will be izsuved unlass Dequested.

Fage 1/1

é‘J‘

Authorised Signature
for SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd

E. & O.E



TWH/2018 Vahicke Hub

Enquire Transaction History

Transaction History Details

g Date/Time 01 Nov 2018/ 10:29:23
Asset Type: Wehicle Transaction Amount:
Asset |- SUKBTSK
Transaction Type 18.32 Insyrance Enguiry (GIRD Payment]  Channel

Business Transaction

= MTE ABDUL HALIL
Uiser (D ESASBAHO - AALOISH BINTE Reference No
Search Date / Time: 27 Oct 2018 14:40:00
Insurance Company: AIG ASLA PACTFIC INSURANCE PTE LTI,
Information displived is correct s at the log date and time
Enquire Related Logs Back to List

hitpeifvil e govasgiaivrifactionubAgency TmLogDelaliPFUNCTION_ID=F1201004ET

External Agoency

20181101102723206170

n



Merimen e-Claims Page | of |

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

/CLATM SUBFOLDER TRACKING

Case | Wotified Est Submitted | Ad) Assigned | Ad) Rpt Ad) Submitted | Ins Auth'ed Status |
1 1
way | 08 Nov 2018 :;,:" 018 551,450,00 5%$1,450.00 MM. . ey
ot hey | gt Aay Apt | mmml e it cancel Case |

Main Clalm Datalls

| I:I..A.'II"_l SUDFOLDER DETAILS |[Created by adjuster]
| Insurnd: LCRF PTE LTD, Co. Heg. No.: 201624557K

Main T

| Clmbrrarit: SMRAT BUSES LTD, Co. Heg. No.| 1982022920

| Vehicie Reg, . |27710/2018 13:00 - :59
(o SMB102A Date of LSS 1440 Months and 28 Days Fram LTA Reg Date (Man Yr]]

| | Claim Type: | TP / 35222842775G PORCY/COVET | 0999994811 (Comprehensive)

Palicy No. |
SLKB7I5K (Clnimant): | DIIO27592MFBF

| Excess:
| SMRT Automotive Services Pre Ltd (Woodiands) 60 Woodiands Ingustral Park B4, 757705 Woadlands - Tel: 68662628

AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Express) - Tel: 65-6415-3000 . [Handled by Cheok, Lee Wai] Cheok Leewai@aig com

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 62222111
s Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel 6256-3561 . [Handled by Muhammad Nazril 8in Abdullah] . [Final Rpt due

LKK Auto Consultant
118/11/2018]
|ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED

lo AIG_SG (09/11/2018): Request to upload TP GIA Report

| ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS™ view Al | Searcn Tasks | Croste New Task | Complate |
Due Date Priority Type  Task Group Subject  Handler Assigned By Complated On Created On Done?
No results.
|

https:/singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=dsp_... 19/8/2019



Mernmen ¢-Claims

Claim Documents

*SMB102A (35222842775G)
[SLK::HI]

SMRAT BUSES LTD
Oct 27 2018 1:00PM
[LCRF PTE LTD]
SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd

Page 1 of 2
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:hhwmw 1 per page =i
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30 [14/03/19 18:31 | General View O | s [ [ |
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc& fuseaction=dsp_doc... 19/8/2019



Merimen e-Claims Page 2 of 2

Yideo 1 per page ME._
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feotm: Bmmarin dew DEGELE whines pou Uhoe it (0 SEher perhes.

https:/singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_doc... 19/82019



Preview Page | of |

NOTE: TO BE COMPLETED BY SURVEYOR TEAM

THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT

(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)
|"|.|Flhll:ll No: SLKBTI5K (Insd veh) Model: ERCEDES-BENZ
SMB102A (TP veh) CS00LE1830H 12.0 D (A)

| Date of Accident: |27/10/2018

Global Sum Settlement | | [ ] Yes | [X] No

Repair Estimate $ 1,831.30

Final Repair Cost S 1.450.00

Loss of Use 8 550.00 2.00 days at 5275.00 per day

Rental (if any) 5 0.00 days

LTA !/ GlA Search Fee ' 5 7.00

Others s 0.00

-
Final Settlement Sum -] 2,007.00

Is Third Party Workshop GIA Registered? [ 1] YES [X ] NO (Kindy indicate
below)
A) For Non GIA Registered Workshop: Agreed Liability 100 (%)

BOLA Applicable: Yes/ No BOLA Scenano No:

B) For GIA Registered Workshop:

BOLA Liability: {%e) Assessed Liabliity (*): — (%)
* Assessed Liability to be filled only for chain collisions and for cases whare BOLA doas not apply.
Remarks

Payment instruction: Payee's Breakdown

1) | SMRT Buses Lid -8 2,007.00
2) 5
3) 3
18 Aug
JOANNE LEE KHANG MIN 2019
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid Date

Please attach all the supparting documents to the form.
(Final Repair Bill; Rental Invoice; Release Voucher; Authorisation to Act; Survey Report; Medical
Report/ BIll (if any)

https://singapore.merimen,com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCdoc& fuseaction=dsp_doclt... 19/8/2019



Adjuster Report

L

Tel 6256-

Page | of 4

KK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd icoregne 1sssoriser
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408833
3561 Fex: 6844-8805 Emall sur@lkkauto.com,assignments@lkkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No: CC3/LCR18020253/NHA302
Date: 18/0872019

REFERENCE

Handling Insurer; AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pie. Lid.  Policy No: 0299894811

Claimant Vehicle SMB102A )

No : Insured Vehicle No: SLKBT35K

Date of Loss: 2Tnor2018 Nature of Claim: ™ Claim No: 35222B427756G

DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE

Reg No: SMB102A
Make & Model MERCEDES-BENZ OCS500LE1830H, 12.0 D (A) Engina No: 45796600148622
Reg. Date: 29/07/2008 (Man. Year: 2009) Chassis No: WEBB3442021000232
Colour; Multi-colour COdometer: BBA290 km
Engine Capacity: 11867 cc
Market Value/New Car Price. N/A
Sum Insured (SS): Market Value/New Car Price
NDITION OF ATTHE T
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable). Yes Foolbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable) Yes Engine Modification Ne Pre-accident Condition
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 2750 R22.5 Rear Tyre Size: 275/T0 R22.5
Front Left Side: Continertal 6 mm Rear Left Side: Bridgestone 7 mm
Front Right Side: Continental 6 mm Rear Right Side: Bridgestane 7 mm
The sbove values reprasent e remaining s ireadh depth
COST OF CLAIMS = Repairer's Adjuster's Difference  Diff %|
Parts 155.30 13877 15.53 10.00
Miscellaneous Ilems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 1.676.00 1.323.00 353.00 21.068
Pantwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (SS$) 1,831.30 1,462.77 368.53  20.12
Approved Total (Overridden) (S§) 1,450.00
Nett Amount (S5) 1,831.30 1,450.00 381.30 20.82
+ Loss of Use (2.0 x S5275.00/day) (S5) 550.00
+ Doc/Search Fee (55) 7.00
Nett Liabllity (5%) 2,007.00
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 0111172018
Date Inspecled: 011172018 Inspacied Al SMRT Automolive Services Ple Lid
{(Woodlands)
60 Woodlands Industnal Park E4
Singapore 757705
Estimated Period ol Repair 2.0 days
https:/singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen_... 19/8/2019
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Adjuster: Muhammad Nazril Bin Abdullah Manager: VIC ALPEH

NOTE: Thia report mpresants our lndings af e time and piace of inspeclion sialed harmin, Such Ngpocton Mes been camed oul 1o e cest of our
krowieadpes and sbilly but any other labilly undar any oiher clircumetancad is heraby srprasly secluded.
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REPAIR DETAILS

Recommended Parts
No. Qty Part Mo. Particulars

Condition Repairer's Amount
1 1 *LAMP .BLINKER -FRONT ,LEFT ,FOR MB OC 500 LE Cracked 155.30F *155.30FL
F=Fmnchise pan. L=ListlismDac

Sub Total (S§) 155.30 155.30
= List ltem Discount on L ltems 0.00/10.00% (5%) 0.00 1553

Total Parts (55) 155.30 138.77

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out

https:/singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen_... 19/8/2019
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Recommended Miscellaneous Items
There are no new miscellanecus llems selected.
Recommended Labour
No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour ltems
1 TO REMOVE & INSTALL ABOVE ITEMS AND REPAIR OTHERS  MNaw 1.060.00 795.00
DAMAGED AFFECTED AREAS
2 PROVIDE LABOUR AND MATERIAL TO PUTTY AND RESPRAY  New 616.00 528.00
ABOVE REPAIR ITEMS
Gross Labour Cost (55) 1,676.00 1,323.00
Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.
< END OF ESTIMATES >
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen_... 19/8/2019



