Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: People's Vehicle Group <peoplevehicle@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, 11 November, 2019 5:58 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: III Ref:MCT18110122/01/sn; : DIRECT SETTLEMENT FOR GBE 5632 T - YOUR REF:
SHC 3133 U

Hi Mei Kwan,

For your attention.

UOB »=#5

Account Detalls
Company [D: 31800200% Account Mumber: 9313418967
Account Name: Peocple's Vehicle Recovery Service Ledger Balance:
Account Type: Currant Account Available Balance:
Account Currency: SGD Total Float:
Account Branch: UOB PLO Owerdraft Facility:
Account Nature Earmark
Primary N Allocated Amount
Regards,
Apple

People's Vehicle Recovery Service
Blk 3023A Ubi Road 1 #01-60 Singapore 408717
Main +65 6743 3246 | peoplevehicle@gmail.com | https://www.peoplesvehiclegroup.com

This e-mail may contain confidential and privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately and destroy this e-mail. Any
unauthorised copying, disclosure or distribution of material in this e-mail is strictly forbidden. The sender cannot guarantee that this communication is secure, free of
viruses, interceptions or interference. The sender does not accept liability for any errors or omissions.

On Mon, Nov 11, 2019 at 5:17 PM Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@Ilkkauto.com> wrote:

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’




