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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Rasul (LKKAuta)

Sent: Friday, 9 November 2018 10:27 AM

To: Kong, Charmaine (VWG Singapore); Oh, Aik Seong (VWG Singapore)
Cc: veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: SKZ 5639H DOA ; 06/11/18

Hi Charmaine,

As spoken with Aik Seang, repair limit is 8K. Due to the cost of repair exceeded more than 8K, propose on repairing
on LUMPSUM
basis is permissable

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkanto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408033)
74 7

ELERAn W Sgye the Earthe Print only when necessary

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 9 November, 2018 9:20 AM

To: 'Kong, Charmaine (VWG Singapore)'

Cc: 'Oh, Ak Seong (VWG Singapore)'; Veron Chen (LKKAuto)
Subject: SKZ 5639H DOA : 06/11/18

Hi Charmaine,

Repair limit for this vehicle is 7K only

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)
F RN S

-
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Catherine Chuns (LKK Auto)

From: ECICS Claims <claims@ecics.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 7 November, 2018 4:55 PM

To: Kong, Charmaine (VWG Singapore); ‘assignments’

Cc: Wang, Meiy (VWG Singapore); Cheong, Pearlyn (VWG Singapare); Goh, Edmund
(VWG Singapore); Oh, Aik Seong (VWG Singapore); ECICS Claims

Subject: RE: REQUEST FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT FOR ACCDT INVOLVING SKZ5639H &
5J512175 ON 6.11.18 ; Our ref DMPC1800417H,

Attachments: MyDocument_2018_11_07_03_37_04 pdf; SKZ5639H- MSIG WINNER V5 ECICS

06-11-2018.pdf

Without Prejudice

Hi Charmaine

Thank you for your email.

Liability is clear for direct settlement.
We will appoint LKK for the survey.
Aside LKK

Our ref DMPC1800417H/JG.

Please assist to arrange survey for TP PRI
Thank you.

Regards,

Janice Goh

Claims Division

DID: +65 5303 0182

FAX: +65 6338 9267

ECICS Limited
10 Eunos Road 8, Singapore Post Center #09-04A, Singapore 408600

WITH IMMEDIATE EFFECT FOR ALL PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION/SURVEY, please email to motorsyrvey@ecics.com.sg
directly.

*#plegse hear with us should we take longer to response as we are currently experiencing a high volume of
claims. Thank you for your kind patience and understanding. **

From: Kong, Charmaine (VWG Singapore) [mailto:charmaine.kong@vw.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 7 November, 2018 3:52 PM

To: ECICS Claims

Cc: Wong, Meiy (VWG Singapore); Cheong, Pearlyn (VWG Singapore); Goh, Edmund (VWG Singapore); Oh, Aik
Seong (VWG Singapore)

Subject: REQUEST FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT FOR ACCDT INVOLVING SKZ5639H & S)512175 ON 6.11.18

Dear Claims,

Please revert on liability & arrange survey at 17 Tuas Ave 9. Car already in Tuas workshop.

Thanks



Best Regards

Charmaine Kong
Insurance Service Advisor
Aftersales

Volkswagen Group Singapore Pte Ltd
247 Alexandra Road
Singapore 159834

Direct line: +65B305 7178
Main Line: +65 6305 7299
Main Fax +65 6474 3643
charmaine_kong@Evw. com.sq
hittp:/fwww v .com.sq

Backwitha
bold new look. 7,

The new Polo.

From: charmaine.kong@vw.com.sg [mailto:charmaine.kong@vw.com.sg]
Sent: Wednesday, 7 November, 2018 3:38 PM

To: Kong, Charmaine (VWG Singapore)

Subject: Scan von MyMFP

Scan from MyMFP

g g

This message may contain privileged and confidential information and is only inte nded for use by the addressee. No representation, warranty, guarantee
or undertaking expressed or implied is made by ECICS Limited; as to the fairness, accuracy or completeness of any information, projections or opinions
contained in this message. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination either in whole or in part is prohibited. If you are not the addressee
indicated in his message (or responsible for delivery of the message to such person), you may not copy or deliver this message to anyone. In such case,
you should destroy this message and kindly notify the sender by reply email. Opinions contained herein are the personal opinions of the sender and do
not necessarily represent the views of ECICS Limited.



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 28 November 2018 10:59 AM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto); Cheong, Pearlyn (VWG Singapore); SUR; Admin A; Admin-D
(LKKAuto)

Cc: Kong, Charmaine (VWG Singapore); Wong, Mely (VWG Singapore); Foo, John (VWG
Singapore)

Subject: RE: SKZ5639H - FINALISE

Dear Pearlyn.

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Confirmed COR $7992.37 before GST
Total 12 workings day

Kindly send Final invoice and all supporting documents to ECICS

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 23 November 2018 9:10 AM

To: Cheong, Pearlyn (VWG Singapore) <Pearlyn.cheong@vw.com.sg>; SUR <sur@Ilkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-
a@lkkauto.com>; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Kong, Charmaine (VWG Singapore) <charmaine.kong@vw.com.sg>; Wong, Meiy (VWG Singapore)
<meiy.wong@vw.com.sg>; Foo, John (VWG Singapore) <lohn.Foo@vw.com.sg>

Subject: RE: SKZ5635H - FINALISE

Hi Pearlyn,

Kindly forward the damage photos for both LH RH taillight lower bracket

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

S=SR== mm Sove the Sarth: Print only when necessary



From: Cheong, Pearlyn (VWG Singapore) [mailto:Pearlyn.cheong@ vw.com.sq]

Sent: Thursday, 22 November, 2018 6:48 PM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto); SUR; Admin A; Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Cc: Kong, Charmaine (VWG Singapore); Wong, Meiy (VWG Singapore); Foo, John (VWG Singapore)
Subject: SkZ5639H - FINALISE

Dear Rasul,

Please confirmed

COR $7992.37 before GST

Total 12 workings day

Best regards,

Pearlyn Cheong
Service Advisor
Aftersales Body & Paint Department

Volkswagen Group Singapore (Alexandra)
247 Alexandra Road
Singapore 159934

Direct line: +55 6305 7288

Mobile +55 9236 1336
Main line: +65 6305 7299
Main Fax: +55 6474 3643

pearlyn.cheong@vw.com.sg
http:/fwww. vw.com.sg

Back with a _
bold new look.

The new Polo.
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> Back to OneMotoring

PARFICOE Rebate Enguiry

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Crhwner 1D Type:

Singapore NRIC

Owner 1D: 9479G
Wehicle No.: SKZ5639H
Vehicle to be Exported: Mo
Intended Deregistration Date: 09 Nov 2018
Vehicle Make: VOLKSWAGEN
Vehicle Madel; JETTAGP 1.4 TS| 90 A/T HLHID 1634G5
Primary Celour: Grey
Manufacturing Year: 2015
Engine No.: CAXFB3813
Chassis Mo.: WWVWZZZ16ZGM013327
Maximum Power Output: 90.0 kW (120 bhp)
Open Market Value: $21,562.00
Original Registration Date: 27 Jan 2016
First Registration Date: 27 Jan 2016
Transfer Count: 0
Actual ARF Paid: £22,187.00
PARF Eligibility: Yes
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: 26 Jan 2026
PARF Rebate Amount: $16,640.00
COE Expiry Date: 26 Jan 20246
COE Category: A - Car up to 1600cc & 97kW (130bhp)
COE Period{Years): 10
QP Paid: $51,301.00
COE Rebate Amount: $37,000.00
Total Rebate Amount: $53,640.00
The information contained herein is correct as at 0% Nov 2018
(2
OK fhidd
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SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT

IMPORTANT NOTICE

1. Please report correctly the defails of Ine sccident o speed up the claime p
t be complated by |
ded musl be as ruthiul @nd accurale as possible, Any wilful mssrepresentation o witholding of materel facts may allow insurance companies 1o
2oty

¢ Policyhalder andior the Authonsed Diriver

4 The issue and accaptancs af the Form by insurancs companios 15 not an admission of policy liability on the pan of the insurance companes.

5 Any false reporting may be referred to the Police for investigation.

&. This ropor will e forwarded by tha insurers of the G1A Records Managemant Centre established by the General Insurance Associabon of Singapese {GIA) for
rat o of this repart will, for 2 fea, be ma ailable upon apphcalion by interested parties

archiving and |
his report 1o the mswrars, you hereby consent 1o the archiving of this report at tha canire and o copies of the rapan baing made available

-
T. By tha lodgemen
aforesaid

ACCIDENT STATEMENT

Date Of Report 07/11/2018 08:03
Date Of Accident 06/11/2018 12:45
Exact Location OFf Accident YISHUN AVE 9 AND YISHUN CENTRAL JUNCTION
Country/State of Loss SINGAPORE
DETAILS OF OWN VEHICLE
Vehicle Registration Mumbaer SKZ5639H
Insured/Policyholder
mMame Of Registered Owner ANG WEI CHONG
NRICG Mo SR2194790
Email Address ANGWEICHONG@GMAIL.COM
Maokile Phone Mo (LOCAL) +65-9768427E8
Alternative Phone Mo OFFICE-97684278
Vehicle Particulars
Manufacturer VOLKSWAGEN
Model JETTA TSI (DSG) HIGHLINE HIDC

Exact Purpose for which vehicle was being used at
time of accident

Are you claiming under your own insurance policy

A MO
for repair to your vehicle?

f Mo. Please state action to be taken THIRD PARTY

Vehicle Category PRIVATE CAR

Insurance Company

MName of Insurance Company MSIG INSURANCE (SINGAFPORE) PTE. LTD
Type Of Coverage COMPREHENSIVE

Fleat Policy NO

Palicy Mumber A 28677434 AVW

Cover Note Number

Driver

MName of Drniver POH YEN LI

NRIC Mo SEINMTIA

Date Of Birth 30/04/1983

Occupation INDOOR

Date Of Driving Pass 15/08/2014

Driving Experience 4 YEARS AND 2 MONTHS
Gender FEMALE

Maobile Number (LOCAL) +85-97560340
Fax Number

Contact Number

EMail &ddress POHYENLI@GMAIL COM



Adrress BLK 15 YISHUN ST 51 #05-31
Pn;ff.nae TETaT3

Was driver an employee of the Insured's Company NO

If Mo, Relationship of the Driver with the Insurad SPOUSE

Vehicle Registration Number of Driver's Owrn -
Vehicle

Insurance Company of Drver's Own Vehicle

General Information of the Accident

Type OF Accident COLLISION - HEAD TO REAR
Weather Conditions CLEAR

Road Surface DRY

Other Information

Was any foreign vehicle involved in this accident? NO

Number of vehicles involved in the accident

Was any body injured in the Accident? MNO

Was any injured conveyed to hospital by NO
ambulance?

Was any other material or property damaged? YES

| have tJE_en d[_:lul'ljacjec by unknown person(s) NO
soliciting/offering accident claims assistance

Number of Passengers (Including Driver) 1

Details of Police Action

Was the acoident reported to the police? ]

If Yas,Please state which Poiice Station

Was natice of intended Prosecution given? MO

If Yes,against whom?

Circumstances of Accident

REFER TO SKETCH PLAN

Attachment(s)

Are accident photos available for attachment? YES

Was there any video capiured by Car Camera? YES
Remarks! Reasons FILE SIZE EXCEEDED
Was there any audio recorded? MO
Vehicle Registration Number 54512175

Vehicle Make/Model/Colour

Details Of Properlies

Vehicle Category PRIVATE CAR
Mame of Driver CHRIS
MRIC/Passport Number

Contact Number 9475 8245
Addrass

Posteode

Insurance Company Name

Mature Of Damage

Mo, Of Passenger (Including Driver)

Page 2 of 23



Sketch Plan Pg. 1

SKETCH PLAN

IMPORTANT NOTICE

1. Fleass report correctly the details of the accident to speed up the claims process.

2. This Form must be completed by the Policyholder and/for the Authorised Driver.
3. Infarmation provided must be as truthful and accurate 35 possible. Any wilful misrepresentation or withhoiging of material

facts may allow insurance companses to rapudiate policy liability.

4. The issue and acceptance of this Form by insurance companies is not an admission of policy llability on the part of the Insurance
companies.

5. A i be referred t Police for inve an.

6. The report will be forwarded by the insurers of the GIA Records Management Centre established by the General Insurance

Association of Singapare (G14) far archiving and that coplies of this report will for a fee be made available upon application oy
Interested parties.

7. 3y the lodgment of this report 1 the insurers, you hereby consent to the archiving of this report a1 the centre and to copies of
the report being made available aforesaid,

8. Consent under the Personal Data Protection Act (PDPA]
I understand, acknowledge, agree and consent that:

tal  Myinsurer, my workshop and the General Insurance Association of Singapore ("GIA™} may/are permitted to collect, use,
disclose and/or process my personal data/personal infarmation set out in this [form] and any ather personal information
pravided by me or possessed oy my insurer (colectively the "Personal Infarmation”} and disclose and transfer such
Personal Information to all insurer{s) who have insured vehicle{s) invohved in this accident (all insurer]s) who have insured
vehicle(s] invalved in this accident shall be collectively referred to as the "Insurers”), the insurers’ lawyers/law firms, the
Maonetary Authority of Singapare and any relevant government agancy/authority [such as the police], for the purposels]
af :

[i} processing, handiing and/or dealing with my claims including the settiernent of the claims and any necessary
investigations refsting ta the claims;

(i1} investigating the accident and/or my claims;
{iii} carrying out and/or dealing with my instructions or responding to any enquiries by me;

[iv] administering my claims {including the malling of correspondence, statements, invosces, reports or notices to me,
which could invalve disclosure of certain personal data about me to bring about delivery of the same as well a5 on the
external cover of envelopes/mall packages); and//or

v} complying with applicable law in administering, processing, handling and/or dealing with my claims.(collectively the
“Purposes”)

[b)  allinsurer(s] wha have insured vehicle(s) involed in this accident and the Insurers’ lawyers/law firms, may/are permitted
to coliect, usa, disclose and/or process my Parsonal Information for one or more of the above Purposas; and

{c}  my Personal information may/can be disclosed by any of the Insurers and/or GIA to their third party service providers or
agentsiincluding their lawyers/law firms), which may be sited outside of Singapore, for one or mare of the above Purpases.

[d) my Personal Information will also be collected and used to compéle claims histary for the purpose of fraud detection,
imvestigation and management in present and all future claims,

e}l the information so collected under (d} above may be shared / discloses:

{i} toall insurers andfor any other third parties that assist in evaluating, investigating, controlling or managing fraud,
regulators, law enforcement and government agencies as reasonably required for the purposas stated, or

{ii} for complying with requirements under any regulations, laws or court orders.

,@/\Zf

Policyhalder's Signatu Driver's 5; Reporting Centre Perionnel’s Signature
011.1 1B

Date & Time: [1f driver is n nlun,-huldm Name:

m Date & Time; :fh"'llil.ﬁ Em WRIC/FIN No.:



Sketch Plan #2 Pg. 1

SKETCH PLAN

I paRTY
Chis N
qui5_faus
SE nDAS
DECLARATION
I/We declare the foregoing particulars are 1ru:\|;:@i-\
Pﬂllcy’ﬁﬂld;"s Signature Drivek) ature Regorting Centre Personnel’s Signature N
Date & Time: (I delper 1§ not the policyhalder] Marne:
M\,ﬁ s gl Date e -‘1]'-" |'I-t= f.cham NRIC/FIN No.:

Page 4 of 21
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Service Order Confirmation

SERVICE ORDER NO:  1BIPZEOT

CUSTOMER NO.:

CAVO3285T

CUSTOMER NAME:  ANG WEI CHONG

TELEPHONE NG

ADDRESS:

18 YISHUN STHEET 51 805-11

Singapare

VEH No.: SKZ5639H

Ordes Date: 110718
Reg Date: oETHe LR LR
VIN MO WWZZZ1EZGMOT 3507 ENGINE O SAs: Geh Edmmind
MODEL: JETTA TSH{RSG) HIGHLINE HIDEMODEL NO.: 163457

Ho, DESCRIPTION aTy e l) UKIT PRICE DISC % AMOUNT

Labar
1 BEF TEHWVING BEP TOWING CHARGES 156 U 126 *.95/ )
2 HEF MECH CHECK WIRE HARNESS, ECL), SENSOR SOCHKET 1 U 280 a0 !’"‘_'-'
1 D& DIAG PROGARAMMING & CALIBRATION- NETT 1 W 4BO qs:-// 336
4 B&P MECH RER WCARRIAGE TO RAR SILEMCER HEAT PLATE 2 Td B4 )(w =
5 BEP MECH R&R FIM & BALANCE 1 bl 50 Fag/ 5
3 REP WHEEL ALIGKMENT B&P WHEEL ALISHNMENT NETT 1 T 380 355’;’" 259
7 B&P ALEX LABOUR LAROUR T UNIT B0 v2 55 m%u
a BEP ALEX PAINT SEHAY FAINT H NI B0 y.2 Lk
g HER ALEX LABOUR FER REAR LUGGAGE TRIM 1 LINIT By >G4 yﬁ vy ]
10 B&P ALEX LABOUR TRANSFER BOOT LID MECHANISM 1 LNIT B0 =l ;rf\{.'j.-d
11 BER ALEX LABOUR RAR EXMALIST SILENCER 1 UNIT 4 My '-E'w
12 BLE TYRE SALES TYRE 1 PCE a0 A *{-g 23] ;.4 ~ SWC

Itaemy -

13 SCREIIO2SE REAR LID ‘H’/ A | i PGS 163850 vssae0 Y 7
T4 WHTOOT3 NUT e al o e, PCS 218 gz *
15 8D0BS34180 REAR NUMBER FLATE PACKING ML = X [ 1 PCS 24 Ed 2488 of A
L SCBEZTTONA SAP WTHRSTRIP = Ao - 1 PCE 266 T1 2gs71
17 SCEAS3E30F LILM wsion A" 1 PCs 108 42 wadz 63470
18 SCEARIEET 739 MAME PLATE - JETTA A= ¢ 1 PCE &7.51 gisr 39. B3
15 SCEASIATEAPGOF MANE FLATE -TS1 Al - 1 PCE 5097 5087 A0 |
bl SCER4E098L TAILLIGHT OUTER RH v {'q‘ 1 PCE 505 44 so544 21 =0 &
21 SCEADTAZTH GRU REAR BUMPER -r*-'” / . 1 PCS 125865 125665 + -
22 SCEI1BAEI0 SENSOR BRAGKET g f I 1 PGS e - 2379
3 SCAS1S491E SENSOR BRACKET | 2 PCS 2374 arsa
4 A0E5154520 SENSOR BRACKET A £ | }{: Sve 1 PCS 2374 2379 +
5 O 1B0KLIZAY IHADHESNE | 1 FCS A5 A4 pas
8 D 82215081 BONOAGENT / i PCH B 27 g4327
F i SO0S1E2TIE GRU SENBOR cﬂ"’ m | 1 PCS 144 40 14440 f

28 500819133 SHO SENSOR O-RING ' 1 oS 172 172 4 o



Vo LKSWAGEN|
SROUP |
SINGAPORE |

181030001

Service Order Confirmation

SERVIGE ORDER NO:.  1HIFE30T
CUSTOMER NO.: CWOZEZEST

CUSTOMER NAME:  AMNG WEI CHONG

TELEPHOME MO.:
ADDRESS: 15 ¥ISHUN STREET 51 #05-31
Singapore

VEH No.: SKZ5639H
Cirder Date: 11/07118
Reg Date: TZTHE HM: 58 685
VIN NO.: WWEZZIEZGMON 3337 ENGINE NO: $A: Ooh Edmuna
MODEL: JETTA TS| {OSG] HIGHLINE HIDCMODEL NO,: 163457

Ho, .11 a IR Qry O URITPRICE DISC % AMOUNT -.
20 SCUGT1I0H ZEMSOR WIRE HARNESS = 1 PGE 18118 1115 0!
30 SCEA0T43T) SPOILER M rd 1 PCS 535 28 sasop 316 50
a1 SCEA0TI0E REINFORCEMENT H = 7 SHLA 1 PCS 498 23 apaza L
a2 SCEA0TEEIE BUMPER CENTRE BRACKET THE 7 /‘ 1 PCS o8 59 ek Sy
33 SCESOTINGE TAILLIGHT LOWER BRACKET LM ': Lo 1 PGS o424 sizn KECo
34 SCEA0TINE TAILLIGHT LOWER BRACKET RH ﬂ_ S J 1 PoS 54 78 asme 5553
e SCEANTATE BUMPER SIDE BRACKET LH kg -"(M ) 1 PCE o114 $1.04: 1
3% s0eanTane BUMPER SIDE BRACKET RH 9 AL | 1 PCE 51 14 9114
37 SCES4ET0EE LH REAR REFLECTOR £"‘ s .,dw 1 PCS B4. 34 B4.35 |
3  SCEBDETID REAR FENDER LINER LH DPE d }[f""--‘ 1 pog 203 685 203 66
g AC0R1S4RE REAR FENDER AlR DUCT LH '? ;" ie | 1 PGS 4453 A4EF Gyl
0 TKE8ZETINE REAR SILENCER HEAT PLATE ﬁ /}:]‘,Lr ?r 1 PCS 187 63 167.63 L
41 SCEEZETZA REAR SILENGER CENTRE HEAT FLATE é‘_‘ 1 Fos 24520 24890 ;¢
4 5062536080 resm siencer b/ YOV L _ 1 oS 161125 181135
ai 1KO2ENA1R CLAMP gt - fom e 1 PCS 117 47 117.47 i
& SHOBDDZSALEZR 18" BPOKANE RIM ORLY 7 ?9"(‘ 1 PCE 1,256 50 § 256 B
45 31E01351 RUBHER vaLvE s "'f}u;"‘- J 1 PCE 220 234

Remarks  ACCIDENT TO THE REAR LEFT SiDE



SERVICE ORDER NO:

CUSTOMER RO

CUSTOMER NAME:

Service Order Confirmation

VHIPZEGT

CMI3zEsT

ANG WEI CHCORG

[VOLKSWAGEN|
GROUP _ |
SINGAPORE |

v
1030001

o

r

TELEPHONE NO.:
ADDRESS; 15 ¥ISHUN STREET 51 #05-31
Singapore
VEH No.: SKZ5639H
Cirder Dato: 11/071E
Rag Date; ud P [ KM: £9,605
WIN WO WANZZZ18ZGMOTIEET ENGINE NO: SA: Goh Egmund
MODEL: IETTA TSI {RSG) HIGHLINE HIDCMODEL NO.: 1634567
hig, DESCRIPTION ary uom UNIT PRICE DISEC % AMGUNT
L{{; G gol00 [
El
\%
> ) S\
- = ' @.'J (Yo
| ﬁj’, llf’ |
| ¢ pw'-"
el K m[v
| TOTAL 27388 61
u E GST AMOUNT 191589
TOTAL AMOUNT 085 T

[VOLKSWAGEN]
On Befall Of CERFARYTT I

] SINGAPORE |

ls1030001)

Authorized Signature

NOTE: THIS IS NOT AN OFFICIAL RECEIPT

Contified GoodsiService received:

Customer



Service Order Confirmation

SERVICE ORDERND:  181P2807
CUSTOMER NO.: Cv0azesT
CUSTOMER NAME:  AMNG WEI CHONG

TELEPHONE NO.:

ADDRESS: 15 ¥ISHUN STREET 51 #05-31

Singapore

VEH No.: SKZ5639H

Order Dale: o71ne

Fieg Date: 2TNE KM: £0,472
VI NO: WWITTIETGMIIRRT EMGIME NO:

MODEL: JETTA TSI (DSG) HIGHLINE HIDC MODEL NO.: 1634GT

o DESCRIFTION
Labar

1 BAF TOWING B&P TOWING GHARGES

2 BAP MECH GHECHK WIRE HARNESS, ECU, SENSOR, SOCHET
2 B&F DIAG PROGRAMMING & CALIBRATION: NETT
4 BE&P MECH A&A UCARRAIAGE TO RAR SILENCERA HEAT PLATE
8 BE&EP MECH A&A AM & BALANGE

-] B&P WHEEL ALIGNMENT BAP WHEEL ALIGHMMENT NETT

T B&P ALEX LABOUR LABCUR

8 BAP ALEX PAINT SFAAY FAINT

¥ BAP ALEX LABCOUR RA&R REAA LUGGAGE TRIM

1 BAF ALEX LABOUR TRANEFER BOOT LID MECHAMNISM
A BEP ALEX LABOURA RAR EXHALIST SILEMCER

2 EXTO003T Tow SVG- Quality Recovery Senvices
13 EXTO03T Taw BVC- Cuslty Recovery Sarvioas

Hem

14 SCAES3EI0F LILM W SIHGN

15 RCBRSMERT T32 NAME PLATE - JETTA

16 SCERSIGETSAPGOF NAME FLATE -TSI

17 SCERASOEN TAILLGHT

18 ECEANTAEL SPOILER

19 SCEA0TAEIE BUMPER CENTHE BRACKET

s BCEAOTIGIE TALLIGHT LOWER BRACKET LH
21 SCEROT394E TAILLIGHT LOWER BRACKET RH

Aernarks . Aepair limit is B

ECICS DMAECT SETTLEMEMNT

DOA B 112018

TP VEHICLE 2312175

SURVEYOH LKK AASUL

Wy

4.1
a5

o5

uoM  UNITPRICE — RSCS

Tu

TU

TU

TL
LINIT
URIT
UNIT
UNIT
UNIT
usIT
UHNIT

g8 8

PCSE
PCS

PCS

PCS

1.25

480

B40

EEEEE B

B4D

108 42
7811
50.97
50544
53523
699
94 28

8 B 8 4 8 B 88 8 8

d1

i1

4

41

41

S&: Goh Edmund

252
2,352

2,240

6347
983
00T
28821
35.82
Er.a2
B5.63
65.63



Service Order Confirmation

SEAVICE ORDER NO:  18IP2807

CUSTOMER NO.: CVOIREST

CUSTOMER MAME:  ANG WEI CHONG
TELEPHOME NO.:

ADDRESS: 15 YISHUN STREET 51 #0531

Singapore

VEH No.: SKZ5639H

Oircer Diata: or1Me

Reg Date: 2T01HE KM 60472

ViN NO.: WWEZE | BXEMOTA52T ENGINE NO: A= Chafi mcmoni]

MODEL: JETTA TSI (CEE) HIGHLINE HIDCMODEL ND.: 183467

Mg DESCRIPTION aTY NOM UNIT PRICE DISG % AMDUNT
TATAL 796207
GST AMOUNT 55847
TOTAL AMOUNT 855104
On Behalf Of "COMPANY" Ceriified Goods/Service received:
Authorized Signature Customer

NOTE: THIS IS NOT AN OFFICIAL RECEIPT



Adjuster Report

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (coreq o 10ss071a8r)

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park

Singapore 408933

Page 1 of 3

Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 66844-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto. com;assignments@ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No: CS/ACS18020164/R1VBMN2Z
Date: 04/12/2018

R REMCE

;1';?::9 ECICS Limited  Policy No: MPC18A00279500

Claimant ;

Vehicle No : SKZ5635H Insured Vehicle No : SJ512175

Date of Loss: D&/11/2018 Nature of Claim; TP Claim No: DMPC1800417THIG

DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE

Reg No: SKZ56359H

Make & Model: VOLKSWAGEN JETTA, 1.4 TSI (A) Engine No: CAXF83813

Reg. Date: 27/01/2016 (Man, Year: 2015) Chassis No: WAWEZZZ16ZGM013327

Colour: Grey Odometer: 60472 km

Engine Capacity: 1390 cc

Market Value/New Car N/A

Price:
Sum Insured (S§):

CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY

Market Value/Mew Car Price

General Condition: Steering (Serviceable): Yes Footbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification: Mo Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 205/55R16 Rear Tyre Size: 205/55R16
Front Left Side: Pirelli 6 mm Rear Left Side: Pirelli 6 mm
Front Right Side: Pirelli 6 mm Rear Right Side: Pirelli & mm
The above values reprasent e remaining tyre [reaos degsth
COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's Adjuster's Difference Diff %
Parts 10,324 .81 8916.37 9,408 44 9112
Miscellaneous Items 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 17,045.00 7,076.00 9,969.00 58.45
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Gross Total (58) 27,369.81 7.992.37 19,377.44 70.80
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (5%) 1,915.89 55047 1,356.42 70.80
Nett Amount (5%) 29,285.70 8,551.84 20,733.86 T0.80
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 071172018
Date Inspected: 08/11/2018 Inspected At: Volkswagen Group Singapore Pte Ltd

Estimated Period of Repair: 12.0 days

(HQ)

MNo: 17 Tuas Ave 9
Singapore 639197

Adjuster: MOHD RASUL

Manager: VERON CHEN

NOTE: This reporf répresents our fndings af the ime and place of inspechon stafed herein. Such inspection has been carred ouf to the besf of our
knowladge and abiity buf any ofher rabiity under any offer circumstanceas (s heraby exprassly excluded

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=g... 4/12/2018



Adjuster Report

REPAIR DETAILS
Reference

Part Source: MEM-5G

Version: 1.0 (Last Synchronised: 04 Dec 2018)

WOLKSWAGEN JETTA 1.4 TSI (A) (Catalogue:Merimen Singapore 1.0)

Parts: 143

Labour: Repairer's {Price-denominated Standard List)
Print Code: (Unsubmitted, no print-code for SKZ5639H)
Validity:

numbers with the END OF ESTIMATES marker on the last estimate page
Further Info: ltemsi/values not in reference catalogue are prefixed with an asterisk *.

Recommended Parts

No.

Co =~ Ah &&=

G L L W M ARM R RN M= % a2 a4 a s s s s D
WM 2 QWD R U AW N =200 00~ O b NSO

34

Qty Part No.

PR SR (R P T g f e S T S Rt S L T Sl ot L ey R R T N, TR G e S QR M R S Tl

-

Particulars

*‘REAR LID

*NUT

"REAR NUMBER PLATE PACKING
*WTHRSTRIP

VW SIGN

*NAME PLATE-JETTA

“NAME PLATE-TS|

*TAILLIGHT OUTER RH

*REAR BUMPER

*SENSOR BRACKET

*SENSOR BRACKET

*SENSOR BRACKET
*ZKADHESIVE

*BONDAGENT

“SENSOR

*SENSOR O-RING

“SENSOR WIRE HARNESS
“SPOILER

“REINFORCEMENT

“‘BUMPER CENTRE BRACKET
“TAILLIGHT LOWER BRACKET LH
*TAILLIGHT LOWER BRACKET RH
*BUMPER SIDE BRACKET LH
“‘BUMPER SIDE BRACKET RH

“LH REAR REFLECTOR

‘REAR FENDER LINER LH

*REAR FENDER AIR DUCT LH
*REAR SILENCER HEAT PLATE
“REAR SILENCER CENTRE HEAT PLATE
‘REAR SILENCER

“‘CLAMP

*16 SPOKANE RIM ONLY
‘RUBBER VALVE

*TYRE

F=Franchise parl. S=SpcNeti

Condition
Serviceable
Serviceable
Serviceable
Serviceable
Mecessary
Mecessary
MNecessary
Cracked
Serviceable
Serviceable
Serviceable
Serviceable
Serviceable
Serviceable
Serviceable
Serviceable
Mot Necessary
Cut
Serviceable
Deformed
Cracked
Cracked

Mot Necessary
Mot Necessary
Serviceable
Serviceable
Serviceable
Serviceable
Serviceable
Serviceable
Mot Necessary
Serviceable
Not Necessary
Serviceable

Total Parts (58)

Repairer's
1,538 60FS
B.72F3
24 B4FS
265.7T1FS
108.42FS
67T.51FS
5097FS
505 44 F5
1,258.65FS
23.74Fs
47 58FS
23.79F8
89.84F5
64.27FS
144 40F5S
1.72F5
161.16F%
R3R.2BFS
498 23FS
S96.99F5
9428 FS
94 28 FS
91.14FS
81.14F5
84 36FS
203 66FS
44 BAFS
187.63FS
249 20FS
1611.25FS
11747 FS
1,256 .58 FS
2.28FS
680.00FS

10,324.81

Page 2 of 3

These estimates are valid only if they contain the print code (above) on all estimate pages, running page

Amount

“FS
*-FS
*FS
“FS
“63.97FS
*39.83FS
*30.07FS
“208 20FS
“FS
“FS
*FS
“FS
*FS
“FS
“.FS
“FS
*FS
*315.82FS
“FS
*57.22F5
*55.63F5
*55.63FS
“FS
“FS
“FS
“FS
“FS
“FS
*-FS
“FS
“FS
“FS
*FS
*FS

916.37

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=g... 4/12/2018



Adjuster Report

Recommended Miscellaneous ltems

There are no new miscellaneous iterns selected.

Recommended Labour

Mo  Particulars

Labour ltems

B&P TOWING CHARGES

CHECK WIRE HARNESS ECU SENSOR SOCKET
PROGRAMMING & CALIBRATION

R&R U/ICARRIAGE TO RAR SILENCER HEAT PLATE
R&R RIM & BALANCE

B&P WHEEL ALIGNMENT

LABOUR

SPRAY PAINT

R&R REAR LUGGAGE TRIM

TRANSFER BOOT LID MECHAMNISM

R&R EXHAUST SILENCER

[

= = @@ 0 ~ o B W

= O

Gross Labour Cost (5§)

Lab.Type

Mew
Mew
New
Mew
MNew
New
Mew
MNew
New
MNew
New

Repairer's

195.00
280.00
480.00
1,680.00
50.00
360.00
5.880.00
5,600.00
840.00
840.00
840.00

17,045.00

Page 3 of 3

Amount

185.00
196.00
336.00
588.00
35.00
252.00
2,352.00
2,240.00
284.00
294.00
204.00

7.076.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out,

< END OF ESTIMATES >

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=g... 4/12/2018



