Jia Le (LKK Auto)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 24 July 2019 7:15 AM

To: Jia Le (LKK Auto)

Ce: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement(FC) - Accident Involving SCAB828K and GBF2637U DOA

03/11/2018 [External Confidential]

Lonpac External - Confidential
Dear Jia Le,

Kindly proceed as proposed

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

HEw | lonpac.com 50

Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only.

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto) [mailto:JiaLe@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, 19 July, 2019 12:42 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement{FC) - Accident Involving SCAB82BK and GBF2637U DOA 03/11/2018

Lonpoc Ref: 18/18/18/VC05/0210%7
LKK Ref: CC4/LPC18020154/R1da3
Dear Sirs/Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

we have highlighted to your good office on 09/11/2018 of Third-Party's request to do Direct Setflernent with
our Principal, Lonpac Insurance Bhd.

This Is a head-to-rear collision, Labllity Is not in our driver's favour

summary to offer to third party repairer, “BORNEO MOTORS (SINGAPORE) PTE LTD" is as follows: -

Claimed Amount Revised Amounl

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST] $8,710.50 $5.71637

2 Loss of Rental (Sdays x $100.00) | $  500.00 $ 500.00 (5days x $100.00]
3. LTA/ GIA Search Fee $§ 200 $ 200




- Total | $9.212.50 | s 6.218.37 |

**05days recommendation for repair,

Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and reference.

I r r W

Best Regards,

Carlor Chan | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultanis Pie Lid

Phone: 6740 5792 | email: Jiale@ lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #o2-25 | 5(408033)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan @ |kkauto.com>
Sent: Friday, 9 November, 2018 6:09 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Ce: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@®lonpac.com>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-
a@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement{FC) - Accident Involving SCAB828K and GBF2637U DOA 03/11/2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

LPCref: 18/18/18/VC05/021097
LKK REF: CC4/LPC18020154/R1ea3

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

Enclosed revert of vehicle: SCA 8828K
We have not authorized repairs.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
e« TP estimated cost of repair
« Preliminary advice

Please take note that the case handler in-charge is Asher and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 6051.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned,

Thank vou.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408033)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 7 November, 2018 5:04 PM
To: Mei Kwan |[LKKAuto) <Meikwan @Ik .com



Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>
Subject: RE: Direct Settlement(FC) - Accident Involving SCA8828K and GBF2637U DOA 03/11/2018

Dear Mei Kwan,

Attached copy of insured’s GIA report for your attention.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: Mel Kwan (LKKAuto) [mailto:Melkwan®@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 7 November, 2018 4:44 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cec: MT_Claim_SG; Admin A; Asher Sng (LKKAuto); CS A Team

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement(FC) - Accident Involving SCAB828K and GBF2637U DOA 03/11/2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

LPC ref: 18/18/18/VC05/021097
LKK REF: CC4/LPC18020154 /ea3

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter,

Kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.
Please take note that the case handler in-charge is Asher and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 6051.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Med Kwan | Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiEwan@lkkauto.comm | fix: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{4080933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 7 November, 2018 9:52 AM

To: 'GERALD POH WEE BIN' <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>; assignments <assignmen lkkauto.com>
Cc: 'MT_Claim_5G' <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Admin A <a - kauto.com>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement(FC) - Accident Involving SCA8828K and GBF2637U DOA 03/11/2018

Dear Mr Gerald,
Thank you for the assignment.
Please be informed that vehicle currently not in the warkshop, repairer will arrange.

Best Regards,
Catherine Chong | Admin



LEK Auto Consultants Pre Lid

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: gssignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408033)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN [mailto:geraldpoh@lonpac.com|

Sent: Wednesday, 7 November, 2018 9:06 AM

To: Admin-D [LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkk .comz>

Cc: MT_Claim_5G <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Siti Nabilah PTCBC <Siti.Nabilah@inchcape.com.sg>
Subject: FW: Direct Settlement({FC) - Accident Involving SCAB828K and GBF2637U DOA 03/11/2018

Our Ref : 18/18/18/VvC05/021097
Dear Catherine,

Kindly proceed to survey and revert to them on liability.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: Siti Nabilah PTCBC
Sent: Monday, 5 November, 2018 6:36 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc: Siti Nabilah PTCBC

Subject: Direct Settlement{FC) - Accident Involving SCAB828K and GBF2637U DOA 03/11/2018

Hi,
Reference 1o the above-mentioned.

Please find attached herein a copy of our client's Accident Report, Damaged Photos & Estimate Invoice for your kind
perusal.

As our client is claiming against your insured GBF2637U thus would appreciate If you could revert to us on the liability
urgently or we could settle the case under Direct Settlement with Car Rental @ $150 per day x no. of days as
recommended by your appointed surveyor.

Kindly have your surveyor to contact our Motor Claim Assessor, Francis Cher (@ 9847 6179 / 6631 1863 |ocated at
Inchcape Centre — No 2 Pandan Crescent / Level 4 for an appointment to inspect our client’s vehicle.

Your kind attention into the above is greatly appreciated.

Thank you very much in advance!

Best Regards,

Nabilah

TPR Team (Claims Accident Recovery Dpt)

DID 65631 1874 | FAX 6B72 7260

Inchcape - Borneo Motors (S) Pte Ltd

Office Address: 2 Pandan Crescent, Inchcape Centre Level 4, Singapore 128462
www.borneomotorscomsg | www.toyotasingapore.comsg



- e AL

Bornes Motors (Singapore| Pte Lid
o Incheape Sodycare Cantre
Level 4, Inchcape Canirs
Borneo Motors it o
Singapors 128463
Tel +B5 8631 185511500
Fax «85 BA72 TG0

www, borneomotors com &g
Our Ref: BM52019/02/PD9255/DS(FC)
Your Ref: LONPAC-GBF2637U
01 Feb 2019 BY HAND (INS COPY)

M/S. LONPAC INSURANCE BERHAD C/0O LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTELTD
Attn  : Asher Sng

Dept : Motor Claims

RE : ACCIDENT INVOLVING SCABB28K AND GBF2637U ON 03 Nov 2018
Dear Officer,

We refer to the above captioned.

The accident was caused by the negligence of your insured and as a result, our client has incurred
the following losses:

A_ Repair Cost -65,716.37 B. LTA Search -52.00
C. Excess . D. Lossof Use

E. Lossof Rental - 5500.00(5100x5days) F. Others

G. Medical Claims -

Total Clai -56,218.37
-Undertake By Claimant ] i $

We would appreciate if you could revert to us with an offer to settlement within B working weeks as
required under NIMA Protocol,

Enclosed are the following documents for your kind perusal:

(¥ ) Original Tax Invoice [X) Vehicle Registration Card

(#) Car Rental Invoice/Agreement/Medical Receipt (+) Driver’s driving license / Identity card
(¥) GIAS/Police Report/s (X) Original Photograph X

(v ) Certificate of Insurance (X) Original/Photocopy Survey

(¥) Letter of Authority (*] LTA Search Fees

*Cheque is to be made payable to BORNEO MOTORS (SINGAPORE) PTE LTD & mail it to, Inchcape
Bodycare Centre Level 4, Inchcape Centre, 2 Pandan Crescent, Singapore 128462, Attn: TPR
Department*

Yours faithfully,

TPR Team

Claims Service Department

F:68727260 E: claimstatusenguiry @hornsomotors.com.sg

(As this is a computer generated letter, no signature is required.)



LETTER OF AUTHORITY

sccioent iwolving. OCA BEIXK oy BEF 7B3AU o 03-(L-1%
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BY THE LETTER OF AUTHORITY, lwe. 4 ua Yevig  Tleek

Totir o1 Piaia ¢ Faceem L 10 EEAnc Comiilts Pmcrbirameeil mariis

of iELF\ EL'I C,ll.tx\ Clid Ka \:“3 e & 'ﬂ{& 1";] Qﬁ{qx‘l{

T aamesr Frwmy

owner ol Vehicle Registration No SCA 18K neteby  soport BORNEQ MOTORS
(SINGAPORE) PTE LTD [hereinafter refers 1o BMSI & company (ncarporaled in Singapore and
having ite registerad offics al 33 Leng Kee Road Singapore 158102 10 de 3l or any of iha following:

1. To submil, resolve and make any claims which 'l'we may have sgainsl 1ha olhet
‘pariyipatties o the Accideni and under (he insurance “policy/pdlicies faken Up by such
‘paryiparies or alternatively Lindes Insurance Policy humber - laken up
lyy "mafis @nd pay the compulsory excess In tespec! of thie cosl of ‘epairs suffersd by "melus
attsing from (e Accident (lbss @nd damage)

2  To colledi payimeni{s] due In respec] of any such deimis) Tor e L-:ﬁs &nd damaga !.uch
payment lo be made by way of Cheque In favalyr of BEORNEO M S (SING,
LTD and give 2 valld receipl and discharge therefole

3 Faol any of ke purposs aloresaid o ececyle sigh and deliver 8| documerids whalsosver n
relptlion |herain

4. Gengrally do &l such scis a8 | shall deem recassary lor the purpose ol settllig such Claim

"IWe heteby declare thial all acle Instruments and documents dana by virlue of Ihis letier of authorily
o "mylcur behall shall be a= good valid and elfeciudl to sl intenls and purposss whislsoaver a5 i he
same had been done ar exgculed by "malus In “myfour own proper personis) and "lwe hereby rallly
and confirm, 2ll acls instruments and dbchmedils done of sxsculad by virlue of he aulhadly and
powers hessby cotifetiad

"WWe hereby luriber deciars tha#l the lelter of authority hereby conferred shall remain
irrevocable.

"WUWe further conflirm |hal lhe scceptance by BMS of lhe seillemenl smound i resgecl of such
conafiluts (He full discharge of *myjour claim|<) in resped) of such loss and dameage

IN WITNESS WHEREGF “Itwe have hereurito 1g set “mylour hand and sign this el of

lhe month Ly Year 20 !
Signed & Deliversd By: Wilness By
A 77 Francis Ch
}Z"': éﬂ Moo Clisings ,ql:.,:“ o
== Bornso Motors (5) Pre {1d
(To be sign by the palicy holder only)

“Prress gwmg thoe company chop for
e e Ll 8 SIASAIY & g

*AEHIE 25 approprn
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" LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

CLAIM NGO 18/18/18/VCO5/021097
DATE : 24 JULY 2019

DISCHARGE VOUCHER

I'We. KUA SENG TECK confirmed acceptance from M/s LONPAC INSURANCE
BHD and/or owner of GBF 2637L! the sum of Singapore Dollar Six Thousand Two
Hundred Eighteen and Cents Thirty-Seven Only ($6,218.37) in full and final
satisfaction, liquidation and discharge of all property losses competent 10 me/us upon
the said M/s LONPAC INSURANCE BHD in respect of all property losses
sustained by me/us whether now or hereafter to become manifest, arising either
directly or indirectly from an accident involving SCA 8828K and GBF 26370 on 03
November 2018 along UPPER BUKIT TIMAH ROAD TOWARDS WOODLANDS.

| /We hereby agree to indemnify and keep indemnify (LONPAC INSURANCE
BHD/ SGP UNITED TRADING PTE LTD AND/OR CHNG KOON HONG)
against all claims and any ¢laims whatsoever made by any person/persons on our
behalf in respect of the said accident.

I/'We further authorize you to pay the above settlement sum directly to BORNEO
MOTORS (SINGAPORE) PTE LTD.

I'We hereby acknowledged that this payment is made on a without admission of

liability basis and without prejudice to all related claims and in respect of our
insured’s recovery action.

LI_,/-’ 5/ e &

'*n j,rlﬂilll‘t' ﬁf v rhu.lc oW m:rr’[}ale

1{U'L1 ":"L\ ||1EL ‘:/'C/”ﬂ

\am-, nf v u.hu..le owner "Ddll:

a later date should such a claim arses.

Thes seftiement does no! preclude/prajubios the
ClamantDimver/Passange for personad injury o

| ¥ Lld S



GDTOYOTA e

#L'.‘y‘%ﬁ"."fa‘#é".ﬁ Cantre

-
CoRegNo : 196700086 to. Z Pandan Crescent
GSTReg No : MR-8500000-9 T“ m Singapoce 128462
Downlaad "My Towold SG° app on Playstore o1 Appstone 1o ccess youl Tovata ME account & marg! Tel no.: 6631 1188
B e Arcount No - -
Account Detal Ciistormur Datall
= 51000007 fICLPIL == o e
Lonpac Impurance Berhad N Mr Kua Seng Teck
100 Beach Road ‘Document No 361 Choa Chu Kang Avenue 3
#19-00 Shaw Tower 38032961 #15-23
Singapors 189702 Singapore 683BB4
Attn: Ms Lily Noh/Mr Chis T —— =
Rocument Dite Hobile: 94233787
16/01/2019
Year Hake Mo Reg Date Veh Reg No K[iomeTers WIF Nao Order No/itemarks
‘13 JEXGBT H2 AVVSOR 20/05/2013 SCABB20K 166151 37338 5DS/SCABB2BK/03111!
Chassis No Engine Na Terma Service Enginest Varhicli In Collected On
MROS3ICKS004010630 2ARUD22641 &0 Francis Cher T S 12/12/2018 18.06 12/12/2018 18.06
|
L I Cd Job/Parts Desaription hy Lirvit Price Dise % Armctant
1]z BP-SUNDRY SUNDRIES B ' 50.00
| T/P INS. : LONPAC INS.
T/F VEH. ! GBEFZ637U
ACC DATE : 03.11.18
BY ! RASUL (LRR)
2 & [PBP-SLANT SUPPLY SEALANT (NETT) = 100.00
3|B PBP-LAE CHK REAR WIRING SYSTEM AND .| 169.50
CONDUCT WATER TEST.
4/ B BP-LAB DRILL HOLE TO INSTALL REVERSE * 169.50
SENSOR.
5B BP-LAB REMOVE REAR BOOT COMPONENTS TO * 3359.00
TEANSFER ONTO NEW DOOR.
& B P-LAB REMOVE ALl NECESSARY DAMAGED PARTS . 1356.00
TQO REPLACE, REPAIR, STRAIGHTEN REAR
BUMPER, REAR BOOT, TAIL-LAMP PANEL
AFFECTED PORTION OF CAR.
T/B BP-RES SPRAY PAINT ON DAMAGED AFFECTED - 1112.00
| PORTICON OF CAR.
81 852159-06974 COVER, RR BUMPER 1-00! 646,40 646.40
2 2 35525?5"06131 RETAINER, RR BUMPER R 1.00 108.30‘ 108.30 |
_ |
Bérraeo Miotees i b ook bt horksed waor kg to madmhaingoue Togote Sevdoe g Touots oeeey ‘
o i or 10000 oy (anizhewmer Comes T 1) 0 Dy T ANy Demefrn ComdiTains aidby |
For & on hahalt of [ Custamer s Sigratuse Charye Summary Tatal
| - Plaase gl inomlisdge ieceipt of webigle :Iah - e
\ Lstumgs
. ;“.;'rr.nl. Loan
d"‘ Latmsatian Flokd
I (Fner - —
I Amount Dis
FLEASE MAIL YOUR CHEQUE TO 2 Pml_mm._l LEVEL 10 INCHCAPE CENTRE, SINGAFORE 1Sd@E@ani1s
10 SECLIRITY GLIARD 388881¢&6
DATE  16/01/2019
PLEASE ALLOW THE UNDERMENTIONED TIME  22:42

VEHICLE TD LEAVE THE COMPANY PHEMISES

nciEn  SCARB2SK @ Bomeo Motors
rohcops

SIGNATLURE
CUSTOMER FOf BORNED MOTORS (SINGAPORE) PTE LTD



@TOYOTA ::T:':T::; f::ﬂuapurt} Pte Ltd

WA Loy DEE. pam. 8
RecNG  : 1967000 Toyots Bodycars Centre
G&TRagNo . MA-8500000-9 TAX INVOICE No. 2 Pandan Crascent
. ngapore 1ZB462
Download *My Toyota SG° app on Playstare o Appstore (o dcces your Toyela ME azcount & more! Tel no.s SE¥L 1188
[ ‘Apoommi Np
Account Dierail Customer Detail
: | 51000007 /ICLPI1 B
Lonpac Insurance Bachasd Mr Kua Seng Teck
100 Beach Road Dotument No 361 Choa Kang Avenue 3
#19-00 Shaw Towsr 38032961 #15-23
Singapore 189702 Singapore GE89BB4
Attn: Ma Lily Koh/Mc Chis Ty Mobile: 94239787
16/01/2019
|
Ve Make Ml Reg Date Vih Reg Mo Kllometers WIP No Order No/Remmarks
13 JEXGBT HZ AVVSOR 20/05/2013 SCABB28K 166151 37338 5DS/SCABB2BK/03111!
Chasus No Engme o Terms Sernice Enqinesr Vohicle In Caftected On
MROSICK5004010630  ZARUO22641 60 Francis Cher T 8  12/12/2018 18.06 12/12/2018 18.06
L -‘i Cd JobParts Description Oty Lindt Price Dise W Amoufit
10 3 S552161-0K040 2 FIECE, RR BUMFER T 4.00 4.00 16.00
11 /4 B564401-06820 PANEL, LUGGAGE DOOR 1.00 1121.60 1121.60
12 ' 5 S75443-06630 PLATE, LUGGAGE COMPT 1.00| 44.8B0 44.80
13| 6 575442-06230 PALTE, LUGGAGE 1.00 44.80 44.80
14 7 'T75441-33151 PLATE, LUGGAGE | 1.00 64.50 64.50
|
B rwi BOLney = Thes imidy suTraeme wa o fo rmisrr |r~|r-|:|_|-‘.-- LA, S0 youan T oyt ey
eyt o 1O ety |l e ==, el § o enpoly werrarty Do i Dol ey
For & on behalt of 1 Cintonar's Siomiine L h Siummgey Pkl 5,342.40
= 1 F':unu leb(;l:l'l‘gl 'H;IFI'I-!ﬂI".t.T;I:h :;F'rh = E',aiﬁ.lﬂ GST 7_ﬂ'u‘ 373.97
| ' Labesit 3,296.00
| l { | EHairriali 0.00 Less 0. un
= | | LubricationFluid 0,00
| Dithhiers a,00 e .
B B S B Bl Amount Dug 5,7T16.37
PLEASE MAIL YOUR CHEQUE TO 2 Fm C‘RISEIH:’I‘. LEVEL .lﬂ INCHCAPE CENTHRE, SINGAPORE lm:-,
TO SECURTTY GUARD 3888817
DATE 16/01/2019
PLEASE ALLOW THE UNDERMENTIONED TmE 22:42

VEHICLE TO LEAVE THE COMPANY PREMISES.

vz scABSzEK @ Bomeo Motors
nchoops

SIGMATURE
CUSTOMER FOR BORNED MOTORS (SINGAPORE] FTE LTD



RENT-A-GAR TAX INVOICE

GST REG. NOL.; 20010627

INVOICE TO DATE INVOICE NO
KUA SENG TECK -Nov-2018 BMS 3640
BLK 361
CHOA CHU KANG AVENUE 2
k1523

SINGAPORE 69884

VHA NO DUE DATE VEH ND
BMS 3640 Mov=2010 SLO 553 R
DESCRIFTION NO. OF DAYS RATE AMOUNT
RENTAL FROM 26 NOVEMBER 2018 TO 30 NOVEMBER 2018 5 g3 4% 46729
YOUR REF. SCA SBME K
_F-"-'.-_.
2485 )T
L
(30 Nov 2018 ')
GST@ 7% §3271
TOTAL §500.00

Al chegues must be made payable ro BKW Rent A Car FPre Lid
Please write the vehicle and irvoice number on the reserve.

BKW Rent-A-Car Pte Ltd
120 Lower Delta Road #02-15 Candex Centra qS_} 169208 Tel: 6738 7777 Fax: 6738 6566

ACRA No: 2001062760 GST Reg No: 20-0106276-D  Website: www.bkw.sg == 5;%
A pubzidinry of BKW Automobile Pte Lid




nxw BKW RENT A CAR PTE LTD

120 Lower Defta Road #02-15 Cendex Eaﬂlre Singapore 168208 Tel: 6738 7777 Fax: 6271 1881
RENT-A-CAR ACRA Ne: 20-0108276-0 :.E‘rﬁeg Ne' 20-0106276-0 viano BMS 3640

| i ) ) 7171 24 HOURS HELPLINE : 6223 1122 28k
UEHIELE HIHING _AGREEMENT - Y ScABE

HIRER'S PARTICULARS (Loan Venicle No:SLAGA34R . RepaceVehNo B
name i) KUA SENG TECK Make & Mogel: TOYOTA PELT|E. (AutoManual) VR No -
MRIC/Passpart ha SI?IZ&B_'!"_ Date of Birn I6-12 IQE\S- I:HAHES o s
auiress. BLE 26! CHOA CHU KANGAVE3 .. 52 || T ZATB reon | 26T | o,

#5233 624884 , || o 95 43 o[ a6t |29
Same & Aodress of Employwr - WeeklyWorninty wosk 9% P e |
——— mﬁﬂrﬁ e S e ——
I Cceupaion Drving Exp 3. COWPAI L] Per dayMonihly i |
oy eoncato STIZEBIH o o0y, 23.05-19B5 || Getvery Catecton Sve .
DL Type: LocalfinVOmers . GST
I__TIF|'D'I " e q4 23 q-ra? J | on N = (A) SUB-TOTAL
DRIVER’'S PARTICULARS el Livel J U T —E ey |- e 3 =
: ¢/ J
Narne (a8 n IC] Swrtrargn | N .
NRIC/Passparn No Date of Hirth — F“T o 'm YREE w"m 1 ST ﬂ' 22 3
Address: Age Excaes mulnage s chargeable .
s y L cents per ko TOTAL GHAHE.ES] sop |00 )
Oy ganan = Rriving Exp: . e || Security Deposit : $ S msg - -,
Driving Leence N — Passed | Expiry Dt
B e et R || casuneTsmsagRiamexcHa N 5520 3800 1390 6633
— —l R n““']i*ﬁ& |.|:||1—|j 1D Mo B|6 J
[ k Mame as in Card @LEERT KUA -
VM WaITVES EXCH uovent o GET):§ 'ISOO ¢
ACCESSORIES l.':IiEGII.
iy O 57D Touls O Hub Cap (1 Radio { CO Cartridge

0 Jack 2 Tye Oponer () Petrol Cap < Spama Tyre

INDRCATE:

LR ]
0 - Dmran

§ - Samcres
N - Crséh

Signature Additional Driver's Signature

| have read and agrea 1o the lerms and ition on both s:des of thes agreement. If | have presented a charge/credit card for peyment. | agree thit I_JTBITI-DI.IM;

payable under this sgreemant and for parking and traffie infringemenis may ba billad to that account and my signature above will be considersd to have besn

Jnads cn ihe chargeicradil card voucher. All information | have been given BXKW Rent A Car Pie Lid in connection wilh this sgreameni (s tru-lr
" IMPOIRTANT

i b

DaloOut | TimeOw | Mileage Chook By Remarks

26”'3 090.5 | 2'75!3 EW|N o wThiivet Sagnature

Rotum Of Verecis The Hirer Dmear ts Reguirsd To Sign in The Coiumn “Signaturs Of Heer Drver Fading Wheeh The Day And Tima insoned Beicw Shal Be Desmed To Be The
Diary Andd Timee The iehicle i Rolurnga To BRW Hont A Car Ple Lig And The Same Shat Be Accepted As Conclushe Evidence Of The Saene And Ba Challenged O
Cusstioond On Aty Accoint Whitssewer And | had cleard my belonging foms fpam he rental vehicys {cashcand. parking coupons., eic)” ! j

__Datein |  Teneln Migage Chack By | [ 0V e faefns %-/y =N B

FTr.dlal! 1£2~ I ™oa o il = oA 20~



Invoice Page 1 of 2

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
GENERAL  RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
'"sumE 5 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
Phane: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
ASSOCIATION Operaling Hours Monday to Friday Sam to Spm

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE GST Registration No. M400017735

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Qur Rel No: GR-18-171385
Date of Requesl 05/11/2018 Your Ref No Online Purchase

Borneo Molors (S) Ple Lid
33 Leng Kee Road
Singapore 159086

Dear SirMadam,

Enguiry Date 05112018

Enquiry By Sitl Nabilah Binte Abdul Rahim

TP Vehicle No. GBF2637U

Accident Date 031172018

Enguiry Result

TP Vehicle No Insurer Period of Insurance Insurer Tel. Na.
GBF263TU Lonpac Insurance Bhd 17/08/2018-16/0812018 +65 82507388
Thank You

The mages provided 1o you are taken from the onginal reports forwarded to the centre by the members of the General Insurance
Association of Singapore and we take no responsibility for their accuracy of contents and shall be under no liabillty whatsoever for any
loss or damage arising oul of or in connection with the repos of their Images.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signalure
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