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Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 7 November, 2018 9:52 AM

To: 'GERALD POH WEE BIN'; assignments

Cc: 'MT_Claim_SG'; Admin A

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement(FC) - Accident Involving SCA8828K and GBF2637U DOA 

03/11/2018

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Completed

Categories: HMK

Dear Mr Gerald, 

 

Thank you for the assignment. 

 

Please be informed that vehicle currently not in the workshop, repairer will arrange. 
 

Best Regards, 

Catherine Chong | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN [mailto:geraldpoh@lonpac.com]  

Sent: Wednesday, 7 November, 2018 9:06 AM 

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Siti Nabilah PTCBC <Siti.Nabilah@inchcape.com.sg> 

Subject: FW: Direct Settlement(FC) - Accident Involving SCA8828K and GBF2637U DOA 03/11/2018 

 

Our Ref        : 18/18/18/VC05/021097 

 
Dear Catherine, 

 
Kindly proceed to survey and revert to them on liability. 
 

 
 

Best Regards 
Gerald Poh 
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 

 

From: Siti Nabilah PTCBC [mailto:Siti.Nabilah@inchcape.com.sg]  

Sent: Monday, 5 November, 2018 6:36 PM 
To: GERALD POH WEE BIN 

Cc: Siti Nabilah PTCBC 
Subject: Direct Settlement(FC) - Accident Involving SCA8828K and GBF2637U DOA 03/11/2018 

 

Hi, 
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Reference to the above-mentioned.    
   
Please find attached herein a copy of our client's Accident Report, Damaged Photos & Estimate Invoice for your kind 
perusal.  
   
As our client is claiming against your insured GBF2637U thus would appreciate if you could revert to us on the liability 
urgently or we could settle the case under Direct Settlement with Car Rental @ $150 per day x no. of days as 
recommended by your appointed surveyor.  
   
Kindly have your surveyor to contact our Motor Claim Assessor, Francis Cher @ 9847 6179 / 6631 1863 located at 
Inchcape Centre – No 2 Pandan Crescent / Level 4 for an appointment to inspect our client’s vehicle.   
   
As for liability clearance, kindly revert to this email.  
   
Your kind attention into the above is greatly appreciated.  
   
Thank you very much in advance! 

 

 

Best Regards, 

Nabilah 

TPR Team (Claims Accident Recovery Dpt) 
DID 6631 1874 | FAX 6872 7260  

Inchcape - Borneo Motors (S) Pte Ltd 
Office Address:  2 Pandan Crescent, Inchcape Centre Level 4, Singapore 128462 
www.borneomotors.com.sg  I  www.toyotasingapore.com.sg  
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This e-mail (and any attachment) is intended for the addressee(s) only and contains information that is legally privileged and confidential. If you are not the 

intended recipient, please be advised that you have received this e-mail in error and that any use, dissemination, distribution, printing or copying of this 

communication is unauthorized and strictly prohibited. Kindly notify us by replying to the sender’s e-mail address and delete this e-mail immediately. E-mail 

transmissions cannot be guaranteed to be secure or error-free as information could be intercepted, corrupted, lost, destroyed, delayed or incomplete, or could 

contain viruses. We therefore do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the contents of this e-mail which arise as a result of e-mail transmission, and 

you are advised to carry out your own virus checks and confirm the accuracy of the contents of this e-mail before relying on it for any purpose. 


