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51 URIAVE 1, 201-25 PAYA URL INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (65 62564115

Your Ref: D18007872MFSH Date: 13/11/2018
Our Ref: CS/FCI18020088/ Tt

The Motor Claims Department
First Capital Insurance Ltd

Dear Sir/Madam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO__SMC 107G
Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle

9/11/2018 at the premises of M/s Charm's Custom craft have the following to report: -

Waorkshop Estimate Amount 188 3281.4]

Revised Estimate Amount : S% 2.786.74

“Check” ltems Amount 1 S% -

Market Value : 5%

LTA Reimbursement Value : 5%

Nett Value : S8

Description of Damage: rear s
The vehicle sustained damages at the

Rear portion.

Comments/ Present Status:
Damages Consistent.

Yours faithfully
Taufikh
Automotive Assessor



Ms @ FirstCapital

& Raffles Quay #21-00 Singapore D48580
Tek (65] 6222 2311 Fax: [65) 6222 3547

M5 First Capital Insurance Limited o feg o 1550000000 GAT Reg. ho. A2 00016752

[laima & Moter Underwiiting Depu 36 Robinson Road #16-01 City House Singapore DEBETT

Tel: [E5) 6507 3848 Fax (65) 6507 3849
wwwi misfirstcapital.comasg

Date

Accident Date
Insured Vehicle
Survey Location
Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor
Contact Person

Contact Number,

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT
01-11-2018 Our Ref No.
30-10-2018 Claim Type.
SHC388BA Third Party Vehicle.

BLK 1010 BUKIT MERAH LANE 3 #01-105

SHARON LEE

62725429/ 0 Fax No.
DIRECT SETTLEMENT:

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

MA Fax No.

MA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

D18007872MFSH

Third Party

SMC107G

62736676

68416315

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop

Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

MIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

QHARNS Attention. MNIL
CUSTOMCRAFT

MNA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA
EILEEN LEE

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.

This is a computer generated letter, no signature required.

Memper of INSURANCE BROUP




Denise Taz (LKKAuto)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 13 November 2018 3:41 PM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto); 'CWS Motor Claims'; assignments
Cc ‘Eileen Lee’; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18007872MFSH/1
Attachments: PRELI ADVISED SMC 107G.pdf

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SMC 107G

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6256-3561 | emall: denisetay @ |kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Bk 51, Paya Uhbi industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 7 November 2018 10:52 AM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com=
Cc: 'Eileen Lee' <EileenLee@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18007872MFSH/1

Dear Sir / Madam,

Thank you for the assignment.
Please be informed that vehicle currently not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

Best Regards,

Catherine Chong | Admin

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8494 | email; assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: b256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 8(4080933)

From: CWS Motor Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 7 November, 2018 10:45 AM

To: ASSIGNMENTS @ LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Eileen Lee <EileenLee@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18007872M FSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.



Denise TaI (LKKAuto)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 15 January 2019 11:32 AM
To: 'Charn’s Customcraft'

Subject: RE: check vehicle status

Dear Sharon,

Confirm total: $2786.74 (b4 GST), 3days.

Please submit all relevant documents to first capital insurance.

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@|kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Charn's Customcraft <charns@singnet.com.sg>
sent: Monday, 14 January 2019 4:02 PM

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@|kkauto.com=
subject: RE: check vehicle status

Importance: High

Hi Denis
Kindly refer to the attached for finalization.

Thanks & Repgards.

Sharon Lee

Charn's Customeraft

Tel: 6272 5429 Fax: 6273 6676
Email: charns(@singnet.com.sg
GST Reg. No: M90367863L
Company Reg No: 25151300M

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) [mailto:denisetay@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Monday, 14 January, 2019 3:58 PM

To: Charn's Customcraft

Subject: check vehicle status

Dear All,
Can check for me for the following vehicle:

sJU 2810L - DOA: 14/11/2018 FIRST CAPITAL
SMC 107G - DOA: 30/12/2018 FIRST CAPITAL
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made different

Certificate of Insurance

MOTOR VEHICLES [THIRD PARTY RISKS AND COMPENSATION| ACT (CHAPTER 183)
MOTOR VEHICLES (THIRD PARTY RISKS AND COMPENSATION) RULES, 1960

ROAD TRANSPORT ACT, 1987 (MALAYSIA)

MOTOR VEHICLES (THIRD PARTY RISKS) RULES, 1959 [MALAYSIA)

Certificate Number: 5102572471 Cover : drivo PREMIUM
1. Index mark and Registration Number of Vehicle SMC107G
Chassis Number CYWIMV2EHDI2450253
2. Name of Policyholder + TAN CHEE FLI
3. Effective Date of Insurance . 2B Aug 2018
4, Expiry Date of insurance 27 Aug 2019
5. Persons or Classes of Persons entitled to drive#

{a] The Policyholder.
k) Any other person whao is driving on the Policyholder's order or with his/her permission

the Mator Vehicle or has been so permitted and is not disqualified by order of 3 Court af Law or by reason of any
enactment or regulation in that behalf from driving the Moter Vehicle
B, Limitations as to Use#
(a] Use for social domestic and pleasure purposes and in connection with the Policyholder's business or profession.
This Policy does not cover
{a} Use for hire or reward.
b} Use for racing, pace-making, reliability trial or speed-testing.
{c] Use for the carriage of goods (other than samples) in connection with any trade or business.
[d} Use for any purpose in connection with the Motor Trade.
# Limitations rendered inoperative by Section & of the Motor Vehicle (Third Party Risks and Compensation)
Act {Chapter 189) and Section 95 of the Road Transport Act, 1387 [Malaysia), are not to be included under these

Frovided that the person driving is permitted in accordance with the licensing or gther laws or regulations to drive

headings.
EXCESS (SECTION 1) ;55600
EXCESS [SECTION 2) L NSA
WINDSCREEM EXCESS : 855100
ADDITIONAL EXCESS L NSA
UNNAMED DRIVER EXCESS PLEASE REFER OVERLEAF
REPAIR AT OWNER'S PREFERRED WORKSHOP YES
INSURE WITH COE . NO
NCD PROTECTION : NO
TRANSPORT ALLOWANCE : YES
EXCESS WAIVER : NOD
PRINMARY DRIVER + TAMN CHEE FUI
MAMED DRIVER (1) . KWAN KAH YIN
NAMED DRIVER (2] © NJA
HIRE PURCHASE COMPANY © MAYBANK
SUM INSURED . MARKET VALUE OF INSURED VEHICLE LESS RESIDUAL COE/PARF

WALUE AT TIME OF LOSS

wvehicles (Third Party Risks and Compensation} Act (Chapter 189 and Part IV of the Road Transport Act? 1987 (Malaysia)

Agency - TIMES IN5 BROKERS (MOTOR BUSINESS) (00000690643)
Date of Issue : DB Aug 2018 18:13 brs

For NTUC INCOME INSURANCE CO-OPERATIVE LIMITED

1 %y‘% /

Countersigned By:

authorised Officer Chief Executive

I/We hereby Certify that the Poliey to which this Certificate relates is issued in accordance with the provisions of the Motor




/NG LICENCE AEPUBLIC OF SINGAPORE
T DENTITY CARD NO $1195221F
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02M1/2018

> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Crwner 1D Type:

Cwner 10:

Vehicle Details

Wehicle No,:

Wehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Viehicle Make:

Vehicle Maodel:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine Mo

Chassis Na.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expary Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date;

COE Category:

COE Period(Years);

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

The infarmation contained herein is correct as at 02 Moy 2018

PARF/COE Rebate Enguiry

Singapore NRIC
4534

SMC 107G

hL=H

30MNov 2018
VOLVD

VADTZ (A

Silver

2017
B4154T52119181
YWIMVZBHD) 2450253
F0.0 kW (120 bhp)
$23,535.00

28 Aug 2017

28 Aug 2017

0

$19.942.00

Yes
27 Aug 2027
%14 941.00

27 Aug 2027

A -Carup to 1600cc & F7kW {130bhp)
10

42 900,00

$34,320.00

$49.261.00

TVILRS L iLd, Qav, SQAlaryrrd Crionienguinrenate oy FUDNCDEIDNEEr2Qonpul /r WL | ILN_IUSrU3usuus |



PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
Vehicle Owner Particulars
Cwner ID Type:

Crwner 10k

Wehicle Details

Wehicle No.:

‘Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date;
Vehicle Make:

Wehicle Modei:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine Mo,;

Chassis Mo.:

Maximum Power Cutput:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date;
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount;
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date;

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

P Paid:

COE Rebate Amount;

Total Rebate Amount:

The information contained herein is correct as at 05 Nov 2018

Singapore NRIC
35336

SKZ308%H

Yes

30Mov 2018

MAZDA

MAZDAS 4-DOOR SEDAM 2,50 SPAEAT SR LED
Blue

2015

PY20705085
IMAGI1032GO2292846
141.0kW (189 bhp)
$23,566.00

18 Jan 2014

18 Jan 2016

o

$24,993.00

Yes
17 lan 2024
$18,744.00

17 Jan 2024

E - Open Category
10

$60,003.00
$42.774.00
$61,518.00

OK

https://vrl.lta.gov.sg/Ita/vrl/action/enquireRebate By PublicBeforeDereglnput ?FUNCTION [D=F03...

Page 1 of |

05/11/2018
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BLOCK 1010, EU'(IT MERAH LAME 3., #1
BLOCE 1008, BUKIT MERAH LANE "'I #I." F? ‘“I"JGP-I-DW': 158723

Ty / TEL: B2717054. 62733304 FAX: G2TISETE E}ﬂ#m charns@singnet.com.sg
hll(hP({QHCJRSEA} Bus. Aeg. No. 251513008
DOA: 30/10/2018/@ 1930

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE PTE LTD 05/11/2018

ATTN: THE MOTOR CLAIMS DEPT

THIRD PARTY CLAIM

ESTIMATE COST OF REPAIR FOR VEHICLE NO:
SMC 107 G - VOLVO V40 T2 (A)

CHASSIS NO: YVIMV28HO0J2450253

I pe Rear bumper §  1.566.30 AL
| pe rear bumper reflector LH § 102,50 euk
1 pe Rear bumper lower garnish 5 522.60 A&~
I pc Rear bumper lower garnish sensor LH S 215.70 "
$ 2.407.10
LESS 5% $ 120.36
$ 228674
Remove necessary parts: jacking. panel beating, repair
and straighten rear inner panel, rear end panel and =D
rear bumper. $ 380.00
Putty and respray rear inner panel. rear end panel and S
rear bumper. 5 40000 <~
§  3.066.74
ADD 7% GST S 214.67
$ 328141
Note: The above is an estimate only. IF other parts requested
during the course of repair, we will inform you accordingly.
1
All partsrare subject to availability. ! ™ cv«)i-l‘-"-- 245714
| W
CHARN'S CUSTOMCRAFT -:\ i

!

Y B ‘” ( N:J i d Ls’;{-m

AP SRR ¥ RN pyeprerye

mm -

-

“"?m'fwﬁj_s




Accident Claim Repair, Corrosion Welding, Body Dent Repalrs,
Spray-Painting, Mechanical Repalr And Cusfomizing of Cars
BLOCK 1010, BUKIT MERAH LANE 3, #01-105, SINGAPORE 159724
BLOCK 1009, BUKIT MERAH LANE 3, #01-82, SINGAPORE 158723
TEL: 82717054, 62733304 FAX: B2TIBETH EMAIL: charns@singnat.com.sg

Bus. Reg, No. 25151300

NTUC/F C{SHCBEBB&}
DOA: 30/10/2018(@ 1930

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE PTE LTD 05/11/2018

ATTN: THE MOTOR CLAIMS DEPT

THIRD PARTY CLAIM
ESTIMATE COST OF REPAIR FOR VEHICLE NO:
18MC 107 G = VOLVO V40 T2 (A)

CHASSIS NO: YVIMV28H0J2450253

1pe Rear bumper $  1,566.30 AL
1 pe rear bumper reflector LH $ 102.50 st
1 pe Rear bumper lower garnish $ 522.60 A2~
1 pe Rear bumper lower garnish sensor LH $ 215.70 sy~
$ 2,407.10
LESS 5% b 120.36 ,
$ 228674
Remove necessary parts: jacking, panel beating, repair
and straighten rear inner panel, rear end panel and 95D
rear bumper. $ 380.00
Putty and respray rear inner panel, rear end panel and o
rear bumper. § 40000 %>
$ 3,066.74
ADD 7% GST $ 214.67
$ 3,28141
Note: The above is an estimate only. IF other parts requested
during the course of repair, we will inform you accordingly.
bject to availability. T 5 9 Hq <™ 1
Twp’

(150 reeopn

parts ™ 71 gjé.r.u:. | @ VC%‘R -

550 !
Wy gu v @ ((handd Go e

¥ ‘—"ga(i};.




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408033

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: B256 4315

Reg. Mo: 199607198R GS5T Reg. No. 19-0607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

38 ROBINSON ROAD

#16-01 CITY HOUSESINGAPORE 06BBT7

Ref CS/FCIB020028/T1tbn2

Data : 16-01-2019

MR

Code . FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHC 38884 Veh. Inspected SMC 107G
Policy No. Coverage (3) 0.00
Claim No. D18007872MFSH Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From EILEEN Assign Date o7M1/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Gondition
Make & Model VOLVO Va0 C.C 1458
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2017
Chassis No. YA MY2ZBHOI2450253 Calour SILVER
Odometer Stearing IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOoD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |205/55 R16 MICHELIN 6 mm
L/H Front Tyre |205/55 R16 MICHELIN & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |205/55 R16 MICHELIM & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |205/55 R16 MICHELIN & mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  30/10/2018 |Inspection Date 09/11/2018
Survey held at CHARN'S CUSTOMCRAFT
BLK 1010 BUKIT MERAH LANE 3
#01-105
SINGAPORE 159724
5a. Remarks
A)DAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
BJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS,

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL FERIOD FOR REPAIR: 3 Working Days




' /d /4

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Bl BE B 51 Ubi Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park. Singapore 408933
PP e TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 19960T198R GST Reg. Mo, 19-9807198-R Page Mo.:1 of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO., SMC 107G
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Description of Parts Condition .
it P Workshop ($))|  (5)
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR BUMPER DEFORMED 1,566.30 1,566.30
1|REAR BUMPER REFLECTOR LH cuT 102.50 102.50
1|REAR BUMPER LOWER GARNISH DEFORMED 522 60 522 60
1|REAR BUMPER LOWER GARNISH SENSOR LH DISTORTED 215.70 215.70
LESS 5% DISCOUNT -120.36 -120.36
2.286.74 2.286.74
LABOUR
REMOVE NECESSARY PARTS.JACKING, PANEL 380.00 250.00
BEATING, REPAIR AND STRAIGHTEN REAR INNER
PANEL,REAR END PANEL AND REAR BUMPER.
PUTTY AND RESPRAY REAR INNER PANEL REAR END 400.00 250.00
PAMEL AND REAR BUMPER.
780.00 500.00
GRAND TOTAL 3,066.74 2,786.74
[ RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS | T [ 278674

Report Ref No, CS/FCI18020098/T1tbn2

M .

MOHAMAD TAUFIKH

M.MATAI, AMSAE-A

Automotive Assessor

ADRIAN LING WAI PING

B.Eng AMSOE, AMIRTE AMSAE-A M.MATAI

Licensed Appralser

HSCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is made solely for the uwse and benefit of the Client named an the ronl page of this Report.




