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' P P LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

v 51 Libi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
- TEL 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No 199607198R GST Reg No. 19-9507198-R
Affilisted to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automabile
EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD Ret : CCEEQIB020044/AML3
ATy AR
#17-00 TOWER BLOCK Date : 05-11-2018
MND COMPLEXSINGAPORE 069110
Code: EQI
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh, YL 20550 Veh. Inspected SGR B1887
Policy No. Coverage (§) 0.00
Claim No. Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 05/11/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.c o
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No, Colour
Odometer - Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4, Description of Damages
6. [ General Information
Accident Date  31/10/2018 Inspection Date o7/11/2018

Survey held at FREMIUM CARZ SERVICES FTE LTD

1 KAKI BUKIT AVE 6
#01-80 AUTOBAY (@ KAK| BUKIT
SINGAPORE 417883

5a. Remarks

AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
BjIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS




> Hack to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Owoer 1D Type: Singapore NRIC
Cwner (D 38812
R R e e
Vehicle No SGRP1I99Z
Viehicle to be Exported: Yes
Intended Deregistration Date 08 Nov 2018
Vehicle Make TOYOTA
Vehicle Model: COROLLAAXIO 15X A
Frimary Colour; Blue
Manufacturing Year 2008
Engine No.: INZD335100
Chassis No. NZE1416110662
Maximum Power Output; B1.0 kW {108 bhp)
Cpen Market Value 514.780.00
Original Registration Date 08 Feb 2010
First Registration Date 08 Feb 2010
Transter Count 1]
Actual ARF Paid; £14.780.00
T T 3T — S ——— |
PARF Eligibility: Yes
FPARF Eligibility Expiry Date: 07 Feb 2020
PARF Rebate Amount: £9.229.00
0T 5 ] 2 £ T 3000000000500 S S |
COE Expiry Date 07 Feb 2020
COE Category A = Car [1600cc & below)
COE Period([Years): 10
QP Paid 519.989.00
COE Rebate Amount: $24%5.00
Total Rebate Amount $11.724.00

The information contained herein |s correct as at 08 Nov 2018

OK
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Premium Carz
ot Pre L

C2 Aeg Mo J0TEIETIOC
1wkl Bukd Ave 8 #O1-80 Autshay @kl Bukit Singapore 417883
Tel &E38 9100 Fer &4 9112
Letter of Authority
Date: | [ 11/>01%

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SGEAME  anp YL 205el oy _3i|io|22ty
ALDONG Yie criw €nad, gon?

To Whom It May Concemn

This is to cartify that |, QGian anr 0Jo Anand 5;;:15}1 NRIC/Passpon No:
SIFYISHZ contactho: 1494 §214 m-mrnivﬂﬂdnﬂf\:
SGRAIRAZ  nereby authorize_Susinderpal Shyh S/0 (gicch

Mo 1o

] Drive the above stated vehicle;

i) Collect the vehicle upon completion of repair
The authority given herein shall be irrevocabie unless notice of revocation is given 1o us
Thank you

Yours sincerely,

P
F

L
I&T‘I’lﬁ Signature)




Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

From: Janet Tan <janet tan@eqinsurance.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, @ November 2018 933 AM

To: Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A; Poh Kin (LEKAuUtO)

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Acoident Involving YL2055U (Ol - EQI - DM18HO02985/1T) AND
SGRIT199Z (TP : LKK REF - CC6/EQI18020044/f03) on 31.10.2018

Attachments: EQIC-MARSO0002931-YL2055U-GlA PDF; TP GIA REPORT.PDF

Dear Shu Pai

Ol repart as attached,

Regards,

Janet Tan
Senior Executive | Claims

eqnsuranc

EQ Insurance Company Limited

5 Maxwell Road #17-00 Tower Block MND Complex Singapore 069110
did 65 5496 9032 | tel 65 6223 9433 ext 032 | fax 65 6223 4190

WiWwW Bgingurance. com.sg

h.\ - - B _ e

Privifeged/Canfidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sem

From: Janet Tan

Sent: Wednesday, November 7, 2018 9:03 AM

To: "Shu Pel [LKKAuUto)' <shupei@lkkauto.com>

Ce: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Poh Kin (LKKAuto) <pohkin@lkkauto.coms

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving YL2055U (O] : EQI - TBA) AND SGR91997 (TP : LKK REF -
CCe/EQI1B020044/fb3) on 31.10.2018

Dear Shu Pei
Our insured has yat to report.
We are fallowing up on nan reporting

Regards,

Janet Tan



Senior Executive | Claims

eq

EQ Insurance Company Limited

5 Maxwell Road #17-00 Tower Block MND Complex Singapore 069110

did 65 6496 9032 | tel 65 6223 9433 ext 032 | fax 65 6223 4190

WWW . eqInsurance.com.sg .
NPT i

L

Privileged/Canfidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sen

From: Shu Pel (LKKAuto) [mailto shupel@|kkauto cam|

Sent: Monday, November 5, 2018 6:01 PM

To: Janet Tan <janet tan @ eqinsurance com. sg>

Cc: Admin A <idmin-ai@lkkauto.com>; Poh Kin (LKKAuto) <pohkin@@lkkauto com>

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving YL2055U (OI : EQY - TBA) AND SGR9199Z (TP . LKK REF -
CCH/EQILBO20044/fb3) on 31.10.2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir / Madam,
Wae refer to the above matter.

We have received a new assignment from M/s Premium Carz Services Pte Ltd and TP repairer proposed for a
direct settlement.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
TP's GIA report

Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.
Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge s Poh Kin and he can be contacted at DID: 6841-2132,

Thank you.

Best Regards

Shu Pei| Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6366-D055 | emall: shupei #lkbauto.com | foc B741-4108
Bl 53, Faya Ubi Industrial Park, Uty Avenue |, #02-25 | 5(408933)



Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

e

From: Aunteng <aunteng@premiumcarz.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 20 November 2018 9:32 AM

To: Poh Kin [LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: New!! Accident involving SGR9199Z & YL2055U on 31/10/2018 ***LKK
REF:.CCB/EQITB020044 /b3

Categories: clear

Hi Poh Kin

Refer to our tele-conversation on 13/11/2018.
We have yet to hear from your good self advising us on the liability.

Please revert with offer on the liability or otherwise so that we can advise our client on the next course of
action.

Regards

Aun Teng

Premium Carz Services Pte Ltd
Tel: 6636 9100 Fax: 6636 9113
1 Kaki Bukit Avenue b

#01-90 Autobay@Kaki Bukit
Singapore 417883

From: Poh Kin (LKKAuto) <pohkin@|kkauto.com>

Sent; 13 November 2018 D9:58:26

To: Aunteng

Subject: RE: New!! Accident involving SGR91992 & YL2055U on 31/10/2018 ***LKK REF:CC6/EQI18020044/fb3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Our Ref: CC6/EQI18020044/fb3
Your Ref: 5GR 91952

Dear Aun Teng,
We refer to the above matter.
Please be informed that basing on the accident statements submitted by both party, the liability is unclear

for the above mentioned case. There is no conclusive evidence yet to substantiate either party's version.
Below Is a copy of our insured's accident report statement for your perusal.

We are in a course of investigating into the circumstances of the accident. After verifying further with our
0l we will revert with our opinion on the cause of the accident. Kindly do not refer to any party for legal
assistance until you heard further from us.



Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

From: Poh Kin (LKKAUt)

Sent: Wednesday, 7 November 2018 4:21 PM

To: ‘Aunteng’

Subject: RE: New!! Accident involving SGR9199Z & YL2055U on 31/10/2018 ***LKK

REF:CCB/EQI1BD20044/b3

Importance: High

Our Ref: CC6/EQI18020044/fb3
Your Ref: SGR 91992

Dear Aun Teng,
Please be informed that our insured has yet lodge the accident report.
Our principal are following up on non reporting.

Shall revert to you once our principal revert to us.

“Kindly note that this negotlation between parties on this matter Is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole
intention of resalving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability,
whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially
affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation
terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,
Poh Kin, Chong (Mr) | Case Handler
LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2192 | email: pohking lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

- ==
RER SN S the Earth Print only when necassary

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged matenal, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribubon by an
umintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mall in eror, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delste the e-mall and all attechments, including any copiles thereaf, and Inform the
sender thal you have deleled the e-mail, all attachments and any coples thereof. Thank you

From: Aunteng [mailto:aunteng@premiumcarz.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 7 November 2018 4:15 PM

To: Poh Kin (LKKAuto) <pohkin@|kkauto.com:

Subject: Re: New|| Accident involving SGR91997 & ¥L2055U on 31/10/2018 ***LKK REF:CC6/EQI18020044/fb3

Hi Poh Kin

Refer to the above matter.



Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

e eeeeeeerrrnrnrnroononenekMheM#ovrenononmeen oo e ——————

From: Poh Kin [LKKAuUto)

Sent: Tuesday, 13 November 2018 9:58 AM

To: ‘Aunteng’

Subject: RE: New!! Accident involving SGR9199Z & YL2055U on 31/10/2018 ***LKK
REF:CCB/EQI18020044/fb3

Attachments: Ol sketch plan+ statement.pdf

Importance: High

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Our Ref: CCB/EQI1B020044/(b3
Your Ref: SGR9199Z

Dear Aun Teng,
We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that basing on the accident statements submitted by both party, the liability is unclear
for the above mentioned case. There is no conclusive evidence yet to substantiate either party's version.
Below is a copy of our insured's accident report statement for your perusal.

We are in a course of investigating into the circumstances of the accident. After verifying further with our
01 we will revert with our opinion on the cause of the accident. Kindly do not refer to any party for legal
assistance until you heard further from us.

Meanwhile, we would like to request the CCTV footage / accident scene photos / evidence in order to seek

further instruction from our principal.

Thank you.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole
Intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liabllity,
whatsoever, should be deemed [ inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsaquently produced by either party that will materially
affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation
terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Poh Kin, Chong (Mr) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phome: 6841-2132 | email; pohking |kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)
¥ ESES

= gt .

SLERER = Sve the Earthe Primt only when necessary:

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged matenal, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient, Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you belleve that you received this e-mall in ermor, please do nol



Cecilia Chuna (LKK Auto)

From: Aunteng <aunteng@premiumcarz.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 24 October 2019 3:52 PM

To: Cecilla Chong (LKK Auto)

Subject: Re: Your ref. CC6/EQI18020044/fb3  Our ref: 0347/SGR9199Z/TP/PC/1118
Dear Cecilia

We confirm acceptance to conclude claim at all-in $1,307.45.
Please expedite with DV for our endorsement and submission of final bill.

Please note that this settlement herein Is strictly in relation to 3rd party property damage claim and is
without prejudice to personal injuries claim,

Regards

Aun Teng

Premium Carz Services Pte Ltd
Tel: 6636 9100 Fax: 6636 9113
1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6

#01-90 Autobay@Kaki Bukit
Singapore 417883

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@Ilkkauto.com>

Sent: 24 October 2019 15:00

To: Aunteng <aunteng@premiumcarz.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Your ref: CC6/EQI18020044/fb3 Our ref; 0347/5GR9199Z/TP/PC/1118

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Aunteng,

We are pleased to offer total amount of 51,307.45 (all-in).
Kindly confirm acceptance.

Thanks

“Please note that our above settlement is made on a without prejudice basis, and should not be construed as an admission of liabllity on our
part or on the part of our insured/driver. Terms of such settlement should also not be disclosed In any ather related matter{s) In respect of the
accident. Our offer made in respect of this present matter is made salely to resolve this matter on ly. No reference shall be made to this offer
or any settlement arising from this offer in any other related matters.

Settlement and payment are subject to production of ariginal decuments on demand at any time and execution of Discharge Voucher (for
settlement sum above 520,000/-) by the Plaintif/Claimant. Further all original documents shall be retained by us after we have made payment
on the settlement sum."

Best Regurds,



= — > S
- ]
Premium Carz
Svrvices Pre Lid
Co. Reg Mo 201416720
| bk Bk Ave & #0180 Autobeyid Kuki Bukit Singapors 4] TRED
el  B6ISOI0N Fax - 6636 ¥11]

Date s 29/11°2018

Your Ref: CC6/EQI1B020044/fb3
Our Ref : 0347/5GR9199Z/TP/PC/1118

EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD
5 Maxwell Road

#17-00 MND Complex

Singapore 069110

Attn : Motor Claims Dept.

Dear Sir/Madam

A INVOLVIN /10/2018 A
KANG ROAD

We refer to the above accident.

The accident was caused solely by the negligence of your insured and as a result, we had
incurred the following Costs and Losses: -

Costs of Repair (Lump Sum) £2,400.00
Loss of Use (4 days at $60/day) § 240,00
LTA TP Search Fee § 745
Claimed Amount $2.647.45
Enclosed are the supporting documents for your perusal:

1. Invoice SGR9199Y

2. LTA Tax Invoice/Receipt

3. GIA Repon for SGR9199Y

4. Police Report

5. Cenificate of Insurance

6. Letter of Authority and Indemnity

7. Letter of Authority

Please let us hear from vou within the next 14 days.

Yours faithfull .

PREMIUM CARZ SERVICES PTE LTD




-' -- e - Consunants
Sl B A B Ple Lrd

SUBEAVE L #0025 PAYA UHLISDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (063) A2563361 FAX @ (065) 62564315

Our Ref: CCO/EQIIE020044/Afb3
20™ November 2018

BROADWAY TRANSPORTATION & LEASING CENTRE
766 Bedok Reservoir View

#07-249 Longvale

Smgapore 470766,

Attn: Mr Tan Kok Kam
Dear Sir'fMadam,

ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING YL 2055U AND SGR 9199Z ALONG
Y10 CHU KANG ROAD ON 31.10.2018

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for EQ INSURANCE COMPANY
LIMITED to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto
Insurance policy taken up with them.

Pursuant 1o the above said accident wherein you and/or your authorized driver had amongst
other information given us your version of how the accident had occurred, we as the
appointed agent of your insurers shall proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with
third party claimant,

If you have evidence/information to proof that we should not settle the third party claim,
kindly let us have them in writing within the next 10 days by 30/11/201R, afier we shall
proceed with negotiation with Third Party claimant on the without prejudice basis and any
settlement should not bind any claims whatsoever by yow'your driver against the other
party’s isurer arising from this particular accident.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by
30% (20% for commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim,
However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this claim
and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further quernes.

Yours faithfully,

l |
|: F
Poh Kin, Chong
Case Handler

DID: 684] 2132
FAX: 6741 4108

Email: vicalpehi@lkkauto.com

e EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LIMITED
fMotor Claims Dept)
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Premium Carz

™ Lad

Co Reg Ne 201418720C
1 kak Bunif Aww & #0160 Autcbay @kan Buklt Smgapoie 41788)
Tel BEME G100 Fan 88369113

LETTER OF AUTHORITY AND INDEMNITY

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE No. SGR Q1412 anp  JL2USS5U
ATIALONG MU cHU kbt D

ON

£ pAY CCToBEA MONTH 2015 yEAR

L]

(4

by

FWe. the omner of sehicle no Eﬁm ﬂq% hereby instruct and suthorite vou 1 commence
repanr 0 the sod vohicles

You are funther suthorsed W appoint solictions on mylour behall and give the soliciions i
instrictiones an i the appointment are given by mefus with respect 10 the condugt of myfour eluims
againest urd party dnver andfor his msurers including if nocessary, o commence legal proceedings m
Casart v S nume against the 1hand purty

YVour have mvfour full suthority to istruct pvdowr solicilons 1o pegotiote o settlement with the thisd
piarty mrdior hus issurers on mich b s vou deem L Upon settiement of my claim, you
avithonered 1o sign any [hscharge Yoocher or any docoment fo confirm my scceptance of the settlemeni
2 ull and firal discharge of my claim, on my behalf

Lty resalving mafowr clisim, vou are suthorized Lo agree with mviour solicitors on the amount of their
professional cos and disbursements for scung for me/us and to relieve payment of the halance of the
selthenment sum on vy /o belall derectly inlo your sccount.

In the ovent that, we amisre requined to sttend ot mylour sobicitors” office or o ottend court in
commection 1o my/four claun, Twe shall render full co-operation.

In the event that mmviour claom agmmst the thand party anddor his msurers s Not sucoessful or canmol be
proceeded with, Vwe suthorized you to make a claim against myfour own insurers for the cost of
ropuirs prad any other josses recoverable under mylour policy of insurance. In this respects, Lwe
undierstand snd acoept el the excem mnount sppheable under the policy of msurance shall be bome
by mefus. Uoe shall also be persosally Lable 10 bear all legal cost incurred by you in clabming bock fof
Ihe repair cost by vour Salicilons,

I for whatever reasons, my/our insurers reject my/our claim for indemnaty for the com of repairs and/on
any Jouses recoveralbile under the palicy of memamce or make any offer 1o poy lews than the amounl
clabmed by vou Vwe agroe 1o udentake 1o pay the full smount of your repair bill snd survey fees and
any other experses ressonably ineurmred on myiour behall or to pay you the difference in smount, as the
case may be

Uwee husve ressd il undersiand the above satement und agroad

Dated this | day povembe month_ 2OlY year

Signature oa {on
Name GianKawr /o Anand Sital | Company Stamp
NRIC/ROC No. S 15433312 o
Address Blk. 143C Langasial-

Ciescant , g OF-4F

Swapei- Hu3rql,
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Services Pre Lad

[ Premium Carz ( INVOICE: 0347 ]

Co Reg No.: 201416720C

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 8 #01-90 Autobay@Kaki Bukit Singapors 417883
Tel BE3S 9100 Fax: 6838 9113

Date : 29/11/2018

Bill Te

Insurance Company Ltd
5 Maxwell Road
#17-00 MND Complex
Singapore 069110

Our Customer

Name  : Gian Kaur /O Anand Singh Vehicle No : SGRI199Z

ICNo. : S1B43881Z Date of Accident : 31/10/2018

Address : Blk 293C Compassvale Crescent Model : Toyota Axio
#0747

Singapore 543293

| To supply labour and materials 1o repair the above-mentioned 1 - $2,400.00
vehicle to its pre-accident condition (Lump Sum)
TOTAL| $2,400.00

For Premium Carz Services Pie Lid

* All cheque should be crossed and make payable to "Premium Carz Services Pte Lid"



11112018 Fleceipt
' > Back to OneMotoring

Land Transport $ Authority

Land Tranuport Authory
10 Sin Ming Drve
Singapors 5TSTDY
GST Aegwiation No_ - MA-D00BS25-2
Print Dale/Time : 01 Nov 2018/ 15:06:18

Receipt Date/Tima - 01 Mov 2018 / 15:08:18

Tax Invoice/Receipt
Rscaipt No.  ITNET-00000-181101-001548
Previous Receipt Mo
8N Iterm Description/ Amount Gs5T Amount
Businass Transaction Referance Befors Amount Afer GST
Hao. GST (55) {s8) (5%)

Result of Ingurance Enquiry - YL20550U
As at 31 Ocl 2018/16.45:00
Insurance Co: EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD

1 Insuance Enquiry - YL 20550
Engquiry Fes T.00 049 Ta40

MNBNONSEIA24 1855

Sub-Total T.00 048 TA9
Total Bators Rounding T.00 CAR TAG
Rounding Differance 0.04
Total Ameunt Payabls TAS
Faid By
Direct Dobit: eNETS Debin
non TAS
FETIONIS0S40TIT 0 Banking)
Total Ta5
Cash Changs 0.00
Tendersd Amount TAS
Excess Refungabls Amount o.oe
THANK YOU AND HAVE A NICE DAY

Please ansurs that all paymants 1o tha Autharity ars good and promplly sattled by the paymant service
provider | inancial institution. Dtherwise, the transaction and recsipt is considered volid and lats fas
may spply.

TVELEHR o 5 s g+ 5 i 9 P ST 5 0% 147 0 e W | B i Bt 4 8

n



Company Asgistration Mo, 1898071980

L1 LB AVE |, U228 PAVA UILINDUSTRIAL PARK. SINGAIMORE 408933 TEL : (65} 62563561 FAX : (65) 62581315

To : M/s EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD

Date: 11/11/2018

THIRD PARTY DIRECT SETTLEMENT

) ¥L 20550 (Insd Veh) |Your Rel. No. : DM1BHO02589/JT
SR SGR 91982 (TP Veh) |Our Ref. No. - CCB/EQI18020044/Agbda2
Date of Accident 3110/2018 -

Liability 50% -
Final Repair Cost 5 ‘150_!:!{]_ o —
Loss of Use |8 100.00 4 days
Rental (ifany)  |'$ days )
Others: s 745] -
— . s —
1,307.45
Final Settlement Sum |: § 1,307 45

Remarks

Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown

1) [PREMIUM CARZ SERVICES PTE LTD

1,307.45

JOANNE LEE

LKK Auto Consultants Pie Lid
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park. Singapore 408833

TEL

6258 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 198607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9807198-R

Afflliated to Federation Internationale Des Exports En Automoblle

EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD Refl CCE/EQI1B020044/Agb3q2
100 TONER B HIHE
#17-00 TOWER BLOCK Date: 11-11-2018
MND COMPLEXSINGAPORE 089110
Code: EQI
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh, YL 2055U Veh. Inspected SGR 91992
Policy No. DMCHHQ18-000030 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. DM18HO02999/JT Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 0711172018
2 Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTA AXIO c.c 1408
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2010
Chassis No. NZE1416110662 Colour BLUE
Odometer 168438 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Maodification SPORTS RIM
General GOOD
Lk Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |195/65R15 YOKOHAMA, 6 mm
L/H Front Tyre |195/85R15 YOKOHAMA 8 mm
R/H Rear Tyre [195/85R15 YOKOHAMA 6 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |195/85R15 YOKOHAMA 6 mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE N/S BODY,
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS,
5. General Information
Accident Date  31/10/2018 Inspection Date a7n1/2018
Survey held at PREMIUM CARZ SERVICES PTE LTD
1 KAKI BUKIT AVE 6
# 01-90 AUTOBAY @ KAKI BUKIT
SINGAPORE 417883
5a. Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS,
B)IN ACCORDAMNCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5h. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 4 Working Days
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

TEL 6258 15681 FAX: 6256 4315

51 Ukl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408833

Reg. No: 198607198R GST Reg. Mo, 18-5607198-R Page No. 1 of 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SGR 91992
aQ Description of Parts Condition | Estimate By | Our Adjusted
v . P Workshop ()| ($)
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT DOQR LH (NPA) TO REPAIR SEE
LABOUR
1|FRONT FENDER LH TO REPAIR SEE 608 B0
LABOUR
1|FRONT FENDER LINING LH NOT NECESSARY 167.60 -
1|FRONT FENDER SIGNAL LAMP LH (NPA) WNOT NECESSARY -
1|SIDE MIRROR ASSY LH CRACKED 1,014.77 a872.00
1|FRONT BUMPER DEFORMED 452 89 452 99
1|FRONT BUMPER SIDE RETAINER LH NECESSARY 51.04 51,84
1IHEADLAMP LH cuT 756.62 B46.00
LESS 258% DISCOUNT -785.68 -530.73
2.357.04 1,502.20
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
10|FRONT FENDER LINING @$5.00 (SN) NOT MECESSARY 50.00
10|FRONT BUMPER CLIP @$5.00 (SN) NECESSARY &0.00 30.00
1|SPORTS RIM (SN} cuTt 350.00 350.00
450.00 380.00
LABOUR
TO CHECK WIRING. B80.00 30.00
PANEL BEATING CHARGES TD REMOVE AND 800.00 400.00
REPLACE ,TO CUT AND WELD ,TO KNOCK AND
RESHAPE DAMAGED PARTS & AREAS INCLUSIVE OF
THE REPAIR OF FRONT DOOR LH AND FRONT FENDER
LH
SPRAY PAINTING ALL AFFECTED PARTS & AREAS. A00.00 B00.00
TO SPRAY ANTI-RUST UNDERCOAT NOT NECESSARY &0.00
1,770.00 1.030.00
GRAND TOTAL 4 577.04 3,002.20

Report Rel No. CCB/EQI18020044/Ag0b3q2
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Page No, 2 of 2

RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 2,400.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CCE/EQI18020044/Agb3qg2

%g’
ADRIAN LING WAI PING
B.Eng AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-AM.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- Thia Report ls made salely for the use snd benelit of the Cllent named an the front page of his Repart
b lhakailizy " .




