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J" W
EUROSPORTS AUTO PTE
24 Leng Kee Road. #01-03, Singapore 150
TEL : (65) 6565 5995 FAX : (65) 6567 551
Attn, Motor Claims
AlG Asia Pacific Insurance
Repair Quotation 30-10-18
SV- -R
(3rd Party Claim against SKT 3947M)
Barts Qty Price
1 [470854860L LINING FOR FENDEA RH__ (®a — Broken |1 [$  ad7g [t wmn
2 |4708532528 TURN SIGNAL RH -~ Broken |1 $ 145
3 [470807728 _ |REAR BUMPER EXTENSION RH LP750 1 _1$ 13808 |45 jos
4 |470601017AG REAR ALUMINIUM RIM 2 ¢A — Chipped |1 [] 13,548 |41 - 11
5 Rivets, clips, and other fasteners A+~ -~ [Nec H 300
bt ker |IF;-I| ¥ Mai : L r....l"*
£V o008 /" J
1 [Todismantie and ReFit ai 1400 & |5 FHIO sa00
2 TGMMPMM%FLMQQWBWHT 1000 & |5 fopo a0
3 %0 07
Sub-Total § 45,877
as7 $ 3,211
TOTAL s 48,088
1 mummmmu.mwmmummmumm
of work,extra material and labour,cost will be charged accordingly for which you will
be informed prior to action taken. &l
2 All malerals prices quoted are subject to changs without notification
3 All repairs are subject to spare parts availability ‘.ho‘?mm‘o@
4  Quoiation valid for one month from date of lssue.
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EUROSPORTS AUTO PTE LTD

24 Leng Kee Road #01-03, Singapore 159096
Main Line: (65) 6565 5995 Fax: (65) 6567 5515

REG. NO.: MS0368995L

*+ PROFORMA INVOICE == |

Deliver To:  Mr Ng Kim Swee

10 Palm Grove Avenue
Singapore 547295

AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd
78 Shenton Way #07-16

AlG Builiding Singapore 079120
Invoice to: 59

TO REPLACE NEW RIM

To fit new Red Sticker Around tyre Rim
Part Numbaer Part Description
4TOED101TAG AEAR RIM LPT50 SV

To replace Rear Bumper Extension - Diffuser

Part Numbaer Part Description
470807728 FAEAR BUMPER EXTENSION AH LPTS0

To replace LINING for Fender RH

SUBCON 4
Part Number Part Description
4708548601 REAR FENDER AH LP750 SV

To replace Turn Signal Lamp RH 4708532528

Rivets, Screws and Fasleners

CLAIM REFERENCE NO:
To do body repair, knocking, and respray § 1000

Labor to dismantle and replace all damaged parts § 2800

DATE OF ACCIDENT: 26/10/2018
SURVEYOR: LKK AUTO (RASLUL)

TAX INVOICE
GST Aeg No.: MOOIBESGEL
Document No.:
Document Date: 23-Jan-18
REGN No.: SF10P
Odometer: 17079
Model: Aventador SV Coupe
Variant: LP750-4
Vehicle 1D No.: ZHWEFIZDTGLAD4495
Repair Order No.: 16698
Delivery Date: 19M10/2015
Page: 1of2
Advisar: Richard Haranto
$50.00
List Price NettPrice  Quantity Total Cost
13,368.33  13,388.33 1.00 13368 39
$13,368.39
Lisi Price NettPrice  Cuantity Total Cost
13,506.20 13,806.20 1.00 13806 20
$13,808.20
Lisi Price MettPrice  Guantity Total Cost
B.47493 BATASS 1.00 B&74.03
$B,474.93
$145.00
$300.00
$3,800.00

Continued Next Page ...
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Tz018 Meriman e-Claims

Print Received Message

This mail is associated with :

*SF10P (3546399823SG)
[SKT3947M]
TP

NG KIM SWEE
Oct 26 2018 6:00PM
[POPULAR RENT A CAR PTE LTD]
Eurpsports Aulo Ple Lid

From AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Express) (AIG_SG_EXPRESS), sent on 30/06/2019 22:47 PM.
To LKK_HQ

Subject  Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (5$22090.29) - SF10P - Claim Handler: Syed-Yusoff, Saliha

Approved:22090.29:mandate approval is subject to final repair bill & ATA. Should TP disagree with our assessment, get
them to provide subsntatial evidence for our further review.

nups:/isingapore. merimen.comiclaimslindax cim Husebox=SVCmailAfuseacton=dsp_Prnt&CFID=55359218ACFTOKEN=b3T52e 1al5al7323-1AMEC... 1N




Vic {‘I.KKAIJIOI

From: Syed-Yusoff, Saliha <Saliha Syed-Yusoff@aig.com>

Sent: Friday, 6 March, 2020 12:12 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Ce Admin A; Khoo, Kay-Eng; Fong, Andy-SY

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 35463998235G003; Your Ref: CC4/AIG18019954/R1FA3Q2
Dear Vic,

On exceptional basis we will proceed with settlement as we have repairer’s confirmation that the will undertake the
balance of 50% COR.

Pis upload all the supporting documents onto merimen and proceed with payment package.

Kind Regards,
Saliha

Saliha Syed Yusoff

AlG

Senior Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd

AIG Building, 78 Shenton Way #08-16, Singapore 079120
Tel +{65) 6419 1917 |
www.alg.5g

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this emall {and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must
not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by
"Reply” command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof, Although this emall and
any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into
which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no
responsibility is accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or
severally, for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.

From: Vic (LKKAuto) [mailto:vicalpeh@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, March 5, 2020 11:45 AM

To: Syed-Yusoff, Saliha <Saliha.Syed-Yusoff@aig.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ilkkauto.com>; Khoo, Kay-Eng <Kay-Eng.Khoo®@aig.com>; Fong, Andy-5Y <Andy-
SY.Fong@aig.com>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>

Subject: [EXTERNAL] RE: Our Ref: 35463998235G003; Your Ref: CC4/AIG18019554/R1FA302

This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments.

Dear Saliha,



SATIS Vv

| hereby certify that my motor vehicle, as per particulars stated here under has been
repaired to my complete satisfaction.

Name of insured:  Ng Kim Swee

Vehicle number:  SF10P

Model of vehicle:  Lamborghini Aventador SV
Policy number:

Date of accident:  26/10/2018
Date of collection:  22/11/2018

uﬂ&* $13>846D .

SIGNATURE OF INSURED NAME NRIC NO.
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- Pra repair inapeclion mguest - SE10P VS SATIS47M (O] DOA 28/10/2018

Fresl  Azlar Byismriane

T AT A AR T S PTGl ST

Lo Farwg, Andy-BY, TP, LasVing & Sawsem, Maor Wiwns, W lihes, Mok imran. L Ghang Yarg. MilPooengh. Assrwesshjsatiie, Char, Yose S, fie Sei
Sanl V008 2 5325 P

= 3-46pm@ol/I he

Pieans reler {0 the encosed resuest from EuroSports Auto Pte Lid.

Claim no 5469582356000 W[’*@Mfglfﬂ

Cuse Owervsr VAN NUR SALIHA BINTE SYED YUSOFF U‘j\i‘t’ﬂ_ r\

i pou haws any quories/conce s, plaase Il us know
Kl @UEET B oanige Mohormed Acrul @i Sngle Joint EaperT ar requestied.

Thanks and regards.,

Syaza inwa krian

AIG

E wpraze Clasms Adjaimier

B Cliirns Operatioen | MG Shared Barsico

Froma Richard Harjants [maitto-richardharjantoGiesrmsportsatn com.sg]

Sant: Thursday, Nowsrmber 0, 2018 2:47 PH

Ta: Aran, Syamirtina; SF Eyu, Les Wai Sing; Khan Wel Loh

€t Fong, Ancy-57; Chin, Lise-Ying; Abu Cassim, Noor Maresa; Md lshak, Mond Immen; Lim, Shang Yieng, Mithoosingh, Asshwesrjoetkaur, Cham, Yoke Shi; Saur, Balje
Subject: RE: - PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION - ACCIDENT INVOLYING OUR INSURED VEHICLE SKTIS47M AND SF10P ON 26/10,2018

Hella,
We have selected a surveyor,
Mohammed Rosul LEK Auto Comaltunts P Lid

Or any othar surveyor fram LKK if the parson s not available

Please arrange the surveyor 1o inspect our customer's vehicla an Friday, 2112018
Our colleague Lea Wal Sing ( 97885556 ) will be handling the case

You may give his number to LKK to s&t liming for the surveyor 1o visit our workshop.

Thank you and,

Bast regards,
Richard Marjanio

Lambarghini Bingapare
EuroSporta Aulo Pte Lid
Richard Haranto
Service Advsor

24 Leng Wee Road #01-03

Singapore 150098

Prone «E5 G887 0865
Mobile: +85 9759 8533

Emad (<hritnanicdsurmontiuto. com sy
Vb proncim

Viub sonsamsartspiobdlozn

e Em— e o p— T — S — i, .. R g o A b b ] 8 b o i R (e mm—

From: Arlen, Systsirding «Syaaindens ArtanSalg coms

Sent Thursaday, November 1, 2008 207 PM

Te: Bichard Harjanto <richasarjanto@eroioortsauto. com.age: 5F EBvv <Sleyr@eunmiportiigto com. sg>, Lee Wil Sing owaiting@eurosponisuto.comags, Khan Wel Loh
akhgnae B s rotporiSauto Lo S

€= Fong, Andy-5Y chndy-5Y Fang@aig coms; Chin, Les-Ying <Les-Ying ChinSaig com>| Ala Kassim, Noor Mariesa < Nogi Maress Abulaism i aig coms; Mg lihak, Mohd mran
abmian ithak@aig comes; Lim, Sheng Yang <Shengting Lm@aig coms, Mithoatingh, Asbween jsetiaur LAathweanpetiiur Mithoosngh@alg coms, Chan, Yoke Shi
soyobmihi.chan §eg com; Kaur, Raijit <Rafjie Ksur@aig coms

Subject: BE: . PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION - ACOIDENT INGOLVING DUN INSURED VEHICLE SKTISATA AND 5F109 OM 26710/2018

Hi e



-

| havww Earm ioe are-repat ingpection hetter Mindly sebict th sreayor from the Rt

Thanka snd regards.

Syt 1reig Arian

RIG

Faprees Chaims dduter W

B0 Clawnin Diparatons | ANG Shafsd Sereices

To: Arin, Syacaiding; SF Eyul Lee Wal Sing, ihan Wil Loh
€ Fong, Ancy-5Y, Chim, Lee-Ying; Abu rassen, Moo Manesa; Mg lshak, Mond Imran; Lim, Sheng Yang; Mithoosngh, Asshweerjeetkaur; Chan. Yoke Shi; Kagr, Baiy
Subject: RE: - PRE-REPAIR INSEECTTON - ACCIDENT THVCLVING CUR INSURED VEHICLE SKTIHTH AND SF10P DN 264/10,2018

Hi there.

| don't understand the email,
| cant apen it Please re-send.

Thank you and,

Bast regards,
Richard Hamanto

Lamborghinl Singapors
EuraSports Auto Pta Lid
Richurd Harjanto
Service Advisar

24 Lang Kaw Acad 201-03
Singapore 158008
Phone: «85 8582 DBGS
Mobile: +6% §759 8550

Wty www surcsoortag|ooel.com
| T—— e ——— S——————m—— ey SR R T ————— S e A e I L e
- - ey p— o g o o i i s ] e —— iy 8 . g ) r— i e N S b Y —————

Fromm: Aglan, Syasaerding <Sygrpding AL TAlE 0aT>

$ert: Wednanztay, October 31, J018 503 P

Te: Rachard Watjanto <riErdharani e e s Do LU COMg>

Lo Fomg, Andy-5¥ €Ancly § Forngdialy comp; Chin, Lee-Yimg <L Yiiig CHInS i o) Abi Kassim, Noor Masiess <booolinies Al sSams s goome; Ma ishak, Mohd
mw;mmmwmwwwmmh
Subject: - PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION - ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR INSURED VEHICLE SKTI3ATM AND LFIOF ON JR/10/2018

Thils Is # 3ecure, encrypted message. To resd &, open the
wiachrent.

ERESHEEN - ORQBEED  NFENE -

Ulenrinwnrdaoe Mdee aderatady e nuhdio sl
o

D@ prMeD WENE HAXYUG U HEHA B
LuE AT

i1 adalaly pean, arvan berenkrigsl, Untuk membscenye, memboks I
stazhment.

Clls v by 2018-13-07 17:0) +08 10 read wour meliage.
After that, opan the sttachment.
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This email has been scanned by the Symuntec Fmmll Sccurity ol service
For more information please visif by wes svmamteecinu com

IAPORTANT MOTRCE:

The infarmatian i this ermail jand any sttachmenti) s confidential f you are not the inbended reciplent, you must not use of diseminale the information. if you have recerved
thih ermail in geod, plesse immedistely notify me by “Aeply” command and permanenity deiete the original and any copies of printouts thereof. Although this emul and amy
sttarhrmants sre bebieved to be free of sy viria of other defect that might affect sny computer system kdo which it i received and opened, it i the respanaibility of the
recipinTt to answre that @ i3 winus free snd o tespansibility s scoepted by Ampnzan Intarnatenal Group, ine or i1 subudiartes o sfillates sther jointly o 1everally, for any
loan o darmage Eining in any way from it use.

Thin wmasl han been scanned by the Symanter Emall Secusiby Lo service
Far more information plesse visie hiio s symissteccioud com

Thus crmmil has been scannied by the Symantes Email Securiy.cood servics,
For more information plesse vise bt vk aymanteccloud com

BAPORTANT NOTICE

Tra irvrmabon = this eml (and any w-m-mnun“mwmumrmhm I you w smceed e eed in e
saase Fmedieety rutly me by "Flaply® Comimand snd pemmananiy deivs he T rmmuts Precead AllPough P emesl s sy STachments e bebeved D be e of ey
wran 3 ofer dulect Sl mighd afect pny comauter syt o which i W15 Tup rpaaaraidialy of i FECEWETL 1 arEurs T L 8 veud free @ R0 fesanrlilily |5 sooeoied By
Ameress imEmliona Grap E r-hﬂ-n“mmunﬂf oy i o Mg BN m By wey fom s use

YRT - PAE-REPAM MP‘EI.'.'FIﬂH- %ﬁu “WMMHWHH'IMT A =

D Woumat, 31 Dt 2070 DB.01.12 <0000
Wit Premdics

¥ oar Reference
Onir Beferemce

: SFIaP
1536399R235G003

Drenr SieMadam.
We refer to your Notice of Actident of sven date

We mtend 1o conduct B pro-pepr survey of the damage w your cliz'symer cusomer's vebicle ooy waiti your clentyour motor workahop, We propose 1o wst one of the melo
stsrveyre matted i the sstached lint o conduct the joimt pre-eepnir sy 00 8 singhe goint open:

Name of Survevar Col Name

AlG In Hiuse Surveyor AlG Asia Parific lnsumnce Pie Lid
Lawrence Ng Chun Kee Prionty Serviced

Jeffrey Ong Leng Kt Prionty Services

fimmy Les Pricrity Services

EC Loal Automobile Inspection Services Pre Lid
Pang Kinh Keen (Frankic) Formizam Adpoiers Pie Lid

| Ng Yoo Hun Formigam Pzl

Soon HonXin { Garvi Formteam Adusiers Pe Lid

Chow Ho Xiong Formigam Adiusiees Pie Lid

Chua Soo Teck (Benjamin) | Formezarn Adjusters Ple Lid
Kalvin Ang LKK Auto Consubiants Pie Lid
| King Guo Cistig LEK Auto Consuftants Pre Lid
Marcus Chuu LEK Auto Consuliants P Lad
Mohamad Taulikh LEK Aute Consulians P Lid
Adrian Ling LEXK Auto Consuliams Pre Lid
Mokammed fass] LK Autp Consullumts e Lid
Kenneth Kong LK Auto Coasultanis P2 Lid

Plonse et i know within twis [2) workitg doys whether you agree 10 the appomsment of sy of thess motor mrveyor a & single jous expert. You may sded one or more
of the listed et smrveyen We sill e the st of the pre-sepie wirvey csrried out by te single mnt espert.

TrHanes B8 Megaras.

Syads lrma Atan
AG
Expraas Canrm Adjuster U

50 Clrm Operstona | ARG Shived Sesate

From;: Rkhasd Harjanto

[riasito;
Sant! Woonesdey, October 31, 2018 4:35 PM

Yo Arian, Syazmirding

C: '5F Eywr; Khan Wiel Lok Lee Wil Sing
Subjoct: (5FI0F - 3rd party clsim againgt SETISTH

Hedlg,
AIG Motor Claims,

Claim Officer; Azlan Syazairdina.

We are making @ third party claim against your insured, SKTI94TM




-

L

On behalf of our customer, &

Lambarghins LPT50 SV, number plate: SF10P

The accident was on the 25/10/2018 &t 810 PM

| have attached the GIA, repair quotation, end photos here

Plaass have a surveyor 1o inspect the vehicls al our workshop al 24 Leng Kee Road, 8™ fioor, within 2 business days.

Thank you and.

Hest regards,
Richard Hararta

Lambarghinl Singapors
EuroSports Auto Pls Lid
Richard Harjanto

Sarvice Advisor

24 Lang Kee Rosd #01-03

Singapors 1560898

Phone: «&85 GBE2 DBES

Mobile: +65 5790 8583

Ermail: tichardhgrisntodieurosponsaulo com sy
‘Wb swew larmborghint-=np3pgss com

Wb woove surinporigledel coen

— srwy ye 0 g w— 1 B

i ———

This emuil kas been scanned by the Symantec Email Zecurity cloud service.
For mare miormation please visit bitg wens symamteccloud com
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Merimen e-Claims Page | of |

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Express

| CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING
Case Natified gt Sobmitted Ad| Assigned Adj Rpt Ad) Bubsmitted Ine Auth'ed | Status
for
- 27 Oct 2018 v $519,944.46 | 5$39,944.45 T
in Eot Hag e Ady ot | st pstmates. | | view ng | carcai cuss |

POPULAR RENT A CAR PTE LTD, Co. Feg. No.: 1596081552

e ani. NG KIM SWEE. 1D: 517269000
Vehicle Reg 26/10/2D18 18:00 - :59
No.: SFi0p Date of LS8 | 1yg \onthg wnd 7 Days From LTA Reg Date (Man ¥r))
Ciaim Type: |TP / 354639982356 Py COue | 0969994431 (Comprenansive)
Vehicle Reg.
Na. SKTIB4TM r;:" ) ). |5016v10989/vPS/RO0
{Insured) nl):
Excess

Repairer: Eurpsports Auto Pte Ltd (HQ] 24 Leng Kes Rond #01-0], 159096 Leng Kee - Tel: 65655995

Handling ALG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Express] - Tel: 65-641%-3000 ... [Handied by Syed-Yusoff, Saliha] Saiiha Syed-
Insurer: Yusoffifiaig.com

CIEImANES | Liberty Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: (65) 6221 8611
Adjuster:  |LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel| 6256-3561  [Handled by MOHD RASUL] ... [Final Rpt due 14/11/2018]
ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED view Al |  Compose Case mas |

« AIG_SG_EXPRESS [30/06/2019); Alert - Adj Mandate Approved ($$22090.29) - SF10P - Claim Handler: Syed-Yusoft, ...
« AIG_SG_EXPRESS (18/06/2019): Alert - Adj Mandate Maintained - SF10P - Clalm Handler: Syed-Yusoff, Sallha

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS- View All | Search Tasks | Crests Mew Tusk | Compiete |

Due Date Priority Type  Task Group Subject  Handler Assigned By Completed On Created On Done?
Mo results.

https://singapore.menmen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=ds... 9/3/2020
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Claim Documents

*SF10P (35463998235G)
[SKT3947M]
il
NG KIM SWEE
Oct 26 2018 6:00PM
[POPULAR RENT A CAR PTE LTD]
Eurosports Auto Pte Ltd

Upiosd Docurrants | wpsosd Proms | Compose New wamer | upioed veiss | upisad suse | View [View in Srowsar| v |
Letters/Correspondences |1 per page I+1| B4
[No_[Finskzed On LKX Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) | [ Thumbnail | Prine
1 [Draft) Third Party Express Settiement — Payment Breakdown Edit
Phatos/Images ™~ 2
Ne |Relabel/Reorder | LKK Autn Consultants Pte Ltd (MQ) Thumbnall | Print
1 |05/03/19 12:06 | General View 0| adre | A
2 |05/03/19 12:06 | Chassis Number 0| loanirc | F
3 |0S/U19 12:06 | Genars! View @ ceivc | B
4 |05/03/1912:06 | Genersl View Q| waws ||
5 |08/03/19 12:06 | Geaneral View @ waws | &
& |05/031512:06 | General View 0| wadwc | A
7 |oSmIIS12:08 | Genersl View 0| taaws | A
8 |05/01/1913:06  General View @ | weawc | 4
(s |05/01912:06 |Genersl View @ werws | B
I0 |08/00/1% 12:06 | General View | weocws | A
11 |05/0019 12:06 | General View D | icadiec | BA
12 |05/03/19 13:06 | Genersl View 0| waws | &
(13 |05/01/1912:06 | General View 0| waaws | A
14 |0S/0W19 12:06 General View 8| aws | A
15 |0S/00/1912:08 | General View 0| cadies | A
16 |05/01/1912:06 | General View O wairs | 2
17 [05/03/1912:06 | Genaral View O oaws | @A
|18 |0S/00/19 12:06 General View ! Load PG | BA
|18 |D5/03/1% 12:06 Ganeral View 8 waws | B
20 |05/00/19 12106 | Genersl View 0| cocies | B8
21 |05/00/1912:06 | General View @ | Lodrs | A
22 |05/00/19 12:06 | Genaral View 0| Lesawrs | B
23 |05/03/19 1206 | Genaral View @ | edvs | B
24 |0S/03/1% 12106 General View B coaws | A
25 |05/03/1912:06 | General View O ilodes |
26 |05/03/1912:06 | General View 0| cars | &
27 |05/03/1912:06 | Genaral View 0 | lcecirs | B
28 |05/00/19 12:06 | Reinspection Photo O teadws | A
2% |05/01/191206 | Reinspection Photo QO cows B
%0 |05/03/19 12:06 | Reinspection Phots - O wers | A
31 |05/03/19 12:06 | Reinspection Photo 0| ot | A
32 |05/03/19 1206 | Relnspection Photo O | looars | B
331 |05/03/1912:06 | Reinspection Photo @ | Ladrs | 4
34 |05/01/19 12:06 Reinspection Photo 0| weaws | B4
35 |05/03/19 12106 | Relnspection Phots 0 | oadies | 4
36 |05/03/19 12:06 Reinspection Photo g Load 1ps | B
37 |05/01/19 12:06 | Relnspection Photo 0O e | A
38 |05/03/19 12:06 Reinspection Photo 0| aaws | A
39 |05/00/19 12106 Reinspection Photo )| woaws | A
40 |05/03/19 1206 | Reinspection Photo C O

https://singapore.merimen.comv/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_d... 9/3/2020
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Letters/Correspongences |1 per page E &
No | Finalized On LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HG) Thumbnall | Print

- (%]
43 |05/03/19 12:06 Reinspection Photo n Load G | M
47 |05/03/19 12:06 | Reinspection Photo 0| s | B
41 |of/o3/19 12:06 Relnspection Photo )| waawc | B
44 |05/03/19 12:06 | Relnspection Photo 0| oadws | &
45 |D5/03/19 12:06 Reinspection Photo n Load 0G| B
46 |05/03/1912:06 | Aeinspection Photo 0| tmaws | &
47 |05/03719 12:06 | Reinspection Photo 0| wews | A
48 |05/03/19 1206 | meinapection Photo 0| imews | A
48 |05/03/1912:07  Reinspection Phote -after repair phote €| ecwc | M |
S0 |05/03/19 12:07 | Reinspection Photo -after repair photo 0| eawc | A
51 |05/03/19 12:07 Rainspection Photo -after repair photo 0O l=dwc | 4
52 |0S/03/1% 12:07 Reinspection Photo -after repair photo n Load PG | B
53 |08/00/19 12:07 | Reinspection Photo -aftar repalr photo )| teawe | B4
54 |05/03/19 12:07 Reinspection Photo -after repalr photo 0| cadwe |
55 |05/00/1% 12:07 | Relnspection Photo -after repair photo 0| loeawc | H
56 |05/03/19 12:07 | Reinspection Phata -after repair photo 0| mdwc | &
57 |05/03/18 12:07 | Reinspection Phato -after repair photo @ | wairc | M
58 |05/03/19 12:07 Aeinspection Photo -after repalr phote 0| oaws | A
Documentation iperpoge [v] M
o | Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pue Ld (HQ) Thumbnail | Print
1 |02/I1/1E16:09 | ACKNOWLEDGEMENT EMAIL TO AIG DD 01.11.2018 | Losoeor
2 |02/11/18 16:05 | TP GIA REPORT 0 | loearor
3 |02/11/18 18:08 | TP ESTIMATE ) | Load poF
4 |02/11/16 16:09 | WEW PRI - SKTI947H AND SF10P Load PRF
S [D2/11/16 16:09 | PRI - SKT3947M Load POF
& |(02/11/1B16:0% | EMAIL FROM AIG DD 01.11.2018 ) | LlosdEoF
7 |07/11/18 20:05 TP ESTIMATE - MARKED Load POF
B |13/06/19 10:02 | LETTER TO 01 Load POF
9  |13/06/19 12110 Workshop tax invoice Load POF
10 |13/06/19 12010 Google Maps 01 Load POF
(11 |13/06/1912:10 | Google Maps 02 @) | Load Por
12 |13/06/19 1312 seek mandate e-mall — Load POF
13 |19/06/19 15:08 RE-SEEK MANDATE E-MAIL Load BOF
14 |19/13/19 11:41 DISCHARGE VOUCHER Load POF
15 |19/12/19 11:43 EMAIL TO TP Load POF
15 |18/12/1911:50  |TPLOD 0 | Loodror
17 |06/03/20 13:16 | EMAIL FROM TP Load POF
18 | 04/03/20 13018 EMAIL FROM AIG Load POF
19 |D9/03/20 09:27 Release YVoucher Load POF
20 | 0%/03/20 09:27 WORKSHOP INVOICE Load POF
No | Finalized On AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd, [5G Thumbnall | Print
1 |05/11/1809:14 | O1 GIA REPORT @ | Load poF
Documents Checklist
DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST meser | save | pom |

There are no document checklists configured

Our Checklist Remarks - LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ)

Show Remarks Te: L] Handiing Insursr
Fite Remarks are privebe uhless sow shos § 1 othar jiarties

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_d... 9/3/2020
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NOTE: TO BE COMPLETED BY SURVEYOR TEAM
THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT
(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)
[‘U‘lhlnln No: SKT3947M (Insd veh) Modal: BORGHINI
SF10P (TP veh) VENTADOR LP750-4 6.5

| Date of Accident: | 26/10/2018 UPERVELOCE (A)

Global Sum Settiement | | | | Yes | [X] No

Repair Estimate - 49,141.89

Final Repair Cost 1§ 21.370.28

Loss of Use - 720.00 8.00 days at $180.00 per day

Rental (if any) - Q.00 days

LTA / GIA Search Fee 5 0.00

Others: - 0.00

S

Final Settlement Sum ' 9 22 080.28

Is Third Party Workshop GIA Registered? [ 1 YES [ X] NO (Kindlyindicate
below)

A) For Non GIA Registerad Workshop: Agreed Liability 50 (%)

BOLA Applicable: Yes/ No BOLA Scenario No:
B) For GIA Registered Workshop:
BOLA Liability: (%) Assessed Liability (*): (%)
* Assessed Liability to be filled only for chain collisions and for cases where BOLA does not apply.

Remarks

Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown

1) |Eurosports Auto Pta Lid 5 22.080.28

2) 5

JOANNE LEE KHANG MIN g
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid Date

Please attach all the supporting documents to the form.
{Final Repair Blll; Rental Invoice; Release Voucher; Authorisation to Act; Survey Report:

Medical Report/ Bill [if any)

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCdoc&fuseaction=dsp_do...

9/3/2020
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (Co Reg No: 199807 198R)

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubl Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: surf@lkkaulo com assignments@ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our Flle No: CC4/AIG1B8019854/R1HA302

Date: 09/03/2020
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Ple. Lid.  Policy No: 0999954432
Claimant "
Vehicle No : SF10P Insured Vehicle No : SKT3847M
Date of Loss: 26M10/2018 Nature of Claim: TP Claim No. 354630082356
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No: SF10P
. LAMBORGHINI AVENTADOR LP750-4, 6.5
Make & Model SUPERVELOCE (A) Engine No L53904864
Reg. Date: 19/10/2015 (Man. Year: 2015) Chassis No: ZHWEFAZDTGLAD4485
Colour White Odometer, 20418 km
Engine Capacity: B498 cc
Marke! Value/New Car NIA
Prica.
Sum Insured (S3) Market Value/New Car Price
ITl F I AT THE TI R
Ganaral Condition: Steering (Serviceable)! Yes Footbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable); Yes Engine Modification: No Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size 355/25Z R Rear Tyre Size: 355252 R
Front Lefi Side Pirelll 8 mm Rear Lefi Side Pirelli 6 mm
Front Right Side: Pirelli 6 mm Rear Right Side: Pirelli 8 mm
The above values represant the remaining hyre treads depih
\COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's Adjuster's Difference  DIff %)
Parts 36,327.00 36,144 46 182 54 0.50
Miscellaneous ltems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 8,600.00 3,800.00 5,800.00 60,42
Paintwork Labour D.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Gross Tolal (S5) 45927.00 39,944,486 5,982.54 13.03
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (S%) 321488 2,796.11 418.78 13.03
Nett Amount (S$) 40 141.89 42,740.57 6.401.32 13.03
+ Loss of Usa (8.0 x S5180.00/day) (S§) 1,440.00
(5%) 44 180 .57
Liable Amount (50.00%) {55) 22,090.29
INSPECTION
Dale of Assignment: 011172018
Date Inspected 021172018 Inspected At: 25 Leng Kee Road
Repairer.Eurosporis Auto Ple Lid (HQ)
Estimated Period of Repair; 5.0 days
Adjuster: MOHD RASUL Manager: VIC ALPEH

https://singapore.menimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=ge... 9/3/2020
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NOTE. This report mepresents our findinga al the lime and place of inspection stated hevein. Such ingpection has bean carrad oul lo he best of our
imowladge and ability buf any ofhar Nabilty under any ather creumstances i3 heneby sxpressly ercluded

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=ge... 9/3/2020
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REPAIR DETAILS

Recommended Parts

No. Qty Part No. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount

1 1 "LINING FOR FENDER RH Cracked BATEODF *B.4T493F
2 1 *TURN SIGNAL RH Broken 14500 F *145,00F
3 1 *REAR BUMPER EXTENSION RH LP750 Scraiched 13 808.00F ™13B808.20F
4 1 *REAR ALUMINIUM RIM Scralched 13,54800F ™13.,3BB.33F
5 1 *RIVETS ,CLIPS AND OTHER FASTENERS Necassary A00.00F *300.00F
6 1 *STICKER (RIM) Necessary 50.00F *S000F
FeFranchess pan

Total Parts (S§) 36,327.00  36,144.46

Report was unsubmitted during this print-oul. |

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=ge... 9/3/2020



Adjuster Report Page 4 of 4
Recommended Miscellaneous Items
There are no new miscellansous items salactod.
Recommended Labour
No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour items
! TODISMANTLE AND REFIT ALL PARTS New 5.600.00 2,800.00
2  TODO RESPRAY PAINT ON REAR BUMPER AND New 4,000.00 1,000.00
SPOILER KIT
Gross Labour Cost (S§) 9,600.00 3,800.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.

< END OF ESTIMATES >

https://singapore.menmen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=ge... 9/3/2020



