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" Catherine Chong (LKK Auto)

From: ONG U U <llong@lonpac.com>

Sent: Frnday, 2 November, 2018 1:27 PM

To: Thiam Heng Huat; MT_Claim_SG; assignments@Ikkauto.com; Catherine Chong (LKK
Auto)

Subject: RE: REQUEST FOR PRS - GBG4389S Our Ref; TBA

Attachments: GBG43895_31102018.pdf; receipt-20181102-121425.pdf

Without Prejudice
Save as to Costs

Dear Steven
We intend to conduct a pre-repalir survey of the damage to your client’s/your customer’s

vehicle jointly with your client/your motor workshop. We propose to use one of the motor
surveyors named in the following list to conduct the joint pre-repair survey as a single joint

expert.
1 Kalvin Ang
2 Xing Guo Qiang
3 Mohamad Taufikh
4 Bryan Ang
5 Adrian Ling
6 Mohammed Rasul
7 Marcus Chua
8 Kenneth Kong
9 Muhammad Nazril Bin
Abdullah
10 Sathya Sai Kathirrasen

Please let us know within two (2) working days whether you agree to the appointment of any
of these motor surveyors as a single joint expert.

Regards,

Ong Li Li

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555
Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: Thiam Heng Huat [mailto:thh176@yahoo.com]
Sent: Friday, 2 November, 2018 1:20 PM




To: l"-"lT_UaEm_SG
'Subject: REQUEST FOR PRS - GBG43895

Dear Motor Claims Team,
We refer to the attachments.

Kindly assist to register our client's TP claim and let us have your list of nominated surveyors
within the next 2 working days from date of this email.

Please respond soonest possible.

Warmest regards,
Steven

Thiam Heng Huat Pte Ltd
82636295



MEAMALE1L 1453 ¢ Sin Ming Autacare BT Pie Lid - W0
ENTAY DATE & TIME: 31/ 10@018 1528
SLETTTED BY: Angeia Tan Chin Chin

SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT

IMPORTANT NOTICE

1. Fisasa repon comectly the details of the accident to speed up the ciaims process
2. This Form mest be complated by the Pallcyholder andior the Authorsed Driver

3. Information previded must be as truthful and accurale as pessibis. Any withil misrepresentation of witholding of matsrial facts may allow insurance cormpandes io

repudiate palicy lability.

4, The issus and scceptance of this Farm by Imsurancs companies

Is not an admission of policy iability on e part of e iNsurance companies.

5. Any false reporting may be referred to the Police for Investigation.

8. This repart will be forwarded by the meurens of the GIA Records Mana

archiving and that coples of this report will, for a fea

aloresax

Date Of Report
Date Of Accident
Exact Location Of Accidant

ACCIDENT STATEMENT
J1M02016 1548
31/10/2018 08:40
ALLANBROOKE RD

Country/State of Loss SINGAPORE
DETAILS OF OWN VEHICLE
Vehicle Registration Number GBG43805
Insured/Policyholdar
Nama Of Registered Owner HORIZON AUTOMOTIVE PTELTD
Co Reg No 201218371K
Email Address GERALDCHEWSC@HORIZON-AUTOMOTIVE.COM

Mablle Phonas No
Allarnative Phona No
Vehicle Particulars
Manufacturer

Maodal

Exact Purpose far which vehicle was being usad al
time of acciden

Are you claiming under your own Insuranca policy
far repair to your vehicla?

If No, Pleasa state action lo be taken
Vehicle Category

Insurance Company

Name of Insurance Company
Type Of Coverage

Fleal Pollcy

Folicy Mumber

Cover Note Numbar

Driver

Name of Dnver

NRIC No

Data Of Birth

Occupation

Data Of Driving Pass

Driving Experience

Gender

Mabile Number

Fax Number

Contact Numbar

EMall Addrass

(LOCAL) +85-92311008
OFFICE-82311006

FIAT
DOBLO CARGO MAXI-1,6 D MT.J AMT GLAZE (M)

WORK

NO

THIRD PARTY
COMMERCIAL VEHICLE

NTUC INCOME INSURANCE CO-OPERATIVE LTD
COMPREHENSIVE

NO

51071978617

JUARIME BIN IBRAHIM
ST125500Z

24/08/1871

CUTDOOR

07/089/2015

3 YEARS AND 1 MONTH
MALE

(LOCAL) +65-87881743

OFFICE-9TB881T43
GERALDCHEWSCEHORIZON-AUTOMOTIVE.COM

geman Centie estabiished by the Genersl Insurance Association of Singapore (GIA) for
b mantie avadable upon application by inerasied partiss

T
- By tha lodgemant of ihis repart to e insuners, you hereby conaent to the archiving of this report at tha centre and i copies of the renar baing made svadatis



Address BLK 11 YORK HILL #07-988
Posicode 162011

Was driver an employee of the Insuyred's Company NO

I Na, Ralationship of the Driver with the Insured  OTHER - HIRER

Vehicle Registration Number of Driver's Own
Vehicle =

Insurance Company of Driver's Own Vehicle -

General Information of the Accident

Type Of Accident COLLISION - HEAD TO REAR
Weather Conditions DRIZZLING

Road Surface DRY

Other Information

Was any foreign vehicle involved in this accident? NO

Mumber of vehicles involved in the accidant 2

¥YWas any body injured in the Accident? YES

Was any injured conveyed to hospital by NO

ambulanca?

Was any other material or properny damaged? YES

| have been approached by unknown person(s) NO
soliciting/offering accident claims assistanca,

Mumber of Passengears (Including Driver) 1

Detalls of Police Action

Was tha accidant reported to the police? YES

If Yes, Pleasa stale which Paolice Station

Police Stallon Nama THOMSON NPP 25 SIN MING RDAD
Police Station Address :ﬁdnGE.PEGERSEIN MING ROAD #01-180 , POSTCODE: 570025 . COUNTRY":
Paolice Station Contact TEL NO: - FAX NO:

YWas notice of intended Prosecution given? NO

If Yes against whom?

Circumstances of Accident

REFER TO SKETCH PLAN

Attachment(s)

Ara accident photos available for attachment? YES

Was there any video captured by Car Camara? NO

Was there any audio recorded? NO

Vehicle Registration Number GWB330R

Vahicle Make/Modal/Colour NISSAN CABSTAR

Details Of Properties

Vahicle Category COMMERCIAL VEHICLE
Name of Drivaer MARIMUTHA MANIKANDAN
MRIC/Passpon Number

Contact Number 63928858

Address

Posicode

Insurance Company Nama
MNature Of Damaga

Paga 2 of 15



Mo, Of Passanger (Including Driver)

DETAILS OF INJURED PERSON 1

MName JUARIME BIN IBRAHIM
Approximala Age

Injunies Sustain 7 DAYS OF MEDICAL LEAVE
Injured person in which vehicla? GBG43885

Were seat balls worn? YES

Was this Injured conveyed 1o hospilal by NO

ambulanca?

Addrass

Posicode

Fage Jof 15



Sketch Plan Pg. 1

POR N

-

Piease report gorrectly the detalls of tha sccident to speed up the claims peocess.
This Form must be comoleted &

Information provided must be as truthiul and f . Ary wiiful misrepresentation or withhalding of material
facts may allow insurance companies to repusliste policy Rability.

e

i

4, The iysue and acceptance of this Form by Insurance companies s not an admission of policy liakility on the part of the Insurance
companies.

6. The repert will be forwarded by the insurers of the GIA Records Management Centre established by the General Insurance
Asyociation of Singapore (GiA] for archiving and that copies of this report will for a fea be made available upon application by
interested partiss

7. Bythe lcdgment of this report to the insurers, you hereby coment to the archiving of this report at the centre and to coples of
thi repart being made avallsble aforesald.

8. Consent under the Personal Data Protection Act [PDPA)

| understand, acknowledge, agres and consent that:

[a] My insurer, my workshep and the General Insurance Assoclation of Singapoce ["GLA") may/are permitted to collect, use,
disclose mnd/for process my personal data/personal information set out in this [form] and any other personal information
provided by me or possessed by my [nsurer [collectivaly the “Personal Information®) snd disciose snd tramafer wch
Personal Information to all Insurer(s) who have insured vehicle(s) involved in this accident |8l Insures{s) who have Insured
wvehlcle{s) Invalved in this accident shall be collectively rafarred to as tha "Insuran™], the insurers’ lawyerslaw firme, the
Monetary Autherlty of Sngapore and any relevant government agency/autherity [such as the police), for the purpose{s)
of :

{I} procewsing, handling and/or dealing with my claima including the settlement of the dalms and any necessary
[nvestigations relating to the dalms:

(il} imvestigating the sccident and/far my daime:
(i) carrying out and/for dealing with mv Instructions of responding to any encuiries by me;

{lv] administering my claims [Induding the mailing of correspondence, statements, involces, reporta or notices to me,
which could Involve disclosure of certaln personal dats about me to bring about delivery of the seme 25 well a3 on the
external cover of envelopes/mail packages); and/for

|v] complying with spplicable law in sdministering, processing, handling and/er dealing with my clsims. (coliectively the
“Purposes”]

[b) &l insurer(s) who have Insured vehicle(s) invelved in this sccident and the Insurers’ lawyers,law firma, may/are permitted
to collect, use, disclase and/or process my Persanal Information for one or more of tha above Purposes: snd

e} my Personal tnformation may/can be disclosed by amy of the fnsurers and/or GA to their third party service providen ar
sgeritafincluding their lawyers/law firms), which may be sited outside of Singapore, for cne or more of the above Purposes.

[d] my Personal information will also be collectad and wsad 1o compile claims history for the purpose of fraud detection,
Invessigation snd management in present and 3l future claims.

[e} theinformation so collected under [d) sbove may be shared [ disclased:

(1} taall nsurers and/ar any other third parties that mslst in evaluating. investigating, controlling er managing fraud,
regulators, law enforcement and government agencies as reasonably required for the purposes stated. or

i} for comglying with requirements undar any regulations, laws of court arders.

NOTE: PLEASE TAKE NOTE THAT YOU MAY HAVE A 14-DAYS TIMEFRAME FOR YOU TO SUBMIT AN OWN
AL BLAIM UNDER YOUR POLICY, PLEASE REFER TO YOUR POLICY FOR MORE INFORMATION.

) . . . g\,
] i ;
LY Jpﬁ"l(é‘ k ‘a
ke T Signaty Crivir's Mgnature Heparting mmﬁh%ﬁh&ue
[IF drtvar bs nat tha policyhalder] Name: g
Date & Tirme: NHIC/FIN No-

Page 4 of 15



Sketch Plan #2 Pg. 1

SKETCH PLAN _ ) om _
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DESCRIBE CIRCUMSTANCES OF THE ACCIDENT

| ATTACHE0 Doles RBT

e
ng particulars are svery respect. { ﬁ‘;
- ] ,'I:' =
(. M =
a
\1’?&"—”:}{' )
Policybolder's Signaturs Deiver's Signature Neporing Centre Peraofmell Signature
Date & Time: (If delver is nat the policyhalder) Miarne:
Date & Tirme: MILC/FIN Noe.:

Page 5 of 15



POLICE REPORT Pg. 1

e e
POLICE FORCE orre

Police Station Of Origin: Tot3

Thomson NPP Report No, Ti20181031/2108

25 Sin Ming Road #01-180 SINGAPORE

570025

Tel No: 1800-4529999

REPORT OF A TRAFFIC ACCIDENT

Date/Time Report Made: Vide Report No.: Station Diary No.:

31!101'2[!13 1?L51

[ II QT 1.'
Name nf Inf::n'rrnrrt
JUARIME BIN IBRAHIM

54

Address:
APT BLK 11 YORK HILL #07-88 SINGAPORE 162011

ID Typa /1D Ne.: Contact No.:

NRIC NO / §7125500Z Home/Office; Maobile: 97881743
Mationality: Email:

SINGAPORE CITIZEN

Sex: Age: Date of Birth: | Type of Informant:

Male 47 24/08/1671 Driver

Racs: Language: Institution / School Name:
Boyanesa

Occupalion; Driving Licence Information:

DESPATCH DELIVERY Class: 3 Dale of Expiry:

"'"TI ] 1 lll_]_u_LL“|

i *lf

Date/Time of Type of Location:

Type of
\ Accidant: Straight Road
Bhiecit 31/10/2018 08:40
Location:
Along Road 1
ALLANBROOKE ROAD
L towards Adillary Ave
Weather: Road Surface: Road Speed Limit:
Drizzling Dry
Traffic Flow: Traffic Control: Traffic Volume:
Two Way Not Controlled
Type of Collision: Anyone conveyed by
Batween Moving Vehicles - Head To Rear ambulance:
No

S| 1\ o e

me Fudastnan Invuh.raﬂ Nu

No. of Pedestrians Injured: NIL

| Use of Pedestrian Crossing: NA

Page 6 al 15



POLICE REPORT Pg. 1

) swospoze A

_ TRO1B1031/2

Police Station Of Origin: 2013
Thomson NPP Repart No. T/20181031/2108
25 Sin Ming Road #01-180 SINGAPORE

570025 CONTINUATION OF REPORT

Tel No: 1800-4526088

Namsa JUARIME BIM IBRAHIM ID No. 571255002
Related Vahicle | GBG43893 (Van) Contact No.| 97681743
Hoszpltal/Clinle | MOUNT ALVERNIA HOSPITAL Class of Class: 3
Driving Date of Expiry: NIL
Licencs &
Expiry Date
Date Traatment | 31/10/2018 Date Discharge | 31/10/2018
No. of Da ted Medical Leave o7 Degrea of Injury | Slight
Name Marimuthu manikandan ID No. G2862880M
Related Vehicle | GW8330R (Lomy) Contact No.| NIL
Hospital/Clinic - | NIL Class of Class: NIL
Driving Date of Expiry: NIL
Licence &
Expiry Date
| Date Treatment | NIL Date Dischargs | NIL
Mo. of Days granted Medical Leave | NIL Degres of Injury | NIL
Brief Datails.

On the above mentioned date and time, | was driving my van (GBG43898) along Allanbrooke Rd towards
Artillery Ave, As | reached the zebra-crossing, | stopped my van to allow the pedestrian 1o cross the road.
While stationary, | suddenly felt a strang impact coming from the rear.

| alight my van and discovered that a lomy(GW8330R) had collided into the rear portion of my van. | then
took photo of the accident and exchange particulars with the driver, Aftar which | carried on with my
journey.

Awhile later | felt pains on neck and my hands. As such | want to Mount Alvernia to seak medical
treatment. | was glven 7 days medical leave

Page T of 15



POLICE REPORT Pg. 1

SINGAPORE
POLICE FORCE

Police Station Of Origin:

Thomson NPF

25 8in Ming Road #01-180 SINGAPDORE
570025

Tel Ne: 1800-4525089

Sketch Plan
Informant is nol able to provide skstch plan

IMPORTANT: Plaase attach a copy of your vehicle's Insurance Certificate
the certificate with you now, please fax a copy 1o 65474885 stating the

LT

TRMA10312108

dol3
Repon Mo. T/20181031/2108

CONTINUATION OF REPORT

to this report. If you don't have

report number as referance,

Signaturs Of Officer Recording The Repart; Signature Of Informant:
E/ [
Sgt 3 MUHAMMAD RIDZUAN BIN ABDUL /

RAHMAN é g

Signaturs Of Interpretar: Date/Time:

Not applicable

Vi

3110/2018 17:51

Officer In Chargs Of Casa:

Clessification Of Caas:-

TP/AEIT/
Sr Staff Sgt MOHAMAD ZULFAZDL
ABDULLAH

SN 070

Authentication Stamp
NP1BE

= SHATIPE

Page 8of 18
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Estimate repair cost

Parts

Rear RH door " Professional" emblem 11+
Rear RH door " Fiat" emblem Y

Rear LH door "Doblo" emblem NN

Rear LH door "Maxi" emblem ™"

Rear LH door "90" emblem NN

Rear LH door "Mulitjet" emblem Nu

Rear door frame weatherstrip  NY

Rear bumper

Rear bumper step garnish  NEC

Rear bumper clips

Rear bumper RH side reflector <R H
Rear bumper LH side reflector ¢ F 7
Rear bumper RH tow cover ~ MN
Rear bumper RH side retainer  +n
Rear bumper LH side retainer ™M
Rear bumper reinforcement 70

End panel

Special Nett

Rear RH door "6pax" sticker NN
Rear LH door " 70km/h" sticker
1sel Rear buntper reverse sensor Abs

Thiam Heng Huat Pte Ltd
Block 176 Sin Ming Drive , Sin Ming Autocare
#05-14 Singapore 575721
Hp: 82636295 Fax: 62662881
Company Registration No: 201605960N

GBG4389S Dom= 3(-10-2<|8

Fiat Doblo
Chassis: ZFA2630006G87375

0p

NEC

& s A b5 U5 U5 Gn R BA A A A A P A N

w B

120.00 *
115.00 *
110.00
110.00
100.00 >
120.00 *
380.00
720.00 <
240.00~
60.00~
50,00 ~
50.00 ~
65.00 %
65.00
65.00 >
420.00 ~
580.00% &

3,370.00

15.00 *
15.00 «
280.00 ¥



Labour isc cl

Labour charges on affected areas § 4co $60.08 -
Putty and respray affected areas § 550 1.00060- 7
Check wiring and lighting system $ 5000% =7 A
Apply rust proofing on replaced and repaired panels $ 60.00 4 XA
Rentove and replace rear inner trims and garnish $ 200.00 *
Remove and replace rear bumper reverse sensor n;ld $ Co 52380060
wire harness
$ 5,870.00

p.0.v - (A fulig ng
Echmede Recaivd —2/uf1¥ AN \!

LKK Auto Consuliants henca notify

ihe Repairer of the following:
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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

—

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 3 December 2018 2:53 PM

To: 'thiam heng huat’

Cc: SUR

Subject; RE: GBG 4389 5 - ESTIMATE RPT & GIA RPT
Dear Steven,

Noted with thanks.

Kindly send Final invoice and all supporting documents to LONPAC INSURANCE

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | emall sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: thiam heng huat <thiamhenghuat@gmail.com>
Sent: Friday, 30 November 2018 2:03 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>
Cec: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: GBG 4389 5- ESTIMATE RPT & GIA RPT
Dear Veron - |kk Case Handler

We hereby confirmed our acceptance of sum repair

Thank you for your assistance to this matter.

Warmesl regards,

Steven/Jo-PA Manager

Thiam Heng Huat Pte Lid- HP: 8263 6295

(A car workshop in Sin Ming Auto-Care Building)

Address: Blk 176 Sin Ming Drive #05-14, Sin Ming Aulo Care Building, Singapore 57572136295

On Fri, 30 Mov 2018 at 13:26, Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veranchen@lkkauto.com> wrote:
Dear Steven,

WITHOUT PREJUDICE



Re-offer Lump Sum $2000/- @ 4 working days.

Please check and confirm.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | emall sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: thiam heng huat <thiamhenghuat@gmail.com>
Sent: Friday, 30 November 2018 11:30 AM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>
Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: GBG 4389 5 - ESTIMATE RPT & GIA RPT

Dear Veron Chen - LKK case handler
4389 5- DOA=31-10-2018
We have reviewed and also assessed that we require $2,450 for this vehicle to be repaired for this accident.
We hope to hear your favourable reply.
Thank you.
Best Rgds

Steven/Jo-PA mgr

Thiam Heng Huat Pte Ltd



(A car workshop in Sin Min Auto-Care Building)

Address: Blk 176, #05-14, Sin Min Auto-Care Building, Singapore 575721

On Fri, 30 Nov 2018 at 07:41, Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Steven,

Please refer to my email below.

Best Regards,
Veron Chen | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | emall :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: thiam heng huat <thiamhenghua il.com>
Sent: Thursday, 29 November 2018 6:29 PM
To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com=>
Subject: Re: GBG 4389 5 - ESTIMATE RPT & GIA RPT

Dear Veranchen - LKK

Your attached amended Estimate Report did not indicate the Lump Sum amount offered. | only saw 4 working
days indicated by your surveyor.

Kindly assist to get it indicated in order not to have any future discrepancies between email amount and
surveyor's understanding.

Thank you for your kind understanding



Warmest regards,

Steven/Jo-PA Manager

Thiam Heng Hual Pte Lid- HP: 8263 6295

{A car workshop in Sin Ming Auto-Care Building)

Address: Blk 176 Sin Ming Drive #05-14, Sin Ming Auto Care Building, Singapore 575721

On Thu, 29 Nov 2018 at 16:08, Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ilkkauto.com> wrote:
Dear Steven,
WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Offer Lump Sum $1850/- @ 4 working days.

Please check and confirm.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: Admin-D {LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 28 November 2018 3:48 PM

To: SUR <sur@| m:

Subject: FW: GBG 4389 S - ESTIMATE RPT & GIA RPT



BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-1972 | emall: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: bagh-4315

Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408033)

From: thiam heng huat [mallto:thiamhenghuat@gmail.com]
Sent: Wednesday, 28 November 2018 3:42 PM

To: assignments@|kkauto.com

Subject: GBG 4389 5 - ESTIMATE RPT & GIA RPT

Dear LKK office

Kindly assist to disseminate the attached 2 reports requires by your surveyor who came to our workshop for
survey.

Thank you.

Warmesl! regards,
Steven/Jo-FA Manager
Thiam Heng Huat Pte Lid- HP: 8263 6295

{A car workshop in Sin Ming Auto-Care Building)

Address: Blk 176 Sin Ming Drive #05-14. Sin Ming Auto Care Building, Singapore 57572136295



. AVG This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
WWW.ave.com

Warmesl regards,
Steven
Thiam Heng Huat Pte Lid

82636295

Warmesl! regards,

Sleven

Thiam Heng Huat Pte Ltd

82636295

Warmest regards,

Steven

Thiarm Heng Huat Pte Ltd
82636295



Veron Chen [LKKAutu!

From: Admin-D (LKKAuUto)

Sent: Wednesday, 28 November 2018 3:48 PM

To: SUR

Subject: FW: GBG 4389 S - ESTIMATE RPT & GIA RPT

Attachments: GBG 4389 S=31-10-2018-ESTIMATE RPT.pdf; GBG 4389 5=31-10-2018-DOA-GIA
RPT.pdf

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: pssipnments@lkkouto.com | fax: G256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: thiam heng huat [mailto:thiamhenghuat@gmail.com]
Sent: Wednesday, 28 November 2018 3:42 PM

To: assignments@|kkauto.com

Subject: GBG 4389 5 - ESTIMATE RPT & GIA RPT

Dear LKK office

Kindly assist to disseminate the attached 2 reports requires by your surveyor who came to our workshop for
survey.

Thank you.

Warmest regards,

Steven/Jo-PA Manager

Thiam Heng Huat Pte Ltd- HP: 8263 6295

(A car workshop in Sin Ming Auto-Care Building)

Address: Blk 176 Sin Ming Drive #05-14, Sin Ming Auto Care Building, Singapore 57572136295

. AVG This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
. Www.ave.com



' Vdl 74 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

e e 51 Uibl Ave 1 #01.25 Paya Uibl Industiisl Park. Singapore 408333
- TEL 256 3561 FAX 8256 4315
Reg No 199607188R GST Reg. No 18-9607198-R
Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile
LONPAC INSURANCE BHD Ref CS/LPC18019843/ vbe2
s ap—— U
Code . LPC2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. GW B330R Veh. Inspected GBG 43835
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. 1B1aMBNVCO0M021092 Excess (5) 0.00
Assign From  ONGLULI Assign Date 02/11/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model FIAT DOBLO MAX| c.C 1688
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 207
Chassis No. ZFA26300006G87375 Colour WHITE
Odometer 50548 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |195E0 R16 HANKOOK & mm
L/H Front Tyre |195/60 R16 HANKOOK & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |185/80R16 HANKDOK 8 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |185/60 R16 HANKOOK & mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS
5. General Information
Accident Date  31/10/2018 |Inspection Date 18/11/2018
Survey held at THIAM HENG HUAT PTE LTD
176 SIN MING DRIVE
#05-14 SINGAPORE 575721
Sa. Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON AITHOUT PREJUDICE™ BASIS.
BjIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS. WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

|[ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 4 Working Days
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

- 51 Uti Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL 6258 3561 FAX: 8256 4315
Reg No' 189607188R GST Reg Ne. 19-9607198-R Page No 1 of 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. GBG 4389S
aty Description of Parts Condition | =8 hm'g} *;11
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR RH DOOR "PROFESSIONAL" EMBLEM NOT NECESSARY 12000 -
1|REAR RH DOQGR "FIAT" EMBLEM NOT NECESSARY 115.00
1|REAR LH DOOR "DOBLO" EMBLEM NOT NECESSARY 110.00 -
1|REAR LH DOOR "MAXI" EMBLEM NOT NECESSARY 110.00 -
1|REAR LH DOOR "80" EMBLEM NOT NECESSARY 100.00 .
1|REAR LH DOOR "MULITJET" EMBLEM NOT NECESSARY 120,00 .
1|REAR DOOR FRAME WEATHERSTRIP NOT NECESSARY 380.00
1|REAR BUMPER DENTED 720 00 72000
1|REAR BUMPER STEP GARNISH NECESSARY 240.00 240.00
1|SET REAR BUMPER CLIPS NECESSARY 60.00 80.00
1|REAR BUMPER RH SIDE REFLECTOR CRACKED 50.00 50.00
1|REAR BUMPER LH SIDE REFECTOR CRACKED 50.00 50,00
1|REAR BUMPER RH TOW COVER NOT NECESSARY 65.00 :
1|REAR BUMPER RH SIDE RETAINER NOT NECESSARY B5.00 -
1|REAR BUMPER LH SIDE RETAINER NOT NECESSARY 65.00 :
1|REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT DENTED 42000 42000
1|END PANEL TO REPAIR SEE 580.00 :
LABOUR
LESS 10% DISCOUNT - -154.00
3,370.00 1,386.00
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|REAR RH DOOR "8PAX" STICKER (SN) NOT NECESSARY 15,00 -
1|REAR LH DOOR "7TOKM/H" STICKER (SN) NOT NECESSARY 15.00 -
1|SET REAR BUMPER REVERSE SENSOR (SN) NOT NECESSARY 280,00 -
310.00 -
LABOUR
LABOUR CHARGES ON AFFECTED AREAS. INCLUSIVE 800.00 45000
OF THE REPAIR OF END PANEL
PUTTY AND RESPRAY AFFECTED AREA 1,000.00 §50 00
CHECK WIRING AND LIGHTING SYSTEM 50.00 30.00
‘;EEIL-EISHUET PROOFING ON REPLACED AND REPAIRED [NOT NECESSARY B0 00 -
REMOVE AND REPLACE REAR INNER TRIMS AND NOT NECESSARY 200.00 -

GARNISH

Report Ref No. CS/LPC18019943/Jvbe2
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TEL: G256 3581 FAX: G258 4315

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl industnal Park, Singapore 408033

Reg No: 188607188R GST Reg. No. 19-8607186-R Pape No.:2 of 2
Qty Description of Parts Condition m%} WA[:;}M:I
REMOVE AND REPLACE REAR BUMPER REVERSE 80.00 50.00
SENSOR AND WIRE HARNESS
218000 1.080.00
GRAND TOTAL 5,870.00 2,466.00
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 2,000.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)
Report Ref No, CS/LPC18018943/Jvba2
ONG HWEE JIE ADRIAN LING WAI PING
Aulomolive Assessor B.Eng, AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-A M MATA|

Licensed Appraiser

CIBCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES: - This Report s made solely bod 10 use and benalil of ihe Clisnt namssl on ihe frond page of this Repart
tie llability of respensibaite whateaeres, 0 contact of torl 18 sccested 1o any Kuird Sarty wihe may peply an ine Repart woaky or in part Any third perty schng o realying en e

Beport |n whobe of b sark dees so sl hia or her own sk,




