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Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 23 November 2018 2:22 PM

To: PBSP

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: REQUEST FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT - SKN9938G & PC3940L (INDIA) ON 

27/10/2018 *** LKK REF: CC3/III18019912/ea3 

Attachments: OI SKETCH PLAN.pdf

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’ 

  SAVE AS TO COSTS 

 

Hi Sir/Mdm, 

 

We refer to the above matter. 

 

We attached here with a copy of our insured’s accident statement for your easy reference. 

 

Our principal has reiterated that the accident was caused due to the entire negligence of your client exit from the minor 

road and collided into our insured vehicle. 

 

We are of the opinion that liability is not in your client’s favor. 

 

Under such a circumstances, we regret to inform you that we have our principal instruction to deny liability and unable 

to look into your client’s claim. 

 

Thank You. 

 

Best Regards, 

Asher Sng | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

phone: 6841-6051 | email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)  

Sent: Tuesday, 20 November 2018 11:35 AM 

To: PBSP <pml-pbsp@simedarby.com.sg>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: REQUEST FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT - SKN9938G & PC3940L (INDIA) ON 27/10/2018 *** LKK REF: 

CC3/III18019912/ea3  

 
‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’ 

  SAVE AS TO COSTS 

 

Dear Caroline, 

 

Thank you for the email,. 
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Dear Asher, 

 

Kindky assist CC3/III18019912/ea3 

 

 

Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of 

resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed 

/ inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 

  

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the 

issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement. 

   

 

 

Thank you 

Best Regards, 

Vivian Lau| Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-8625 | email: Vivianlau@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

  

  

  

 

 

 

From: PBSP [mailto:pml-pbsp@simedarby.com.sg]  

Sent: Tuesday, 20 November, 2018 11:30 AM 

To: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) <vivianlau@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Re: REQUEST FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT - SKN9938G & PC3940L (INDIA) ON 27/10/2018 *** LKK REF: 

CC3/III18019912/ea3  

 

Dear Sirs, 

  

Kindly reply on liability. 

  

 

 

Thank you. 
 
Regards, 
Caroline 
C/o Performance Motors Limited - Body and Paint 
303 Alexandra Road Singapore 159941 
DID: 6319 0174 Fax: 6479 4601 

From: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) <vivianlau@lkkauto.com> 

Sent: Monday, 12 November 2018 10:53:00 AM 

To: PBSP 
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Subject: Automatic reply: REQUEST FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT - SKN9938G & PC3940L (INDIA) ON 27/10/2018 *** LKK 

REF: CC3/III18019912/ea3  

  

  

Hi, 

Thank you for your email. 

I will be back on 14 November. 

I will look into your email when I am back. 

For urgent matters, please contact Ms. Thin Thin at 6841-2360 or write to cs-a@lkkauto.com 

  

Thank you. 

  

Vivian 

  


