Vic (LKKAuto)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 1 October, 2019 5:05 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SME102) & YM9424LL ON 30/10/2018 [External
Confidential]

Lonpac External - Confidential
Dear Vic,

Kindly proceed as proposed.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706
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Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only.

From: Vic (LKKAuto) [mailto:vicalpeh@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 17 September, 2019 3:58 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc: MT_Claim_SG; Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SME102] & YM9424LL ON 30/10/2018 [External Confidential]

Dear Gerald,

We refer to the below email.

Our technical auditor had further reviewed and in the view that what the surveyor had recommended were all
justifiable and in order based on the damaged profile to the TP vehicle, accident scenario, inspection and re-inspection
photos to the TP damaged vehicle.

For your approval on our mandate please and/or further instructions.

Thank you.



Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto)

Sent: Saturday, 7 September, 2019 11:27 AM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN; Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: MT_Claim_SG; KKLau; Simon Ho (LKKAuto); Olivia Lau (LKKAuto); Celine Fong (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SME102) & YM9424LL ON 30/10/2018 [External Confidential]

Dear Gerald

Will get our technical audit to review this COR.
Dear Vic

Please pass file to Simon to check first on Monday.
Best Regards,

Bryan Ang

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3561 | email: bryanang@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Sent: Friday, 6 September 2019 4:29 PM

To: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@lkkauto.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; KKLau <kklau@lkkauto.com>

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SME102J & YM9424LL ON 30/10/2018 [External Confidential]

Lonpac External - Confidential
Our Ref : 18/18/18/VC05/021091

Dear Bryan,

Please see attached email.

The purpose of Direct Settlement is to expedite settlement whereby the workshops can
ibnerr']:tftljtrn for getting payment fast and thus the repair costs and loss of use should be kept

low.

However, in this case, there is not much reduction here.
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Kindly look into his case.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555

Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only.



