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Catherine Chung (LKK Auto)

From: CHAN LI Sl <lisi@uoi.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 31 October, 2018 10:12 AM

To: Michelle Ong Siew Bee

Cc: assignments@Ilkkauto.com; 'SUR'

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Our Ref. SJP6299M : Your Insured: GANTRY POLE LOCATED

AT BLK 268 BT BATOK CARPARK HDB U13 EXIT 2 DOA 12/10/2018 @ ARD
1550HRS UOI's claim ref: 111055471811

Dear Michelle,

| believe you meant 7th Nov 2018.

We have arranged for the survey on Tth Nov.

Dear Bernice - LKK,

As spoken, please arrange VWP survey on the vehicle.

Regards,

Chan Li Si

Executive

Claims

United Overseas Insurance Limited

4 Ansan Road, #28-01 Springleal Towai, Singapare 075909
Main = {65) 6222 7733 | DID - (65) 6450 9330 | Fax - (83) £327 3860 | Email + lisi@yol oom.sg

UOB EMAIL DISCLAIMER

Any person receiving this email and any attachment(s) contained, shall treat the information as confidential and not misuse, copy,
disclose, distribute or retain the information in any way that amounis tc a treach of confidentiality. If you are not the intended
recipient, please delete all copies of this email from your computer system. As the integrity of this message cannot be guaranteed,
neither UOB nor any entity in the UOB Group shall be responsible for the contents. Any opinion in this email may not necessarily
represent the opinicn of UOE ar any entity in the UOB Group

From: Michelle Ong Siew Bee [maiItn:miche"e.ong@wearnes.mm]

Sent: Wednesday, 31 October, 2018 10:04 AM

To: CHAN LI 5l <lisi@uoi.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Our Ref: SJP6299M : Your Insured: GANTRY POLE LOCATED AT BLK 268 BT BATOK
CARPARK HDB U19 EXIT 2 DOA 12/10/2018 @ ARD 1550HRS UOI's claim ref: L11D55471811

Importance: High

Dear Li 5i,

Please arrange for survey on 7' Oct 2018 (Wednesday) between 10am to 12pm.
Kindly confirm the appointment in writing on urgent basis.

Thanks.

Best regards,

Michelle Ong



Service. Consultant
Bodyshop & Paint

Wearnes Automaotive Pte. Ltd.

245 plexandra Road Singapore 159103
M (65 5129 4556 F (85) 6264 7137

WWW, WERMTICE,COM michelle onefiwearnss.com

This email, including any attachment, is confidantial and may also be privileged.
if you have received it in error, please nolify ug immediately by reply email and then dalete this message from your system.
Blaase do nat capy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose ifs contents or any attachment to any other persarn. Thank you.

From: CHAN LI Sl <lisi@uoi.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, October 29, 2018 9:10 AM

To: Michelle Ong Siew Bee <michelle.ong@wearnes.com>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Our Ref: SJP6299M ; Your Insured: GANTRY POLE LOCATED AT BLK 268 BT BATOK
CARPARK HDB U19 EXIT 2 DOA 12/10/2018 @ ARD 1550HRS UOI's claim ref: 111055471811

Dear Michelle,

We refer to your email on 27 October 2018,

We are agreeable to explore direct settlement on the following conditions:

1) That you would abide by the recommendation provided by our appointed surveyor on costs of repairs and.

2) That we shall not be held liable for any delay caused at your end due to your inability to obtain the spare parts to
carry out the repair to your client's vehicie within the reasonable period of time.

For the pre repair inspection, we propose surveyor LLK Auto Censultants Pte Ltd. Please confirm if you are agreeable
5o that we can make the necessary arrangements with LKK.

Thank you.

Regards,

Chan Li Si

Executive
Claims

United Qverseas Insurance Limited

5 anson Boad, #28-01 Springleal Tower, Singapore 073908
Main + (85) 6222 7733 | DIO - (B3) 5400 4330 | Fax + (B5) 6327 3859 | Email « lisi i.com.

UOB EMAIL DISCLAIMER

Any person receiving this email and any attachment(s) contained, shall treat the infarmation as confidential and not misuse, Copy,
disclose. distribute or retain the information in any way that amounts to a breach of confidentiality. If you are not the intended
recipient, please delste all copies of this email from your computer system. As the integrity of this message cannot be guaranteed,
neither UOB nor any entity in the UOB Group shall be responsible for the contents. Any opinion in this email may not necessarily
represent the opinion of UOB or any entity in the UOB Group

Erom: Michelle Ong Siew Bee [mailto:michelle.ong@wea rnes.com]j

Sent: Saturday, 27 October, 2018 1:11 PM

To: CHAN LI 5l <lisi@uoi.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Our Ref: SJP6299M ; Your Insured: GANTRY POLE LOCATED AT BLK 268 BT BATOK

CARPARK HDB U19 EXIT 2 DOA 12/10/2018 @ ARD 1550HRS UOI's claim ref: 111055471811
Importance: High




Dear Li 5i,
please advise on liability clearance on urgent basis.

Thanks.

Best regards,

Michelle Ong
Service Consultant
Bodyshop & Paint

Wearnas Automotive Pte. Lid.
240 Alexandra Road Singapore 159103
M (65) 9129 4556 F (65) 6264 7137

WWW, WEATTES. COm mighelle ongfweames com

This email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged.
if you have received it in arror, please natify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your system.
Elease do nof copy it or use if for &Ry pUIPOse, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank you.

From: CHAN LI Sl <lisi@uoi.com.sg>

sent: Tuesday, October 23, 2018 2:10 PM

To: Michelle Ong Siew Bee <michelle.ong@wearngs.com>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Our Ref: SJP6299M ; Your Insured: GANTRY POLE LOCATED AT BLK 268 BT BATOK
CARPARK HDB U19 EXIT 2 DOA 12/10/2018 @ ARD 1550HRS UOl's claim ref: L11D55471811

Without Prejudice
Dear Michelle,
We refer to your email dated 22 October 2018.

We are the public liability insurers of Secure Parking Singapore and the above captioned incident was notified to us
on 18 October 2018.

We are currently investigating the matter and will revert soon.

Regards,

Chan Li Si

Executive
Claims

United Overseas Insurance Limited

4 Anson Road, #28-01 Springleafl Tower, Singapore 0795089
Main « (85) 6222 7733 | DID - (65) BADO G330 | Fax + (65) 5327 3869 | Ermail « liif@uoi.con.

UOB EMAIL DISCLAIMER

Any person receiving this email and any attachment{s) contained, shall treat the information as confidential and nol misuse, copy,
disclose, distribute or retain the information in any way that amounts to a breach of confidentiality. If you are not the intended
recipient, please delete all copies of this email from your computer system. As the integrity of this message cannot be guaranteed,
neither UOB nor any entity in the UOB Group shall be responsible for the contents. Any opinion in this email may not necessarily
represent the opinion of UOB or any entity in the UOB Group.

From: LEW JENNY
sent: Tuesday, 23 October, 2018 12:47 PM
To: CHAN LI 5l <lisi@uoi.com.sg=



Subject: FW: Direct settlement - Our Ref: SJP6299M ; your Insured: GANTRY POLE LOCATED AT BLK 268 BT BATOK
CARPARK HDB U198 EXIT 2 DOA 12,!" 10/2018 @ ARD 1550HRS
Importance: High

Dear Lisi

FYA

Warmest Regards

Jenny Lew

Claims Department

United Overseas Insurance Limited

3 Ansan Road, #28-01 Springleaf Tower, Singapore 078809
Main «(65) 6222 7733 | DID = (B5) 8430 9329 | Fax + (§5) 6327 38658 | Email » {ennylew{Euol.com. sq

UOBE EMAIL DISCLAIMER

Any person receiving this email and any attachment(s) contained, shall ireat the information as confidential and not misuse, copy,
disclose, distribute or retain the information in any way that amounts to a breach of confidentiality. If you are not the intended
recipient, please delete all copies of this email from your computer system. As the integrity of this message cannot be guaranteed,
neither UOB nor any entity in the UOB Group shall be responsible for the contents Any opinion in this email may not necessarily
represent the opinion of UQB or any entity in the UOB Group.

From: Michelle Ong Siew Bee [mailto:michelle.ong@wearnes.com]

Sent: Monday, 22 October, 2018 6:54 PM

To: LEW JENNY <jennylew@uoi.com.sg>; LEE KATIE <katielee@uoi.com.sg=

Subject: Direct Settlement - Our Ref: SIP6299M ; Your Insured: GANTRY POLE LOCATED AT BLK 268 BT BATOK
CARPARK HDB U19 EXIT 2 DOA 12/10/2018 @ ARD 1550HRS

Importance: High

Dear Sirs,

We refer to the above matter.
Attached for Direct Settlement.
Kindly revert asap.

Best regards,

Michelle Ong
Service Consultant
Bodyshop & Paint

Wearnes Automotive Pte. Ltd.

249 Alexandra Road Singapore 158103

M (55) 0128 45568 F (B5) 6264 7137

www weames.com  fichelle ong@weames.con)

This email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged.
If you have received it in 8rron, please notify us immediately by reply amail and then delete this message from your system.
Please do not copy if or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank you.




Veron Chen (LKKAuUto)

From: yeron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 15 November 2018 12:53 PM

To: ‘Michelle Ong Siew Bee’; Taufikh (LKKAuto); SUR
Subject: RE: FINAL BILL for SIP6299M

Dear Michelle,

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Confirm amount $1950 before GST @ 3 working days.

Kindly send Final invoice and all supporting documents to UNITED OVERSEAS INSURANCE LTD.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Michelle Ong Siew Bee <michelle.ong@wearnes.com=

sent: Wednesday, 14 November 2018 6:43 PM

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@Ikkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Subject: FINAL BILL for SIPE299M

Importance: High

Dear Taufikh,
Please refer to Final Bill as attached.

Best regards,

Michelle Ong
Service Consultant
Bodyshop & Paint

Wearnes Automotive Pte. Ltd.

_w_ 249 Alexandra Road Singapore 158103

M (55) 5120 4556 F (66) 6264 7137
WEARNES  ywwwearmes.com michellg ongiwearmes. com
This emall, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged.
If ol have received it in emor, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your system.
Elease do not copy it or use if for any purpose, or disclose ifts contents or any gitachment to any other person. Thank you.



ATWRATET 38043 | Weames Autornotive Pie Lid - Lang Kee
ENTRY DATE & TIME: 18/10/2018 17:21
SUAMITTED BY: Ho Ruimeng Rschmand

L AF |1:«,‘

Your NCD will be affected due to late reporting
Actual e-Filling Submission Date & Time: 19/10/2018 18:29

SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT

IMPORTANT NOTICE

1. Plaasa report nudTec:II tha datails of the accdant to speed up the claims process
2. This Form must ke completad by the Policyholder andior the Aulhorised Driver,

3. Information provided must be as truthful and accurate as possible. Any wiltul misrepresentation or witholding of material facls may allow insurance companies bo

repudiate policy liabiity

4. Tha issue and acceplance of this Form by insurance companies is nat an admission of policy habilty on the part of tha insurance companies.
5. Any false reporting may be referred to the Police for investigation.

&. This repart will be forwarded by the insurers of the GIA Records Managemeni Cenre established by the General Insurance Association of Singapore (GIA] for
archiving and that copies of this report will, for a fee, be made available upon application by interested parties.
7. By tne lodgement of this report 1o the insurers, you hereby consent o the archiving of this repart al the centre and to copies of the report being made available

aforesaid

ACCIDENT STATEMENT

Date Of Report
Date Of Accident
Exact Location Of Accident

Country/State of Loss

19/10/2018 17:21

12/10/2018 15:50

BLK 268 BT BATOK CARPARK HDB U1S EXIT 2
SINGAPORE

DETAILS OF OWN VEHICLE

Vehicle Registration Number
Insured/Policyholder
Mame Of Registered Owner
NRIC No

Email Address

Mobile Phone Mo
Alternative Phone No
Vehicle Particulars
Manufacturer

Model

Exact Purpose for which vehicle was being used at
time of accident

Are you claiming under your own insurance policy
for repair to your vehicle?

If Mo, Please state action to be taken
Vehicle Category

Insurance Company

Name of Insurance Company
Type Of Coverage

Fleat Palicy

Policy Number

Cover Note Number

Driver

Name of Driver

NRIC No

Date Of Birth

Oeccupation

Date Of Driving Pass

Driving Experience

Gender

Mobile Mumber

Fax Number

Contact Number

EMail Address

SJPGE295M

CHUA KOK CHING
S7028931H

NOEMAIL

(LOCAL) +65-86607173
OTHERS-86607175

VOLVO
S60-1.5 T2 (A)

S0OCIAL

NO

THIRD PARTY
PRIVATE CAR

AlG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE. LTD.
COMPREHENSIVE

MO

210047850702

CHUA KOK CHING
$7028931H

14/08/1970

INDOOR

04/07/1990

28 YEARS AND 3 MONTHS
MALE

(LOCAL) +65-06607175

OTHERS-86607175
NOEMAIL
Page 1 of 14



Address
652194

NO
OWNER

Paostcode
Was driver an employee of the Insured's Company
If Mo, Relationship of the Driver with the Insured

Vehicle Registration Number of Driver's Own -
Vehicle =

Insurance Company of Driver's Own Vehicle -

General Information of the Accident

Type Of Accident

Weather Conditions CLEAR

Road Surface DRY

Other Information

Was any foreign vehicle involved in this accident? NO

Mumber of vehicles involved in the accident 1

Was any body injured in the Accident? NO

Was any injured conveyed to hospital by NO

ambulance?

Was any other material or property damaged? YES

| have been approached by unknown person(s)

soliciting/offering accident claims assistance. NG

Number of Passengers (Including Driver) 2

FPassenger 1 NAME:
GENDER:

Details of Police Action

Was the accident reported to the police? NO

If ¥Yes Please state which Police Station

Was notice of intended Prosecution given? NO

If Yes,against whom?

Circumstances of Accident

Flease refer attachments.

Attachment(s)

Are accident photos available for attachment? YES

Was there any video captured by Car Camera? NO

Was there any audio recorded? NO

BLK 1948 BUKIT BATOK WEST AVENUE 6 #12-243

HIT BY FALLEN TREE / OTHER OBJECTS

© WENG QING YING
. FEMALE

DETAILS OF OTHER VEHICLE PROPERTY 1

Wehicle Registration Number
Wehicle Make/Model/Colour
Details Of Properties GANTRY POLE
Vehicle Category NAUNKNOWN
Name of Driver
NRIC/Passport Number
Contact Mumber 96729909
Address

Fostcode

Insurance Company Name

Mature Of Damage

Mo, Of Passenger (Including Driver)

Page 2 of 14
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Vehicle Registration Mumber of Drivar's Own wn Vehicle (if
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GENERAL INFORMATION OF THE ACCIDENT
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Circumatance of the Accldent
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CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE

WEARNES AUTO PROTECTOR (VOLVO) PRIVATE VEHICLE

Name of Policyholder  : CHUA KOK CHING Vehicle No. 1 SJPG298M
Period of Insurance : 10 Aug 2018 To 09 Aug 2019 Policy No. : 2100478507-02
Engine No. + B4154T51618341 Endorsement No.

Chassis No. : YV1FS28C05G2415803 Issued Date : 26 Jul 2018

ABOUT THE COVER

MakeMadel AOLYO 860 T2
Engine Capacity/Tonnage : 149800 CC Sum Insured : Market Value First Year of Registration : 2016
Driver Restriction t NA Off Peak Car : No Insuring with COE/PARF  : Yes

| Person or Classes of Persons Entitled to Drive™

a} The Folicyholder

b Ay other pensan who = drivng an e Policyholder's order or with his/her pemission

This Palicy wil ndamnify thi Policyholdes of any auonsa snyer paly if heishe mests the specfied Aga condtion

Yol have b pay an aoditonal sum of §3,000 a8 “Inexpenencan Drmer Excass” (*IDR") il You are or Your Autherised Driver {named or uanamad) has less than 2 years driving expanence

Age Condition : 35 years old and above

Limitation as to use®
Use only for social, domastic and plaasuna PUMOSES BnC for 1he Polcyholders busmess. This Poacy does nal cover UsS i hine o rewaed, crivirg Tuition, driving test, racing, pace-making reliabiisy trial of
apead-tasting, the camiag of gonds afhar than sarmgles in cannection with any irage or helkiness oF use bor Bry pUTDOS 0 connechon wil kotor Trade

Loss of Use 20006

* Limizations rendered iroperatve by Seclion B of the Molor Vehicles [Third-Party Risks ang Compengation] Act {Cap. 18%) and Baction 25 of the Road Transport Act. 1087 (Malaysial, are not 1o be
incluted under these headings ]

Section 1
Fire - 33 Own Damaga - 3800 Theft - 50 Flood Cover - 50

Section 2
Property Damage - $0

Windscreen : 5100

mMamed Driver and EXCeSS (where appicabie)
CHLIA KOK CHING - 3800 (Own Damage}

APPROVED REPORTING CENTRES/AUTHORISED REPAIRERS (F RELATED REPAIRS)

1 Waames Automotive Pie Lid fdd; 248 Alexandra Road Singapors 158935 GAS0LE80 BATARASD

Far ofher Approved Reparting Cantresific Authorisad Repairers, please contact our 24-hour secident emengency hodne gt +55 8338 6200, Altarnately, you may refier lo A O webisie wiww 2i0.Com 53
or AIG SG Mobile App. Simply seanch and downlsad "ANG 367 from iTunes or Google Play

IMPORTANT NOTES

Hire Purchase Company/Employer's Loan: OCBC Bank Lid

\fa haredy cerity that the policy to which this Cartificate af Inaurencs redates i issued in accordanca with the prowisions of the Motor Yehides(Third Party Risks and Compensation) Act (Cap. 188}, Pan [V of
the Roas Trarsport Act, 1987 {Malaysia) and Molor Viehicles {Third Party Risks) Rules, 1959 [Malaysia).
0503485744 u

.‘T.t

WEARNES AUTOMOTIVE - FFL (V)
45 LENG KEE ROAD

1001 365 THLACA

SINGAPORE 150103 AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.
Undanaritten by AIG Asla Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. AUTHORISED REPRESENTATIVE

SEROLG
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WEARNES
SERYICE ESTIMATE
85482 - CO0001 SI.: SERVWICE SnALES pC
Mr Chua Kok Ching GST Reg.Ho:HZBT2062Z8%
Blk 180 Yung Shena Road Inv.No. E4P 0 Paage
k13-109 Inv.date 22/10/2018
WIF No. : Sa968
Singapore &10180 Veh. In/Out:
$Tal . No. Hobile: 26607175
Feg.No. SIPL299H
Closed by Michelle Ong S1ew Be Reg.date .: 10/08/201¢
ave Consultant Milaage . o]
Remarks ...... Mr Chua Kok Ching Chassis Mo; YVIF3Z28COGZ415802
Op.HNo Description Hech 4dty Price Disc% PKa Amount &
o
202 T0O REPAIR REAR BUHPER 0 1600.00° O LE600.00 3
200 TO PUTTY SPRAY PAINT ON 0 1400,00 O 1,400,008 l?aﬁ
REAR BUHPER
280 TO CHECK WIRIMG THCLUDE Q 450,00 450.00 uu,f“
RESETTING OF ALL ELECTRICAL
HODULES
LKK Auto Consultants hence nolify TaudWAe qa3asH Y
the Repairer of the following: . '
= To resurvey belone/alier spray painting

» T display damaged partis) during resurvey

= Parts prices are subject to confirmation

® Third party survey & on @ “Without Prejudices” basa

= No illegal modification|s) is aliowed

* Supplamentary itemis) must be resurveyed and
is subject o final approval from Insurance Company |

Acknowledged by Repaier

[l e N

FParts
(= Wl - Lo |

GST: 5=5

Wearnes Automotive Pta. Ltd,

StdRated:

Signature:
Date:
—
Total L 450.00
Totkta l Q.00
Total 0.00

O=0ut0fScope; I=lercHated

45 Leng Kee Road, Singapore 159103 T +65 6430 4930 www.wearnesauin.com

Cao reg no. 199501400R / GST reg no. MIRGI0620Y

2 fie e \52
3|..Lu-9 IWW

ﬁhﬁ“ﬂjﬁﬂﬁa¥klﬁfmkf

=

e

oW

Gross Total 3,450,000
Met. . 3. 450,00
GST @& 7.0% 241 .5
73 7, 1 —— 5.691.50
Paid.....sx- 0.00
Fleaze Fay.. I 69150



hﬁ#EEﬂ\FZFHIEEE
enpm ey X R sy LT E:
g = Uodanl 5l - UNITED OVERSEAS IHSURENCE LTD
YHLTED OVERSEAS TNSHRANCE LTO {al Req Ho-HLB8920&28%
% AHS0OH ROAD tpyoMo. . o B&P ¢ Page 1
gee-01 SPRIMGLERAF TOWER rey . date. : 13F11/2018
G IHGHPORE O79909 BIP Mo. - 3964
vah.In/0ut: 07/11/2018 oo fLL/ 2048
§Tel No. . @ b2IE F1E
Red . Ho - SIP&ZOMN
Closed by ... sichelle Ong Siew Be Reg.date .: Lo /08 f 201
aye Consultant ¢ AL wileage ..: 21,497
REMaikE ooeee= % #r Chua Kok Ehing Chassis Hoz Yy 1FSZACOHZALSE0S
Op.MNo peacription Mech Qty price Disch PRg Anount 1]
BoZ To REFAIR REAR EUMPER 0 Bo0.00 0 o0, 00 S’#f.
/00 [0 PUTTY SPRAY PAINT ONW 0 Too. o0 U Ja0,.00 5
RERR BUMPER /
280 70 CHECK WIRING INCLUDE 0 450 .00 0 450,00 —_:./
RESETTING OF ALL ELECTRICAL
HMODLILES
Gross Total L.,950.,00
Labour Tolka 1 1.950.00 Mot g e 1,950.00
Far ts Teptan l 0. 00 GsT & 7.0% 15550
Package T e 3 .00 TOEAL i wirom s - 7., 086.50
Badd . aemme (.00
Flease Pay.. 2, 086,50

GaT: S=StdRateds G=fut0f3capes 7= iernfated

Wearnes Autamotive Pte. Lid.
45 Leng Kea Road, Singapore 155103 T +65 6230 4930 www.wEarmesaute.com

o tag ne. WHOSO400R / GET reg no. MIZBS20628X



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubi industrial Park, Singapore 408833

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo 199607198R GST Reg. No 15-9607198-R

Affiliated to Federa

tion Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

UNITED OVERSEAS INSURANCE LTD Ref : CS/UOI18019812/T1vbn2
gs:i?;:gﬂ%ﬁ%gsmmpo% 079909 Dale:: (F0-11:2010 lemmumlm
Code: UOI2
£ Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. PUBLIC LIABILITY veh. Inspected SJP 6299M
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. L11D55471811 Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From CHAN LI 8 Assign Date 31102018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model VOLYVO S60 c.c 1408
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2018
Chassis No. v\1FS2BC0G2415803 Colour GREY
Odometer Steering IN ORDER
[ |Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOoD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre [215/55 R16 MICHELIN & mm
L/H Front Tyre |215/55 R16 MICHELIN & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |21 5/55 R16 MICHELIN 6 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |215/55R16 MICHELIN & mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR OIS PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS
5. General Information
Accident Date  12/10/2018 Inspection Date 07112018
Survey held at WEARNES AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD
249 ALEXANDRA ROAD
SINGAPORE 159935
5a. Remarks
AYTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
BN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair
ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 3 Working Days




'’ 74 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

= f.; = - 51 Ui Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
e TEL. 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No- 159607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page No.1of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SJP 6299M
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qt}' Daﬁﬁﬂpﬂuﬂ of Parts cﬂﬂdiﬂnﬂ Wm’kﬂhop ts} la}
LABOUR
TO REPAIR REAR BUMPER. 1,600.00 800.00
TO PUTTY SPRAY PAINT ON REAR BUMPER. 1,400.00 700.00
TO CHECK WIRING INCLUDE RESETTING OF ALL 450.00 450.00
ELECTRICAL MODULES.
3,450.00 1,950.00
GRAND TOTAL 3,450.00 1,950.00
[ RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS | | 1,950.00|
Report Ref No. CS/UOI 8019812/T1vbn2
MOHAMAD TAUFIKH ADRIAN LING WAI PING
M.MATAI, AMSAE-A B.Eng AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-AM.MATAI

Automotive Assessor Licensed Appraiser




