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! / l'/ Auto

- Consultants
D, B A Pie Lig Campany Registration No 199607 198R
S} LRI AVE L, #02-25 PAYA UBL INDUS TRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 4084933 TEL: (0651 62563561 FAX 165 62564315
Your Ref’ GUI1111M/RH/pl
Our Refl: CS/EGI18019802/Uvb Date: 16/11/2018

The Motor Claims Department

M/s: ERGO INSURANCE PTE LTD

Dear Sir/Madam,

Without Prejudice

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO.GBA 8218H

We thank you for your instruction on

1/11/2018

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on

31/10/2018 at the premises of M/s

and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount
Revised Estimate Amount
"Check” Items Amount
Market Value

LTA Reimbursement Value
MNett Value

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the
rear o/s portion

Comments/Present Status:

Damages Consistent

Yours faithfully,

MARCUS CHUA
Licensed Appraiser

FASTECH AUTO FTE LTD

+ 5%10,923.20
£ §%4,000,00 (LUMP SUM)
1 5%
: 5%
1 5%
(5%

rear




Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 16 November 2018 9:53 AM

To: 'Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.)

Cc SUR

Subject: RE: GU1111M / TP : GBAB218H/LKK / DOA : 30/10/2018
Attachments: GBA 8218H PREL! REVISED.pdf

Dear Pei Li,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle GBA 8218H
Date of survey: 31/10/2018
Number of days :4 days

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 1 November 2018 2:31 PM

To: 'Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.)’ <Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg>
Cc: SUR <sur@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: GU1111M /TP : GBAS218H/LKK / DOA : 30/10/2018

Dear Pei Li,
Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle GBA 8218H on 31/10/2018.

We are pending estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 1 November 2018 11:45 AM

To: 'Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.)’ <Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg>; assignments
<assignments@lkkauto.com=

Cc: SUR <sur@|kkauto.com=

Subject: RE: GU1111M /TP GBAB218H/LKK / DOA : 30/10/2018

) |



Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.
BEST REGARDS, .

G Nivitha | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte, Ltd.) [mailto:Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg)
Sent: Thursday, 1 November 2018 11:41 AM

To: 'admin-d@lkkauto.com' <admin-d @lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM' <ASSIGNMENTS@LEKKAUTO.COM=

Subject: 01 : GU1111M /TP : GBAS218H/LKK / DOA : 30/10/2018

Dear Catherine/Nivitha,

In compliance with “State Courts Practice Directions Amendment No.1 of 2016” in regards to the Pre Repair Survey,
both TP repairer and ERGO Insurance Pte Ltd have agreed on your company LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD to be
the “Single Joint Expert”.

Please assist to conduct this survey from FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD,

ADDRESS 1 1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 6
#01-46/48/50 AUTOBAY
SINGAPORE 417883

PERSON TO CONTACT : NANCY @ 6746 5405

ERGO OFFICER-IN-CHARGE : ROHAINI

Note: To survey on without prejudice basis. Please advise the consistency of damages to third party vehicle. Obtain
estimate from workshop and inform the repairer in writing, that you are require to conduct a re-survey before
vehicle is returned to claimant. They are to contact your office directly. Please do keep us in the loop.

Please fill up the necessary on ERGO PRS Form from workshop and return to us together on your update of the survey
status via Survey.Report{@ergo.com.sg.

Attached are insured and TP's SAS (note: reports not to be released to any Third Party). No estimates was provided.

Kindly acknowledge receipt of this email.

Regards
Yee PeiLi

Claims Assistant (Mator)
ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.

5 Temasek Boulevard, #04-01 Sunlec Tower Five
Singapore 038285

DD +65 682599154

Tel +55 BBZ2Y 9199



Fax® +55 6820 0247

ERGO

ERGO is one of the major insurance groups in Germany and Europa. Warldwide. ERGO i represented in more than 30 couniries and concentrates
on Eurape and Asia. ERGO is part of Munich Re (Group), ane of the workd's leading risk Carners

WWW.BT00.CO0M S5

. AVG Thic email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
; WWW.avg.com



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAUto)

Sent: Thursday, 1 November 2018 2:31 PM

To: ‘Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.)'

Ce: SUR

Subject: RE: GUT111M / TP : GBAB218H/LKK / DOA : 30/10/2018
Dear Pei Li,

Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle GBA 8218H on 31/10/2018.

We are pending estimate from repairer.

Mmaest Regards,
Veron Chen | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 1 November 2018 11:45 AM

To: 'Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.)' <Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg>; assignments
<assignments@|kkauto.com>

Cc: SUR <sur@|kkauto.com=>

Subject: RE: GU1111M /TP : GBAB218H/LKK / DOA : ap/10/2018

Dear Sir/Mdm,

“hank you for the assignment,
BEST REGARDS,
G.Nivitha | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6841-1972 | email: gssignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.) [mailto:Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg]
Sent: Thursday, 1 November 2018 11:41 AM

To: 'admin-d@lkkauto.com' <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Ce: 'ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM' <ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM>

Subject: Ol : GU1111M / TP : GBAB21BH/LKK / DOA : 30/10/2018

Dear Catherine/Nivitha,



In compliance with “State Courts Practice Directions Amendment No.1 of 2016" in regards to the Pre Repair Survey,
both TP repairer and ERGO Insurance Pte Ltd have agreed on your company LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD to be

the “Single Joint Expert”.

Please assist to conduct this survey from FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD

ADDRESS ;1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE &
#01-46/48/50 AUTOBAY
SINGAPORE 417883
PERSON TO CONTACT © NANCY @ 6746 5405
ERGO OFFICER-IN-CHARGE  : ROHAINI

Note: To survey on without prejudice basis. Please advise the consistency of damages to third party vehicle. Obtain
estimate from workshop and inform the repairer in writing, that you are require to conduct @ re-survey before
vehicle is returned to claimant. They are to contact your office directly. Please do keep us in the loop.

Please fill up the necessary on ERGO PRS Farm from workshop and return to us together on your update of the survey
status via Survey. Report@ergo.com.sg.

Attached are insured and TP's SAS (note: reports not to be released to any Third Party). No estimates was provided.

Kindly acknowledge receipt of this email.

Regards
Yee Pei Li
Claims Assistant (Motor)

ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.

5 Temasek Boulevard, #04-01 Suntec Tower Five
Singapore 038385

DID.- +B85 6829 9154

el +B5 BB20 9198

Fax +65 G829 9247

o DN ERGO

ERGO i ang of the major insurance groups in Germany and Eurcpe Worldwide, ERGO is rapresentad in more than 30 countries and concentrates
on Eurape and Asia ERGO s part of Munich Re (Graup), ene of the world's leading risk carriers

. AUG This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.



MNivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.) <Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 1 November 2018 11:471 AM

To: ‘admin-d@Ilkkauto.com'

Cc: 'ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM'

Subject: Ol: GUT111M / TP : GBAB218H/LKK / DOA : 30/10/2018

Attachments: GU1111M - SAS.pdf; GBAB218H - SAS.pdf, GBAB218H - PRS FORM.pdf; RE: Request

for PRS : GEAB218H (20.6 KE)

Dear Catherine/Nivitha,

In compliance with “State Courts Practice Directions Amendment No.1 of 2016” in regards to the Pre Repair Survey,
both TP repairer and ERGO Insurance Pte Ltd have agreed on your company LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD to be
the "Single loint Expert”.

Please assist to conduct this survey from FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD,

ADDRESS : 1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 6
#01-46/48/50 AUTOBAY
SINGAPORE 417883

PERSON TO CONTACT : NANCY @ 6746 5405

ERGO OFFICER-IN-CHARGE : ROHAINI

Note: To survey on without prejudice basis. Please advise the consistency of damages to third party vehicle. Obtain
estimate from workshop and inform the repairer in writing, that you are require to conduct a re-survey before
vehicle is returned to claimant. They are to contact your office directly. Please do keep us in the loop.

Please fill up the necessary on ERGO PRS Form from workshop and return to us together on your update of the survey
status via Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg.

Attached are insured and TP's SAS (note: reports not to be released to any Third Party). No estimates was provided.

Kindly acknowledge receipt of this email.

Regards
Yee PeiLi
Claims Asgsistant (Motor)

ERGO Insurance Pte, Ltd.

5 Temasek Boulevard, #04-01 Suntec Tower Five

ERGO

RGO 1= one of the major insurance groups in Germany and Europe Worldwide, ERGD & represented in more than 30 countries and concentratas
an Europe and Asiz. ERGO is part of Munich Re {Group), one of the world's l2ading fisk camers



ERGO

Sent via Fax
Bt 01.11.2018 ntvi i
Our Reference:  OU 1111M/RH/pl or
Your Reference: GBA 8218H
Email
nancy.lam@fastechauto.com.sg

To: FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD
Pre-Repair Survey (PRS) Acknowledgement
Vehicle For Inspection: GBA B218H
Insured's Vehicle; GU 1111m
Date Of Accident: 30.10.2018
We acknowledge receipt of your request for PRS on: 31.10.2018
In compliance with "State Courts Practice Directions Amendment No.1 of 2016", do select an assessor from
the list below and indicate your selection in the box marked =, *

AlS Automaobile Inspection Services Pte Ltd LBS LB.5S Auto Consultants Pte Lid

FTA FermTearn Consultancy Pre Ltd LKK LKE Auta Consultants Pte Ltd

1A% Infiniti Appraisal Service PS Priority Services

IPKE JP Knights Pte Ltd WAL ‘Wicom Ltd

v Others:

OFFICER-IN-CHARGE - ROHAINI

Your request for inspection does not have your client's cost of repair estimate, kindly forward a copy.
Your request for inspection does not have your client's GIA report, kindly forward a copy.
‘We acknowledge your interest for direct settlement, we will assess & revert scon upon receipt of estimate,

Our Insured's driver has not reported the accident to us todate.

Frepared by:

Signature:

Y. p

Pei Li 6B29 9194 claims@ergo.com.s
FAX : 6829 9247

Assessor use only:

Assignment Date:
Assignment Time:

Remarks:

Waorkshop use only:
A lil rksh LiH

Date:
Time
Inspector:
D Vehicle not available at the appointed date and time.

Kindly acknowledge our Assessor presence for the above job .

Workshop Acknowledgement & Stamp.
Naote: OQur Inspection s on @ without admission to labliity basis.
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Used Tovota Dyna Car & Used Cars & Vehicles Singapore - sgCarMart

SGEARMART.COM Login  Sign up

Mew Cars i [ Sell My Car Directary Products Insurance Articles

Forum

Resources

500+ dealers . +Sellur Car for More Cash :
competed to " . Highest Price or Get $100 Free | SELLYOURCAR
buy my carl \ ; + Get Pald Now, Handover Later ]
- L)
Post an Advertisement VALUE FOR MONEY B
Sell it yoursel Advertise & ot just val u_E FOR HME =
$53 until it's SOLD! A PEACE OF MIND =
. e e Y
HOTLINE: 6741 9997 ' | vewourcars -
Browse by Category v «Back {1 2 ) Next Soet by Date Posted ¥ || 20 resubis/page ¥
36 vehicles Toyots Dyna b
Mol Price Depreciation Eng Cap Mileage eh Type
Search Selectien  Toyota Dyna Ary Ay m m:;:zlar{s] e Arry Ary Available
Toyota Dyna 150 (COE till $17,800 §7.350 fyr L4-Aug-2007 2,582 oc 417,848 km Truck Availahle
0a,/20212)
Fuel Type: Diess|
Lowest Price In The Market, Ko Further Discount. Serious Buyer Are Welcome!
Thank One Automobee & Trading
Padted: O1-May-2018 Tags: 2007 Toyoka Dyra, 2007 toyats dyna, Topcks Dyid, tovots dyres, Tayats, Dyras, dyna, Uded Toyota
Toyota Oyna 100 (COE till £27,800 §6,640 fyr 08-Jan-2008 2,582 oc 180,000 km Truck Available
01/2023)
Fual Typa: [eseal
{Original Paint Wark From Day 1) Raw Condition, Very Wel Maintained By One Single Owner, Absvays Service On Time, Low Milsage, Mint Interiar,
Fast Sabes| Sclling Cheap, Call Mow Before It Too Late, V..
Pusted: 31-0ct-2018  Taps: 7008 Toyom Dyna, 2008 toyota dyna, Toyoka Dyna, toyoca dyna, Toyota, Dyna, dyna, Used Toyo:
Toyola Dyna 150 (COE till $26,800 47,080 fyr 14-Aug-2007 2,982 ar - Truck Available
08/2022)
Fuel Typa: [escl
‘We Provide Doorstep Viewing, Cheapest] Excellent Conddtion Wear And Tear Already Replaced No Repair Needed, High Loan High Trade In Welcome, " FranRI A ]
Door Step Available Call Now,
Posted; 31-0ct=2018 Tags voka dyma, Toyota, Cyvna, dyaa, Ussd Tayats
Toyota Dyna 150 (COE till §19,800 $6,470 fyr 11-Jun-2008 2,982 oo . Truck Available
06/2023)
Fuel Type: Diesel
= 1 Crewnar Qinky, The Maost Durable Lorry In Town, Monthly Loan AL $668 Only, Price Inclusive OF 5 Years CDE, Wear And Tear Al Done dnd Ready To
e Go, 100% Eagy Loan Avallable With Low Intarest Rate, You Ma... L TRRNIN A
506G Motor Link Pte Lid
Porstend: 30-Cct-H01E  Tags 2008 Toyals Dyna, 2008 toyota dyna, Toyota Dyna, toyota dyna, Tovota, Dyna, dvna, Used Tovaka
GETYOUR Is your COE expiring? Let us help you ronaw itl
COE Gesting your COE renewed is sagy, fast and aFardable. We'll help you renew your COE and get a lnan for it. Get the cheapest loan in town and an
RENEWAL  aporoval In 2 days without effort! Enguire boday,
| LOAN
Toyota Dyna 150 (COE till $29.800 $6,320 fyr 21-Jul-2008 2,582 cc - Truck Availale
07 /2023)
Fuel Type: Diesel
Addidonal Insurance Disoount Will Ba Given To You! Once You Purchase A Vehiche From Ls! Very Wel Maintained, Mo Repairs Needed, Comes With
Mew 5§ Years COE, High Loan With Low Interest Available, Tra... L FRaE a0
KEL Automotive Pte Lid
Pathed: 30-0ct-2008  Tags: 2008 Toyoka Dyna, 2008 toyota dyna, Toyola Dyra, tovola gvra, Towota, (vma, dyna, Uksed Toyom
,m! Toyota Dyna 150 [(New 5-yr $33,777 $6,750 jyr HOct- 2008 2,962 oc - Truck Available
3 COE)
e o ™8 Fuel Type: Diesel Sl
PEE=—=0  Adaninnal Insurance Discount When You Purchase From Us! Very Well Maintained, Mo Repairs Needed Toyota Dyna With Super Cold Cabin Height
1.& Wiah 4 Swing Door, Easy To Load Up Your Goods! Comes W,
omotive Pe Lid
hitpsJfwww.sgcarmart.comiused_cars/listing. php?RGD=10&MOD=Toyola%200yna&RPG=208VEH=08AVL=2 113
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> Back to OneMotoring

' Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner 1D Type:
Onwner 1D:
Wehicle Details
Vehicle Mo
ehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Wehicle Make:
Vehicle Model:
Primary Caolour:
Manufacturing Year:
Engine MNo.:
Chassis Mo.:
Maximum Power Qutput:
Open Market Value:
Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:

= Transfer Count:
Actual ARF Paid:
Intended PARF Rebate Details
BARF Eligibility:
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date;
COE Category:
COE PeriodiYears):
POP Paid:
COE Rebate Amount:
Total Rebate Amount:
Message

PARFICNE Rahals Frooiny

Company
7741M

GBAB218H

Mo

01 Mov 2018
TOYOTA

DYNA 150 MANUAL
Blue

2007

1KD1722484
JTFAT35YB03001544
$24,285.00

04 Feb 2008

04 Feb 2008

0

$£1.215.00

Mo

£0.00

03 Feb 2023

C - Goods Vehicle & Bus
5

$23.496.00
$19,999.00
$19,999.00

Please note that all future COE renewals for this vehicle can only be for a S-year period, subject to the statutory lifespan (if applicable) of the

vehicle.

The information contained herein is correct as at 01 Nov 2018

PILESL VLIV, v, SUTILAY VI BLUONY eNYUINE MEDE1ED Y FUDICDBIOTEUETEGINPULIFUNL LIVIN_ILFSTUIUSUUEL T

il



Date of Accident
Accident Place
Vehicle. No. (Car Plate No.)

X Bf,fwfl'.‘?

A+
(LB AX2 I¥H Make/Model: B

Accident Time; 2+ S f[f"“l (24-HR-Formag)

Lﬂu'-.:mi Eif-m‘,f,a . Kcacif

Insurace Company P—f‘j 0 Policy No: 1) AC V(75022098
Dwnarorooﬁ:pmyﬁame /IC No. IIQ'E. Aut ¥ P{-{_ L'h:f
. Owner or Company Contact No. Owner'sHp Company Tel
DRIVER’S Name / IC No. Cf%"ﬁ‘ ﬁf:‘w{ Cagios /”:‘e? "—'{*'ﬂ}'?q,L
DRIVER’S Date Of Birth 10 o] 1968 DRIVER’S License Pass Date >/ > [ (992
Relationship of Owner & Driver :Spome\Pmm\Chﬁd:m\&hﬁng\E{k@lﬂm:
DRIVER’S Address 1 BIK 1> Upnir Buon f‘-‘“‘-\ Read 205-818
DRIVER’S ContactNo/ AltNo. 1 683 4 T4 R it -
DRIVER’S Occupation :mr}oomo@gﬁe.g. working inside or outside office)
Email Address :
Weather & Road Surface :CLEAR&DRY\RAIND@ET\AFTERM&WET
Reporting Type ;Rapmmgmwxcm@m\mmcmmm
Namber of Passengers (inchuding Driver): | D r{ yes”
Wmﬁmmyﬁdm%ﬂuedhywm@ﬂﬂ
Emmhﬁhhvehiﬂcwbdng aitheﬁmﬂefmddthﬁvﬂem\kapmpme
Any Injury (If YES, Pls state): jM

0 Party Did Pz
Vehicle. No: Gy UM (Efjﬂ) Vehicle, No:
Vehicle Make\hiods: ' Vehicle Make'Model;_
Name Driver; Name Driver:
IC No. Driver/Contact; - IC No. Driver/Contact:

* NEW - Passenger’s name & gemder:



SKETCH PLAN

IMPORTANT NOTICE

Please report correctly the details of the accident to speed up the claims process.

2. This Form must be co ted Pali and/or the ised D :

3. Information provided must be as truthful and accurate as possible. Any wilful misrepresentation or withholding of material

facts may allow insurance companies to re licy lability.

4. Theissue and acceptance of this Form by insurance companies is not an admission of policy liability on the part of the insurance
companies,

5. false reporting ma erred to Police for in igation.

i

6. The report will be forwarded by the insurers of the GIA Records Management Centre established by the General Insurance
Association of Singapore (GIA) for archiving and that copies of this report will for a fee be made available upon application by
interested parties.

7. By the ladgment of this report to the insurers, you hereby consent to the archiving of this report at the centre and to coples of
the report being made available aforesaid.

8. Consent under the Personal Data Protection Act (PDPA)
| understand, acknowledge, agree and consent that:

(a) My insurer, my workshop and the General Insurance Association of Singapore (“GIA”) may/are permitted to collect, use,
disclose and/or process my personal data/personal information set outin this [form] and any other personal information
provided by me or possessed by my insurer (collectively the "Personal Information”) and disclose and transfer such
Personal Information to all insurer(s) who have insured vehicle(s) involved in this accident (all insurer{s) who have insured
vehicle(s) involved in this accident shall be collectively referred to as the “Insurers”), the Insurers’ lawyers/law firms, the
Monetary Autherity of Singapore and any relevant Eovernment agency,/authority (such as the police), for the purpose(s)
of :

(i) processing, handling and/or dealing with my claims including the settlement of the daims and any necessary
investigations relating to the claims;

(ii) investigating the accident and/or my claims;
(iil) carrying out and/or dealing with my Instructions or responding to any enquiries by me;

(iv) administering my claims (including the mailing of correspondence, statements, invoices, reports or notices to me,
which could involve disclosure of certain personal data about me to bring about delivery of the same as well 3 on the
external cover of envelopes/mail packages); and/or

(v} complying with applicable law in ad ministering, processing, handling and/or dealing with my claims.(collectively the
“Purposes”)

(b} allinsurer{s) who have insured vehicle(s) involved in this accident and the Insurers’ lawyers/law firms, may/are permitted
to collect, use, disclose and/or process my Personal Information for one or more of the above Purposes; and

(c)  my Personal Information may/ecan be discdlosed by any of the insurers and/or GIA to their third party service providers or
agents{including their lawyers/law firms), which may be sited outside of Singapore, for one or more of the above Purposes,

(d]  my Perscnal Information will also be collected and used to compile claims history for the purpose of fraud detection,
investigation and management in present and all future claims.

(e] the information so collected under (d) above may be shared / disclosed:

(i) toallinsurers and/or any other third parties that assist in evaluating, investigating, controlling or managing fraud,
regulators, law enforcement and government agencles as reasonably required for the purposes stated, or

i) for complying with requirements under any regulations, laws or court orders.

c 4.,
£y =ral /g ,\] .
Policyholder's Signature Driver's Signature Reporting Centre Personnel's Signature
Date & Time: (If driver is not the policyholder) Mame:
Date & Time: MRIC/FIN No.:
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Policyholder's Signature

Date & Time:
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Driver's Signature

(If driver is not the policyholder)

Date & Time:

Reporting Centre Personnel's Signature
Mame:
MRIC/FIN No.:
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FASTECT AUTO PTE LTD L/Ji/?
1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 6 3/ Jrol o
#01-46/48/50 r
SINGAPORE 417883
VEHICLE NO: GBA 8218H
aty PARTICULAR _ : )
1PCS TAILGATE /H 3t O D Kt $1,655.10 -
1PCS TAILGATE LOWER MEMBER Le~t ~$678.10—
1PCS TAILGATE LOCK HINGES O/S L of $195.50_—
1PCS TAILGATE LOWER L' PANEL OIS 7¢°. () KA $10850
1PCS TAILLAMP O/S Crn $245.30—
1PCS DROPSIDE GATE O/S Wi e “ $2,210.10
1PCS DROPSIDE GATE LOWER MEMBER O/S - Buc/Bs{  s98550, -
1PCS FRONT DOOR REAR CABIN PILLAR 0/S FATE $665.10,%
$6,743.20
S.NETT
1SET TAILGATE CORPORATE STICKER A $500.00 201
1PCS TAILGATE 'TOKM/H' STICKER Al $2000 /0
1PCS TAILGATE 13 PAX' STCIKER ALA §20.00 /0
1 SET DROPSIDE GATE CORPORATE STICKER OIS A $500.00 o/
1PCS DROPSIDE GATE TOP RAILING O/S Aol $480.00 3,7
1 PCS TAILGATE LOWER 'L' PANEL RUBBER Q/S

LABOUR CHRAGES:

TO CHECK WIRING

TO SPRAY RUSF PROOFING

LABOUR FOR PANEL BEATING & REPLACING PARTS
TO PUTTY & SPRAY PAINTING

Uning resurvey
nfirmation

1150 a "Withou! Prejudice” basis
115) & adlowad

TS ] Must be resurveyed and

I &pproval from Insurance Company

110

Acknowledged by Repairer
SIgnature:

Dlate

73, $6000 -

$80.00 o)
$120.00 £ o
$1,200.00 2,0
$1.200.00 75 >
TOTAL $10,923.20

J 4

po¥ 1



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL; 8256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Feg. No: 19960T198R GST Reg. Mo, 19-9607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

ERGO INSURANCE PTE LTD Ref : CS/EGIB019802/Uvbn2

5 TEMASEK BOULEVARD

LRI

#04-01 SUNTEC TOWER FIVE Date -  20-11-2018
SINGAPORE 038985
Code: EGI
Qi Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. GU 1111M Veh. Inspected GBA B218H
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. GU1111MRH/pl Excess () 0.00
Assign From ¥YEE PEI LI Assign Date 01/11/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTA DYNA (M) c.c 2982
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2008
Chassis No. JTFAT35YRO3001544 Colour BLUE
Odometer 523625 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification NIL
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |195 R15 YORKOHAMA & mm
L/H Front Tyre 195 R15 YOKOHAMA & mm
R/H Rear Tyre [155R12(D) YOKOHAMA B/& mm
L/H Rear Tyre |155R12 (D) YOKOHAMA, B/6 mm
4, Description of Damagas
THE VEHICLE SUSTAIMED DAMAGES AT THE REAR O/S PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5, General Information
Accident Date  30/10/2018 Inspection Date 30208
Survey held at FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD
1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE B
#01-46/48/50 AUTOBAY
SINGAPORE 417883
5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS,
BiIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 4 Working Days




' Vdl V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Adm B ; - 51 Ui Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo 199607T108R GST Reg. Mo, 19-96071698-R Page Mo.:1of2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. GBA 8218H
Estimate Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Wo rkshop?;}] ‘g?"
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|TAILGATE DENTED / BENT 1,655.10 1,419.10
1| TAILGATE LOWER MEMBER BENT 678.10 6T8.10
1| TAILGATE LOCK HINGES O/S BENT 195 50 195.50
1|TAILGATE LOWER “L" PANEL O/S BENT 108.50 95.50
1| TAILLAMP O/S CRACKED 24530 24530
1|DROPSIDE GATE O/S TO REPAIR SEE 2,210.10 -
LABOUR
1|DROPSIDE GATE LOWER MEMBER O/S BUCKLED f BENT 985.50 885 50
1|FRONT DOOR REAR CABIN PILLAR O/S TO REPAIR SEE 665.10 &5
LABOUR
LESS 25% DISCOUNT - -004.75
5,742.20 2.714.25
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|SET TAILGATE CORPORATE STICKER (SN) MECESSARY 500.00 250.00
1| TAILGATE "TOKM/H" STICKER (SN) MNECESSARY 20.00 10.00
1|TAILGATE "13 PAX" STICKER (SN) NECESSARY 20.00 10.00
1|SET DROPSIDE GATE CORPORATE STICKER OfS (SN) WOT NECESSARY 500.00 -
1|DROPSIDE GATE TOP RAILING O/S (SN) BENT 480.00 300.00
1| TAILGATE LOWER "L" PANEL RUBBER 0/S (SN) TORN 60.00 60.00
1.580.00 630.00
LABOUR
TO CHECK WIRING. BD.0O 20.00
TO SPRAY RUSF PROOFING. 120.00 60.00
LABOUR FOR PANEL BEATING & REPLACING 1,200.00 800.00
PARTS.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF DROPSIDE GATE
O/ AND FRONT DOOR REAR CABIN PILLAR OS5
TO PUTTY & SPRAY PAINTING. 1,200.00 TBO.00
2,600.00 1,660.00
GRAND TOTAL 10,923.20 5,004.25
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 4,000.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No, CS/EGI18019802/Uvbn2
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Report Ref No. CS/EGI18013802/Uvbn2

CHUA KANG SENG
Licensed Appraiser

DESCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report |8 made solely for the use and banefit of the Client namsd on the frond page of this Repori.




