Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Tony Ong <tony@carcrafters.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 9 January, 2019 7:46 AM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto); Vic (LKKAuto); Faisal - CarCrafters Singapore

Subject: Re: Finalize Repair Estimate & photos after paint SIA1436X / LKK Ref:
CC4/ASM18019801/ha3

Hi Rasul

Thanks for your prompt reply.
We accept lump sum $1800.00 before GST with 4 days repair.
Regards

Tony

On 8/1/2019 5:02 PM, Rasul (LKKAuto) wrote:

> Hi Tony,

>

> Refer to attachment

> There is a bit of error, the rear weather strip should not be given cos the rear hatch door was not replace.
> Anyway finalised lump sum of $ 1,800.00 / 4 days given, need your

> confirmation. So sorry on the error

>

>

>

> Best Regards,

> Rasul | Assessor

> LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

> Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315 Blk 51,
> Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933) Save the

> Earth. Print only when necessary.

>

> From: Tony Ong [mailto:tony@carcrafters.sg]

> Sent: Thursday, 22 November, 2018 1:42 PM

> To: Rasul (LKKAuto); Vic (LKKAuto); faisal@carcrafters.sg

> Subject: Finalize Repair Estimate & photos after paint SJA1436X
>

> Dear Rasul

>

> The attached files consists of Finalized Repair Estimate and photos for your scrutiny.
> Please offer your favourable lump sum with 4 days repair.

> Hope to hear from you soon.

>

Best Regards

Tony Ong
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