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Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 16 November, 2018 4:52 PM

To: Jack Ng

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT BETWEEN SLK 6006 U AND YOUR INSURED SKE 3659 Z LKK REF 

CC4/ASM18019780/ha3

Without Prejudice 

 

Dear Jack, 

 

We refer to your below email. 

 

Please be informed that our principal as of today, is still looking into the outstanding premium pending for clearance 

from our Insured and hence, could not advise for Direct Settlement yet. 

 

They will continue to follow up the matter with our Insured and we will get back to you for an update. 

 

Thank you. 

 
Best Regards, 

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

 

 

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an 
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not 
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the 
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you. 
 

 

From: Jack Ng [mailto:jackng@honda.com.sg]  

Sent: Friday, 16 November, 2018 3:44 PM 

To: Vic (LKKAuto) 

Cc: Admin A 

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT BETWEEN SLK 6006 U AND YOUR INSURED SKE 3659 Z LKK REF CC4/ASM18019780/ha3 

 

Dear Vic, 

 

Kindly update on this case, our client mentioned that this case dragging too long. 

 

 

 
Thank you and have a great days ahead  
 
Cheers !!! 
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Best Regards, 

Jack  Ng 
Hp: 8288 6309 
Email : Jackng@honda.com.sg 
BODY REPAIR AND PAINT CENTRE 

255 Alexandra Road Singapore 159937  

DID : +65 6514 5481  FAX : +65 6362 5015 

Kah Motor Co. Sdn. Bhd. 

(A MEMBER OF ORIENTAL HOLDING BERHAD) 

Website: www.honda.com.sg 

 

 

� Please consider the environment before printing this email 

CONFIDENTIAL NOTE: The Information contained in the e-mail is intended only for the use of the individual or entity named above and 

may contain information that is privileged, confidential and exempt from disclosure under applicable low. If the reader of this message is not the 

intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this communication is strictly prohibited. If you 

have received this message in error, please immediately notify the sender and delete the mail. Thank you for your collaboration. 
 

 

 

 

From: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Monday, November 12, 2018 3:55 PM 

To: Jack Ng <jackng@honda.com.sg> 

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT BETWEEN SLK 6006 U AND YOUR INSURED SKE 3659 Z LKK REF CC4/ASM18019780/ha3 

 

Without Prejudice 

 

Dear Jack, 

 

We refer to the below email and to our telephone conversation earlier. 

 

As spoken, our Insured had already reported the accident (see below statement). 
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However, we are still pending for DS instruction  from our principal as they are currently looking into the matter. 

 

We will follow up and will get back to you for an update. 

 

Thank you. 

 
Best Regards, 

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

 

 

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an 
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not 
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the 
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you. 
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From: Jack Ng [mailto:jackng@honda.com.sg]  

Sent: Friday, 9 November, 2018 3:15 PM 

To: Vic (LKKAuto) 

Cc: Admin A 

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT BETWEEN SLK 6006 U AND YOUR INSURED SKE 3659 Z LKK REF CC4/ASM18019780/ha3 

 

Dear vic,  

Kindly advice on this case liability. 

Had they pass your the GIA report? 

As your insured already done his reporting long ago and this case have been delay for so long.  

Best regards  
Jack  

Get Outlook for Android 
 

From: Jack Ng 

Sent: Thursday, November 8, 2018 2:34:11 PM 

To: Vic (LKKAuto) 

Cc: Admin A 

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT BETWEEN SLK 6006 U AND YOUR INSURED SKE 3659 Z LKK REF CC4/ASM18019780/ha3  

  
Dear vic,   

Kindly advise on this case.  

Best regards  
Jack 

Get Outlook for Android 
 

From: Jack Ng 

Sent: Monday, November 5, 2018 4:42:55 PM 

To: Vic (LKKAuto) 

Cc: Admin A 

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT BETWEEN SLK 6006 U AND YOUR INSURED SKE 3659 Z LKK REF CC4/ASM18019780/ha3  

  
Dear Vic, 

  

Noted, kindly assist to update me once you received the GIA report. 

  

  

  
Thank you and have a great days ahead  
  
Cheers !!! 
  
Best Regards, 

Jack  Ng 

Hp: 8288 6309 

Email : Jackng@honda.com.sg 

BODY REPAIR AND PAINT CENTRE 

255 Alexandra Road Singapore 159937  
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DID : +65 6514 5481  FAX : +65 6362 5015 

Kah Motor Co. Sdn. Bhd. 

(A MEMBER OF ORIENTAL HOLDING BERHAD) 

Website: www.honda.com.sg 
  

 

� Please consider the environment before printing this email 

CONFIDENTIAL NOTE: The Information contained in the e-mail is intended only for the use of the individual or entity named above and 

may contain information that is privileged, confidential and exempt from disclosure under applicable low. If the reader of this message is not the 

intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this communication is strictly prohibited. If you 

have received this message in error, please immediately notify the sender and delete the mail. Thank you for your collaboration. 

  

  

  

  

From: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Monday, November 05, 2018 4:40 PM 

To: Jack Ng <jackng@honda.com.sg> 

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT BETWEEN SLK 6006 U AND YOUR INSURED SKE 3659 Z LKK REF CC4/ASM18019780/ha3 

  

Without Prejudice 

  

Dear Jack, 

 

We refer to your below email. 

  

Please be informed that we are still pending for our Insured’s GIA report. 

 

We will continue to follow up on the matter and will get back to you for an update. 

  

Thank you. 

  

  
Best Regards, 

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

  

 

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an 
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not 
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the 
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you. 
  

  

From: Jack Ng [mailto:jackng@honda.com.sg]  

Sent: Monday, 5 November, 2018 11:37 AM 

To: Vic (LKKAuto) 
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Subject: FW: ACCIDENT BETWEEN SLK 6006 U AND YOUR INSURED SKE 3659 Z 

Importance: High 

  

Dear Vic, 

  

Kindly assist to advice on this case liability status. 

  

Understand from your insured that he already done his report. 

  

  

  
Thank you and have a great days ahead  
  
Cheers !!! 
  
Best Regards, 

Jack  Ng 

Hp: 8288 6309 

Email : Jackng@honda.com.sg 

BODY REPAIR AND PAINT CENTRE 

255 Alexandra Road Singapore 159937  

DID : +65 6514 5481  FAX : +65 6362 5015 

Kah Motor Co. Sdn. Bhd. 

(A MEMBER OF ORIENTAL HOLDING BERHAD) 

Website: www.honda.com.sg 
  

 

� Please consider the environment before printing this email 

CONFIDENTIAL NOTE: The Information contained in the e-mail is intended only for the use of the individual or entity named above and 

may contain information that is privileged, confidential and exempt from disclosure under applicable low. If the reader of this message is not the 

intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this communication is strictly prohibited. If you 

have received this message in error, please immediately notify the sender and delete the mail. Thank you for your collaboration. 

  

  

  

  

From: Jack Ng  

Sent: Monday, October 29, 2018 12:22 PM 

To: cst@axa.com.sg; motor.survey@axa.com.sg 

Subject: ACCIDENT BETWEEN SLK 6006 L AND YOUR INSURED SKE 3659 Z 

Importance: High 

  

Dear all, 

  

Kindly assist to register for direct settlement, attached is the GIA report.  

  

We propose 100% direct settlement in our client favour. 

  

  
Thank you and have a great days ahead  
  
Cheers !!! 
  
Best Regards, 

Jack  Ng 
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Hp: 8288 6309 

Email : Jackng@honda.com.sg 

BODY REPAIR AND PAINT CENTRE 

255 Alexandra Road Singapore 159937  

DID : +65 6514 5481  FAX : +65 6362 5015 

Kah Motor Co. Sdn. Bhd. 

(A MEMBER OF ORIENTAL HOLDING BERHAD) 

Website: www.honda.com.sg 
  

 

� Please consider the environment before printing this email 

CONFIDENTIAL NOTE: The Information contained in the e-mail is intended only for the use of the individual or entity named above and 

may contain information that is privileged, confidential and exempt from disclosure under applicable low. If the reader of this message is not the 

intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this communication is strictly prohibited. If you 

have received this message in error, please immediately notify the sender and delete the mail. Thank you for your collaboration. 

  

  

 

Confidential Note: The information contained in this email is intended only for the use of the 

individual or entity named above and may contain information that is privileged, confidential and 

exempt from disclosure under applicable law. If the reader of this message is not the intended 

recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this 

communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please immediately 

notify the sender and delete the mail. Thank you. 

 

Confidential Note: The information contained in this email is intended only for the use of the 

individual or entity named above and may contain information that is privileged, confidential and 

exempt from disclosure under applicable law. If the reader of this message is not the intended 

recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this 

communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please immediately 

notify the sender and delete the mail. Thank you. 
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Confidential Note: The information contained in this email is intended only for the use of the 

individual or entity named above and may contain information that is privileged, confidential and 

exempt from disclosure under applicable law. If the reader of this message is not the intended 

recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this 

communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please immediately 

notify the sender and delete the mail. Thank you. 


