Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Yin Jie <yinjie@lhl.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 19 November, 2018 1:17 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: FW: SLR5577H Bodywork repair quotation
Attachments: 3331c5ad-dde0-41d6-8f76-17badd9f306e.jpg

Dear Vic Alpeh Sanghilan

Refer Ref : CC3/A1G18019761/hb3
Please refer attached cheque copies for Accident Case SKE8988R AND SLR 5577H.

Thanks & Regards

Yin Jie

LHL International Pte Ltd

29 Jurong Port Road Singapore 619102
Tel : (65) 6265 0063 Ext : 255

Fax : (65) 6265 7477

www.lhl.com.sg

LHL inTERNATIONAL

Confidentiality caution & disclaimer. This message, together with any attachment is intended only for the use of the individual or entity to which it
Is addressed and may contain information that is legally privileged and confidential If you are not the intended recipient, please be informed that
any dissemination, distribution or copying of this message, or any attachment is strictly prohibited. Kindly note that e-mail communications are not
secured, and therefore are susceptible to alteration. LHL International Pte Ltd will not accept legal responsibility for the contents of this message.
If you have received this message in error, please advise the sender by reply e-mail, and delete the message Thank you for your co-operation.

From: Richie See <richie.see@lhl.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 19 November, 2018 12:29 PM

To: yinjie@lhl.com.sg

Subject: FW: SLR5577H Bodywork repair quotation

Hl yin Jie,
As per request for your record. See email blow and attachment above.
Richie

From: Judy [mailto:judy@xuya.com.sq]

Sent: Monday, 5 November, 2018 8:37 PM

To: richie.see@lhl.com.sg

Subject: Fwd: SLR5577H Bodywork repair quotation




Judy Ng

Sent from my iPhone

Begin forwarded message:

From: LiliC <lilic7Z8 @yahoo.com.sg>

Date: 3 November 2018 at 2:08:35 PM SGT

To: Judy <judy@xuya.com.sg>

Subject: Re: SLR5577H Bodywork repair quotation

Thank you Ms Ng.

Sent from my iPhone

On 2 Nov 2018, at 5:24 PM, Judy <judy@xuya.com.sg> wrote:

Received
Ok will process the cheq payment and advise u once done
Judy Ng

Sent from my iPhone

On 2 Nov 2018, at 5:02 PM, LiliC <lilic78 @yahoo.com.sg> wrote:

Hi Judy

Please find attached for your kind attention. The cheque should be
made to Performance Motors Limited. The reference is b1 48941.

You may attention the mail to Mr Gary Poh.
Please kindly advise if the cheque is mailed out.

| look forward to early settlement. Once the cheque is cleared, | will
withdraw the third party claim against Mr See’s insurance.

Thank you.

Regards
Lili

Sent from my iPhone

Begin forwarded message:

From: Teng Wai Khan
<teng.wai.khan@simedarby.com.sg>

Date: 2 November 2018 at 8:15:03 AM SGT
To: "lilic78 @yahoo.com.sg"
<lilic7Z8@yahoo.com.sg>




Cc: Cresendo Llurca Lagman
<cresendo.lagman@simedarby.com.sg>, Gary Poh
Chai Hoon
<gary.poh.chaihoon@simedarby.com.sg>
Subject: SLR5577H Bodywork repair quotation

Good Morning Ms LiLi,

Thank you for allowing me to liaise with you
through telephone conversation. As per your
request to forward our retail prices repair quotation
on your car for your perusal. As mentioned we need
to clear third party cheque OR cash/credit prior to
commencement of the repair work.

Thanks & Regards,
Wai Khan

Performance Motors Limited
Body & Paint Department
DID : 63190149

Fax : 64743229

“This electronic mail content and any accompanying
attachments ("the Message") is intended only for
the named addressee ("the Recipient") and may
contain information that is confidential, privileged
and/or proprietary to the Sime Darby group of
companies ("Sime Darby") and/or protected under
applicable laws. If you are not the intended
Recipient, you are strictly prohibited from using,
disseminating, forwarding and/or printing the
Message. Please notify the sender immediately by
return e-mail and permanently delete all copies of
the Message. Sime Darby disclaims all liability for
any error, loss or damage arising from the Message
being infected by computer virus or other malicious
software. Any views and/or opinions expressed in
the Message are solely those of the author's and do
not necessarily represent those of Sime Darby's.”

<image(002.jpg>

<SLR5577H Bodywork repair estimate.pdf>



